City of

Urange Beach

UNIT PRICE BID TABULATION SHEET

Life is better here

Project Name:
Requisition No.

AGGREGATE
2021-0114

Bid Date: January 14, 2021
Bid Opening Time: 11:00 AM

Bidder's Name

Couch Aggregates, LLC

Martin Marietta

Slats Lucas Aggregates

Stephens Trucking

City, State Orange Beach, AL Theodore, AL Hattiesburg, MS Luverne, AL
Robert Powell Jim Riis Darron Wood Michelle Stephens
Contact rpowell@dunnconstruction.com james.riis@martinmarietta.com darronwood@warrenpaving.com stephensccO0@gmail.com
(205) 531-1216 (251) 680-1371 (601) 270-9555 (334) 335-3800
Bid Amount Loaded Loaded/Delivered Loaded Loaded/Delivered Loaded Loaded/Delivered Loaded Loaded/Delivered
A - Crushed Gravel . . . . .
ALDOT No. 57 $26.50 / Ton $31.00/Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.45/ Ton
iL'DC(;‘f;zdsL;me“"”e $32.50 / Ton $37.00/ Ton $34.00 / Ton $45.50 / Ton $31.95/Ton $36.45 / Ton No Bid $47.00/ Ton
¢ rushed Limestone $32.50 / Ton $37.00/ Ton $34.00 / Ton $45.50 / Ton $31.95 / Ton $36.45 / Ton No Bid $47.00/ Ton
2L'§gleea‘js:if‘e“°”e Rip Rap $50.00 / Ton $54.50 / Ton $50.00 / Ton $62.50 / Ton $ 45.00 / Ton $51.00 / Ton No Bid $51.00/ Ton
£ Cushed Limestone fip fep $50.00 / Ton $54.50 / Ton $50.00 / Ton $62.50 / Ton $ 45.00 / Ton $51.00/ Ton No Bid $51.00/ Ton
G - Crushed Limestone Rip Rap $55.00 / Ton $59.50 / Ton No Bid No Bid $47.00 / Ton $53.00 / Ton No Bid $52.00/ Ton
ALDOT Class 3
H - Crushed Limestone Rip Rap .
ALDOT 3"6" Gabion Stone $50.00 / Ton $54.50/ Ton $50.00 / Ton $62.50/Ton $42.00 / Ton $48.00/ Ton No Bid $47.50/ Ton
;:::;Z':d Crushed Concrete $29.00 / Ton $33.50 / Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1 hecycled crushed Conrete No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
x2" Cobbles
K - Rubble Riprap, <300 Ibs. $30.00 / Ton $34.50/ Ton No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Yard Location

22801 Canal Road

22601 Canal Road

Tabulated by R. Eberly 1/14/2021




