
HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
Purchasina Department

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED 81DS

ITB 17-027

TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES, MATERIALS AND HARDWARE

Bid opening: 3/15{17

NUM DESCRIPTION I 0-49 I 50·99 I l00or+ I RANK

1 3 X 6 Sin«le heMe

Osburn As5<X:iates, Inc. I $0.26 $0.26 $0.26 1
Universal Signs & Ac:c:euories $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 2

2 4 X8 Standard hole

Osburn Associates, Inc. t- $0.44 $0.44 $0.44 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 2

3 6 X 12 With 2 Ho'es

Universal Sllns & Accessories $0,97 $0.97 $0.97 1
Osburn Associates. Inc. $0.98 SO.98 $0.98 2

• 12 X 6 Wrth 2 Holes

Universal Silns & Accessories SO·97 SO·97 $0.97 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. SO.98 SO.98 $0.98 2

5 16 X:J6 SCHOOl CROSSING DRllliD FOR FOOT Z-BAJI

Universal Sitns & Accessories $10.35 $10.35 $10.35 1
Osburn Associates. Inc. $17.64 $17.64 $17.64 2

• 9 X 24 With 4 Holes

Universal 5'1"$ & Acceswries $2.92 $2.92 $2.92 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $2.94 $2.94 $2.94 2

1 9 X :JO With 4 Holes

Universal Signs & Accessories $3.65 $3.65 $3.65 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $3.68 $3.68 $3.68 2

• 9 X 36 With 4 Holes I
Universal Signs & Accessories $4.39 $4.39 $4.39 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $4.41 $4.41 $4.41 2

• 9 X 42 With 4 Holes I
Universal Signs & Accessories $5.12 $5.12 $5.12 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $5.14 $5.14 $5.14 2

10 9 X48 WIth 4 Holes

Universal Signs & Accessories $5.85 $5.85 $5.85 1
Osburn AssocIates. Inc. $5.88 $5.88 $5.88 2

11 9 X 54 With 4 Holes

Universal Signs & Accessories $6.58 $6.58 $6.58 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $6.61 $6.61 $6.61 2

11 U X 18 With 2 Holes

Universal Si&ns & Accessories $2.92 $2.92 $2.92 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $2.94 $2.94 $2.94 2

13 24 XU DRIU£D FOR FOOT l-BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $3.90 $3.90 $3.90 1
Osburn Associales, Inc. $3.92 $3.92 $3.92 2

l' 12 X 36 DRIUeO FOR FOOT Z·BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $5.85 $5.85 $5.85 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $5.88 $5.88 $5.88 2
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BASE FOR RANKING--
NUM DESCRIPTION 0-49 SO·99 100 or t RAN'

15 36 X 12 ORIU.ED fOR FOOT I-BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $5.85 $5.85 $5.85 1

Osburn Associites, Inc. $5.88 $5.88 $5.88 2

" 21 X 15 DRILLED fOR FOOT Z-BAR

UnivefSil[ Signs & Acce$SOfies $4.25 $4.25 $4.25 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $4.27 $4.27 $4.27 2

" I' X24 DRllliO FOR FOOT Z/BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $5.85 $5.85 55.SS 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. SS.88 $5.88 $5.88 2

1B 24 x 18 DRillED FOR fOOT Z·BAR

Universal Sians & Accessories $5.85 55.SS $5.85 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. SS.88 $5.88 $5.88 2

" 48 X 18 With 2 Holes

Universal Slant & Accessories $11.70 $11.70 $11.70 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $11.76 $11.76 $11.76 2

2. 24 X 36 DRILLED FOR fOOT Z-BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $11.70 $11.70 $11.70 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $11.76 $11.76 $11.76 2

21 36 x 24 DRlLUD fOR FOOT Z-BAR -Universal Signs & Accessories $11.70 $11.70 $11.70 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $11.76 $11.76 $11.76 2

22 24.48 ORllliO FOR fOOT I-BAR

Univ«sal Signs & Accessories $15.60 $15.60 $15.60 1
Osburn Assocliltes. lne. $15.68 515.68 $15.68 2

23 48 x 24 DRIU.ED FOfl FOOT I·BAR

Universal Slans & Accessories $15.60 515.60 515.60 1
Osburn Assodiltes, Inc. $15.68 $15.68 $15.68 2.. JO X 18 DRIU.ED FOR FOOT I-BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $7.30 $7.30 $7.30 1

Osburn AsSoda!es, Inc. 57.35 57.3S $7.35 2

25 30 X 36 DRILLED FOR FOOT I·BAR

Universal Signs & AccessorIes $14.60 $14.60 $14.60 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $14.70 $14.70 $14.70 2

2' 48 X 30 With 4 Holes I --- -
Universal Signs & Accessories $19.50 $19.50 $19.50 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $19.60 $19.60 $19.60 2

27 30 X 60 With 4 Holes

Universal Signs & Accessories $24.40 $24.40 $24.40 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $24.50 $24.50 $24.50 2,. 36 x ZO DRILLED FOR FOOT Z·BAR

Univ«sa[ Signs & Accessories $9.75 $9.75 $9.75 1
Osburn As.soci.ltes, Inc. $9.80 $9.80 $9.80 2,. 48 X36 With 4 Holes

Univ«sal Signs & Accessories $23.40 $23.40 $23.40 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $23.52 $23.52 523.52 2

'" 18 X 18 With 2 Holes DriMed Square FOR FOOT Z-BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $4.40 $4.40 $4.40 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $4.41 $4.41 $4.41 2
US Standard Sign --

31 18 X 18 With 2 Holes Drlled Diamond Shape

Universal Si8n~& Accessories $4.40 $4.40 $4.40 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $4.41 $4.41 $4.41 2
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BASE fOR RANKING

~
DESCRIPTION 0-49 I SO-99 I l00or+ I RANK

32 24 X 24 With 2 Holes DRllliD fOR fOOT l-BAR

Univer~1 Signs & Acceuories $7-80 $7.80 $7-80 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $7.84 $7.84 $7.84 ,

33 )0 X)O With 2 Holes Driled Squllre FOR FOOT l·BAR

Unlvers.ll Silns & Accessories $12.20 $12.20 $12.20 1

Osburn~tes, Inc. $12.25 $12.25 $12.25 ,.. )0 X)O With 2 Holes Driled Diamond Sh~ DRILLED fOR FOOT I-BAR

Universal Silns & Accessories $12.20 $12.20 $12.20 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.2S $12.25 $12.25 ,

35 36 X36 Wlth 2 Holes Drilled Squllre FOR FOOT Z·BAR

Universal Silns & Accessories $17.60 $17.60 $17.60 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $17.64 $17.64 $17.64 ,

36 36 x36 Circle With 2 Holes Drilled DRILLED fOR FOOT I-BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $17.60 $17.60 $17.60 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $17.64 $17.64 $17.64 ,

37 36 X 36 With 2 Holes Drilled Diamond Shape FOR FOOT l-BAR

Uni ....ersal Signs & Accessories $17.60 $17.60 $17.60 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $17.64 $17.64 $17.64 ,.. 36 oetacon With 2 Holes

Universal Silns & Accessories $16.50 $16.50 $16.SO 1
Osborn Associates,lnc. $17.64 $17.64 $17.64 ,

39 36 Triancie With 2 Holes DRillED fOR fOOT I-BAR

Universal Signs & Accessories $8.75 $8.75 $8.75 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $8.82 $8.8, $8.S2 ,

.., )0 Ochcon With 2 Holes

Universal Silns & Accessories $11_SO $11.50 I $11_SO 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.25 $12.25 I $12.25 ,

.1 36 X36 Pentqon County RTE. With 2 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. $17.00 $17.00 I $17.00 I 1
Universal 5ilns & Accessories 517.64 $17.64 I $17.64 ,

42 30 l( 24 DRILLED FOR FOOT Z·BAR

Universal Signs~Accessories $9.75 $9.75 $9.75 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $9.S0 $9.80 $9.80 ,., 48 X48 With 4 Holes Drilled Diamond

Universal Silns & Accessories I $31.20 $31.20 $31.20 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $31.36 $31.36 531.36 2.. 24 X30 DRILLED FOR FOOT I-BAR

Universal Silns & Accessories $9.75 $9.75 I $9.75 1
Osburn Associates, lne. $9.80 $9.80 $9.80 2., FLA.T SIGN BRACKETS SHAll FIT POSTS 2 3/S AND 2 1/2

Universal Silns & Accessories $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 1
Osborn AssociateS, Inc. $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 2

:'6 STREET SKiN TWIST BRACKET FOR U CHANNEL POST

Osburn Associltes, Inc. S6.SO $6.SO I $6.50 1
UniverYl Signs & Accessories $8.00 $S.OO $8.00 2

47 2 3/S" Round si,n post.IIIN. 10'

Osburn Associates, Inc_ $14.76 $14.76 $14.76 1
Universal Silns & Accessories $42.00 $35.00 $33.00 2

2 3/S" Round sian post, 'al ..... 12'

Osburn Associates, Inc. $16.60 $16.60 $16.60 1--
Universal Signs_& Accessories $50.00 $42.00 $40.00 2

23/8" Round sign post,lalv.14'
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lASE FOR RANKING

NUM DESCRIPTION 0-49 SO·99 100 or + RAN'

Osburn Associates, Inc. $19.37 $19.37 $19.37 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $58.00 $49.00 $46.00 2.. Z1/Z- Round sip post, alum. 10'

Osburn Associates, Inc. $24.40 $24.40 $24.40 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $35.00 $30.00 530.00 2

Z1/Z- Round siCn post, alum. 12'
Osburn Associates, Inc. $29.28 $29.28 $29.28 1
Universal $lCns & Accessories $40.00 $35.00 $35.00 2

Z lIZ" Round sian post, alum. 14'

Osburn Associates. Inc. $34.16 $34.16 $34.16 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 2.. 3- Round sicn post, alum. 10'

Osburn Associates. Inc. $29.90 $29.90 $29.90 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $48.00 $48.00 $40.00 2

r Round sicn post, alum. 12'

Osburn Associates. Inc. $35.88 $35.88 $35.88 1
Universal Sicns & Accessories $58.00 $45.00 $45.00 2

r Round siCn post, alum. 14'

Osburn Associates, Inc. $41.86 $41.86 $41.86 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $65.00 $60.00 $55.00 2

SO 3 lIZ" Round sicn POSt. aJum. 10'

Osburn Associales, Inc. $50.90 $50.90 $50.90 1
Unlversoil SiCns & Accessories $75.00 $70.00 $70.00 2

3 lIZ- Round siC" post, alum. 12'
Osburn Associates, Inc. $61.08 $61.08 $61.08 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $SO.OO $75.00 $75.00 2

31/2- Round siCn post, alum. 14'

Osburn Associates, Inc. $71.26 $71.26 $71.26 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $88.00 $88.00 $88.00 2

51 4" Round sip post, alum. 10'

Osburn Assodates, Inc. $78.00 $78.00 $78.00 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $100.00 $95.00 $90.00 2

4~ Round sicn post, alum. 12'

Osburn Associates. Inc. $96.30 $96.30 $96.30 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $115.00 No bid No bid 2

4- Round sian post, alum. 14'

Osburn AssCKlates. Inc. $109.20 $109.20 $109.20 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $125.00 No bid No bid 2

S2 4 lIZ- Round sicn post, alum. 10' -
Osburn Associales, Inc. $86.SO $86.SO 586.80 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $165.00 No bid NO bid 2

41/Z· Round siC" POSt. atum. 12'
Osburn Associates, Inc. $104.16 $104.16 $104.16 1
Universal $lens & Accessories $175.00 No bid No bid 2

41/Z- Round sian post, alum. 14'

Osburn Associates. Inc. $121.52 $121.52 $121.52 1
Universal Siens & Accessories $195.00 No bid No bid 2

53,54,55 ·U· channel post,lalnnized, 1.12Ibs/ft. 6'

Osburn Associates. Inc. $5.40 $5.40 $5.40 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $6.75 $6.75 $6.75 2

·U· channel post, galvanized, 1.12 Ibs/ft, 7'
Osburn Associates, Inc. $6.30 $6.30 $6.30 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $7.85 $7.85 $7.85 2

"U" channel post.calvanized,l.lZ Ibs/ft, 8'
Osburn Associates, Inc. $7.20 $7.20 $7.20 1
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BASE fOR RANKING

NUM DESCRIPTION 0-49 I SO-99 100 or .. RANK

Universal Signs & AcceSS()(ies $8.75 $8.75 $8.75 2
·U· channel post, lalvaniz.ed, 1.U Ibs/tt. g'

Universal Signs & Accessories $8.10 SUO $8.10 1

Osburn AssociOites. Inc. $9.75 $9.75 $9.75 2
·U· channel post, calvaniled. 3 Ibs/ft, 10'

Osburn Associat6, Inc. $23.20 I $23.20 $23.20 1
Universal Signs & Accessories No bid No bid No bid

.U" channel post, calvaniled. 3 Ibs/ft. 12'

Osburn Associates, Inc. $27.84 $27.84 $27.84 1
Universal Signs & Accessories No bid No bid No bid

·U· chilnnel post.lillvi1Inized. 3lbs/ft, 14'

Osburn Assocla~. Inc. $32.48 $32.48 $32.48 1

Universal Signs & Accessories No bid No bid Nobid

56 Galv. "U· bold with alum., Z W

Osburn Associates, Inc. I $1.72 I $1.72 $1.72 1

Universal Signs & Accessories $3.75 I $3.75 $3.75 2

57 Galv. ·U· bold with .luJ.. 3"

Osburn Associates. Inc. $1.98 t $1.98 $1.98 1
Universal Silns & Accessories $3.90 I $3.90 $3.90 2.. GalY. RU· bold with alum., 3S

Osburn Anodatl!s, Inc. $1.98 I $1.98 $1.98 1
Universal Slins & Accessories $4.35 I $4.35 $4.35 2

" ~. ·U· bold with alum., 4-

Osburn Assoc~tl!s, Inc. $2.22 I $2.22 $2.22 1
Universal Signs & AcC6S0ril!S $4.80 I $4.80 $4.80 2

00 GMv. ·U· bold with alum., 4.5·

Osburn As5ociates, Inc. $3.19 $3.19 $3.19 1
Universal Slins & Accl!ssories $5.10 $5.10 $5.10 2

61 10' GalY. Squarl! tube post, 101aull!

Universal 5i,ns & Accl!ssoril!S No bid No bid Nobid

Osburn Associates, Inc. No bid No bid Nobid

62,63,64 ·U· chilnnl!! post, ,alYanized, 4Ibs/foot, 10'

Osburn Associatl!s, Inc. $30.70 $30.70 $30.70 1
Universal Signs & ACCl!ssorll!S $32.30 $32.30 $32.30 2

·U· channel post, galvanlzl!d, 4 Ibs/foot, 12'

Osburn Associatl!S,lnc. $36.84 $36.84 $36.84 1
Universal Signs & Accl!ssorles $38.80 $38.80 $38.80 2

·U· channel post, lalvanizl!d, 4lbs/foot, 14'

Osburn Associall!S, Inc. $42.98 $42.98 $42.98 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $45.25 $45.25 $45.25 2

·U· channel post, galnnized, 4lbs/foot,1~

Osburn Associales, Inc. $49.12 $49.12 $49.12 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $51.75 $51.75 $51.75 2

6S lrll24- Blank, drilled for fOOT I-Bar

Universal Signs & Accessories $3.90 $3.90 $3.90 1
Osburn ~tl!S, Inc. $3.92 $3.92 $3.92 2.. lrx30- Blank, drilled for fOOT I-Bar

Universal Silns & Accessories $4.85 $4.85 $4.85 1
Osburn AssocIates, Inc. $4.90 $4.90 $4.90 2., 12·x36· Blank, drilled for fOOT I-Bar -
Universal Signs & Accessories $5.85 $5.85 $5.85 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $5.88 $5.88 $5.88 2.. lZ-x4Z- Blank, drilled for fOOT I-Bar

Universal Signs & Accessories $6.80 $6.80 $6.80 1
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llAS£ FOIl RANKING

NUM DESCRIPTION 0-49 I SO·99 I 100 or + RAN',
Osburn Associates, Inc. $6.86 $6.86 $6.86 ,.. 12~lC4I" Blank, armed for FOOT I-Bar

Universal Sicns & Acc6sories $7.80 $7.80 $7.80 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $7.84 $7.84 $7.84 ,

70 12wx54- Blank, armed for FOOT I-Bar

UniverYl SiJfls & Accessories S8.80 $8.80 S8.80 1
Osburn Associates, Inc.. sa.82 $8.82 $8.82 ,

71 12-no- Blank,. drilled for fOOT Z-Bar -
Universal Signs & Accessories $9.75 $9.75 I $9.75 1
Osburn Associates, lne. $9.80 $9.80 $9.80 ,

72 9-K24- Blank, drilled with 3M DG 3 sheeting

Osburn Associates, Int. $11.40 $11.40 $11.40 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $11.95 $11.95 $11.95 ,

73 9wk30- Blank, drilled with 3M DG 3 sheeting

Osburn Associates, Inc. $14.25 $14.25 $14.25 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $14.90 $14.90 $14.90 ,

,
7. 9·xli- Blank, drilled with 3M DG 3 sheetin,

Osburn Associates, Inc. $17.10 $17.10 $17.10 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $17.90 $17.90 $17.90 ,

75 9-x4Z- Blank, drilled with 3M DG 3 sheeting -
Osburn Assodat@s, lne. $19.91 $19.91 I $19.91 I 1
Univffsal Signs & Acc@ssori@s $20.90 $20.90 I $20.90 I ,

7' 9M x48" Blank, dril~ with 3M DG 3 meetin,

Osburn Assodat@s. Inc. $22.80 $22.80 I $22.80 I 1
Universal Signs & AcceSSOries , $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 ,

77 9"x48" Blank, drilled with 3M DG 3 sheetin,

Osburn Associat@s, Inc. $25.61 $25.61 I $25.61 1
Universal 51gns & Acc@ssori@s $26.85 $26.85 $26.85 I ,

78 12"x24" Blank, drilled for fOOT I-Bar, with 3M DG 3 sh@@t!n,

Osburn Assodat@s. Inc. $10.60 $10.60 $10.60 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $15.90 $15.90 $15.90 ,

79 12"x30" Blank, drilled fo} fOOT I·Bar, with 3M OG 3 sh@etln,

Osburn Associates, Inc. $13.25 $13.25 $13.25 1
Universal Signs.& Accessories $19.90 $19.90 $19.90 ,

80 12"x24" Blank, drilled for fOOT I-Bar, with 3M DG 3 sheeting

Osburn Associates, Inc. $15.90 $15.90 $15.90 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 ,,., lrx4r Blank, drllted for fOOT I-Bar, with 3M DG 3 sheeting

Osburn Associates, lne. $18.55 $18.55 $18.55 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $27.85 $27.85 $27.85 ,,

12 U"X48" Blank, drilled for fOOT I-Bar, with 3M DG 3 sheetin,

Osburn Associates, Inc. $21.20 $21.20 $21.20 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $31.80 $31.80 $31.80 ,,

13 U M xS4" Blank, drilled for fOOT Z-Bar, with 3M DG 3 sheetin,

Osburn Associates, Inc. $23.85 $23.85 $23.85 1
Universal Si,ns & AcceSSOl"ies $35.80 $35.80 $35.80 ,,.. 12"x60" Blank, drilled for FOOT Z·e.r, with 3M DG 3 sheeting

Osburn Associates, Inc. $26.50 $26.50 $26.50 1
Universal Signs & Accessori@s $39.75 $39.75 $39.75 ,

IS Aluminum Z-Bar, 13/4" x 8M

Osburn Assoclat@s. Inc. $2.57 $2.57 $2.57 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $3.75 $3.75 $3.75 ,
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lASE FOIl AAHltlNG

NUM DESCRIPTION 0- 49 I 50-99 1 l00or+ RANK.. Aluminum Z-8at.13/4~Jl14~

O$burn ~te:s. Inc. $4.18 $4.18 $4.18 1
Universal Signs & Acce:~s $5.50 $5.50 $5.50 I 2,

87 Aluminum Z-Bar.13/4~ x 20"

Osburn Msodates, Inc. $5.98 $5.98 I $5.98 I 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $7.75 $7.75 1 $7.75 I 2,

88 Aluminum I-Bar, 13/4~ I( 26~

Osburn Associates, Inc. $7.73 $7.73 I $7.73 1

Universal Signs & Accessories $10.25 $10.25 I $10.25 I 2
~.. Aluminum I-Bar, 13/4- x 3r

Osburn Associates. lne. $9.29 $9.29 I $9.29 I 1

Univer5a1 Signs & Accessories $12.50 $12.50 I $12.50 I 2

90 Aluminum Z.k,13/4- x 38-

Osburn Associates, Inc. $10.79 I $10.79 I $10.79 I 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $14.00 I $14.00 I $14.00 I 2.. Aluminum 2·8.lr,13/4- x 46-

Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.02 I $12.02 I $12.02 I 1
Universal Signs & Accessories , $17.00 I $17.00 I $11.00 I 2

92 Aluminum Z-Bar,13/4- Il Sr
Osburn Associates, Inc. $17.05 I $17.05 $17.05 I 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $21.00 I $21.00 $21.00 2., 30- Stop Face

Osbum Associates. Inc. $18.13 $18.13 I $18.13 I 1
Universal Signs & AcceSSOfies $24,40 I $24.40 I $24.40 I 2,.. 36- Stop Face

Osburn Associates. Inc. $26.10 $26.10 $26.10 I 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $35.50 I $35.50 , $35.50 I 2.. 36- Stop Ahead Symbol face with tK"nk

Osburn Associates, Inc. I $47.70 I $47.70 $47.70 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $63.05 I $63.05 $63.05 2.. 36- Sian,,1 Ahe"d Symbol F"ce with bl"nk

Osburn Associates, Inc. I $47.70 I $47.70 $47.70 1
Universal Signs & Accessories I $63.05 I $63.05 $63.05 2

'7 36- Yield Face with blan'

Osburn Associates, Inc. ---l. $13.85 I $13.85 $UgS 1
Universal Signs & Acceuories $55.50 I $55.50 $55.50 2.. 36- Reduced Speed Ahe"d W3·S Face with blank, No Numbers Of leners Of border tot" speed limit

Osburn Associates, Inc. $47.70 I $47.70 $47.70 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $63.05 $63.05 $63.05 2.. 24-lt48- School Speed Zone -When Fltihinc Face & Bloank"

Osburn Associates, Inc. $42.40 $42.40 $42.40 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $59.80 f $59.80 $59.80 2

100 36" School Crossinl face & bloank, lime IrHn

Osburn Associates, Inc. $47.70 $47.70 $47.70 1
Universal Signs & Accessories $63.05 I $63.05 $63.05 2

101 4-lt84- Red reflective po~t panel with 4·holes

Osburn Associates. Inc. $12.36 I $12.36 $12.36 1
Universal Signs & Accessories No bid No bid No bid I

102 4-lt84- White reflective Post p"nel with 4-holes

Osburn Associates. Inc. $12.36 I $12.36 j $12.36 1
Universal Signs & Accessories No bid I No bid NO bid,

10' 4"lt84" Ydlow reflective post pand with 4-holes
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BASE fOil RANIONG

NUM DESCRIPTION 0·49 50·9') 100 or t RANK-
Osburn Associates. Inc. $12.36 $12.36 $12.36 1
Universal Signs & Accessories No bid Nobld Nobld

.04 4-1184- Ume CJC!flI reflective post ~elwith 4.J101es

Osburn As.sociates. Inc. $12.36 $12.36 I $12.36 I 1
Universal Silns & Acussories No bid No bid I No bid I, -.OS .-x84- Oranle reflective post p;1Inel wtth 4-holes

Osburn As5oclates. Inc. $12.36 $12.36 1 $12.36 I 1
Universal Silns & Accessories No bid No bid I No bid I

.06 Rewerse strHt sian twist bracket for U channel post

Osburn Associates, Inc. $6.50 I $6.50 I $6.50 1
Universal Silns & Accessories Nobld No bid I Nobld

'.7 Aluminum soil plate drilled vertically & slotted hOfltontlfly

Osburn ASSCKlates, Inc. $11.00 $11.00 I $11.00 I 1
Universal Silns & Accessories $12.75 $12.75 I $12.75 I 2
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local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the

designation (LPA). Local Preference was not used to award this bid.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO ALL VENDORS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY FOR THE BID PERIOD 04/01/2017·

03/31/2018.

Clinton Howerton, P.E., HeBeC eounty Engineer

a Ie Gilbert, HCBCC Purchasing Manager

RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:

~~dzY<'
JUneisher, HCBCe County Administrator

Date

J-N-I
Date
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