

**TABULATION FOR RFP#11820197(DB)
SULLIVAN COUNTY EMS**

DESCRIPTION	WILSON COUNTY MOTORS		BILL GATTON CHEVROLET		FREELAND AUTOMOTIVE		TT OF G MURFREESBORO		Muster Emergency Vehicles	
	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
TWO (2) 2019/2020 CHEVROLET 4500/5500 CHASSIS CAB 4X2	\$48,577.84	\$97,155.68	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 51,650.00	\$ 103,300.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 48,500.00	\$ 97,000.00
YEAR	2020				2020				2019	
	Note: WT not LT / 5500				5500 model	LT package			4500 model	LT package
TOTAL		\$97,155.68			\$ 103,300.00				\$ 97,000.00	
DELIVERY TIME		18-20 weeks				180 days				
IRAN DIVESTMENT ACT AFFIDAVIT SIGNED		yes				yes				
DESCRIPTION	WILSON COUNTY MOTORS		BILL GATTON CHEVROLET		FREELAND AUTOMOTIVE		TT OF G MURFREESBORO		Muster Emergency Vehicles	
	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL
TWO (2) 2019/2020 CHEVROLET 4500/5500 4X4	\$51,157.80	\$102,315.60			\$ 53,800.00	\$ 107,600.00			\$ 51,922.00	\$ 103,844.00
YEAR	2020				2020				2019	
	Note: WT not LT / 5500				5500 model	LT package			5500 model	LT package
TOTAL		\$102,315.60			\$ 107,600.00				\$ 103,844.00	
TWO (2) 2019/2020 CHEVROLET 4500/5500 4X4		N/A				N/A			\$ 50,700.00	\$ 101,400.00
YEAR									2019	
									4500 model	LT package
TOTAL									\$ 101,400.00	
DELIVERY TIME		18-20 weeks				180 days				
IRAN DIVESTMENT ACT AFFIDAVIT SIGNED		yes				yes				
Note: Letter from dealership that they could not bid - not a medium duty dealer					Note: See RFP # 118201098(DB) for pricing					

WT Package

Added to Master - See note to file - yd.

1/13/20 - Per Jim Perry - wants to 2019/LT/ LT Package 55