

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2425

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:  
 Grand Oaks Elementary, Net Zero Building at Clinton High School  
 And Office of Technology  
 ANDERSON COUNTY, TN

BID DATE: Tuesday, March 12, 2024, @ 2:30 PM

Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	BID BOND	ADDEN	BASE BID	UNIT PRICE TREATED WOOD NAILER (LF)
Eskola Roofing & Waterproofing			No Bid	2X4 2X6 2X8 2X10
Rackley Roofing			No Bid	2X4 2X6 2X8 2X10
Dixie Roofing, Inc.	✓	✓	129,330.00	2X4 4.00 2X6 5.00 2X8 6.00 2X10 7.00
Genesis Roofing Company	✓	✓	158,000.00	2X4 5.00 2X6 6.00 2X8 7.00 2X10 8.00
Foam-Crete, Inc.	✓	✓	148,450.00	2X4 5.00 2X6 6.00 2X8 7.00 2X10 8.00

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2425

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:  
 Grand Oaks Elementary, Net Zero Building at Clinton High School  
 And Office of Technology  
 ANDERSON COUNTY, TN

BID DATE: Tuesday, March 12, 2024, @ 2:30 PM  
 Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	UNIT PRICE EQUIPMENT CURB REPLACEMENT (LF)	UNIT PRICE METAL DECK REPAIR (SF)	EXTERIOR GRADE PLYWOOD SHEATHING (SF)	1/2" HD INSULATION BOARD FILLER (SF)
Eskola Roofing & Waterproofing			1/2" 3/4"	
Rackley Roofing			1/2" 3/4"	<del>2.00</del>
Dixie Roofing, Inc.	25.00	12.50	1/2" 5.00 3/4" 6.00	1.50
Genesis Roofing Company	40.00	16.00	1/2" 3.00 3/4" 4.00	1.50
Foam-Crete, Inc.	175.00	12.50	1/2" 3.00 3/4" 4.00	3.00

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2425

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:  
 Grand Oaks Elementary, Net Zero Building at Clinton High School  
 And Office of Technology  
 ANDERSON COUNTY, TN

BID DATE: Tuesday, March 12, 2024, @ 2:30 PM

Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	BID BOND	ADDEN	BASE BID	UNIT PRICE TREATED WOOD NAILER (LF)
Davis Brothers Roofing	✓	✓	105,955.10	2X4 2.00 2X6 3.75 2X8 4.50 2X10 6.00
Porter Roofing Contractors	✓	✓	210,580.00	2X4 4.00 2X6 4.50 2X8 5.00 2X10 5.50
ABG Caulking & Waterproofing			NO BID	2X4 2X6 2X8 2X10
Henley Roofing Company	✓	✓	152,000.00	2X4 3.00 2X6 4.00 2X8 5.00 2X10 6.00
Morristown Roofing Company			NO BID	2X4 2X6 2X8 2X10

BID TABULATION FOR BID NO. 2425

Partial Roof Replacement for Anderson County Schools:  
 Grand Oaks Elementary, Net Zero Building at Clinton High School  
 And Office of Technology  
 ANDERSON COUNTY, TN

BID DATE: Tuesday, March 12, 2024, @ 2:30 PM

Anderson County Purchasing Department, 100 N. Main Street, Anderson County Courthouse, Clinton, TN 37716

CONTRACTOR	UNIT PRICE EQUIPMENT CURB REPLACEMENT (LF)	UNIT PRICE METAL DECK REPAIR (SF)	EXTERIOR GRADE PLYWOOD SHEATHING (SF)	1/2" HD INSULATION BOARD FILLER (SF)
Davis Brothers Roofing	95.00		1/2" 3/4"	
Porter Roofing Contractors	150.00		1/2" 3/4"	
ABG Caulking & Waterproofing	5		1/2" 3/4"	
Henley Roofing Company	50.00	10.00	1/2" 3/4"	2.00
Morristown Roofing Company			1/2" 3/4"	