BID TABULATION SHEET

IFB #336-19 VARIOUS VEHICLES FOR DAWSON COUNTY

March 6, 2019

ALLAN VIGIL FORD

ALAN JAY AUTOMOTIVE

2019 Ford Escape — Detailed
Specification Sheet A

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

2019 Ford Escape — Detailed
Specification Sheet A

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

Base Price $21,967.00 Base Price $22,131.00
All additional add-ons/options, if any $0.00 /:rll;addltlonal add-ons/options, if $0.00
BASE + Additional Equipment Price BASE + Additional Equipment

TOTAL PRICE 821,967,900 Iprice TOTAL PRICE $22,131.00
Delivery time from order 8-12 WEEKS Delivery time from order 10-14 WEEKS

FOB Charge $0.00] |FOB Charge $0.00

WARRANTY (Circle one)

Comply |

WARRANTY (Circle one)

Comply |

2019 Dodge Ram 1500 Big Horn/Lone
Star Crew Cab — Detailed Specification
Sheet B

Vehicle pricing

(Price for 1)

2019 Dodge Ram 1500 Big
Horn/Lone Star Crew Cab —
Detailed Specification Sheet B

Vehicle pricing

(Price for 1)

Base Price NO BID Base Price $40,655.00

Minus $50.00 to be
. . . iti - i i li H
All additional add-ons/options, if any  |$ All additional add-ons/options, if |delivered t_o ayes
any Chevrolet in Gainesville,

GA

BASE + Additional Equipment Price BASE + Additional Equipment

TOTAL PRICE NOBID Price TOTAL PRICE $40,605.00

Delivery time from order Delivery time from order TBD

FOB Charge $ FOB Charge $0.00




WARRANTY (Circle one)

Does not

Comply Comply

WARRANTY (Circle one)

Comply

2019 Ram 2500 Tradesman Regular
Cab — Detailed Specification Sheet C

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

2019 Ram 2500 Tradesman
Regular Cab — Detailed
Specification Sheet C

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

Base Price NO BID Base Price $30,123.50

Minus $50.00 to be
- . . . deli dtoH

All additional add-ons/options $ All additional add-ons/options elvered to Hayes
Chevrolet in Gainesville,
GA

BASE + Additional Equipment Price BASE + Additional Equipment

TOTAL PRICE NOBID Price TOTAL PRICE $30,073.50

Delivery time from order Delivery time from order TBD

FOB Charge $ FOB Charge $0.00

. Does not .
WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply Comply WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply

2019 Ford EcoSport — Detailed
Specification Sheet D

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

2019 Ford EcoSport — Detailed
Specification Sheet D

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

Base Price $21,199.00 Base Price NO BID
All additional add-ons/options $0.00 All additional add-ons/options $

BASE + Additional Equipment Price BASE + Additional Equipment

TOTAL PRICE $21,199.00 Price TOTAL PRICE NOBID
Delivery time from order 8-12 WEEKS Delivery time from order




FOB Charge

$0.00

FOB Charge

$

WARRANTY (Circle one)

Comply

WARRANTY (Circle one)

Comply

Does not

Comply

2019 1500 Ram Tradesman — Detailed
Specification Sheet E

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

2019 1500 Ram Tradesman —
Detailed Specification Sheet E

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

Base Price NO BID Base Price $24,599.00

Minus $50.00 to be
. . . . deli dtoH

All additional add-ons/options $ All additional add-ons/options elvered to Hayes
Chevrolet in Gainesville,
GA

BASE + Additional Equipment Price BASE + Additional Equipment

TOTAL PRICE NOBID Price TOTAL PRICE $24,549.00

Delivery time from order Delivery time from order TBD

FOB Charge $ FOB Charge $0.00

. Does not .
WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply Comply WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply

2019 V6 Dodge Durango Police Pursuit
— Detailed Specification Sheet F

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

2019 V6 Dodge Durango Police
Pursuit — Detailed Specification

Vehicle pricing

(Price for 1)

Sheet F
Base Price NO BID Base Price $28,848.50
Minus $50.00 to be
All additional add-ons/options $ All additional add-ons/options delivered to Hayes

Chevrolet in Gainesville,

GA




BASE + Additional Equipment Price

BASE + Additional Equipment

TOTAL PRICE NO BID Price TOTAL PRICE $28,798.50

Delivery time from order Delivery time from order TBD

FOB Charge $ FOB Charge $0.00
. Does not .

WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply Comply WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply

2019 V8 Dodge Durango Police Pursuit

— Detailed Specification Sheet G

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

2019 V8 Dodge Durango Police
Pursuit — Detailed Specification
Sheet G

Vehicle pricing
(Price for 1)

Base Price NO BID Base Price $31,423.50

Minus $50.00 to be
- . . . deli dtoH

All additional add-ons/options $ All additional add-ons/options elvered to Hayes
Chevrolet in Gainesville,
GA

BASE + Additional Equipment Price BASE + Additional Equipment

TOTAL PRICE NOBID Price TOTAL PRICE $31,373.50

Delivery time from order Delivery time from order TBD

FOB Charge $ FOB Charge $0.00

) Does not .
WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply Comply WARRANTY (Circle one) Comply

AWARDED: 2 Ford Escapes and no EcoSport vehicles to
Allan Vigil on 3/8/2019 - Total of $43,934.00

AWARDED: 1 each for the Dodge Rams and 2 each for the
Dodge Durango V8 vehicles to Alan Jay Automotive on

3/13/2019 - Total of $157,974.50




