CITY OF MYRTLE BEACH

PROJECT NO.: 18-B0065

OPENING TIME: 2:30 PM November 20, 2017

American Uniform Sales, Inc. Uniforms by John NAFECO
ITEM# | DESCRIPTION o | WNT | ceoliamsies | ovemewes | ToTALPRicE | PNTPRECEOUMAR| Vemewes | TOTALPRICE | pegliapeizes | ovemsizes | TOTALPRICE
Men's Trouser, Black no bid
1 |Elbeco E820RN 1 ea $ 39.95 $39.95 $ 38.90 $42.90
Flying Cross 47410 1 ea $ 42.90 $46.90
2 |Men's Trouser, Dark Navy no bid
Elbeco E2804R 1 ea $ 38.90 $42.90
511+ 74370 1 ea $ 36.95 $36.95 $ 39.90 $49.90
Flying Cross 47400 1 ea $ 38.90 $42.90
3 |Men's Cargo Trouser, Dark Navy no bid
Elbeco E2874R 1 ea $ 45.90 $49.90
511+ 74371 1 ea $ 36.95 $36.95 $ 39.90 $49.90
Flying Cross 47300 1 ea $ 53.90 $58.90
4 |[Men's Trouser, Black no bid
Flying Cross 3910 1 ea $ 33.90 $36.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 36.95 $36.95
5 [Men's Shorts, Dark Navy no bid
Flying Cross XF1-FX57300 1 ea $ 35.90 $39.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 36.95 $36.95
6 |Men's Long Sleeve Shirt, Marine or no bid
Medium Blue
Flying Cross 35W5435 1 ea $ 31.90 $39.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 30.95 $30.95
7 |Men's Short Sleeve Shirt, Marine or no bid
Medium Blue
Flying Cross 85R5435 1 ea $ 27.90 $35.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 26.95 $26.95
8 |Men's Long Sleeve Shirt, White no bid
Flying Cross 35\WW5400 1 ea $ 31.90 $39.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 30.95 $30.95
9 |Men's Short Sleeve Shirt, White no bid
Flying Cross 85R5400 1 ea $ 27.90 $35.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 26.95 $26.95
10 |Men's Long Body Short Sleeve Shirt, no bid
Marine orMedium Blue
Flying Cross 85R5435LB 1 ea $ 28.90 $37.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 26.95 $26.95
11 |[Men's Long Body Short Sleeve Shirt, no bid
White
Flvina Cross 85R5400LB 1 ea $ 28.90 $37.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 26.95 $26.95
12 |Four-In-Hand Long Tie, Black, 100% no bid
Polyester
Samuel Broome 455T 1 ea $ 3.90 $3.90
Approved Equal 1 ea $ 4.95 $4.95
13 |Full Grain Leather Belt, Black, with no bid
Gold or Silver Buckle
Duty Man 1611T 1 ea $ 18.95 $18.95 $ 19.90 $19.90
Approved Equal 1 ea
14 |Women's Station Uniform Pants, no bid

Midnight Navy




Elbeco TEK3 4-Pocket Domestic Pants ea 38.95 $38.95 38.90 $42.90
Approved Equal ea

15 |Women's Cargo Trousers, Midnight no bid
Navy
511+ Tactical Series Cargo Pants, ea 52.95 $52.95 42.90 $45.90
Women's Stryke PDU Cargo Pant B Class
Approved Equal ea

16 |Dress Pants, LAPD Navy no bid
Flying Cross 38200 ea 37.95 $37.95 34.90 $38.90

17 |Class A Dress Coat Officer no bid
Flying Cross Style 17B8696C ea 317.90 $349.90
Alternative ea 167.95 $167.95

18 |Class A Dress Coat FF/Eng. no bid
Flying Cross 38804 ea 119.90 $131.90
Alternative ea 95.95 $95.95

19 |Reverse High-Visibility Jacket no bid
Flying Cross 73160A ea 118.90 $130.90
Alternative ea 104.95 $104.95

TOTAL




