OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
CITY OF KNOXVILLE, TENNESSEE

BID TABULATION FORM

DATE: August 9, 2022 TITLE: ITB - Tennis Court, Pickleball Court & Basketball Court Maintenance at
Multiple Sites
DEPARTMENT: Parks & Recreation

. . Non-Collusion | Child Crime | Drug Free Iran DBE Option
BIDDERS Bid Form/Price Affidavit Affidavit Affidavit | Divestment A or B?
ocatio Bid P $
(11) tennis courts at West Hills Park $221,342.00 v v v v B
(1) basketball court at West Hills Park $24,505.00
(6) pickleball courts at West Hills Park $49,010.00
(2) ¥2 size basketball courts at Skyline Park $21,183.00
(1) tennis court at Skyline Park $25,090.00
(2) tennis courts at Edgewood Park $35,555.00
TOTAL BID PRICE $367,685.00

Holm Court, LLC.

Optional Locations Bid Price

(2) basketball courts at William Powell Park $21,931.00
(1) basketball court at Frajan Campbell Park | $13,533.00
(1) basketball court at Babe Ruth Park $13,247.00
(1) basketball court at Whitlow Logan Park $13,664.00
(1) basketball court Baxter Avenue Park 511,505.00
(2) basketball courts at Cecil Webb Park $23,517.00

3) basketball courts at Harriet Tubman Park | $34,422.00
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Location Bid Price
(11) tennis courts at West Hills Park $98,417.00 v v v v B
(1) basketball court at West Hills Park No Bid o o o
(6) pickleball courts at West Hills Park $22,312.00
(2) 2 size basketball courts at Skyline Park No Bid
(1) tennis court at Skyline Park No Bid
(2) tennis courts at Edgewood Park $16,277.00
Baseline Sports TOTAL BID PRICE $137,006.00

Construction, LLC Optional Locations Bid Price
(2) basketball courts at William Powell Park $11,204.00
(1) basketball court at Frajan Campbell Park | $5,296.00

(1) basketball court at Babe Ruth Park No Bid

(1) basketball court at Whitlow Logan Park No Bid

(1) basketball court Baxter Avenue Park $5,004.00
(2) basketball courts at Cecil Webb Park $16,927.00

(3) basketball courts at Harriet Tubman Park | $37,580.00




Location Bid Price
(11) tennis courts at West Hills Park $88,000.00
(1) basketball court at West Hills Park $7,500.00
(6) pickleball courts at West Hills Park $16,200.00
(2) 2 size basketball courts at Skyline Park $7,500.00
(1) tennis court at Skyline Park $8,00.00
(2) tennis courts at Edgewood Park $16,00.00
Sport Surface Pros, LLC. | "TOTAL BID PRICE $143,200.00

Optional Locations Bid Price
(2) basketball courts at William Powell Park $9,500.00
(1) basketball court at Frajan Campbell Park | $7,500.00
(1) basketball court at Babe Ruth Park $5,000.00
(1) basketball court at Whitlow Logan Park $3,000.00
(1) basketball court Baxter Avenue Park $3,000.00
(2) basketball courts at Cecil Webb Park $16,800.00
(3) basketball courts at Harriet Tubman Park | $21,000.00

I CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE TABULATION OF THE PROPOSALS THAT WERE RECEIVED %
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