AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS

ITB 16-019
BASIC LIFE SUPPORT SUPPLIES

Bid opening: 3/10/16

BASE FOR AWARD

Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 440003 1440003 Each $0.0960 96/cs $9.22 1
Midwest Medical Supply Dynarex 3103 DYN3103 Each $0.0966 12/bg 8bg/cs $9.27 2
Bound Tree Medical Dukal 8518 276-8515BG Each $0.1092 12rl/bg 8bg/cs | $10.48 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Covidien 2244 8907242 Each $0.2900 Each $0.29 4
Moore Medical Dukal 703 73979 Each $0.3100 12/bg 8bg/cs $29.76 5
2 1" hypo-allergenic cloth tape ! & e
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 705211 1705211 Each $0.5800 144/cs $83.52 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Dynarex 3562 4990655 Each $0.6100 Each $0.61 2
Midwest Medical Supply Dynarex 3562 DYN3562 Each $0.6600 12/bx 12 bx/cs | $95.04 3
Bound Tree Medical Dynarex 3562 F165631 Each $0.6650 12/bx 12bx/cs $95.76 4
Moore Medical Covidien 7138C 17530 Each $0.9000 12/bx 10bx/cs $108.00 5
3 3" hypo-allergenic cloth tape ' ’
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 705213 1705213 Each $1.7400 48/cs $83.52 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Dynarex 3564 4990699 Each $1.8200 Each $1.82 '
Midwest Medical Supply Dynarex 3564 DYN3564 Each $1.9800 4/bx 12 bx/cs $95.04 3
Bound Tree Medical Dynarex 3564 F165633 Each $1.9950 4/bx 12bx/cs $95.76 4 o
Moore Medical Covidien 7140 74281 Each $3.3500 4/bx 10bx/cs $134.00 5
4 1" Band-Aids 3
Midwest Medical Supply ASO CBD2019-012-000 | ASOCBD2019-012-000 Each $0.0113 100/bx 12 bx/cs | $13.56 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 880113 1880113 Each $0.0130 2400/cs $31.20 2
Bound Tree Medical Dynarex 3602 083602 Each $0.0149 100/bx 24bx/cs = $35.76 3
Moore Medical Moore 68181 68181 Each $0.0213 100/bx 12bx/cs | $25.56 4
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Henry Schein, Inc. Johnson 5555844 $0.0400
Moore Medical Moore 68183 68183 Each $0.0310 100/bx 12bx/cs | $37.20 1
Midwest Medical Supply ASO CBD2016-012-000 | ASOCBD2016-012-001 | Each $0.0420 50/bx 12 bx/cs | $25.20 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 880124 188124 Each $0.0440 1200/cs $52.80 3
Bound Tree Medical Dynarex 3634 F165601 Each $0.0596 50/bx 24 bx/cs | $71.52 4
Henry Schein, Inc. Johnson 5716 5550446 Each $0.1200 Each $0.12 5
A oA e e e T e T ,
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 777590 1777590 Each $0.0660 400/cs $26.40 1
Moore Medical Moore 13876 13876 Each $0.0668 25/bx 16bx/cs | $26.72 2
Midwest Medical Supply Dynarex 3501 DYN3501 Each $0.0760 20/bx 20 bx/cs | $30.40 3
Bound Tree Medical Dukal 5590 085590 Each $0.0864 25/bx 16bx/cs $34.56 4
Henry Schein, Inc. Dukal 5590 1202048 Each $0.1000 Each $0.10 5
/ 4"x4", 4-ply sterile sponges : = it
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 251444 1251444 Each $0.0220 1200/cs $26.40 1
© Midwest Medical Supply Ardes H44421 EMPH44421 Each $0.0230 JRRISPT 27,60 2
Henry Schein, Inc. Dukal 1048665 1048665 Each $0.0300 Each $0.03 3
Moore Medical Covidien 8044 67081 Each $0.0444 50/bx 24bx/cs $53.28 4
Bound Tree Medical Dukal 7454SP 276-7454SP Each $0.0447 100/bx 8 bx/cs | $35.79 5
8 4"x4", 8-ply unsterile sponges
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 448111 1448111 Each $0.0080 4000/cs $32.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply Ardes GA44820 EMPGA44820 Each $0.0081 200/bx 20bx/cs $32.40- B 2
~ Bound Tree Medical Dukal 8509 276-8509BG Each $0.0132 | 200/bx 20bx/cs = $52.60 3
Moore Medical Moore 12278 12278 Each $0.0160 | 200/pk 20pk/cs | $63.80 4
Henry Schein, Inc. Dukal 1048194 1048194 Each ‘ $0.0206 i Each $0.02 %g
9 2” x 2", 12 ply sterile gauze pads .
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 221201 1221201 Each $0.0180 2400/cs $43.20 1 |
B Midwest Medical Supply Dynarex 3352 DYN3352 Each $0.0199 A 100/bx 24 bx/cs | $47.76 2 |
Moore Medical Moore 08250 08250 Each $0.0257 100/bx 24 bx/cs | $61.68 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Dukal 1004380 1004380 Each $0.0300 Each $0.03 4 |
Bound Tree Medical Medline PRM21419 0475 Each $0.0300 100/bx 24 bx/cs | $72.00 4
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Midwest Medical Supply Medsource MS-11050 MSOMS-11050 Each $0.1900 12/bx 20 bx/cs | $45.60 1
Moore Medical Cypress 59950 92750 Each $0.2100 240/cs $50.40 2
Bound Tree Medical Medsource STORM-11050 1124-03680 Each $0.2300 240/cs $55.20 3
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 404056 1404056 Each $0.2700 240/cs $64.80 4
Henry Schein, Inc. Dukal CTB40 1209201 Each $0.3300 Each $0.33 5
11 Adult multigrip head immobilizer No substitutions i Seeaw i L ' o
Henry Schein, Inc. I-TEC 101 8653602 Each $3.8600 Each $3.86 1
Moore Medical I-TEC 101 71443 Each $3.9300 50/cs $196.50 2
Bound Tree Medical I-TEC 101 261234 Each $4.3500 Each $4.35 3
Midwest Medical Supply I-TEC 101 ITE101 Each $4.5000 50/cs $225.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS I-TEC 101 No bid
12 Child multigrip head immobilizer No substitutions
Henry Schein, Inc. I-TEC 102 8655190 Each $3.8600 Each $3.86 1
Moore Medical I-TEC 102 76588 Each $3.9300 50/cs $196.50 2
Bound Tree Medical I-TEC 102 26102 Each $4.3500 Each $4.35 3
Midwest Medical Supply I-TEC 102 ITE102 Each $4.5000 50/cs $225.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS I-TEC 102 No bid
13 7 ft. Oxygen cannula - adult with curved tip
Henry Schein, Inc. Ningbo C0209 9007036 Each $0.1900 Each $0.19 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 999308 1999308 Each $0.2350 50/cs $11.75 2
Midwest Medical Supply Ventlab 1007 VEN1007 Each $02500 | S0/cs | $12.50 3
Moore Medical Med Tech MTR-24002 14046 Each $0.2700 50/cs $13.50 4
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm ME7407 30050 Each $02700 | S0/cs | $13.50 4
14 7 ft. Oxygen cannula - pediatric with curved tip :
Henry Schein, Inc. Ningbo C0202 9007034 Each $0.1900 Each $0.19 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 999312 1999312 Each $0.2350 50/cs ~ $11.75 2
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm ME7407C 30056 Each $0.2700 50/cs $13.50 3
Midwest Medical Supply Ventlab 1207 VEN1207 Each $0.3600 50/cs $18.00 4
Moore Medical Unomedical 331-E 82280 Each $0.7300 Each $0.73 5
Each
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Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 999107 1999107 Each $0.6250 50/cs $31.25 1
Midwest Medical Supply Ventlab 2101 VEN2101 Each $0.6400 50/cs $32.00 2
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm ME7409-1V 30051 Each $0.6700 50/cs $33.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Medsource MS25060 4996737 Each $0.8000 Each $0.80 4
Hudson RCI 1060 50799 Each $0.9400 50/cs $47.00 5
.  use restraint straps; 2 piece 2" x5' e 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 293305 1293305 Each $1.3700 72/cs $98.64 1
Midwest Medical Supply DMS 47152 DKM47152 Each $1.5200 Each $1.52 2
Bound Tree Medical DMS 47152PR-sft B0124 Each $1.7100 36/cs $61.56 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Morrison 13900R-SET 4997057 Each $2.1000 Each $2.10 4
Moore Medical Dick Medical Supply | 48333 48333 Each $4.3200 36/cs $155.52 5
17 Disposable fitted sheets for stretcher; white; 30"x72" No sbustitutions :
Bound Tree Medical Allcare EF600 114250 Each $0.8790 50/cs $43.95 1
Midwest Medical Supply Allcare EF600 ALCEF600 Each $0.9500 50/cs $47.50 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Allcare EF600 No bid "
Moore Medical Allcare EF600 No bid
Henry Schein, Inc. ADI Medical gf;gg 4992507 $0.7600 50/cs $38.00 Reject
18 Fluid resistant flat sheets; dark blue
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 388401B 13884018B Each $0.3500 50/cs $17.50 1
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm ME1903-MG031 14068 Each $0.3746 | 50/cs | $18.73 2
Moore Medical - Moore o 77016 77016”4 - Each | $0.3840 I SOV/ESA » $_1“‘EA)5(‘) ‘ 7?;7 :
Henry Schein, Inc. ADI 36701 4677310 Each $0.7400 Each $S0.74 4
Midwest Medical Supply Graham 65232 GRA652320 Each $0.8900 50/cs k $44.50 5
19 ‘Multi-trauma dressing 10x30 :
Moore Medical Moore 13874 13874 Each $0.5000 25/cs $12.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 771030 1771030 Each $0.6200 50/cs . $31.00 2
Midwest Medical Supply Medsource MS-G2M001 MSOMS-G2MO001 | Each $0.7300 25/cs $18.25 3
Bound Tree Medical Medline NON21459 536-NON21459EA | Each $0.7600 50/cs $38.00 4
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Henry Schein, Inc.

Dukal

3050

BASE FOR AWARD

$1.4400

20 Regulator Brass w/2 50psi ports 1-25 lpm LSP Rhino

e

AREG8725-B2D

MEPAREG8725-B2D

$29.5800

$29.58

Midwest Medical Supply Meret Each Each 1
Moore Medical Meret EMSREG8725B2D | 95188 Each $72.6700 Each $72.67 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 870225BR 1870225BR Each $89.8900 Each $89.89 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Allied 6370-220-4 611-4342 Each $164.9400 Each $164.94 4
Bound Tree Medical Allied L370-220-A 380021B Each $195.4800 Each $195.48 5
21 7ft. non-rebreathing mask with check valve - child e S R o
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 999110 1999110 Each $0.6300 50/cs $31.50 1
Midwest Medical Supply Ventlab 2201 VEN2201 Each $0.6700 50/cs $33.50 2
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm ME7410 30053 Each $0.6800 50/cs $34.00 3
Moore Medical Husdon RCI 1058 50808 Each $0.9300 50/cs $46.50 4
Henry Schein, Inc. Medsource MS25058 4996154 Each $1.0900 Each $1.09 5
22 7 ft. oxygen mask - high concentration infant
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 999120 1999120 Each $0.7200 50/cs $36.00 1
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm ME74101-1V 30058 Each $0.8900 50/cs $44.50 2
Moore Medical Uno Medical 3266E B 83031 Each $1.5000 50/cs $75.00 3
Midwest Medical Supply Teleflex 395497 TEL395497 Each $3.4100 50/cs $170.50 4
Henry Schein, Inc. Rusch 395497 8269995 Each $4.4000 | Fach $4.40 5
23 Ambu-Spur Il resuscitator mask, adult No substitutions
Bound Tree Medical AMBU 520-211-000 2442-52002 Each $9.1000 Each $9.10
Henry Schein, Inc. AMBU 520211000 | 4793940 Each $9.1100 | Each $9.11 B
Moore Medical AMBU 520211000 | 81050 Each $9.4200 | 12/cs s11304 |
» Midwest Medical Supply AMBU 520-211-000 | AMB520-211-0000 | Each $10.8100 | 12/cs $129.72 R
B Nashville Med. & EMS AMBU 520-211-000 Each Nobid ”
24 Ambu-Spur Il resuscitator mask, infant/child No substitutions &
Henry Schein, Inc. AMBU 530-212-000 4996431 Each $12.0800 Each $12.08 1
Moore Medical AMBU 530-212-000 81051 Each $12.5400 12/cs $150.48 2
Bound Tree Medical AMBU 530-212-000 065-530212000EA | Each $13.4500 ‘ Each $13.45 3
Midwest Medical Supply AMBU 530-212-000 AMB530-212-0000 | Each $13.5800 ' 12/cs $162.96 4
Nashville Med. & EMS AMBU 530-212-000 Each No bid
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ko

SRR A

BASE FOR AWARD

Midwest Medical Supply

Graham

54849

GRA652320

$1.0000

25/cs

Each $25.00 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 886657 1886657 Each $1.1100 25/cs $27.75 2
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm STORM-B300 16570 Each $1.8500 24/cs $44.40 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Allcare EB100 4990413 Each $2.8800 Each $2.88 4
Moore Medical Med-Tech 17570 Each $3.5900 18/cs $64.62 5
26 Disposable suction canisters, 1200 CC No substitutions par s G 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Bemis 484410 Each $2.7300 48/cs $131.04 1
Midwest Medical Supply Bemis 484410 BEMA484410 Each $2.7800 48/cs $133.44 2
Bound Tree Medical Bemis 484410 598041 Each $2.8600 48/cs $137.28 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Bemis 484410 1169264 Each $2.8900 48/cs $138.72 4
Moore Medical Bemis 484410 53554 Each $2.9300 48/cs $140.64 5
27  Universal suction tubing 1/4" x 100' : i
Midwest Medical Supply Conmed 0048260 CON0048260 Each $10.7100 Each $10.71 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Covidien 8888280412 8900941 Each $11.7600 Each $11.76 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 993334 1993334 Each $12.9900 Each $12.99 3
Bound Tree Medical Cardinal 516500 8010200 Each $280875 | 4fcs | $11235 | 4
Moore Medical Each No bid
28 Large-bore suction catheter with thumb control - Yankaur only
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 887710 1887710 Each $0.3100 50/cs $15.50 1
Midwest Medical Supply Dynarex 4690 DYN4690 Each $0.3400 50/cs $17.00 2
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm MS-YK10 533-MS-YK10EA Each $0.5100 50/cs $25.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Motion HS101 1064698 Each $1.9600 Each $1.96 4
Moore Medical Each No bid -
29 Cold packs
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 561112 1561112 Each $0.2300~ 48/cs $11.04 1
Henry Schein, Inc. GAM - 612-00109824 4990814 ’. Each $0.2700 Each $0.27 2
Moore Medical : Cypress 97-02 81854 Each $0.1800 3/bx 8bx/cs $4.32 3
Bound Tree Medical Dynarex 4511 4313 Each $0.2600 24/cs $6.24 4
- Dynarex 4512 DYN4512 Each $0.3900 24/cs $9.36 5
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Midwest Medical Supply

Graham Field

4109-LF

G/F4109-LF

BASE FOR AWARD

$0.0660

250/cs

$16.50

Each 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 901100 1901100 Each $0.0730 100/cs $7.30 2
Bound Tree Medical Adi Medical 10920 1880-92078 Each $0.0795 100/bx 10 bx/cs | $79.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Avcor 18679 8370006 Each $0.1600 Each $0.16 4
Moore Medical Graham Medical 36648 90037 Each $0.1600 500/cs $80.00 4
31 Plasticurinals | B ey - =
Midwest Medical Supply Medegen H140-01 ACTH140-01 Each $0.3500 50/cs $17.50 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Avcor 14140-01 1004606 Each $0.4300 Each $0.43 2
Bound Tree Medical Medegen H140H-01 721-H140H-01EA | Each $0.4400 50/cs $22.00 3
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 201103 1201103 Each $0.4700 50/cs $23.50 4
Moore Medical Medgen H140D-01 88903 Each $0.4800 50/cs $24.00 5
32  Disposable sterile burn sheets % : ‘
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 888111 1888111 Each $1.3900 24/cs $33.36 1
Midwest Medical Supply Medsource MS-BS0033 MSOMS-B50033 Each $1.6400 50/cs $82.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. Allcare B6100 4993574 Each $1.7300 | Each $1.73 3
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm STORM-BS0033 | 30061MS Each $1.9900 Each $1.99 4
Moore Medical Roehampten 63456 Each $5.6800 24/cs $136.32 5
33 Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; small No substitutions
Henry Schein, Inc. Henry Schein 1118535 1118535 100 Each $3.8500 1000/cs $38.50 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Henry Schein 1118535 1118535 No bid
B Moore Medical Henry Schein 1118535 1118535 No bid ]
Bound Tree Medical Henry Schein 1118535 1118535 No bid ]
Midwest Medical Supply Henry Schein 1118535 1118535 | Nobid ]
34 Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; medium No substitutions
Henry Schein, Inc. Henry Schein 1118536 1118536 100 Each $3.8400 1000/cs $38.40 1
. Nashville Med. & EMS Henry Schein | 1118536 1118536 No bid
Moore Medical Henry Schein | 1118536 1118536 No bid T
Bound Tree Medical Henry Schein 1118536 1118536 No bid ]
Midwest Medical Supply Henry Schein 1118536 1118536 No bid
35  Criterion powder-free nitrile gloves; large No substitutions
Henry Schein, Inc. Henry Schein ] 1118537 1118537 100 Each $3.8400 1000/cs $38.40 [ 1
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Nashville Med. & EMS

Henr chein

1118537

1118537

BASE FOR AWARD

No bid

Moore Medical Henry Schein 1118537 1118537 No bid
Bound Tree Medical Henry Schein 1118537 1118537 No bid
Midwest Medical Supply Henry Schein 1118537 1118537 No bid
Henry Schein, Inc. Henry Schein 1118539 1118539 100 Each $3.8400 1000/cs $38.40 1
Nashville Med. & EMS Henry Schein 1118539 1118539 No bid
Moore Medical Henry Schein 1118539 1118539 No bid
Bound Tree Medical Henry Schein 1118539 1118539 No bid
Midwest Medical Supply Henry Schein 1118539 1118539 No bid
37 Powder-free nitrile medical exam gloves; xx-large - e bt : :
Moore Medical Microflex N855 20087 100 Each $5.5000 100/bx 10 bx/cs | $55.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply IHC 182400 INNI82400 100 Each $7.7920 1000/cs $77.92 2
Henry Schein, Inc. Microflex MK-296-XXL 5654216 100 Each $8.6500 1000/cs $86.50 3
Nashville Med. & EMS 100 Each No bid
Bound Tree Medical 100 Each No bid
38 Bio-Hazardous red bags; 5 gallon
Bound Tree Medical Medegen F116 290116 Each $0.0800 500/cs $40.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply Medgen 116 ACT116 Each $0.1000 500/cs $50.00 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 09801 109801 Each $0.1100 200/cs $22.00 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Medical Action 50-42 609-1889 Each $0.1200 Each $0.12 4
Moore Medical Unimed 5-21RMDP20 88720 Each $0.1535 20/pk 10pk/cs | $30.70 5
39 Bio-Hazardous red bags; 30 gallon
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 333901 1333901 Each $0.1500 250/cs $37.50 1
Bound Tree Medical Medline NONHDR43 | 290037 Each $0.1600 | 250/cs ' $40.00 2
Henry Schein, Inc. - Medical Action 44-05 - 6024938 Each $0.1706W' Eacﬁ - $0.17 3
Moore Medical Medeger; F117 28856 Each $0.i'8_9§h 1 250/cs - $47.33hw 4
Midwest Medical Supply Medgen 117 ACT117 Each $0.2100 250/cs $52.50 5
40 StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); pediatric No substitutions
Bound Tree Medical Laerdal 260202 980200 Each $4.3500 Each $4.35 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Laerdal 260202 2206020 Each $4.6900 Each $4.69 2
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Moore Medical

Laerdal

260202

48530

Each

BASE FOR AWARD

$4.7200

50/cs

$236.00

Midwest Medical Supply Laerdal 260202 LAE980200 Each $4.8000 50/cs $240.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Laerdal 260202 Each $5.8900 Each $5.89 5
Stffeck cervical immobilization device (CID); regular No subsituti ST s
Bound Tree Medical Laerdal 260205 980500 Each $4.3500 Each $4.35 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Laerdal 260205 2204171 Each $4.6900 Each $4.69 2
Moore Medical Laerdal 260205 15621 Each $4.7200 50/cs $236.00 3
Midwest Medical Supply Laerdal 260205 LAE980500 Each $4.8000 50/cs $240.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Laerdal 260205 Each $5.8900 Each $5.89 5
42 stiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); tall No substitutions e e ‘
Henry Schein, Inc. Laerdal 260206 980650 Each $2.1700 Each $2.17 1
Bound Tree Medical Laerdal 260206 260206 Each $4.3500 Each $4.35 2
Moore Medical Laerdal 260206 16158 Each $4.7200 50/cs $236.00 3
Midwest Medical Supply Laerdal 260206 LAE980600 Each $4.8000 50/cs $240.00 4
i Nashville Med. & EMS Laerdal 260206 Each | $58900 | Each $5.89 5
43 StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); short No substitutions
Bound Tree Medical Laerdal 260204 980400 Each $4.3500 Each $4.35 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Laerdal 260204 980400 Each $4.6900 Each $4.69 2
Moore Medical Laerdal 260204 15622 Each $47200 | 50/cs | $236.00 | 3
- Midwest Medical Supply Laerdal 260204 B LAE980400 Each $4.8000 50/cs o SEA0.00 M;l
Nashville Med. & EMS Laerdal 260204 Each $5.8900 Each $5.89 5
44 StiffNeck cervical immobilization device (CID); no neck No substitutions
Bound Tree Medical Laerdal 260201 980100 Each $4.3500 Each $4.35 1
-  Henry Schein, Inc. Laerdal 260201 2202123 | Each | $4.6900 | Each $469 | 2
Moore Medical Laerdal 260201 48535 | Fach | $47200 | S0/cs | $23600 | 3
| Midwest Medical Supply Laerdal 260201 | LAE980300 | Each $4.8000 | 50/cs | $24000 | 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Laerdal 260201 | Each $5.8900 | Each | $589 | 5 |
45 Bio-Hoop collection bag with hook No substitutions
Moore Medical Haetwell BH1100H 47681 Each $1.4958 12/bx 40 bx/cs | $717.98 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Haetwell BH1100H Each $1.5000 480/cs $720.00 2
Midwest Medical Supply Haetwell BH1100H HTMBH1100H Each $1.6100 480/cs $772.80 3
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Bound Tree Medical Haetwell BH1100H 440101 Each $1.6233 480/cs $779.20 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Haetwell BH1100H No bid
ble strap foam limi tandard foam No substitutions
Midwest Medical Supply Posey 2;; P0OS2528 $4.5800 Each 1
Bound Tree Medical Posey 2528 660543 Each $5.1900 Each $5.19 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Posey 2528 No bid
Moore Medical Posey 2528 No bid |
Henry Schein, Inc. Posey ;ﬁﬁ 4490588 Each $2.6500 Each $2.65 Reject
47 Pediatric IV arm board, padded B s SR B %
Midwest Medical Supply Precision 45004-11-MPG | PRD45004-11-MPG | Each $0.5100 100/cs $51.00 1
Moore Medical Morrison 005-50 55347 Each $0.5900 50/cs $29.50 2
Henry Schein, Inc. Precision 45010-11-MPF 4963343 Each $0.6100 Each $0.61 3
Bound Tree Medical Morrison 1005-50 56-1005EA Each $0.8100 50/cs $40.50 4
Nashville Med. & EMS No bid
48 12" Cardboard Splints w/Foam Padding Case
Nashville Med. & EMS Dick Medical DMS61012MCF | DMS61012MCF Each $0.6900 36/cs $24.84 1
Midwest Medical Supply DMS 61012MGF DKM61012MCF Each $0.7000 36/cs $25.20 2
Bound Tree Medical DMS 61012FF 660001 Each $1.0800 Each $1.08 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Morrison 1507-25 2205483 Each $1.5400 Each $1.54 4 i
Moore Medical Tech Med 79686 Each $1.8100 20/cs $36.20 5 |
49 24" Cardboard Splints w/Foam Padding Case
Nashville Med. & EMS Dick Medical DMS61024MCF | DMS61024MCF Each $1.1900 36/cs $42.84 1
44444 * Midwest Medical Supply DMS | 61024MCF DKM61024MCF | Each | $1.1900 | 36/cs | 4284 2
Bound Tree Medical DMS 1 61024FF 660003 Each $1.5900 Each $1.59 3 |
o Henry Schein, Inc. Morrison 1560-20 2205819 Each $2.4100 v Each $2.41 4 |
Moore Medical Tech Med 79687 Each $3.1400 20/cs $62.80 5
50 Sprague Rappaport Style Stethoscope :
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 104410 1104410 Each $4.3900 20/cs $87.80 1
Midwest Medical Supply Veridian 05-11001 VRD05-11001 Each $4.5400 50/cs $227.00 2
Moore Medical Moore 66248 66248 Each $5.7100 20/cs $114.20 3
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Henry Schein, Inc. Tech-Med 1305 1002892 Each $6.4600 Each $6.46 4
Bound Tree Medical Briggs 10-414-160 508-10-414-160 Each $7.9600 Each $7.96
Mooremm Tyvek 122S Each $4.4924 25/cs $112.31 1
Bound Tree Medical Tyvek 122S 31710467 Each $5.4316 25/cs $135.79 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Tyvek 1228 No bid
Midwest Medical Supply Tyvek 122s No bid
Henry Schein, Inc. ::::::;n d -::-TzﬁM-XL 7001053 Each $2.4900 Each $2.49 Reject
Moore Medical Safetec 17350 55123 Each $0.9100 24/cs $21.84 1
Henry Schein, Inc. Safetec 17350 4223880 Each $0.9700 24/cs $23.28 2
Midwest Medical Supply Safetec 17350 SAF17350 Each $1.0900 24/cs $26.16 3
Bound Tree Medical Safetec 17350 R3119 Each $1.1300 24/cs $27.12 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Safetec 17350 Each No bid
53  Blood pressure cuff; blue, adult No subs itution e : T

Bound Tree Medical ADC 760-11AN 170765 Each $15.6500 Each $15.65 1
Midwest Medical Supply ADC 760-11AN AME760-11AN Each $15.8800 Each $15.88 2 o
Nashville Med. & EMS ADC 760-11AN No bid
Moore Medical ADC 760-11AN No bid
Henry Schein, Inc. ADC zgg;:AN 4990742 Each $5.6900 Each $5.69 Reject

54 Blood pressure cuff; blue, child No substitutions
Henry Schein, Inc. ADC 760-9CN 4997943 Each $14.8900 Each $14.89 1
Bound Tree Medical ADC 760-9CN 1330 Each $15.6500 Each $15.65 2
Midwest Medical Supply ADC 760-9CN AME760-9CN Each $15.8800 | Each | s15.88 3
Nashville Med. & EMS ADC 760-9CN No bid
Moore Medical ADC 760-9CN No bid

55  Blood pressure cuff; blue, infant No substitutions
Henry Schein, Inc. ADC 760-7IN 4997943 Each $14.8900 Each $14.89 1
Bound Tree Medical ADC 760-7IN 1366 Each $15.6500 Each $15.65 2
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Midwest Medical Supply ADC 760-7IN AME760-7IN Each $15.8800 Each $15.88
Nashville Med. & EMS ADC 760-7IN No bid
Moore Medical ADC 760-7IN No bid
56 Boodpresswecuffblue, adultlarge Nosubstitutions =
Henry Schein, Inc. ADC 760-12XN 4260018 Each $18.3200 Each $18.32 1
Midwest Medical Supply ADC 760-12XN AME760-12XN Each $19.3100 | Each $19.31 2
Bound Tree Medical ADC 760-12XN 1331 Each $20.6900 | Each $20.69 3
Nashville Med. & EMS ADC 760-12XN No bid
ADC 760-12XN No bid
B. Braun R5000-01 G0912 Each $1.7800 16/cs $28.48 1

Midwest Medical Supply B. Braun R5000-01 BBMR5000-01 Each $2.3400 16/cs $37.44 2
Moore Medical Baxter 2F7114 13935 Each $2.4000 12/cs $28.80 3
Henry Schein, Inc. B. Braun : R5000-01 5075000 Each $6.0000 Each $6.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Each No bid

58 Sterile Water, 500 ml bottles v v '
Bound Tree Medical B. Braun R5001-01 355001 Each $1.6300 16/cs $26.08 1
Midwest Medical Supply Nurse Assist 6290 WEL6290 Each $1.8900 18/cs $34.02 2
Moore Medical Baxter 2F7113 15071 Each $2.2600 18/cs $40.68 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Baxter 2F7113 1530102 Each $11.4400 Each $11.44 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Each No bid W

59  Sterile Water, 250 ml bottles : :
Midwest Medical Supply Nurse Assist 6260 WEL6260 Each $1.5900 24/cs $38.16 1
Moore Medical Baxter 2F7112 45311 Each $2.2400 24/cs A $53.76 2“-””‘
Bound Tree Medical Baxter 2F7112 607112 | Each $26500 | 24/cs | $63.60 3
Henry Schein, Inc. B Baxter” - 2F7112 1536483 i Each $11.8800 lgéﬂc_h iiiii $11.88 o 4 R
Nashville Med. & EMS Each No bid T

60 Technol PFR 95 Respirator — Regular No substitutions
Moore Medical Kimberly Clark 46727 73320 Each $0.5857 35/bx 6bx/cs $123.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply Kimberly Clark 46727 KC46727 Each $0.6050 35/bx 6 bx/cs $127.05 2
Bound Tree Medical Kimberly Clark 46727 299170 Each $0.6714 35/cs $23.50 3
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Henry Schein, Inc. Kimberly Clark 46727 1531074 Each $0.7000 Each $0.70 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Kimberly Clark 46727 Each No bid
 Technol PFR 95 Respirator - Small No Substitution: e e SR e

Moore Medical Kimberly Clark 46827 73270 Each $0.5857 35/bx 6 bx/cs $123.00 1
Midwest Medical Supply Kimberly Clark 46827 KC46827 Each $0.6050 35/bx 6 bx/cs $127.05 2
Bound Tree Medical Kimberly Clark 46827 299174 Each $0.6714 35/cs $23.50 3
Henry Schein, Inc. Kimberly Clark 46827 1534801 Each $0.7000 Each $0.70 4
Nashville Med. & EM Kimberly Clark Each No bid
Henry Schein, Inc. Iron Duck 35755 3874094 Each $136.7100 Each $136.71 1
Bound Tree Medical Iron Duck 35755 265776 Each $144.2500 Each $144.25 2
Moore Medical Iron Duck 35755 75402 Each $146.0100 | Each $146.01 3
Midwest Medical Supply Iron Duck 35755 IRO35755 Each $162.6600 Each $162.66 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Iron Duck 35755 No bid

63  Thermal Blankets ;
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 886658 1886658 Each $0.4300 250/cs $107.50 1
Midwest Medical Supply Dukal 721 DUK721 Each $0.4300 250/cs $107.50 2
Bound Tree Medical Medstorm ME1709-MG031 | 12945 Each $0.4500 200/cs $90.00 3
Moore Medical Moore 11584 11584 Each $0.5000 150/cs $75.00 4
Henry Schein, Inc. Calerdon 301N-Ther 5083902 Each $10.0400 Each $10.04 5

64  Sam Splint, 36" roll No substitutions : '
Henry Schein, Inc. SAM MEDICAL W-SP1121 3601359 Each $6.3500 Each $6.35 1
Moore Medical SAM MEDICAL W-SP1121 53884 Each $6.5000 | 60/cs $395.40 | 2
Bound Tree Medical SAM MEDICAL W-SP1121 661121 Each $7.2800 Each $7.28 3
Midwest Medical Supply SAM MEDICAL W-SP1121 SMM1121 Each $8.0500 60/cs $483.00 4
Nashville Med. & EMS SAM MEDICAL W-SP1121 No bidw - N

65 OB Kits - Soft Pack ; »
Nashville Med. & EMS Kentron 999700 1999700 Each $4.1900 10/cs $41.90 1
Midwest Medical Supply Motion Med 1702 MMD1705 Each $4.7800 10/cs $47.80 2
Bound Tree Medical Motion Med 1721 540-1721EA Each $4.9800 Each $4.98 3
Moore Medical Busse 388 68221 Each $5.7900 10/cs $57.90 4
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Henry Schein, Inc.

650-4001-0000

3262005

BASE FOR AWARD

$6.0700

s S

Henry Schein, Inc. Attaire 175-35 1101011 Each $1.1000 Each $1.10 1
Moore Medical Attaire 175-35 75519 Each $1.2100 36/cs $43.56 2
Nashville Med. & EMS Medique 19818 19818 Each $1.8900 48/cs $94.50 3
Bound Tree Medical Cardinal 5205083 6491-20 Each $1.8900 Each $1.89 3
Midwest Medical Supply Medique 198-18 TEX198-18 Each $1.9200 48/cs 4
Moore Medical O-Two 01CVv0211 14940 Each $31.0000 10/cs $310.00 1
Henry Schein, Inc. O-Two DEV0212CS 4998524 Each $32.6500 Each $32.65 2
Midwest Medical Supply O-Two 01CVv0211-CS 0TMO01CV0211-CS Each $41.6500 10/cs $416.50 3
Bound Tree Medical O-Two 01CV0211-CS 2430-21103 Each $44.7500 10/cs $447.50 4
Nashville Med. & EMS Each No bid
68 Flow Safe Il CPAP w/sm AD w/ Intergral manometer and popoff No substitutions '

Nashville Med. & EMS Mercury Medical 10-57200 No bid

Henry Schein, Inc. Mercury Medical 10-57200 No bid

Moore Medical Mercury Medical 10-57200 No bid

Bound Tree Medical Mercury Medical 10-57200 No bid

Midwest Medical Supply Mercury Medical 10-57200 No bid

69  CAT Tourniquet No substitutions
Moore Medical North American 23140 93970 Each $23.6000 Each $23.60 1
Nashville Med. & EMS North American 23140 30-0001 Each $23.9500 Each $23.95 2
Midwest Medical Supply North American 23140 NAR30-0001 Each $25.6200 Each $25.62 3
Bound Tree Medical North American 23140 1880-13022 Each $26.9500 Each $26.95 4
Henry Schein, Inc. North American 23140 4997780 R Each $29.2300 Each $29.23 5 ]
REMAINDER OF THIS PAGE WAS LEFT BLANK INTENTIONALLY
14/15




BOUNDTREE MEDICAL LLC.
500 Tuttle Crossing Blvd. Dublin OH, 43016 800-533-0523 193018

HENRY SCHEIN, INC.
PO Box 3227, Irmo, SC 29063 800-845-3350 204153

MOORE MEDICAL, LLC.
1690 New Britan Ave., Farmington, CT 03032 800-234-1464 290841

MIDWEST MEDICAL SUPPLY CO.
13400 Lakefront Dr., Earth City, MO 63045 888-540-3232 199641

NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS, INC.
~ PO Box 64, Springfield, TN 37172

615-384-0576 . 863032

Local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the designation (LPA). Local Preference was not used to award this bid.
Southeastern Emergency Equipment's submittal arrived after the deadline, this Vendor is considered non-responsive and their bid is rejected.

Minor discrepanices between the case price on the submitted bid and the award are due to roundings.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO ALL VENDORS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY FOR THE BID PERIOD 04/01/2016 - 03/31/2017.

élam_ﬂ_@,wﬂ‘-\ 3-28-16
mes Duppenthaler, HCBCC Interim EMS Director Date

RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:

QM?/}/ZAVZ/U g;ﬁ/ it

June Fisger, HCBCC/County Administrator Daé

Tl

ielle Gilbert, HCBCC Purchasing Manager Date
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