

Project: Shoal Creek WWTP New Headworks and Pump Station
 Date: September 25, 2018 Time: 2:00 p.m.

Signature: Jason Graham
 Location: City of Griffin

Contractor Name	Addendum					Bid Bond	Bid Form	Qual Stmt		Base Bid	Alternates		Remarks
	#1	#2	#3	#4	#5						A1	A2	
Reynolds Construction, LLS Attn: Jeremy Cox 300 East Broad Street Fairburn, GA 30213 Phone: 770-969-4040 Fax: 770-969-4363									1	NO BID	A1	NO BID	
											A2	NO BID	
									2	NO BID	A3	NO BID	
											A4	NO BID	
									3	NO BID	A5	NO BID	
											A6	NO BID	
									Total	NO BID	A7	NO BID	
IHC Construction Companies, LLC Attn: Grady Higginbotham 15 Executive Dr Elgin, IL 60123 Phone: 847-742-1516 Fax: 847-742-6610									1	6,503,040.00	A1	12,000.00	
											A2	7,000.00	
									2	836,160.00	A3	256,650.00	
											A4	201,674.00	
									3	20,800.00	A5	No Bid	
											A6	23,000.00	
									Total	\$7,360,000.00	A7	12,000.00	
PF Moon and Company, Inc. Attn: Keith Steen 2207 Hwy 103 West Point, GA 31833 Phone: 706-643-1524 Fax: 706-645-1511									1	6,166,400.00	A1	14,000.00	
											A2	3000.00	
									2	561,600.00	A3	94,960.50	
											A4	No Bid	
									3	48,000.00	A5	No Bid	
											A6	31,000.00	
									Total	\$6,776,000.00	A7	27,300.00	
 Phone: Fax:									1		A1		
											A2		
									2		A3		
											A4		
									3		A5		
											A6		
									Total		A7		