ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT COMMERCIAL/RESIDENTIAL ABATEMENT PROJECTS

Vendor Registry Quote# EE LOT CLEANUPS/DEMOLITION 2021-02-23

Bids Due
Mandatory Walk-through

Open Date:  2/18/2021

Close Date: ' 5/26/2021

2/23/2021 beginning @ 8:30 a.m.

Larry Gates JRH WELT Meadows ANDALA Morris & Morris | Collins Land Service
BR Bonners Construction| CUSTOM DEMO Maintenance [ENTERPRISES, INC. Landscaping (CLS)
Project Address Bid Amount Bid Amount | Bid Amount | Bid Amount| Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount

1 1315 WARHOP LN NO BID NO BID NOBID | $ 3,479.00 [ $ 6,300.00 | $ 8,180.00 NO BID NO BID
2 406 BELMONT AVE $ 2,500.00 NOBID|$ 3,400.00 | $ 989.00 | $ 3,000.00 [ $ 3,170.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 2,200.00
3 200 W DETROIT BLVD S 2,000.00 NOBID | $ 2,950.00 NOBID [ $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,180.00 | $ 975.00 | $ 1,700.00
4 4600 BLK WHISPER WAY $ 3,500.00 NOBID | $ 2,100.00 NOBID [ $ 2,200.00 | $ 1,680.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,700.00
5 7140 WHIRLYBIRD AVE S 2,000.00 NOBID | $ 2,300.00 NOBID [ $ 2,700.00 | $ 2,880.00 | $ 2,432.00 | $ 1,450.00
6 1114 ARDEN ST $ 1,800.00 NOBID | $ 1,800.00 NOBID | $ 900.00 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 1,312.00 | $ 1,250.00
7 15 BAGGETT CT NO BID | $12,500.00 NO BID NOBID | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,400.00 NO BID NO BID
8 2219 N U ST. $ 2,500.00 NOBID | $ 2,600.00 NOBID [ $ 10,000.00 | $ 2,140.00 NOBID | $ 5,200.00
9 1306 BELAIR RD S 3,800.00 NOBID | $ 3,950.00 NOBID [ $ 5,700.00 | $ 3,240.00 | S 3,197.00 | $ 5,800.00
10 7 TALLADEGA TRL $ 5,800.00 NOBID | $ 3,800.00 | $ 6,300.01 |$ 7,000.00 [ $ 3,780.00 | $ 2,210.00 NO BID
11 5346 WALES AVE S 1,250.00 NOBID | $ 2,800.00 | $ 1,421.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 2,640.00 | $ 1,618.00 | $ 1,300.00
12 2832 MANDEVILLE LN $ 4,875.00 NOBID | $ 8,400.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $  4,000.00 NOBID | $ 5,121.00 | $ 4,800.00
13 4651 KINGSTON DR S 450.00 NOBID|S$S 900.00 | $ 763.00|S$ 275.00 NOBID | $ 975.00 | $ 500.00
14 311 CAMBORNE PL PULL PULL PULL PULL PULL NO BID NO BID PULL
15 11601 CHANTICLEER DR PULL PULL PULL PULL PULL PULL NO BID PULL
16 5423 VIKING RD $ 3,850.00 NOBID | $ 2,300.00 NOBID [ $ 2,700.00 | $ 2,400.00 NOBID | $ 1,900.00
17 5216 VIKING RD S 2,200.00 NOBID | $ 2,300.00 NOBID [ $ 2,700.00 | $ 3,580.00 NOBID | $ 2,700.00
18 1821 BAINBRIDGE AVE $ 4,850.00 NOBID | $ 3,700.00 NOBID [ $ 8,200.00 | $ 4,440.00 | $ 1,502.00 | $ 4,850.00
19 2022 BAINBRIDGE AVE S 4,500.00 NOBID | $ 6,900.00 NOBID [ $ 7,200.00 | $ 3,120.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 5,700.00
20 615 CALHOUN AVE PULL PULL PULL PULL PULL PULL NO BID PULL
21 17 SULLIVAN RD. NOBID | $ 9,500.00 NOBID | $ 5,789.00 [ $ 8,500.00 | $ 8,100.00 NO BID NO BID
IVendor Totals $45,875] $22,000.00 $50,200 $106,800 $89,175 $69,070 $27,242 $41,050

RESULTS ARE UNDER REVIEW AND NOT FINAL UNTIL ALL INSURANCE AND PERMITTING REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN
CONFIRMED DO NOT COMMENCE ANY WORK OR OBTAIN ANY PERMITS UNITL YOUR PURCHASE ORDER HAS BEEN
RECEIVED FROM ESCAMBIA COUNTY.
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