Porterville Unified School District Bid Solicitation 2022-2023 School Year

Solicitation is for COMMODITY PRICING pricing should reflect final delivered price after vendor mark up

Supplemental Bid School Year 2023-2024 Bid# SN-24-1

Vendor Name:

EST. Contributions Preffered Brand Case Serving Price
ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION Brand Vendor ID
Usage Grain M/MA or equivelent Price in Case Per Serving

Frozen Items- #DIV/0!
1 App|e Cinnamon Nada 4 0z, must meet 2 WG and 1/4 cup fruit (IW) 2 0 [Bell Tasty or equal #DIV/0!
2 B | 2.5 0z, BULK or IW, catering item, does not need By

agels to be smart snack compliant #DIV/0!
3 Blueberry BiSCUitS 2.50z, IW, WG 2 0 Bridgeford or equal #DIV/0!
4 |Breaded Chicken Chunks bulk, WG, chicken breast chunks 2 2 |Gold Kist or equal #DIV/0!
5 |Breakfast Crossiant with ham and swiss cheese 3.6 0z IW, WG, 1.5 [ 1 [Buena Vista Foods or equal
6 |Buffalo Chunks 4.4 0z, WG, chicken breast with rib meat 1.25 2 |Pro View or equal #DIV/0!
7 |Cake Batter Frozen Yogurt 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal #DIV/0!
8 |Cheese Lasagna Rollup 4.3 0z, bulk 2 1 [Tasty Brand or equal #DIV/0!
9 |Chicken Breast Fillet 4 0z breaded, WG, fully cooked, whole muscle 1 2 Gold Kist or equal #DIV/0!
10 Chicken Str|ps skinless breast strips, whole muscle, WG, BULK 1 2 Gold Kist or equal #DIV/0!
11 [Chorizo and Cheese Bollilo 5in, 5.49 0z, IW, WG 2 2 |Ardella's or equal #DIV/0!
. catering item, does not need to be smart snack
12 COOkIeS' Assorted compliant, thaw and bake pucks Bakersrouce or equal #DIv/0!
13 |Cookies and Cream Frozen Yogurt smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal #DIV/0!
14 [Dumplings, Chicken and Vegetable WG, BULK 2 2 |schwan's or equal
15 Dumplings, Vegetable WG, BULK 2 2 |schwan's or equal
16 Egg Ham and Cheese Bar 0.25 1 |Hormel or equal #DIV/0!
17 |Fruit , Diced IQF, 2 5 Ib bags Wawona or equal #DIV/0!
18 [Glazed Chicken Wings 5.40 oz, fully cooked 2 |Tyson or equal #DIV/0!
19 Hasbrown Triang|e 4.5 0z, must meet 1/2 cup starchy vegetable Sysco or equal
20 Honey Whole Wheat Biscuit W, WG 1 Bridgford or equal
21 |Kettle Cooked Taco Meat 3 0z, fully cooked, boil in bag 2 |Hot Off the Grill or equal #DIV/0!
22 Mango Sorbet 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal #DIV/0!
23 |Mini Pancake Bites 2.6 0z, WG, BULK, 1.25 | 1.25 |Pro View or equal #DIV/0!
24 M uffins i:f::ﬁfr::ermh;?:igii:iea to be smart snack 2 Bakers Source or equal #DIV/0!
25 Pepperoni Nada 4.5 oz, turkey pepperoni, IW or BULK< WG 2 2 Bell Tasty or equal #DIV/0!
26 |Pizzaboli Cheese Calzone 50z, IW, WG 2 2 |Tasty Brands or equal #DIV/0!
27 |Pizza, 7" Round Pepperoni w/Boxes 7WRMP2 2 2 |Nardones or equal #DIV/0!
28 [Pizza, 5" Round Pepperoni w/Boxes > ROuT T FeppeTon P20, TAVAuaTy Fre: 2 | 2 |Nardones or equal #DIV/0!
29 |Pizza, 8" WW Garlic French Bread Cheese, Boxed j,,wfi ”ME,, e treneh Breqa heese, BOTEP 2 | 2 [Nardonesor equal #DIV/0!
30 Pork Carnitas 2.5 0z, 128 servings per case 2 Brockwood Farms or equal #DIV/0!
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31 Pozole/Pulled Pork 2.5 0z, 128 servings per case 2 Brockwood Farms or equal #DIV/0!
32 Ramen Soup Base 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving 2 Nippon Shokken or equal #DIV/0!
33 |Roasted Potatoes 3.29 0z, roasted, meets 1/2 cup vegetable 2 Simplot or equal #DIV/0!
34 Savory Battered Fries 2.53 0z, skin on, 3/8in 2 Simplot or equal #DIV/0!
35 |Sandwhich, Maple Waffle, Chicken sausage 2.5 0z, IW, WGR 1 1 [Bake Crafters or equal
5 |Scones T oo
37 Sp|Cy Fries 3/8" cut,, 6 4.5 Ib bags Cavendish or equal #DIV/0!
38 Spicy Grilled Cheese 4.19 oz, IW, WG 2 2 |Hot Off the Grill or equal #DIV/0!
39 Strawberry Sorbet 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal #DIV/0!
40 |Stuffed Hashbrown Bulk 2 Mc Cains or equal #DIV/0!
41 Tempu ra Chicken N uggets 3.75 oz, WG, fully cooked, white meat 1 2 Tyson or equal #DIV/0!
42 Teriyaki Dunkers 3 oz, fully cooked, 2 Don Lee, Advance Pierre or equal #DIV/0!
a3 |Tortilla SOUp, seasoning mix, 8 oz packet Bernard Foods or equal #DIV/0!
a4 Tamale, Pork 5.10z, bulk 2 2 Padrinos or equal
45 Tamale, Chile Cheese Bulk, 5.30 oz, 2.25 2 Los Cabos or equal
46 |\Waffle Sticks, Dutch 4" BULK, 51% WG 2 J&J Snacks or equal #DIV/0!
Dry Gooods #DIV/0!
47 |Bags, HOT 6x9, perforated #DIV/0!
48 B|rthday Grahams 10z, WG 1 Zee Zees, National Foods or equal #DIV/0!
49 |Breakfast Bar 2.50z, IW, WG 2 Sky Blue or equal #DIV/0!
50 Churro Crackers 1oz, IW, WG 1 J&J Snacks or equal #DIV/0!
51 |Coffee Stirrer BULK #DIV/0!
52 Forks plastic, black, heavy duty, BULK #DIV/0!
53 Fruit Punch Dry MIX non smart snack compliant #DIV/0!
54 Genera| TSO'S Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal #DIV/0!
55 Granola Cnspy Bites 1oz, IW, WG 1 Darlington Snacks or equal #DIV/0!
s6 |lce Tea Bags Lipton or equal #DIV/0!
57 JUiCG, 4 0z Welch's or equal #DIV/0!
58 |KIND Bar Choc Chunk 1.2 0z, WG, IW 1 Kind or equal #DIV/0!
59 |KIND Bar Oats and Honey 1.2 0z, WG, IW 1 Kind or equal #DIV/0!
60 |Kiwi Strawberry Juice 10 oz, 1.25 cup fruit Tropicana or equal #DIV/0!
61 |Lids (coffee cups) #DIV/0!
62 Lucky Charms Cereal Bar 2.5 0z, IW, WG 2 General Mills or equal #DIV/0!
63 Mango Habanero Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal #DIV/0!
64 Maple Wafﬂe Snaps 1.9 0z, IW, WG 2 Darlingtoon Snacks or equal #DIV/0!
65 Mlckey Goldfish .75 0z, IW, WG 0.75 Campbells or equal #DIV/0!
66 |Mini Lemon DOOdIeS 1oz, IW, WG 1 Fieldstone or equal #DIV/0!
67 Mixed Berry Applesauce 4.5 oz unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit 1 National Food Group or equal #DIV/0!
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68 Napkins 32006 Georgia Pacific or equal #DIV/0!
69 Peach App|esauce 4.5 oz, meets 1/2 cup fruit Peterson Farms or equal #DIV/0!
70 Peach Cherrios Bar 2.50z, IW, WG General Mills or equal #DIV/0!
71 |Powdered Sugar 1 b bags #DIV/0!
72 |Pozole/Hominy six 10# cans #DIV/0!
73 |Samll Bowl 5 0z, micro bowl, item #M48058 Anchor Packing or equal
74 |Small Bowl Lid Zfz;r:n’;c;cigjx;f, must be compliant with line Anchor Packing or equal #DIV/0!
75 SOdaS, Assorted assorted flavors Pepsi or Coke products or equal #DIV/0!
76 Spoons plastic, black, heavy duty, BULK #DIV/0!
77 Strawberry App|esauCe 4.5 oz unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit Peterson Farms or equal #DIV/0!
78 Strawberry Crisp Bar 20z, IW, WG National Foods or equal #DIV/0!
79 Sweet Ch||| Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal #DIV/0!
80 Sugar Free Syrup 10z, IW, sugar free Smuckers, Kraft Heinz or equal
81 Teryaki Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal #DIV/0!
82 Tort|||a Ch|p3 3 0z, IW, yellow corn La Tapatia or equal #DIV/0!
83 Telera Bread 2.99 oz, BULK, NOT frozen La Tapatia or equal
84 Ventu ra Sauce signature sauce, shelf stable, 4 1 gallon Ventura or equal #DIV/0!
85 Waterme|on Applesauce 4.5 oz unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit National Foods or equal #DIV/0!
86 |Assorted Juice 100z, IW, Welch's or equal #DIV/0!
87 |White Rice 25 Ib bag #DIV/0!
Cold Items #DIV/0!
88 |Butter, patts #DIV/0!
89 Ch||e Wrap Tort|||a 8" Golden Sun, La Tapatia or equal #DIV/0!
9 |Creamer, cups assorted flavors #DIV/0!
91 Mango Pineapple Smoothie must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 Bar Fresh or equal #DIV/0!
92 |Margarine 11b tub #DIV/0!
93 Peach Smoothie 7.60z bottle must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 Bar Fresh or equal #DIV/0!
94 |Spinach Wrap Tortilla 8", Golden Sun, La Tapatia or equal #DIV/0!
95 Strawberr Banana Smoothie 7.60z bottle must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 Bar Fresh or equal #DIV/0!
y /
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Vendor Name:

Sysco Central CA Subr

ion

Valley Foods Submission

GOLD STAR FOODS

La Tapatia Subr n

Contributions Preffered Brand Case Serving. Price Case Serving Price Case Serving Price Case Serving Price
ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION Brand Vendor ID Brand Vendor ID Brand Vendor ID Brand Vendor ID
Grain or equivelent Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving
Frozen ltems- $ - $ -

t |Apple Cinnamon Nada 4 02, must meet 2 WG and 1/4 cup fruit (IW) 2 | O [peliTastyorequal BELLTSY CAS700W 50.44 60 0.85 s - $ - | BELLTASTY, 60/407 142974 s 5287 60 s o088
2 B I 2.5 0z, BULK or IW, catering item, does not 2

agels need to be smart snack compliant BKRSCLS 28014 21.86 12 03 Muffin Town 97129 $ 2662 84 $  0.32 [TONY ROBERTS, 72/30: 144567 $ 2193 72 $ 030
3 3|ueberry Biscuits 2.5 0z, IW, WG 2 0 |Bridgeford or equal NO BID $ - $ - |BRIDGFORD, 72/2.502| TBD $  32.60 72 $ 0.45
4 |Breaded Chicken Chunks bulk, WG, chicken breast chunks 2 2 |Gold Kist or equal TYSON 10269760928 125.06 1 Gold Kist 7526 $ 11178 120 $ 0.93 [GOLD KIST, 128/3.7502 403671 $ 12432 128 $ 0.97
5 _|Breakfast Crossiant with ham and swiss cheese 3.6 021w, WG, 15 | 1 [BuenaVista Foods or equal BAKCRFT 4707 44.97 48 094 Buena Vista 32541 $ 7663 60 $  1.28 BUENAVISTA, 60/3.60 410258 s 7802 60 $ 130
6 [Buffalo Chunks 4.4 0z, WG, chicken breast with rib meat 1.25 2 |Pro View or equal PROVIEW 64230-WG 75.79 4 Pro View 64230 $  89.57 72 $ 1.24 PROVIEW, 4/5L8 138972 $  90.51 72 $ 1.26
7_|Cake Batter Frozen Yogurt 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal NO BID $ - $ - |SPOON YOGURT, 24/5 137727 $ 3016 24 $ 126
8 |Cheese Lasagna Rollup 4.3 0z, bulk 2 1 |Tasty Brand or equal TASTY B 00801WG 97.94 110 Tasty Brands 801WG $ 9488 110 $ 0.86 |STY BRANDS, 110/4.30! 401876 $ 9589 110 $ 0.87
9 |Chicken Breast Fillet 4 0z breaded, WG, fully cooked, whole muscle 1 2 |Gold Kist or equal GLDKIST 7516 157.35 6 Gold Kist 7516 S 15000 120 S 1.5 | GOLD KIST, 120/40Z 403669 $ 147.66 120 s 123
10 |Chicken Strips skinless breast strps, whole muscle, WG, BULK 1| 2 |GeldKistorequal TYSON 10085220928 123.80 6 Gold Kist 7527 $ 14854| 107 1.39 | GOLD KIST, 30/4.502 410238 $ m618| 30 [s a8
11 |Chorizo and Cheese Bollilo 5 in, 5.49 oz, IW, WG 2 2 |Ardella’s or equal NO BID Ardella's 10015 $ 5545 72 $ 0.77 | ARDELLAS, 72/3.350Z 149678 $ 5437 72 $ 0.76
12 | Cooki Assorted catering item, does not need to be smart snack sak ! 139816

0oKies, Assorte compliant, thaw and bake pucks akersrouce or equa BKRSCLS 71818SY 44.61 48 $ - S - [TCATBAKERY, 192/1.3|  140196,TBD S 4615 192 s 024
13 |Cookies and Cream Frozen Yogurt |smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal NO BID S - $ - ISPOON YOGURT, 24/5. 137730 $ 30.16 24 $ 1.26
14 |Dumplings, Chicken and Vegetable WG, BULK 2 2 [schwan's or equal NO BID $ - $ - NS FOOD SERVICE INC, 141458 $ 6446 96
15 jurnplingsY \/egeta[ﬂe WG, BULK 2 2 Schwan's or equal NO BID S - $ - CHEF ONE, 3/2.5LB 149551 $ 39.18 38
16 |Egg Ham and Cheese Bar 025 | 1 [Hormelor equal HORMEL 41902 46.68 80 s , s " MFG DISC MFG DISC
17 uit , Diced 1QF, 2 5 Ib bags \Wawona or equal WAWONA 045530-00 40.01 4 $ - $ - 'WAWONA, 2/5LB TBD $ 2186 53 $ 0.41
18 |Glazed Chicken Wings 5.40 0z, fully cooked 2 [Tyson or equal TYSON 10000052436 113.16 1 $ - $ - TYSON, 4/7.5.8 406739 $ 12487 119 $ 105
19 [Hasbrown Triangle 4.5 02, must meet 1/2 cup starchy vegetable Sysco or equal SYS IMP 1.07347E+13 44.50 6 simplot 10071179280224 | $  36.15 107 S 0.34 |LAMB WESTON, 6/5.8 141514 s 7292 240
20 |Honey Whole Wheat Biscuit w, we 1 Bridgford or equal BRDGFRD 6285 30.19 100 Bridgford 6681 $ 2867 72 $  0.40 | BRIDGFORD, 100/20Z 140106 S 3134 100

eltie Cooke aco Meal 0z, fully cooked, boil in bag lot Off the Grill or equal . Integrate: N780008B 225.54 213 1.06 | INTEGRATED, 8/5LB 143963 227.71 213 1.07
2 |Kettle Cooked T: Meat 3 0z, fully cooked, boil in b 2 |Hot Off the Grill | IFS C78000B 69.99 213 d $ $ /! $ S
22 Mango Sorbet 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal BIG SPN 11820 21.09 24 $ - $ - SPOON YOGURT, 24/5, 138780 $ 3016 24 $ 1.26
2 |Mini Pancake Bites 2.6 02, WG, BULK, 1.25 | 125 |Pro View or equal PILLSBY 132264000 38.31 72 Pro View 64014 $ 3009 57 $  053| PROVIEW,2/58 149303 $ 3038 57 $ 053
24 [Muffins o o e to persmaresmock P Bakers Source or equal BKRSIMP 75748 27.08] 72 s - $ - | DAves 90/1.90z 134042-88 $ 3398 90 [$ o038
2 |Pepperoni Nada 4.5 02, turkey pepperoni, IW or BULK< WG 2 2 [Bell Tasty or equal BELLTSY PIZZANADA2B12W| 47.74 60 $ - $ - LLTASTY, 60/4.502 BU| 133947 $ 5279 60 $ 088
26 |Pizzaboli Cheese Calzone 5 02, IW, WG 2 2 [Tasty Brands or equal TASTY B 53201 95.84 96 Tasty Brands 53206 $  99.60 96 $  1.04 |ALBIES FOODS, 48/507| 409940 $ 5316 48 $ 11
27 |Pizza, 7" Round Pepperoni w/Boxes 7TWRMP2 2 2 [Nardones or equal 0 NOBID $ - $ - |RDONE BROS, 48/9.56| TBD $ 7264 48 $ s
28 |Pizza, 5" Round Pepperoni w/Boxes "":m""’ 220, ATy P 2 [ 2 [Nardones or equal NARDONE 5WRMP1NY2 4789 60 s - $ - IRDONE BROS, 40/5.40) 406557 $ 4494 40 [$ 112
29 |Pizza, 8" WW Garlic French Bread Cheese, Boxed e TENCT Breau Cheese, BOXED 2 [ 2 [Nardones or equal NO BID s - $ - BRDONEBROS,40/4.5 8D $ 4494 40 [$ 112
30 |Pork Carnitas 2.5 0z, 128 servings per case 2 [Brockwood Farms or equal USDA 12303 43.37 4 $ - $ - FARMS, 2/! 139907 $ 6119 64 $ 09
31 |Pozole/Pulled Pork 2.5 0z, 128 servings per case 2 [Brockwood Farms or equal NO BID $ - $ - FARMS, 2/¢ TBD $ 4874 64 $ 076
32 |Ramen SOUp Base 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving 2 Nippon Shokken or equal KIKOMAN 1620 99.73 4 Nippon Shokken 630 $  140.22 240 $ 0.58 [PPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.6 254279 $ 13870 324 $ 0.43
33 |Roasted Potatoes 3.29 02, roasted, meets 1/2 cup vegetable 2 Simplot or equal MCCAIN MCF04851 33.06 4 Simplot 10071179000464 $  23.02 72 $ 0.32 | SIMPLOT, 6/2.5L8 403779 $ 3199 84 $ 0.38
34 |Savory Battered Fries 2.53 0 skin on, 3/8 in 2 simplot or equal SIMPLOT 1.00712E+13 45.14 6 Simplot 10071179049579 | $  28.04 $ - SIMPLOT, 6/5L8 149545 S 4499 160 $ 028

andwhic , Maple Vvarile, icken sausage .5 0z, IW, ake Crafters or equal . - BAKE CRAFTERS, 168/2.5¢ 137923 139.71 168
35_|Sandwhich, Maple Waffle, Chick 2.5 0z, IW, WGR 1 1 [Bake Craf | BAKCRFT 6657 120.13 126 $ /- S
36 |Scones e e Joes MoT meed To D Smart otk Pilsbury or equal PILLSBY 130472000 7302 96 Pillsbury Various $ 698 55 |$ 127 [PILLSBURY, 96/3.7502 141545 $ 7520 9% [$ o8
37 |Spicy Fries 3/8" cut,, 6.4.5 Ib bags 1 Cavendish or equal MCCAIN MCX03621 36.99 6 $ - $ - | cAVENDISH, 6/4.5L8 409826 $ 3316 187 $ 018
38 |Spicy Grilled Cheese 4.19 0z, IW, W6 2 2 |Hot Off the Grill or equal HOTOFFG 134000 69.67 72 Integrated 704004 $ 7668 72 $  1.07 [NTEGRATED, 72/4.290; 401639 $ 7804 72 $ 108
39 |Strawberry Sorbet 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal BIG SPN 12710 45.28 100 $ - $ - |SPOON YOGURT, 24/ 8D $ 3016 24 $ 12
40_|Stuffed Hashbrown Bulk 2 Mc Cains or equal GLDCRSP 1000010772 110.73 6 $ - $ - |ccain FooDs ING, 6/4f 149724 $ 113.96 130 $ o088
41 |Tempura Chicken Nuggets 3.75 0z, WG, fully cooked, white meat 1 2 [Tyson or equal TYSON 10221780928 78.00 500 Tyson s 232 2 $ 055 TYSON,4/5.7810LB 404686 $ 8139 4 $ 2035
42 |Teriyaki Dunkers 3 0z, fully cooked, 2 |DonLee, Advance Pierre or equal ADVCE 10000068012 133.59 495 Don Lee Farms CNQTDO753 $ 5172 160 $  0.36 [ON LEE FARMS, 160/3 403349 $ 15896 160 $ 099
43 |Tortilla Soup, seasoning mix, 8 0z packet Bernard Foods or equal NOBID $ - $ - NO BID NO BID
44 _|Tamale, Pork 510z, bulk 2 2 |Padrinos or equal DELREAL 122 48.23 48 $ - $ - JAELB'S BESTWAY, 72/! 404504 $ 8755 72 $ 122
45 |Tamale, Chile Cheese Bulk, 5.30 02, 225 | 2 |Los Cabos or equal DELREAL 129 50.14 48 $ - $ - 00Ds/LOS CABOS, 60/| 406764 $ 7716 60 $ 129
4 |Waffle Sticks, Dutch 4" BULK, 51% WG 2 184 Snacks or equal NOBID 18 Snacks 4521 $ 2527 8 $  0.53 R JSNACK FOODS, 600 142945 $ 3403 600 $ 006

Dry Gooods $ - $ -
47 |Bags, HOT 619, perforated MCNAIRN 321650 12252 | 2000 s - s - NO BID NO BID
48 |Birthday Grahams 102 WG 1 Zee Zees, National Foods or equal ZEEZEES 610688 58.16 200 $ - $ - INALFOOD GROUP, 13| 154186 $ 6163 135 $ 046
49 |Breakfast Bar 2.5 0z, IW, WG 2 [Sky Blue or equal READIBK 40402 21.39 48 Sky Blue Bakery HWB5172 $ 3991 72 $ 0.55 |Y BLUE FOODS, 72/2.8 102242 $ 399 72 $ 0.54
50 |Churro Crackers 102, IW, WG 1 1) Snacks or equal J&J 2049193 32.11 1 J&J Snacks 2049194 $ 3478 160 $ 0.22 |J SNACK FOODS, 160/1] 251279 $ 3788 160 $ 0.24
s1 |Coffee Stirrer BULK HANGARD 305214002 27.15 10 $ - $ - NO BID NO BID
52 |Forks plastic, black, heavy duty, BULK SYS IMP YPWFESYS 96.13 1000 $ - $ - LLICUP USA INC., 1000 210194 $  17.0 1000 $ 0.02
s3_|Fruit Punch Dry Mix non smart snack compliant SAHAR B 74228705278 38.74 12 $ - $ - KOOL AID, 82.502 8D $ 1422 90 $ 016
54 |General TSO's Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON 8.50022E+11 96.74 6 Nippon Shokken 550 S 6323 312 $ 020 [PPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.8| 254266 $ 6288 324 $ 019
s5_|Granola Crispy Bites 102 1W, WG 1 Darlington Snacks or equal APPLWAY DA71600 25.21 108 Darlington 71600 s 3022 108 $  0.28 PARLINGTON, 108/107 252913 $ 2042 108 $ 027
s6_|lce Tea Bags Lipton or equal CLSCSTH 3467539 45.68 96 $ - $ - LIPTON, 3/104CT 239881 $ 1554 312 $ 005
57 Jui(;eY 4 02 Welch's or equal SAHAR B 3009 50.56 96 $ - $ - [OOL TROPICS, 96/40Z 254122-VEGTBRY |$ 39.96 96 $ 0.42
s8 |KIND Bar Choc Chunk 1.2 02, WG, W 1 Kind or equal KIND 18082 61.96 6 Kind Healthy Snacks 28404 $ 100.54 250 S 0.40 p HEALTHY SNACKS, 6/ TBD $ 5528 72 $ 077
s9 |KIND Bar Oats and Honey 1.2.02, WG, IW 1 Kind or equal KIND 18080 61.96 6 Kind Healthy Snacks 29819 $  100.54 250 $  0.40 D HEALTHY SNACKS, 6/ 252840 $  55.28 72 $ 077
60 |Kiwi Strawberry Juice 2002, 1.25 cup fruit Tropicana or equal TROPCNA 2144 1.71 15 $ - $ - | TROPICANA, 15/1002 209746 $ 1249 15 $ o083
61 |Lids (coffee cups) DART 20JL 39.58 10 $ - $ - NO BID NO BID 0
62 |Lucky Charms Cereal Bar 2.5 02, IW, WG 2 General Mills or equal GM 16853000 32.51 48 General Mills 16853000 s 3323 48 $  0.69 [ENERAL MILLS, 48/2.5 254280 $ 3157 48 $ 066
63 Mango Habanero Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON 00342 93.68 6 Nippon Shokken 546 $  9.97 312 $ 0.31 JPPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.9] 252816 $  96.94 324 $ 0.30
64 |Maple Waffle Snaps 1.9 0z, IW, WG 2 Darlingtoon Snacks or equal APPLWAY DA74100 128.32 180 Darlington 74100 $ 8728 180 $  0.48 JARLINGTON, 180/1.90) 254214 $ 811 180 $ o048
65 |Mickey Goldfish .75 0z, 1w, w6 075 campbells or equal PEPFARM 2.0014E+11 56.81 1 Campbells 200140027516 $ - |PERIDGE FARM, 300/.7: 249195 S 67.07 300 $ 022
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66_|Mini Lemon Doodles 102 1W, WG 1 Fieldstone or equal FIELDST 9720 48.58 144 Fieldstone 9720 $ 5016 144 $  0.35 | FIELDSTONE, 144/1CT 253821 $ 5068 144 $ 035
67 |Mixed Berry Applesauce 4.5 oz unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit 1 National Food Group or equal ZEEZEES A1580 41.58 96 $ - $ SON FARMS FRESH, 96/ 406269 $ 3073 9 $ 032
68 |Napkins 32006 Georgia Pacific or equal GEORGIA PACIFIC| 32006 65.99 24 $ - $ NOBID NO BID
69 |Peach Applesauce 4.5 0z, meets 1/2 cup fruit Peterson Farms or equal PETFARMS ASA10017 29.47 96 $ - $ ISON FARMS FRESH, 96 410043 $ 3073 % $ 032
70_|Peach Cherrios Bar 2.5 02, IW, WG 2 General Mills or equal GM 168562 30.93 48 General Mills 16856 $ 3323 48 $ 069 [ENERAL MILLS, 48/2.5¢ 254281 $ 3157 48 $ 066
71 |Powdered Sugar 116 bags C&H 404852 28.84 24 $ - $ C&H SUGAR, 24/1L8 209445 $ 4071 362 $ om
72 |Pozole/Hominy six 104 cans CASACLS 75213179 24.88 6 $ - $ oDI CANNING CO, 6/41 253710 $ 3258 6 $ 543
73 |Samll Bowl 5 0z, micro bowl, item #M48058 [Anchor Packing or equal ANCHPKG 4604804 87.91 500 $ - $ ICHOR PACKAGING, 50( 209594 $ 3899 500
74 |Small_Bowl Lid T oy Tt L ComPTant W ime [Anchor packing or equal ANCHPKG 4334810 6313 500 s - $ [CHOR PACKAGING, 50( 239366 $ 3349 s00 [$ o007
75_|Sodas, Assorted assorted flavors Pepsi or Coke products or equal COCACOL 49000012781 16.42 24 $ - $ COCA COLA, 35/1202 | 209890-COKE DIET CRV 35 $0.59 + CRV.
76 Spoons plastic, black, heavy duty, BULK SYS IMP YPWSWSYS 87.98 1000 $ - $ DOWELL, 10/100CT 210263 $ 2649 1000 $ 0.03
77 |Strawberry Applesauce 4.5 oz unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit Peterson Farms or equal ZEEZEES A1490 41.58 96 $ - $ SON FARMS FRESH, 96/ 409797 $ 3073 9 $ 032
78 |Strawberry Crisp Bar 202, IW, WG 2 National Foods or equal DARFARM DA75400 70.05 160 $ - $ MFG DISC
79 |Sweet Chili Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 0z serving Nippon Shokken or equal MINOR 50000783045USL 60.46 4 Nippon Shokken 643 $ 6545 312 S 0.21 [PPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.4| TBD $  65.07 324 $ 020
80 |Sugar Free Syrup 1 02, IW, sugar free [Smuckers, Kraft Heinz or equal SMUCKER 5150002277 17.93 100 $ - $ MOND CRYSTAL, 100/ 8D S 1495 100
81 Teryaki Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON 0 12.06 1 Nippon Shokken 3 $ 4371 312 $ 0.14 [PPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.9 239365 $  43.10 324 $ 0.13
82 |Tortilla Chips 3 0z, 1W, yellow corn 1 La Tapatia or equal TOSTITO 28400208710 16.86 28 $ - $ |A VENCEDORA, 150/20) 209542 S 3485 150 $  0.23 fa Tapatia Tortilleria, In #77009 $ 3412 100 $ 034
83 |Telera Bread 2.99 02, BULK, NOT frozen 2 La Tapatia or equal NOBID $ - $ BREA BAKERY, 96/3.5 8D S 6188 % La Tapatia Tortilleria, In #50865 $ 2712 8pk/sct.
84 |Ventura Sauce signature sauce, shelf stable, 4 1 gallon Ventura or equal NOBID $ - $ DOT, 4/0.5GAL TBD $ 4081 256 s 016
8s |Watermelon Applesauce 4.5 oz unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit National Foods or equal ZEEZEES 0 41.58 96 $ - $ INAL FOOD GROUP, 96, 406684 $ 4219 9 s 044
86 |Assorted Juice 100z, 1W, Welch's or equal MARTNLI 30570 39.05 24 $ - $ JUICY JUICE, 24/1002 248377-FP CRV 24 $0.62 + CRV
87 |White Rice 25 Ib bag SYS IMP R1YK259Z0 18.27 1 $ - $ PEAK, 1/258 113198 $ 1800 100 $ 018
Cold Items $ - $
88 |Butter, patts WHLFIMP 6060 67.83 4 $ - $ NO BID NO BID
89 |Chile Wrap Tortilla 5" 1 Golden Sun, La Tapatia or equal BBRLCLS 10246 29.46 6 $ - $ NO BID NO BID La Tapatia Tortilleria, Inf #883552 $  20.00 | 5pk/ioct. | #VALUE!
90 Creamer, cups assorted flavors CITVCLS 1012080 21.17 288 $ - $ E PROFESSIONAL, 180/|  201654-HZ NUT $16.92 180 $ 0.09
91 |Mango Pineapple Smoothie must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 [BarFresh or equal 1883MAI 6115 54.75 8 $ - $ BARFRESH, 48/7.60Z 144561 $  47.96 48 $ 100
92 |Margarine 11b tub SYS IMP 0 60.72 36 $ - $ NO BID NO BID
93 |Peach Smoothie 7.60z bottle must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 [Bar Fresh or equal BARFRSH TGPCY48 48.00 48 $ - $ BARFRESH, 48/7.602 144872 $ 479 48 $ 100
9 |Spinach Wrap Tortilla 5", 1 Golden Sun, La Tapatia or equal SYS CLS 10257 29.49 6 $ - $ ATAPATIA, 5/10CT, 12 141090 $ 2261 50 $  0.45 faTapatia Tortilleria, In #883602 $  20.00 | 5pk/ioct. | #VALUE!
95 |Strawberry Banana Smoothie 7.602 bottle must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 [Bar Fresh or equal BARFRSH TGSBY48 48.00 48 $ - $ BARFRESH, 48/7.60Z 143817 $  47.96 48 $ 100
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Supplemental Bid School Year 2023-2024 Bid# SN-24-1

Sysco Central CA Submission

ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION EST.  Contributions Preffered Brand Brand enaerin Case Serving Price
Usage Grain M/MA or equivelent Price in Case Per Serving
1 Apple Cinnamon Nada 4 0z, must meet 2 WG and 1/4 cup fruit (IW) 2 0 Bell Tasty or equal BELLTSY CAS700W 50.44 60 0.85
2 Bagels f.Sboz, BULK or IW, cater'ing item, does not need 2 BKRSCLS 28014 21.86 12 03
0 be smart snack compliant .

6 |Buffalo Chunks 4.4 0z, WG, chicken breast with rib meat 1.25 2 Pro View or equal PROVIEW 64230-WG 75.79 4
12 COOkieS Assorted caterir‘Jg item, does not need to be smart snack Bakersrouce or equal

) compliant, thaw and bake pucks BKRSCLS 71818SY 44.61 438
16 Egg Ham and Cheese Bar 0.25 1 |Hormel or equal HORMEL 41902 46.68 80
18 [Glazed Chicken Wings 5.40 0z, fully cooked 2 |Tyson or equal TYSON 10000052436 113.16 1
19 Hasbrown Triangle 4.5 0z, must meet 1/2 cup starchy vegetable Sysco or equal SYS IMP 1.07347E+13 44.50 6
22 |Mango Sorbet 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal BIG SPN 11820 21.09 24
24 |Muffins caterngTiem, G0es nor Need tobe smart snack 2 Bakers Source or equal BKRSIMP 75748 2708 72
25 |Pepperoni Nada 4.5 oz, turkey pepperoni, IW or BULK< WG 2 2 |Bell Tasty or equal BELLTSY PIZZANADA2B12W 47.74 60
26 |Pizzaboli Cheese Calzone 50z, IW, WG 2 2 [Tasty Brands or equal TASTY B 53201 95.84 96
35 |Sandwhich, Maple Waffle, Chicken sausage 2.5 07, IW, WGR 1 1 [Bake Crafters or equal BAKCRFT 6657 120.13 126
38 |Spicy Grilled Cheese 4.19 07, IW, WG Hot Off the Grill or equal HOTOFFG 134000 69.67 72
a4 |Tamale, Pork 5.10z, bulk 2 2 [Padrinos or equal DELREAL 122 48.23 48
47 |Bags, HOT 6x9, perforated MCNAIRN 321650 122.52 2000
48 |Birthday Grahams 10z, WG 1 Zee Zees, National Foods or equal ZEEZEES 610688 58.16 200
50 |Churro Crackers 1oz, IW, WG 1 J&J Snacks or equal J&J 2049193 32.11 1
s1 |Coffee Stirrer BULK HANGARD 305214002 27.15 10
59 |KIND Bar Oats and Honey 1.2 02, WG, IW 1 Kind or equal KIND 18080 61.96 6
60 |Kiwi Strawberry Juice 10 0z, 1.25 cup fruit Tropicana or equal TROPCNA 2144 11.71 15
61 |Lids (coffee cups) DART 20JL 39.58 10
63 Mango Habanero Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON 00342 93.68 6
65 |Mickey Goldfish 75 0z, IW, WG 0.75 Campbells or equal PEPFARM 2.0014E+11 56.81 1
66 |Mini Lemon Doodles 1oz, IW, WG 1 Fieldstone or equal FIELDST 9720 48.58 144
68 |Napkins 32006 Georgia Pacific or equal GEORGIA PACIFIC 32006 65.99 24
69 |Peach Applesauce 4.5 0z, meets 1/2 cup fruit Peterson Farms or equal PETFARMS ASA10017 29.47 96
70 |Peach Cherrios Bar 250z, IW, WG 2 General Mills or equal GM 168562 30.93 48
71 |Powdered Sugar 11b bags C&H 404852 28.84 24
72 |Pozole/Hominy six 10# cans CASACLS 75213179 24.88 6
78 |Strawberry Crisp Bar 20z, IW, WG 2 National Foods or equal DARFARM DA75400 70.05 160
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80 |Sugar Free Syrup 10z, IW, sugar free Smuckers, Kraft Heinz or equal SMUCKER 5150002277 17.93 100
87 |White Rice 25 Ib bag SYS IMP R1YK259Z0 18.27 1
88 |Butter, patts WHLFIMP 6060 67.83 4
90 |Creamer, cups assorted flavors CITVCLS 1012080 21.17 288
92 |Margarine 11btub SYS IMP 0 60.72 36
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Supplemental Bid School Year 2023-2024 Bid# SN-24-1

Vendor Name:

Valley Foods Submission

Contributions Preffered Brand Case Serving Price
ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION Brand Vendor ID

Grain  M/MA or equivelent Price in Case Per Serving
4 Breaded ChiCken Chunks bulk, WG, chicken breast chunks 2 2 Gold Kist or equal Gold Kist 7526 $ 111.78 120 5 0.93
5 |Breakfast Crossiant with ham and swiss cheese 3.6 0z IW, WG, 15 1 |Buena Vista Foods or equal Buena Vista 32541 $  76.63 60 $ 1.28
8 |Cheese Lasagna Rollup 4.3 0z, bulk 2 1 [Tasty Brand or equal Tasty Brands 801WG $ 9488 110 $ 086
20 [Honey Whole Wheat Biscuit W, W6 1 Bridgford or equal Bridgford 6681 $ 2867 72 $ 040
21 |Kettle Cooked Taco Meat 3 0z, fully cooked, boil in bag 2 |Hot Off the Grill or equal Integrated N780008 $ 22554 213 $ 1.06
23 [Mini Pancake Bites 2.6 0z, WG, BULK, 1.25 | 1.25 |Pro View or equal Pro View 64014 $  30.09 57 $ 0.53
33 |Roasted Potatoes 3.29 0z, roasted, meets 1/2 cup vegetable 2 Simplot or equal Simplot 10071179000464 |$  23.02 72 $ 0.32

catermg Item, does not need to be smart snack . . .

36 [Scones ernnlinnt thes cnd hake nucke Pilsbury or equal Pillsbury Various S 69.80 55 S 1.27
41 [Tempura Chicken Nuggets 3.75 0z, WG, fully cooked, white meat 1 2 [Tyson or equal Tyson 383870928 $ 2321 42 $ 055
42 |Teriyaki Dunkers 3 oz, fully cooked, 2 |Don Lee, Advance Pierre or equal Don Lee Farms CNQTD0753 $ 5772 160 $ 036
a6 |Waffle Sticks, Dutch 4" BULK, 51% WG 2 J&J Snacks or equal J&J Snacks 4521 $ 2527 a8 $ 0.53
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L] L]
Supplemental Bid School Year 2023-2024 Bid# SN-24-1
Vendor Name: GOLD STAR FOODS Submission
EST. Contributions Preffered Brand Case Serving Price
ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION Brand Vendor ID
Usage Grain M/MA or equivelent Price in Case Per Serving

3 |Blueberry Biscuits 2.5 0z, IW, WG 2 Bridgeford or equal BRIDGFORD, 72/2.502 TBD 32.60 72 $ 0.45
7 |Cake Batter Frozen Yogurt 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal BIG SPOON YOGURT, 24/5.50Z 137727 30.16 24 $ 1.26
9 |Chicken Breast Fillet 4 0z breaded, WG, fully cooked, whole muscle 1 Gold Kist or equal GOLD KIST, 120/40Z 403669 147.66 120 $ 1.23
10 |Chicken Stnps skinless breast strips, whole muscle, WG, BULK 1 Gold Kist or equal GOLD KIST, 30/4.502 410238 146.18 30 $ 4.87
11 |Chorizo and Cheese Bollilo 5in, 5.49 0z, IW, WG 2 Ardella's or equal ARDELLAS, 72/3.350Z 149678 54.37 72 $ 0.76
13 |Cookies and Cream Frozen Yogurt smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal BIG SPOON YOGURT, 24/5.50Z 137730 30.16 24 $ 1.26
14 |Dumplings, Chicken and Vegetable WG, BULK 2 Schwan's or equal SCHWANS FOOD SERVICE INC, 8/2.5LB 141458 64.46 9%

15 |Dumplings, Vegetable WG, BULK 2 Schwan's or equal CHEF ONE, 3/2.518 149551 39.18 38

17 |Fruit , Diced IQF, 2 5 Ib bags Wawona or equal WAWONA, 2/5LB TBD 21.86 53 S 0.41
27 |Pizza, 7" Round Pepperoni w/Boxes 7" Round, Self Rising Whole Wheat 7WRMP2 2 2 [Nardones or equal NARDONE BROS, 48/9.560Z TBD 72.64 48 $ 1.51
28 |Pizza, 5" Round Pepperoni w/Boxes E Rounzg o F",'(,,ﬁﬁf’f,"m' Preze, Tarviauay Pre 2 | 2 |Nardones or equal NARDONE BROS, 40/5.400Z 406557 44.94 40 $ 112
29 |Pizza, 8" WW Garlic French Bread Cheese, Boxed e Breaccheese, BERED 2 2 |Nardones or equal NARDONE BROS, 40/4.50Z TBD 44.94 40 $ 1.12
30 |Pork Carnitas 2.5 0z, 128 servings per case 2 |Brockwood Farms or equal BROOKWOOD FARMS, 2/5LB 139907 61.19 64 $ 0.96
31 |Pozole/Pulled Pork 2.5 0z, 128 servings per case 2 |Brockwood Farms or equal BROOKWOOD FARMS, 2/5LB TBD 48.74 64 $ 0.76
32 |Ramen Soup Base 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving 2 Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.6LB 254279 138.70 324 $ 0.43
37 |Spicy Fries 3/8" cut, 64.5 Ib bags 1 Cavendish or equal CAVENDISH, 6/4.5LB 409826 33.16 187 $ 0.18
39 |Strawberry Sorbet 5.5 0z, smart snack compliant Big Spoon or equal BIG SPOON YOGURT, 24/5.50Z TBD 30.16 24 $ 1.26
40 [Stuffed Hashbrown Bulk 2 Mc Cains or equal MCCAIN FOODS INC, 6/4LB 149724 113.96 130 $ 0.88
45 |Tamale, Chile Cheese Bulk, 5.30 0z, 225 Los Cabos or equal MCI FOODS/LOS CABOS, 60/5.30Z 406764 77.16 60 $ 1.29
49 (Breakfast Bar 250z, IW, WG 2 Sky Blue or equal SKY BLUE FOODS, 72/2.80Z 102242 39.19 72 $ 0.54
52 |Forks plastic, black, heavy duty, BULK LOLLICUP USA INC., 1000CT 210194 17.10 1000 $ 0.02
53 |Fruit Punch Dry Mix non smart snack compliant KOOL AID, 82.50Z TBD 14.22 90 $ 0.16
s4 |General TSO's Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.8LB 254266 62.88 324 $ 0.19
s5 |Granola Crispy Bites 1oz IW, WG 1 Darlington Snacks or equal DARLINGTON, 108/10Z 252913 29.42 108 $ 0.27
s6 |lce Tea Bags Lipton or equal LIPTON, 3/104CT 239881 15.54 312 $ 0.05
57 [Juice, 40z Welch's or equal COOL TROPICS, 96/40Z 254122-VEG T BRY 39.96 96 $ 0.42
62 |Lucky Charms Cereal Bar 250z, IW, WG 2 General Mills or equal GENERAL MILLS, 48/2.50Z 254280 31.57 a8 $ 0.66
64 |Maple Waffle Snaps 190z, IW, WG 2 Darlingtoon Snacks or equal DARLINGTON, 180/1.90Z 254214 87.11 180 $ 0.48
67 [Mixed Berry Applesauce 4.5 0z unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit 1 National Food Group or equal PETERSON FARMS FRESH, 96/4.50Z 406269 30.73 9% $ 0.32
73 |Samll Bowl 5 0z, micro bowl, item #M48058 Anchor Packing or equal ANCHOR PACKAGING, 500CT 209594 38.99 500

74 |Small Bowl Lid > 9% TIICT0 DOWTTIG, MUST be CompIant Wit e Anchor Packing or equal ANCHOR PACKAGING, 500CT 239366 3349 500 |$ 0.7
75 |Sodas, Assorted assorted flavors Pepsi or Coke products or equal COCA COLA, 35/120Z 209890-COKE DIET CRV 35 $0.59 + CRV
76 |Spoons plastic, black, heavy duty, BULK DOWELL, 10/100CT 210263 26.49 1000 $ 0.03
77 |Strawberry Applesauce 4.5 0z unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit Peterson Farms or equal PETERSON FARMS FRESH, 96/4.50Z 409797 30.73 % $ 0.32
79 |Sweet Chili Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.4LB TBD 65.07 324 $ 0.20
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81 |Teryaki Sauce 6 half gallon btls, 1.8 oz serving Nippon Shokken or equal NIPPON SHOKKEN, 6/4.9LB 239365 43.10 324 $ 0.13
84 Ventu ra Sauce signature sauce, shelf stable, 4 1 gallon Ventura or equal DOT, 4/0.5GAL TBD 40.81 256 s 0.16
85 [Watermelon Applesauce 4.5 0z unsweetened, 1/2 cup fruit National Foods or equal NATIONAL FOOD GROUP, 96/4.50Z 406684 42.19 96 $ 0.44
86 |Assorted Juice 100z, IW, Welch's or equal JUICY JUICE, 24/1002Z 248377-FP CRV 24 $0.62 + CRV
91 |Mango Pineapple Smoothie must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 |Bar Fresh or equal BARFRESH, 48/7.60Z 144561 47.96 48 $ 1.00
93 [Peach Smoothie 7.60z bottle must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 [BarFresh or equal BARFRESH, 48/7.60Z 144872 47.96 a8 $ 1.00
95 |Strawberry Banana Smoothie 7.60z bottle must meet 1/2 cup fruit 1 |Bar Fresh or equal BARFRESH, 48/7.60Z 143817 47.96 48 $ 1.00
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Supplemental Bid School Year 2023-2024 Bid# SN-24-1

Vendor Name: La Tapatia Submission
EST. Contributions Preffered Brand Case Serving Price
ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION Brand Vendor ID

Usage Grain M/MA or equivelent Price in Case Per Serving
82 |Tortilla Chips 3 0z, IW, yellow corn 1 La Tapatia or equal La Tapatia Tortilleria, Inc. #77009 $ 3412 100 $ 0.34
83 |Telera Bread 2.99 0z, BULK, NOT frozen 2 La Tapatia or equal La Tapatia Tortilleria, Inc. #50865 $  27.12| 8pk/5ct.
89 |Chile Wrap Tortilla 8" 1 Golden Sun, La Tapatia or equal La Tapatia Tortilleria, Inc. #883552 $  20.00 | 5pk/10ct. | #VALUE!
94 |Spinach Wrap Tortilla 8" 1 Golden Sun, La Tapatia or equal La Tapatia Tortilleria, Inc. 4883602 $  20.00 | 5pk/10ct. | HVALUE!
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