

BIDS

Pipe 23-1

REQUISITION #: 35652

DATE: 06/22/2023

ARTICLES		BIDDERS				
Corrugated Metal Pipe (Round) LINEAR FEET		Miller's Supply Inc.	Straight Path Distributing	Integrated Technologies	Weems Excavating	Berry Home Centers, Inc.
16 Gauge - 12" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$17.60 N/A	\$18.52 \$18.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
16 Gauge - 15" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$21.12 N/A	\$23.00 \$22.73			
16 Gauge - 18" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$26.40 N/A	\$27.52 \$27.19			
16 Gauge - 24" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$34.44 N/A	\$36.26 \$35.95			
16 Gauge - 30" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$42.24 N/A	\$45.05 \$44.70			
16 Gauge - 36" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$51.04 N/A	\$53.75 \$53.45			
16 Gauge - 42" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$59.84 N/A	\$63.20 \$62.95			
16 Gauge - 48" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$66.88 N/A	\$72.20 \$71.89			

All Valid Bid Prices/Vendors Accepted.
Purchases for individual projects will be based upon availability, distance, project pipe specifications/requirements, and best pricing. All items shall conform to acceptable Johnson County Highway Department and/or State of TN individual project specifications.
Conformity to these specifications will be reviewed by Johnson County Highway Department as needed. No guarantee of purchases in any amount.

16 Gauge - 60" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$87.12 N/A	\$95.00 \$94.67																		
Corrugated Metal Pipe (Arch) LINEAR FEET																					
48" - 57x38; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 2-2/3 x 1/2)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$125.84 N/A	\$133.00 \$132.46																		
54" - 64x43; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 2-2/3 x 1/2)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$141.51 N/A	\$162.00 \$160.85																		
60" - 66x51; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$160.45 N/A	\$122.00 \$120.52																		
66" - 73x55; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$178.18 N/A	\$133.00 \$131.99																		
72" - 81x59; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$194.06 N/A	\$145.00 \$143.78																		
78" - 87x63; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$209.94 N/A	\$157.00 \$155.56																		
84" - 95x67; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$225.82 N/A	\$169.00 \$167.33																		
90" - 103x71; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$248.41 N/A	\$182.00 \$179.11																		
96" - 112x75; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$266.53 N/A	\$193.00 \$190.88																		
102" - 117x79; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----	\$281.04 N/A	\$205.00 \$202.67																		
																Green Highlighted Boxes show lowest base price only, not necessarily lowest cost to pick-up.					
																Lowest Delivered Price (Truck Load Quantities - See Bid Documents for More information)					
																See Bid Documents for Delivered Load Quantities					

108" - 128x83; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$299.09 N/A	\$216.00 \$214.45				
114" - 137x87; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$315.48 N/A	\$228.00 \$226.22				
120" - 142x91; 12 Gauge Per Foot (Type 5x1)	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$331.81 N/A	\$241.00 \$238.00				
Slick Wall Plastic Pipe (Non-ASSHTO) LINEAR FEET								
15" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$11.75 N/A	N/A N/A				
18" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$16.00 N/A	N/A N/A				
24" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$27.00 N/A	N/A N/A				
Slick Wall Plastic Pipe (Meets AASHTO M294 Type S Requirements) LINEAR FEET								
15" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$12.60 N/A	\$13.35 \$13.06				
18" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$29.75 N/A	\$17.16 \$16.84				
24" Dia. Per Foot	(Pick-Up) ----- (Delivered) -----		\$42.50 N/A	\$29.70 \$29.33				

BIDS

Guardrails 23-2

REQUISITION #: 35652

DATE: 06/22/2023

ARTICLES	BIDDERS	Tennessee Guardrail				
Guardrails - New - Per Foot (Installed) -----	\$39.50	NO BID		No guarantee of purchases in any amount.		
Guardrails - Used - Per Foot (Delivered Non-Installed) -----	\$23.75					
Posts - New - Each (Installed) -----	\$18.50					
Posts - Used - Each (Delivered Non-Installed) -----	\$9.25					
Posts - New - Each (Installed) -----	\$92.50			Lowest price vendor will be used, based upon product availability, and items meeting project specifications.		
Posts - Used - Each (Delivered Non-Installed) -----	\$72.25					
End Terminals - New - Each (Rounded Ends) (Installed) -----	\$26.75					
End Terminals - New - Each (Rounded Ends) (Delivered Non-Installed) -----	\$19.50					
End Terminals - New - Each (Rounded Ends) (Installed) -----	\$85.00					
End Terminals - New - Each (Rounded Ends) (Delivered Non-Installed) -----	\$72.50					

* Hwy Markings - See bid for further information.

BIDS

Stone 23-3

REQUISITION #: 35652

DATE: 06/22/2023

ARTICLES	BIDDERS	Blue Water Industries - Abingdon & Watauga Quarries	Maymead Materials, Inc.	Middle Quarry	Butler Stone & Gravel	Radford Quarries	
Crusher Run Price Per Ton		\$21.10	\$16.00	\$13.00	NO BID	NO BID	All Valid Bid Prices/Vendors Accepted. Purchases will be based upon best pricing, availability, distance, and product quality.No guarantee of purchases in any amount. Green Highlighted Boxes show lowest base price only, not necessarily lowest cost to obtain. Items with Red Box Outline show duplicate bid prices. Open Market purchase applicable, but distance calculation will remain a deciding purchase factor.
Block Material		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
Grade D		\$21.60	\$20.00	N/A			
#57 Stone		\$28.20	\$20.00	N/A			
#5 Stone		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
#78M Stone		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
3/4" Stone		\$28.20	\$20.00	N/A			
Surge Pile		\$21.75	\$20.00	N/A			
Rip Rap or Class B (Pick-Up)		\$29.20	\$22.00	\$20.00			
#67 Stone		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
#8 Stone		\$27.20	\$20.00	N/A			
#68 Stone		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
#10 Stone		\$25.25	\$20.00	N/A			
#6 Stone		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
#8P Stone		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
2" Stone		\$26.20	\$20.00	\$19.00			
4" Stone		N/A	\$20.00	\$20.00			
#79 Stone		N/A	\$20.00	N/A			
#9 Stone		\$28.02	\$20.00	N/A			

BIDS

Liquid Asphalt 23-5

REQUISITION #: 35652

DATE: 06/22/2023

ARTICLES	BIDDERS	Associated Asphalt - Bristol LLC	Hudson Materials Company		All Valid Bid Prices/Vendors Accepted. Purchases for individual projects will be based upon availability, distance, and best pricing. No guarantee of purchases in any amount.	
Price Per Gallon						
Grade CRS-2 Emulsified Asphalt Material (Plant Pick-Up) -----		\$2.380	\$2.950			
(Delivered) -----		\$2.510	\$3.280			
Pricing Subject to Changes-----		NO - FIRM	YES			