







**RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
BID TABULATION**

**BID FORM 7: 1ST STREET FROM OAK TRAIL TO SOUTH END**

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC							AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.		
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00
3	7,440	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 74,400.00	\$ 74,400.00	\$ 74,400.00	\$ 14,880.00	\$ 14,880.00	\$ 14,880.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 39,432.00	\$ 39,432.00	\$ 39,432.00
4	8,267	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 41,335.00	\$ 41,335.00	\$ 41,335.00	\$ 33,068.00	\$ 33,068.00	\$ 33,068.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38,028.20	\$ 38,028.20	\$ 38,028.20
5	124	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -			\$ -			\$ 37,200.00			\$ 24,800.00			\$ -			\$ -		\$ -	\$ 19,840.00		
6	124	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -		\$ 62,000.00			\$ 22,692.00		\$ -			\$ -		\$ -	\$ 43,400.00		
7	8,267	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -			\$ -					\$ 165,340.00			\$ 107,471.00				\$ -		\$ -		\$ 52,908.80	
10	16,533	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 165,330.00	\$ 165,330.00	\$ 165,330.00	\$ 49,599.00	\$ 49,599.00	\$ 49,599.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 87,624.90	\$ 87,624.90	\$ 87,624.90
8	2,067	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 41,340.00	\$ 41,340.00	\$ 41,340.00	\$ 12,402.00	\$ 12,402.00	\$ 12,402.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,821.10	\$ 6,821.10	\$ 6,821.10
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00
13	20	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00
11	20	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 19,000.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 24" CMP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 24" CMP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 24" CMP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 759,605.00	\$ 784,405.00	\$ 846,410.00	\$ 275,249.00	\$ 273,141.00	\$ 324,852.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 239,654.20	\$ 263,214.20	\$ 234,694.80
										\$ 569,605.00														

**BID FORM 8: 2ND STREET FROM LANE AVE TO SOUTH END**

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC							AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.		
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 73,000.00	\$ 73,000.00	\$ 73,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 73,000.00	\$ 73,000.00	\$ 73,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00
3	13,480	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 107,840.00	\$ 107,840.00	\$ 107,840.00	\$ 26,960.00	\$ 26,960.00	\$ 26,960.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 71,444.00	\$ 71,444.00	\$ 71,444.00
4	14,978	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 59,912.00	\$ 59,912.00	\$ 59,912.00	\$ 59,912.00	\$ 59,912.00	\$ 59,912.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 68,898.80	\$ 68,898.80	\$ 68,898.80
5	225	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -			\$ -			\$ 67,500.00			\$ 45,000.00			\$ -			\$ -		\$ -	\$ 36,000.00		
6	225	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -		\$ 67,500.00			\$ 41,175.00		\$ -			\$ -		\$ -	\$ 78,750.00		
7	14,978	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -			\$ -					\$ 299,560.00			\$ 194,714.00				\$ -		\$ -		\$ 95,859.20	
10	29,956	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 269,604.00	\$ 269,604.00	\$ 269,604.00	\$ 89,868.00	\$ 89,868.00	\$ 89,868.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 158,766.80	\$ 158,766.80	\$ 158,766.80
8	3,744	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 74,880.00	\$ 74,880.00	\$ 74,880.00	\$ 22,464.00	\$ 22,464.00	\$ 22,464.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,355.20	\$ 12,355.20	\$ 12,355.20
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00
13	36	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 14,400.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 900.00	\$ 900.00	\$ 900.00
11	36	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 216,000.00	\$ 216,000.00	\$ 216,000.00	\$ 75,600.00	\$ 75,600.00	\$ 75,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 34,200.00	\$ 34,200.00	\$ 34,200.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 24" CMP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,400.00	\$ 3,400.00	\$ 3,400.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 18" CMP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 899,136.00	\$ 899,136.00	\$ 1,071,284.00	\$ 481,704.00	\$ 477,879.00	\$ 571,506.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 406,072.80	\$ 448,822.80	\$ 397,033.20

Contract Pricing Only



RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
 BID TABULATION

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC						AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.			
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 35,000.00	\$ 77,000.00	\$ 77,000.00	\$ 77,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$ 77,000.00	\$ 77,000.00	\$ 77,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00
3	14,180	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 85,080.00	\$ 85,080.00	\$ 85,080.00	\$ 28,360.00	\$ 28,360.00	\$ 28,360.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 75,154.00	\$ 75,154.00	\$ 75,154.00
4	15,756	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 63,024.00	\$ 63,024.00	\$ 63,024.00	\$ 63,024.00	\$ 63,024.00	\$ 63,024.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 72,477.60	\$ 72,477.60	\$ 72,477.60
5	236	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 59,000.00	\$ 59,000.00	\$ 59,000.00	\$ 47,200.00	\$ 47,200.00	\$ 47,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 37,760.00	\$ 37,760.00	\$ 37,760.00
6	236	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 94,400.00	\$ 94,400.00	\$ 94,400.00	\$ 43,188.00	\$ 43,188.00	\$ 43,188.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 82,600.00	\$ 82,600.00	\$ 82,600.00
7	15,756	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 236,340.00	\$ 236,340.00	\$ 236,340.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 100,838.40	\$ 100,838.40	\$ 100,838.40
10	31,511	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 283,599.00	\$ 283,599.00	\$ 283,599.00	\$ 94,533.00	\$ 94,533.00	\$ 94,533.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 167,008.30	\$ 167,008.30	\$ 167,008.30
8	3,939	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 78,780.00	\$ 78,780.00	\$ 78,780.00	\$ 23,634.00	\$ 23,634.00	\$ 23,634.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,998.70	\$ 12,998.70	\$ 12,998.70
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00
13	22	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,800.00	\$ 8,800.00	\$ 8,800.00	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 3,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 550.00	\$ 550.00	\$ 550.00
11	22	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 154,000.00	\$ 154,000.00	\$ 154,000.00	\$ 46,200.00	\$ 46,200.00	\$ 46,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20,900.00	\$ 20,900.00	\$ 20,900.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 48" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 6,500.00
12	2	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 10,600.00	\$ 10,600.00	\$ 10,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #4, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00
				<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 848,283.00</b>	<b>\$ 883,683.00</b>	<b>\$ 962,599.00</b>	<b>\$ 488,891.00</b>	<b>\$ 484,839.00</b>	<b>\$ 583,455.00</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ -</b>	<b>\$ 435,356.60</b>	<b>\$ 480,196.60</b>	<b>\$ 425,957.40</b>

Contractor Evaluation completed  
 Pricing completed 05.11.2021



RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
 BID TABULATION

BID FORM 12: CR 4104 FROM US 175 FRONTAGE RD TO FM 148

			ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC			AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.			
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	
1	1	LS Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
2	1	LS Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
3	23,860	LF Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 143,160.00	\$ 143,160.00	\$ 143,160.00	\$ 130,000.00	\$ 130,000.00	\$ 130,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00
4	26,511	SY 8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 79,533.00	\$ 79,533.00	\$ 79,533.00	\$ 47,720.00	\$ 47,720.00	\$ 47,720.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 126,458.00	\$ 126,458.00	\$ 126,458.00
5	398	TON Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 79,600.00	\$ 79,600.00	\$ 79,600.00	\$ 106,044.00	\$ 106,044.00	\$ 106,044.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 121,950.60	\$ 121,950.60	\$ 121,950.60
6	398	TON Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 79,600.00	\$ 79,600.00	\$ 79,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 63,680.00	\$ 63,680.00	\$ 63,680.00
7	26,511	SY Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 159,200.00	\$ 159,200.00	\$ 159,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
10	53,022	SY Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 477,198.00	\$ 477,198.00	\$ 477,198.00	\$ 130,000.00	\$ 130,000.00	\$ 130,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00
8	6,628	SY 2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 132,560.00	\$ 132,560.00	\$ 132,560.00	\$ 47,720.00	\$ 47,720.00	\$ 47,720.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 126,458.00	\$ 126,458.00	\$ 126,458.00
14	1	EA Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 397,665.00	\$ 397,665.00	\$ 397,665.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 169,670.40	\$ 169,670.40	\$ 169,670.40
15	1	EA Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 477,198.00	\$ 477,198.00	\$ 477,198.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 281,016.60	\$ 281,016.60	\$ 281,016.60
16	1	EA Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 132,560.00	\$ 132,560.00	\$ 132,560.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21,872.40	\$ 21,872.40	\$ 21,872.40
13	40	EA Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00
11	40	EA Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 240,000.00	\$ 240,000.00	\$ 240,000.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #4, 18" HP, 40' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38,000.00	\$ 38,000.00	\$ 38,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #5, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #6, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 2,600.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #7, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #8, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #9, 30" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #10, 30" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	2	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #11, 30" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,400.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #12, 30" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #13, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #14, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,800.00	\$ 6,800.00	\$ 6,800.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #15, 18" HP, 36' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #16, 18" HP, 36' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,400.00	\$ 3,400.00	\$ 3,400.00
12	1	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #17, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00
12	2	EA Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #18, 30" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 2,800.00
			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,468,051.00	\$ 1,547,651.00	\$ 1,706,583.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 2,800.00	\$ 2,800.00
			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00
			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,400.00
			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 877,698.00	\$ 870,932.00	\$ 1,036,697.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 758,585.60	\$ 834,205.60	\$ 742,625.40

Contract Pricing 05.11.2021





RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
 BID TABULATION

**BID FORM 15: SHERWOOD LN FROM FM 2757 TO END**

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC						AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.			
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ 21,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00
3	3,860	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7,720.00	\$ 7,720.00	\$ 7,720.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20,458.00	\$ 20,458.00	\$ 20,458.00
4	4,289	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 17,156.00	\$ 17,156.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 19,729.40	\$ 19,729.40	\$ -
5	64	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,240.00	\$ -	\$ -
6	64	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,712.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 22,400.00	\$ -	\$ -
7	4,289	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 55,757.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 27,449.60
10	8,578	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,734.00	\$ 25,734.00	\$ 25,734.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 45,463.40	\$ 45,463.40	\$ 45,463.40
8	1,072	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,432.00	\$ 6,432.00	\$ 6,432.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,537.60	\$ 3,537.60	\$ 3,537.60
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00
13	15	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ 2,250.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 375.00	\$ 375.00	\$ 375.00
11	15	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 31,500.00	\$ 31,500.00	\$ 31,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 14,250.00	\$ 14,250.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 24" HP, 36' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,700.00	\$ 4,700.00	\$ 4,700.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,600.00	\$ 3,600.00	\$ 3,600.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 152,292.00	\$ 151,204.00	\$ 178,093.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 136,061.40	\$ 148,221.40	\$ 133,541.60

**BID FORM 16: UNION HILL ROAD FROM FM 2757 TO END**

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC						AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.			
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00
3	7,540	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 15,080.00	\$ 15,080.00	\$ 15,080.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 39,962.00	\$ 39,962.00	\$ 39,962.00
4	8,378	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 33,512.00	\$ 33,512.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38,538.80	\$ 38,538.80	\$ -
5	126	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 20,160.00	\$ -	\$ -
6	126	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 23,058.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 44,100.00	\$ -	\$ -
7	8,378	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 108,914.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 53,619.20
10	16,756	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 50,268.00	\$ 50,268.00	\$ 50,268.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 88,806.80	\$ 88,806.80	\$ 88,806.80
8	2,094	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,564.00	\$ 12,564.00	\$ 12,564.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,910.20	\$ 6,910.20	\$ 6,910.20
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00
13	20	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00
11	20	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ 42,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 19,000.00	\$ 19,000.00
12	2	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,600.00	\$ 10,600.00	\$ 10,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 7,200.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 48" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,400.00	\$ 6,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 7,000.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 286,624.00	\$ 284,482.00	\$ 336,826.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 249,185.80	\$ 273,125.80	\$ 244,106.20

Contractor Pricing 05.21.2021

RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
 BID TABULATION

**BID FORM 17: CR 4007 FROM CR 4009 TO COUNTY LINE**

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC				AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.			
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
3	7,000	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
4	7,778	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 31,112.00	\$ 31,112.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 37,100.00
5	117	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 23,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 35,778.80
6	117	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21,411.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 18,720.00
7	7,778	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 101,114.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 40,950.00
10	15,556	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 46,668.00	\$ 46,668.00	\$ 46,668.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 49,779.20
8	1,944	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,664.00	\$ 11,664.00	\$ 11,664.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 82,446.80
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,415.20
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00
13	7	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 1,050.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00
11	7	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14,700.00	\$ 14,700.00	\$ 14,700.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 175.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,650.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 24" HP, 32' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,400.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 229,694.00	\$ 227,705.00	\$ 276,296.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 212,493.80

**BID FORM 18: CR 4009 FROM CR 4007 TO CR 4011**

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC				AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.			
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
3	18,900	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 103,000.00	\$ 103,000.00	\$ 103,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,000.00
4	21,000	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 37,800.00	\$ 37,800.00	\$ 37,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00
5	315	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 100,170.00
6	315	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 63,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 96,600.00
7	21,000	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 57,645.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 50,400.00
10	42,000	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 126,000.00	\$ 126,000.00	\$ 126,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 134,400.00
8	5,250	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 31,500.00	\$ 31,500.00	\$ 31,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 222,600.00
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 17,325.00
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00
13	16	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00
11	16	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 33,600.00	\$ 33,600.00	\$ 33,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 15,200.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,400.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,600.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #4, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,600.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #5, 24" HP, 32' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,600.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #6, 24" HP, 36' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,700.00	\$ 4,700.00	\$ 4,700.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,500.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 612,100.00	\$ 606,745.00	\$ 738,100.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,600.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 545,403.00







RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
BID TABULATION

BID FORM 22: SHADY LN FROM FM 1388 TO CITY LIMIT

ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC					AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.					
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 135,000.00	\$ 135,000.00	\$ 135,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 135,000.00	\$ 135,000.00	\$ 135,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	
3	24,800	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 49,600.00	\$ 49,600.00	\$ 49,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 131,440.00	\$ 131,440.00	\$ 131,440.00	
4	27,556	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 110,224.00	\$ 110,224.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 126,757.60	\$ 126,757.60	\$ -	
5	413	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 82,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 66,080.00	\$ -	\$ -	
6	413	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 75,579.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 144,550.00	\$ -	\$ -
7	27,556	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 358,228.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 176,358.40	
10	55,111	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 165,333.00	\$ 165,333.00	\$ 165,333.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 292,088.30	\$ 292,088.30	\$ 292,088.30	
8	6,889	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 41,334.00	\$ 41,334.00	\$ 41,334.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 22,733.70	\$ 22,733.70	\$ 22,733.70	
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	
13	50	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 7,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 1,250.00	
11	50	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 105,000.00	\$ 105,000.00	\$ 105,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 47,500.00	\$ 47,500.00	\$ 47,500.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 15" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 3,900.00	\$ 3,900.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 36" HP, 32' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #4, 30" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ 5,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #5, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #6, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,400.00	\$ 4,400.00	\$ 4,400.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #7, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #8, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #9, 36" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ 5,300.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00	\$ 4,300.00	
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 875,791.00	\$ 868,770.00	\$ 1,041,195.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 748,857.60	\$ 827,327.60	\$ 732,378.40	

Draft - Contractor Pricing completed 05.11.2021



RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
 BID TABULATION

**BID FORM 23: SILVERCREEK DR FROM FM 148 TO BLUEBONNET DR**

				ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC			AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.			
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 39,000.00	\$ 39,000.00	\$ 39,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 45,500.00	\$ 45,500.00	\$ 45,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 84,000.00	\$ 127,500.00	\$ 127,500.00	\$ 127,500.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	
3	15,400	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 46,200.00	\$ 46,200.00	\$ 46,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 30,800.00	\$ 30,800.00	\$ 30,800.00	\$ 55,440.00	\$ 55,440.00	\$ 55,440.00	\$ 30,800.00	\$ 30,800.00	\$ 30,800.00	\$ 81,620.00	\$ 81,620.00	\$ 81,620.00	
4	17,111	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 102,666.00	\$ 102,666.00		\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 68,444.00	\$ 68,444.00		\$ 171,110.00	\$ 171,110.00		\$ 110,194.84	\$ 110,194.84		\$ 78,710.60	\$ 78,710.60		
5	257	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -			\$ 38,550.00			\$ -			\$ 51,400.00			\$ 44,088.35			\$ 51,400.00			\$ 41,120.00			
6	257	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)		\$ -			\$ 78,642.00			\$ -			\$ 47,031.00			\$ 126,444.00			\$ 69,390.00			\$ 89,950.00		
7	17,111	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment			\$ -			NO BID			\$ -		\$ 222,443.00				NO BID			\$ 290,887.00			\$ 109,510.40	
10	17,111	SY	Asphalt TY-D (PG64-22) TXDOT 340	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 342,220.00	\$ 342,220.00	\$ 342,220.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 342,220.00	\$ 342,220.00	\$ 342,220.00	\$ 376,442.00	\$ 376,442.00	\$ 376,442.00	\$ 419,219.50	\$ 419,219.50	\$ 419,219.50	\$ 359,331.00	\$ 359,331.00	\$ 359,331.00	
8	4,278	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21,390.00	\$ 21,390.00	\$ 21,390.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,668.00	\$ 25,668.00	\$ 25,668.00	\$ 43,635.60	\$ 43,635.60	\$ 43,635.60	\$ 14,973.00	\$ 14,973.00	\$ 14,973.00	\$ 14,117.40	\$ 14,117.40	\$ 14,117.40	
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 500.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,750.00	\$ 2,750.00	\$ 2,750.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 5,600.00	\$ 5,600.00	\$ 5,600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	
13	46	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,050.00	\$ 8,050.00	\$ 8,050.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,900.00	\$ 6,900.00	\$ 6,900.00	\$ 18,630.00	\$ 18,630.00	\$ 18,630.00	\$ 9,200.00	\$ 9,200.00	\$ 9,200.00	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 1,150.00	
11	46	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 64,400.00	\$ 64,400.00	\$ 64,400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 96,600.00	\$ 96,600.00	\$ 96,600.00	\$ 203,228.00	\$ 203,228.00	\$ 203,228.00	\$ 103,500.00	\$ 103,500.00	\$ 103,500.00	\$ 43,700.00	\$ 43,700.00	\$ 43,700.00	
12	2	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #1, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ 14,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 7,240.00	\$ 7,240.00	\$ 7,240.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 3,200.00	\$ 3,200.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #4, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 11,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,620.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00	
12	2	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #5, 18" HP, 36' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ 16,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 8,400.00	\$ 8,400.00	\$ 8,400.00	\$ 8,720.00	\$ 8,720.00	\$ 8,720.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,600.00	\$ 4,600.00	
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 781,126.00	\$ 821,218.00	NO BID	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 820,432.00	\$ 816,063.00	\$ 923,031.00	\$ 1,109,893.95	\$ 1,192,249.60	NO BID	\$ 836,287.34	\$ 854,277.34	\$ 965,579.50	\$ 657,657.00	\$ 706,487.00	\$ 647,336.80	

Contractor Evaluation  
 Pricing completed  
 05.11.2021

RFP 21-11: Kaufman County Road Bond Projects  
BID TABULATION

BID FORM 24: CR 4090 FROM FM 1390 TO TX 34 (ADDENDUM #1)

				ANDERSON ASPHALT & CONCRETE PAVING, LLC			AUSTIN BRIDGE & ROAD			CK NEWBERRY, LLC			ED BELL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY			PAVECON PUBLIC WORKS, LP			TEXANA LAND & ASPHALT, INC.			TEXAS MATERIALS GROUP, INC.					
Item No.	Est Qty	Unit	Description	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount	Amount Bid	Alt #1 Bid Amount	Alt #2 Bid Amount			
1	1	LS	Mobilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 155,000.00	\$ 155,000.00	\$ 155,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00	\$ 13,000.00
2	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 155,000.00	\$ 155,000.00	\$ 155,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 12,000.00
3	28,520	LF	Ditch Grading	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 57,040.00	\$ 57,040.00	\$ 57,040.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 151,156.00	\$ 151,156.00	\$ 151,156.00
4	31,689	SY	8" Subgrade Stabilization	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 126,756.00	\$ 126,756.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 145,769.40	\$ 145,769.40	\$ -
5	475	TON	Cement for Subgrade Stabilization (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 95,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 76,000.00	\$ -	\$ -
6	475	TON	Hydrated Lime (6%)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 86,925.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 166,250.00	\$ -	\$ -
7	31,689	SY	Subgrade Preparation & Emulsified Asphalt Treatment	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 411,957.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 202,809.60
10	63,378	SY	Chip Seal	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 190,134.00	\$ 190,134.00	\$ 190,134.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 335,903.40	\$ 335,903.40	\$ 335,903.40
8	7,922	SY	2" Flexible Base	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 47,532.00	\$ 47,532.00	\$ 47,532.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 26,142.60	\$ 26,142.60	\$ 26,142.60
14	1	EA	Remove Small Tree (10" Diameter & Smaller)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ 400.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00	\$ 516.00
15	1	EA	Remove Medium Tree (11"-19" Diameter)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ 600.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00	\$ 826.00
16	1	EA	Remove Large Tree (20" Diameter or Larger)	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ 1,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00	\$ 2,066.00
13	48	EA	Remove and Reinstall Mailbox	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 7,200.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 1,200.00
11	48	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. 18" CMP Driveway Culvert, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 100,800.00	\$ 100,800.00	\$ 100,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 45,600.00	\$ 45,600.00	\$ 45,600.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #2, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 2,300.00	\$ 2,300.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #3, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00
12	2	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #4, 30" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 6,600.00	\$ 6,600.00	\$ 6,600.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #5, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 3,000.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #6, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 2,400.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #7, 24" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ 4,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 3,300.00	\$ 3,300.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #8, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 2,500.00
12	1	EA	Remove and Replace Ex. Cross Culvert #9, 18" HP, 30' Length	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ 4,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 2,700.00
				\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 979,962.00	\$ 971,887.00	\$ 1,170,163.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 838,379.40	\$ 928,629.40	\$ 819,419.60

Contractor Pricing completed 05.11.2021

