Purchasing Division

HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS
ITB 18-020

Bid opening: 2/13/2018

ML CESCRIPTION 0-49
1 3 X 6 Single hole

Osburn Associates, Inc. . 50.28

Vulcan, Inc, (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $0.57
[2 4 X 8 Standard hole

Osburn Associates, Inc. $0.49

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $0.78
3 6 X 12 With 2 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. $1.08

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $1.25
q 12 X 6 With 2 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. $1.08

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $1.17
5 36 X 36 SCHOOL CROSSING DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $16.78

Osburn Associates, Inc. o $19.35
6 9 X 24 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. $3.23

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $3.24
7 9 X 30 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. $4.03

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $4.06
8 9 X 36 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. | $4.84

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $5.10
9 9 X 42 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. $5.63

Vulean, inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $6.07
10 9 X 48 With 4 Holes

Vuican, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Signs) $2.63
| Osburn Associates, Inc. $6.45
11 9 X 54 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc. §7.25

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Signs) $7.77
12 12 X 18 With 2 Holes

Osburn Associates, inc. $3.23

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs} $3.25
13 24 X 12 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc. $4.30

Vulean, Inc.- {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) | $4.54

118 18-020 TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES, MATERIALS, AND SUPPLIES
PAGE10F8

TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES, MATERIALS AND HARDWARE

50-99

50.28
50.57

$0.49
$0.78

$1.08
51.25

s1.08
$1.17

$16.78
$19.35

$3.23
$3.24

$4.03
$4.06

$4.84
$5.10

$5.63
$6.07

$2.63
$6.45

$7.25
$7.77

$3.23
$3.25

54.30

$4.54

100 or + RANK
$0.28 1
$0.57

$0.49 1
$0.78 2
$1.08 1
$1.25 2
$1.08

$1.17 2
$16.78 1
$19.35 2
$3.23 1
$3.24 2
$4.03 1
$4.06 12
$4.84 1
$5.10 2
$5.63

$6.07 )
$2.63 1
$6.45

$7.25 1
$7.77 2
$3.23 1
$3.25 2
$4.30 1
$4.54 2



NUM
14

17

18

15

23

25

27

DESCRIPTICN

12 X 36 DRILLED FOR FDOT 2-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, ln-c. (dBa Vulcan Alurminum / Vulcan Signs)
36 X12 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
21 X 15 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Yulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
18 X 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z/BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
24 x 18 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
48 X 18 With 2 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
24 X 36 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
36 x 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT 2-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
24 x 48 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Si_gns)
48 x 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc,

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
30 X 18 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulean Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
30 X 36 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc,

Vulcan, Inc. {(dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
48 X 30 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Signs)
30 X 60 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
36 x 20 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR

QOsburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
48 X 36 With 4 Holes

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Ine. {dba Yulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
18 X 18 With 2 Holes Drilled Square FOR FDOT Z-BAR

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, In¢. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
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0-439

$6.45
$6.71

$6.45
$6.71

$4.69
$4.84

$6.45
$6.76

56.45
$6.76

$12.90
$13.35

$12.90
$13.10

$12.90
$13.10

$17.20
$17.68

$17.20
$17.68

58.06
$8.22

$16.13
516.56

$21.48
$22.10

$26.88
$26.97

$10.74
$11.05

$25.78
$26.61

$4.84
$5.07

50- 99

$6.45
$6.71

$6.45
$6.71

$4.69
54.84

$6.45
$6.76

$6.45
$6.76

$12.90
$13.35

$12.90
$13.10

$12.50
$13.10

$17.20
$17.68

$17.20
$17.68

$8.06
$8.22

$16.13
$16.56

$21.48
$22.10

$26.88
$26.97

$10.74
$11.05

$25.78
$26.61

$4.84
$5.07

100 or + RANK |
$6.45 1
$6.71
$6.45 1|
$6.71 {
1
$4.69 i 1
$4.84 2
$6.45 1
$6.76 2
$6.45 1
$6.76 2
$12.90 1
$13.35 2
$12.90 1
$13.10 2
$12.90 1
$13.10 2
$17.20 1
$17.68 2
$17.20 1
$17.68 2
$8.06 1
$8.22 2
$16.13 1
$16.56 2
$21.48 1
$22.10 2
$26.88 1
$26.97 2
$10.74 1
$11.05 2
$25.78 1
$26.61 2
54,84 1
$5.07 2



NUM DESCRIPTICN 0-49 50-99 100 ar + RANK

31 18 X 18 With 2 Holes Drilled Diamond Shape
| Osburn Associates, Inc. $4.84 54.84 $4.84 1
Vulean, inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $5.10 $5.10 $5.10 2
32 24 X 24 With 2 Holes DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Osburn Associates, Inc. $8.60 $8.60 $8.60 1
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $8.91 $8.91 $8.91 2
33 30 X 30 With 2 Holes Drilled Square FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Oshurn Associates, Inc. $13.42 $13.42 $13.42 1
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $13.52 | $13.52 $13.52 2
34 30 X 30 With 2 Holes Drilied Diamond Shape DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Qsburn Associates, Inc. $13.42 $13.42 $13.42 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $13.52 $13.52 513.52 2
35 36 X 36 With 2 Holes Drilled Square FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Osburn Associates, Inc. 519.34 $19.34 $19.34 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $19.76 $19.76 $19.76 2
36 36 x36 Circle With 2 Holes Drilled DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR
‘Julcan, Inc. {(dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs} $18.76 $18.76 $18.76 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $19.34 $19.34 $19.34 2
37 36 X 36 With 2 Holes Drilled Diamond Shape FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Osburn Associates, Inc. $19.34 $159.34 519.34 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $19.76 $19.76 519.76 2
138 36 Octagon With 2 Holes
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $17.54 $17.54 $17.54 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $18.49 $18.49 $18.49 2
39 36 Triangle With 2 Holes DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $9.21 $9.21 50.21 1
Osburn Associates, Inc. $9.68 $9.68 59.68 2
40 30 Octagon With 2 Holes
Vuican, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $11.92 511.92 $11.92
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.88 $12.88 $12.88 2
41 36 X 36 Pentagon County RTE. With 2 Holes
Osburn Associates, Inc. $19.78 $19.78 $19.78 1
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $19.97 $19.97 $19.97 2
42 30 x 24 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Osburn Associates, Inc, $10.74 $10.74 $10.74 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $10.99 $10.99 $10.99
43 48 X 48 With 4 Holes Drilled Diamond
Osburn Associates, Inc. $34.40 $34.40 534.40 1
Vulean, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $35.30 $35.30 $35.30 2
44 24 X 30 DRILLED FOR FDOT Z-BAR
Osburn Associates, Inc. $10.74 $10.74 $10.74 1
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) $10.99 $10.99 $10.99
45 FLAT SIGN BRACKETS SHALL FIT POSTS 23/8 AND 21/2
~ Osburn Associates, Inc. $3.25 $3.25 $3.25 1
B Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid -
46 STREET SIGN TWIST BRACKET FOR U CHANNEL POST
___Osburn Associates, Inc. $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid -
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|NUM
47

51

DESCRIPTION

2 3/8" Round sign post, galv. 10"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Slgns]
23/8" Round sign post, galv. 12'

Osburn Assaciates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
2 3/3" Round sign post, galv. 14'

Oshurn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Ine. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Si_g_ns)'

2 1/2" Round sign post, alum. 10

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
2 1/2" Round sign post, alum. 12'

Osburn Associates, Inc,

Vulcan Inc. {dba Vulean Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
21/2" Round sign post alum, 14"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
3" Round sign post, alum. 20

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. idha Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
3" Round sign post, alum, 12'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Signs)
3" Round si§n_post, alum. 14'

Osburn Associétes, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulean Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
3 1/2" Round sign post, alum. 10’

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. (dba Vuican Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
31/2" Round sign post,'alum. 12’

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
3 1/2" Round sign post, alum. 14' -

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
4" Round sign post, alum. 10'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
4" Round sign post, alum. 12’ o

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
4" Round sign post, alum. 14'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
41/2" Round sign post, alum. 10'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
4 1/2" Round sign post, alum. 12'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
41/2" Round sign post, alum. 14'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Sig_n.sl
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0-49

$31.80
No Bid

538.16
No Bid

$44.52

~ No Bid

$26.90
No Bid

$32.28
No Bid

$37.66
No Bid

$33.30
No Bid

$39.96
No Bid

$46.62
No Bid

$56.50
No Bid

567 80
No Bid

$79.10
No Bid

$86.80
No Bid

$104.16
No Bid

$121.52
No Bid

$96.30
No Bid

$115.56
No Bid

$134.82
No Bid

50-39

$31.80
No Bid

$38.16
No Bid

$44.52
No Bid

$26.90
No Bid

$32.28
No Bid

$37.66
No Bid

$33.30
No Bid

$39.96
No Bid

$46.62
No Bid

$56.50
No Bid

$67.80
No Bid

$79.10
No Bid

$86.80
No Bid

$104.16
No 8id

$121.52
No Bid

$115.56
No Bid

$134.82
No Bid

100 or + RAMNE
$31.80 1
No Bid .
$38.16 1
No Bid -
$44.52 |1
No Bid -
$26.90 | 1
No Bid .
$32.28 1
No Bid -
$37.66 1
No Bid .
$33.30 1
No Bid -
$39.96 1
No Bid .
$46.62 1
No Bid -
$56.50 1
No Bid .
$67.80 1
No Bid -
$79.10 1
No Bid .
$86.80 1
No Bid .
$104.16 1
No Bid 5
$121.52 1
No Bid -
$96.30 1
No Bid 5
$115.56 1
No Bid -
$134.82 1
No Bid .



NUM
53, 54, 55
i

56
57

61

62,63, 64

DESCRIFTION

"U" channel post, galvanized, 1.12 ibs/ft, 6'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
"U" channel post, galvanlzed 1.12 |bslft 7'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum /Vulcan Signs)
“U" channel post, galvamzed 1.12 ibs/ft, 8'

Osburn Associates, inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
"U" channel post, galvamzed 1.12 Ibslft 9

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
"U" channel post, galvanized, 3 Ibs/ft, 10' )

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulean Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
"U* channel post, galvanized, 3 Ibs/ft, 12 o

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
“U* channel post, galvamzed 3 Ibs/ft, 14'

Oshurn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Galv. "U" bold with alum., 2 %"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Galv. "U" bold with alum., 3"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Signs)
Galv. "U" bold with alum., 3.5"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Galv. "U" botd with afum., 4"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Galv, "U" bold with alum., 4.5"

Osburn Assaciates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
10’ Galv. Square tube post, 10 gauge

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulean Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)

Osburn Associates, Inc. o
"U" channel post, galvanized, 4 Ibs/foot, 10'

Osburn Assaciates, Inc.

Vulcan Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
"U" channel post, galvamzed 4 lbs,’foot 12'

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
"U" channel post, galvanized, 4 Ibs/foot, 14' a

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
"U” channel post, galvamz_ed__ 4 Ibsffoot, 16'

Oshurn Associates, Inc. '

Yulcan, inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)

T8 18-020 TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES, MATERIALS, AND SUPPLIES
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0-49

$5.64
No Bid

$6.58
No Bid

$7.52
No Bid

$8.46
No Bid

$23.90
No Bid

528.68
No Bid

$33.46
No Bid

5234
No Bid

$2.45
No Bid

5281
No Bid

$2.87
No Bid

$2.93
No Bid

No Bid
No bid

$31.70
No Bid

$38.04
No Bid

$44.38
No Bid

$50.72
No Bid

50-99

$5.64
No Bid

$6.58
No Bid
$7.52
No Bid

$8.46
No Bid

$23.90
No Bid

$28.68
No Bid

$33.46
No Bid

$2.34
No Bid

$2.45
No Bid

$2.81
No Bid

$2.87
No Bid

$2.93
No Bid

No Bid
No bid

$31.70
No Bid

$38.04
No Bid

$44.38
No Bid

$50.72
No Bid

100 or + RAMNK
$5.64 1
No Bid .
$6.58 1
No Bid -
$7.52 1
No Bid .
$8.46 1
No Bid -
$23.90 1
No Bid .
$28.68 1
No Bid -
533.46 1
No Bid .
$2.34 1
No Bid o
§2.45 1
No Bid .
$2.81 1
No Bid .
$2.87 1
No Bid .
$2.93 1
No Bid -
No Bid 5
No bid -
$31.70 1
No Bid .
$38.04 1
No Bid 5
$44.38 1
No Bid .
$50.72 1
No Bid .



NUM
05

71

T2

73

74

DESCRIPTION

12"x%24" Blank, drilled for FDOT Z-Bar

Osburn Associates, Inc.

VUican, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean S|:§ns)_
12"x30" Blank, drilted for FDOT Z-Bar

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. Ldba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
12"x36" Blank, drilted for FDOT Z-Bar

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Yulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
12"x42" Blank, drifled for FDOT Z-Bar

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
12"x48" Blank, drilled for FDOT Z-Bar

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
12"x54" Blank, drilled for FDOT Z-Bar

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba'Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Signs_)
12"x60" Blank, drilled for FDOT Z-Bar

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 8"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Yulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 14"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 20"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulean Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 26"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 32"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vultan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 38"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 46"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
Aluminum Z-Bar, 1 3/4" x 52"

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulé'an, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
30" Stop Face

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vuican Signs)
36" Stop Face

Osburn Associates, Inc.

Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs)
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0-49

$4.30
No Bid

$5.38
No Bid

$6.45
No Bid

$7.53
No Bid

$8.60
No Bid

$9.68
No Bid

$10.74
No Bid

$2.58
No Bid

$3.78
No Bid

$5.65
No Bid

$7.32
No Bid

$9.19
No Bid

$10.28
No Bid

511.71
No Bid

$14.80
No Bid

$18.11
No I_Bid

$26.08
No Bid

50-99

$4.30
No Bid

$5.38
No Bid

$6.45
No Bid

$7.53
No Bid

$8.60
No Bid

$9.68
No Bid

$10.74
No Bid

$2.58
No Bid

$3.78
No Bid

$5.65
No Bid

$7.32
No Bid

$9.19
No Bid

$10.28
No Bid

$11.71
No Bid

$14.80
No Bid

$18.11
No Bid

$26.08
No Bid

100 or + | RANK
$4.30 1
No Bid -
$5.38 1
No Bid .
$6.45 1
No Bid .
$7.53 1
No Bid .
$8.60 1
No Bid -
$9.68 1
No Bid .
$10.74 1
No Bid .
$2.58 1
No Bid -
$3.78 1
No Bid .
$5.65 1
No Bid .
$7.32 1
No Bid .
$9.19 1
No Bid -
$10.28 1
No Bid .
$11.71 1
No Bid 5
$14.80 1
No Bid .
$18.11 1
No Bid -
$26.08 1
No Bid .



NUM DESCRIPTION 0-49 50-99 100 or + RANK

82 36" Stop Ahead Symbol Face with blank
Osburn Associates, Inc. | $47.34 $47.34 $47.34 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid | -
83 36" Signal Ahead Symbol Face with blank
Osburn Associates, Inc. $47.34 $47.34 $47.34 {5
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Yulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs}) | NoBid No Bid No Bid -
84 36" Yield Face with blank
Oshurn Associates, Inc. $23.67 $23.67 $23.67 G
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Yulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid |
85 36" Reduced Speed Ahead W3-5 Face with blank, No Numbers or letters or border for speed limit
Osburn Associates, Inc. ' $47.34 | %4734 $47.34 i
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No 8id No Bid -
86 24"x48" School Speed Zone "When Flashing Face & Blank"
Osburn Associates, Inc. $42.08 542.08 $42.08 1
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulean Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) | NoBid No Bid No Bid -
87 36" School Crossing face & blank, lime green
Osburn Associates, Inc. | %47.34 | $47.34 $47.34 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid -
88 4"x84" Red reflective post panel with 4-holes
Oshurn Associates, Inc. $12.27 $12.27 $12.27 1
Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid | No Bid No Bid -
89 4"x84" White refiective post panel with 4-holes
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.27 $12.27 $12.27 1
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid
90 4"x84" Yellow reflective post panel with 4-holes
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.27 $12.27 $12.27 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid -
91 4"x84" Lime green reflective post panel with 4-holes
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.27 $12.27 $12.27 S |
Vulean, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid -
92 4"x84" Orange reflective post panel with 4-holes
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.27 $12.27 $12.27 1
Vulcan, Inc. (dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid -
93 Reverse street sign twist bracket for U channe! post
Osburn Associates, Inc. $6.50 $6.50 $6.50 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid
94 Aluminum soil plate drilled vertically & slotted horizontally
Osburn Associates, Inc. $12.28 $12.28 $12.28 1
Vulcan, Inc. {dba Vulcan Aluminum / Vulcan Signs) No Bid No Bid No Bid -
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Neither Local Preference nor WMBE Preference was used to award this bid.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO BOTH VENDORS BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY FOR THE BID

PERIOD 04/01/2017 thru 03/31/2018.

| FZT [penene 31318

Clinton Howerton, P.E., HCBCC County Engineer Date

% O 3-8
Chris Davis, HCBCC Purchasing Manager Date

RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:

Rmndy Uk 3/iefe

Randy Vosbag, HCBCC County A@'linistrator Date



