
Anderson County Government, Purchasing Department

Bid: 4810 Pilgrim's Pride Corporation Tyson

Bid Title:  Chicken Commodity Processing 1770 Promontory Circle 2200 Don Tyson Parkway

Bid Opening: Februrary 21, 2018 at 2:30pm Greeley, CO 80634 Springdale, AZ 72762

Jody Hardin @ 678-482-2231 Charles Boger, Sr @ 479-290-3519

Item Process Chicken A522      100103 Bulk Pack Large Chicken from USDA Delivered State
 Pack 
Size

Cases Lbs/Case Servings/Case Oz./Serving $/Case $/Case x 10 Lbs/Case Servings/Case Oz./Serving $/Case $/Case x 10

Whole grain breaded, whole muscle white breast/rib meat breakfast fillet Fully Cooked 30# 10 32.0200 218 2.20 47.55 475.50 32.5695 226 2.12 57.00 570.00

Credits for minimum of 1 M/MA and 0.5WGR  Equivalent for USDA Frozen

Sodium less than 260mg, weight maximum of 2.25 oz per serving

Gold Kist Farms A+ 7519 as reference 2,200 total servings

Whole grain breaded, whole muscle white breast/rib meat sandwich fillet Fully Cooked 30# 200 32.0200 108 4.25 47.55 9510.00 33.5095 132 3.75 58.79 11758.00

Credits for a minimum of 2 M/MA and 1 WGR Equivalent for USDA Frozen

Sodium less than 425mg, weight 4.5 oz maximum per serving

Gold Kist Farms A+7522 as reference 23,000 total servings

Whole grain breaded, whole muscle white breast/rib meat tenderloins Fully Cooked 30# 400 32.0200 110 4.35 48.45 19380.00 33.5595 117 4.23 61.98 24792.00

Credits for a minimum of 2 M/MA and 1 WGR Equivalent for USDA for 3 strips Frozen

Sodium less than 400mg for 3 strips and maximum weight 4.5 oz for 3 strips

Gold Kist Farms A+7572 as reference 44,000 total servings

Whole Muscle/rib meat Roasted Chicken Breast Fillet/ Grill Marked, fully cooked Fully Cooked 20# 10 21.7500 106 3.00 62.70 627.00 10.6368 54 3.00 27.20 272.00

Credits for a minimum of 2 M/MA, can contain some residual soy for texture Frozen

Sodium less than 450mg per patty, weighing minimum 2.9 oz

Gold Kist #7520 as reference 1,000 servings

Whole Grain Breaded Dark Meat Chicken Smackers/Popcorn Chicken Fully Cooked 30# 400 31.9500 108 4.30 39.75 15900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Credits for a minimum of 2 M/MA  and 1 WGR Equivalent per approximate 10 pieces Frozen NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 of product or about 4.50 oz total weight maximum NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sodium should be less than 500mg per serving NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gold Kist #110458 as reference 44,000 servings NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Boneless, Skinless Dark Chicken Strips, oven roasted and lightly marinated, grill marked Fully Cooked 30# 10 31.7300 195 2.47 48.75 487.50 31.6552 168 2.85 49.20 492.00

Credits for a minimum of 2 M/MA for each 2.5 oz serving Frozen

Sodium should be less than 300mg per serving

Gold Kist #1260 as reference 2,000 servings

Dark Meat Chicken Italian Meatballs, oven roasted fully cooked Fully Cooked 30# 10 31.8700 181 2.65 48.36 483.60 11.0586 58 2.75 13.00 130.00

Credits for 2 M/MA per serving, minimum serving weighs 2.5 oz or more Frozen

Sodium should be less than 400mg per serving

Gold Kist #6410 as reference 2,000 servings

46,863.60$ 38,014.00$ 

7

BID TOTALS

5

6

3

4

Desired Specifications

1

2

2/22/2018


