
B002635.RVO1 Audio/Visual Upgrade for Chan 
Auditorium

Item Qty
Model Description

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

 1)   
4

JBL VRX-AF Array Frame Suspending VRX932LA & VRX918F
$757.00 $3,028.00 $795.00 $3,180.00

 3)   2 Behringer S16
I/O Box with 16 Remote-Controllable Midas 
Preamps, 8 Outputs $513.00 $1,026.00 $1,049.00 $2,098.00

5)
1

Middle Atlantic PTRK21 PTRK Series Rack with Casters $610.00 $610.00 $638.00 $638.00

6)
1

Furman M-8X2
Furman M-8X2 Merit Series 8 Outlet Power 
Conditioner with Surge Protector $110.00 $110.00 $79.00 $79.00

7)
1 Cable Lot and Connectors for Audio Cable Lota nd Connectors for Audio $610.00 $610.00 $884.35 $884.35

8) 1 Hardware and Shop Suppies for Audio
Nuts, Bolts, Gas, Misc. Strut, Support and other 
as needed. $1,879.00 $1,879.00 $1,265.40 $1,265.40

9) NA
3 New Drivelines from the FOH Console to the 
Mains(Subs run on Aux) No Bid No Bid $508.30 $508.30

10) NA
6 XLR Return Lines (2-floor box) to stage for 
monitor return lines No Bid No Bid $18.30 $18.30

11) Freight $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $580.00 $580.00

12) Scaffolding $600.00 $600.00 $950.00 $950.00

13) One Year On-Site Warranty Included Included Included Included

14) Tuning, Commision, Office Time
$2,860.00 $2,860.00 $1,163.75 $1,163.75

15) Installation, Programming, On-Site Labor $9,187.50  $   9,187.50 $7,786.40  $   7,786.40 

TOTAL
$20,910.50 $19,151.50
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ESB Bid on orignial 
Specifications not the 
revised bid 
specifications.  They 
added- Yamaha MTX-3 
@Unit price of 1,134 for 
one.  And TP-Link AC 
@ 74.00 Per unit.  Total 
Bid with these added - 
$22,118.50

Bid is awarded Verta Technolgies the apparant 
lowest responsiblie bidder , meeting 

specifications. UAH Destination

NET 30

UAH Destination

NET 30

The ESB Group Inc. Verta Technologies

1Year Labor, Standard 
Equipment Warranty

30 Days from PO

No. 17-19-105

Manufacturers Warranty on 
Equipment and 1 Year Labor 

Warranty on Installation

30 Days from PO
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