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Dry Bid School Year 2022-2023 Bid# SN-23-07
Vendor Name: SYSCO NORTHERN CALIFORNIA GOLD STAR FOODS ePallet, Inc. VALLEY FOOD SERVICE

ITEM NAME DESCRIPTION
EST. Contributions Preffered Brand

Brand Vendor ID

Case PACK/SIZE Price

Brand Vendor ID

Case Serving Price

Brand Vendor ID

Case Serving Price

Brand Vendor ID

Case Serving Price

Usage Grain M/MA or equivelent Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving Price in Case Per Serving

1 BEANS, BAKED 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 SYS CLS 8326607 $36.42 6 $6.07 BUSH BROS, #197631/001619, 6/117OZ203169 $48.04 156 $0.31 No Bid $ - #DIV/0! BUSH'S BEST 1619 $44.39 #DIV/0!

2 BEANS, BLACK 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 CASACLS 5844220 $28.97 6 $4.83 BUSH BROS, #533448/01885, 6/108OZ208299 $32.97 144 $0.23 No Bid $ - #DIV/0! BUSH'S BEST 1885 $30.47 #DIV/0!

3 BEANS, GARBANZO 6 Can Case 56 SYS CLS 4062337 $27.15 6 $4.53 BUSH BROS, #1701, 6/111OZTBD $32.97 144 $0.23 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 1701 $22.83 #DIV/0!

4 BEANS, PINTO 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 CASACLS 3362274 $25.16 6 $4.19 BUSH BROS, #538202/01819, 6/111OZ208304 $32.97 144 $0.23 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 5245 $22.83 #DIV/0!

5 BEANS, REFRIED, DEHYDRATED 6 bag case, low sodium 25 SANTAGO 6710594 $39.83 6 $6.64 COOK QUIK, #1182482010, 6/30OZ202680 $23.69 126 $0.19 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

6 BEANS, VEGETARIAN 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 SYS CLS 4110177 $38.18 6 $6.36 BUSH BROS, #619748/01638, 6/115OZ208348 $37.11 150 $0.25 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 5273 $28.80 #DIV/0!

7 CANNED, APPLESAUCE 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 SYS IMP 4062097 $41.63 6 $6.94 CHERRY CENTRAL, #9707/FP01-94, 6/#10249299 $34.70 142 $0.24 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 5148 $30.98 #DIV/0!

8 CANNED, APPLESAUCE must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving, IW MUSSLMN 4536983 $49.36 6 $8.23 MOTTS, #10065615, 72/4.5OZ209163 $27.05 72 $0.38 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

9 CANNED, BEEF RAVIOLI whole grain, 6 Can Case, low sodium 100 CHEFBOY 4239497 $43.19 6 $7.20 CHEF BOYARDEE, #64144-81080, 6/#10201088 $74.90 72 $1.04 No Bid #DIV/0! CHEF BOYARDEE6414481080 $69.21 #DIV/0!

10 CANNED, CORN, KERNELS 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 SYS CLS 4107520 $42.80 6 $7.13 LODI CANNING, #, 6/#10TBD $37.05 144 $0.26 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 5837 $32.07 #DIV/0!

11 CANNED, ENCHILADA SAUCE, GREEN 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 LAS PAL 4134698 $49.55 6 $8.26 LAS PALMAS, #7411024/381925, 6/#10202800 $42.70 288 $0.15 No Bid #DIV/0! LAS PALMAS 11024 $50.09 #DIV/0!

12 CANNED, ENCHILADA SAUCE, RED 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 LAS PAL 4554416 $44.81 6 $7.47 LAS PALMAS, #359374/11050, 6/#10202666 $42.70 288 $0.15 No Bid #DIV/0! LAS PALMAS 11050 $39.46 #DIV/0!

13 CANNED, GREEN BEANS 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 SYS CLS 3101583 $32.95 6 $5.49 DEL MONTE, #2004501, 6/#10248457 $28.76 144 $0.20 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 7597 $29.89 #DIV/0!

14 CANNED, JALAPENO PEPPERS, SLICED 6 Can Case, low sodium 25 CASACLS 5882758 $30.06 6 $5.01 DEL SOL, #DS00115, 6/#10209918 $26.59 144 $0.18 No Bid #DIV/0! LAS PALMAS 63348 $60.83 #DIV/0!

15 CANNED, MIXED FRUIT 6 Can Case, lite syrup 56 SYS CLS 2183368 $46.38 6 $7.73 DEL MONTE, #2004733, 6/#10248565 $51.24 144 $0.36 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 5581 $48.37 #DIV/0!

16 CANNED, PEACHES, SLICED 6 Can Case, lite syrup 56 SYS REL 2182084 $37.70 6 $6.28 DEL MONTE, #2004734, 6/#10248500 $51.22 144 $0.36 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 1750 $46.20 #DIV/0!

17 CANNED, PEARS, DICED 6 Can Case, lite syrup 56 SYS CLS 2182091 $57.75 6 $9.63 DEL MONTE, #2002352, 6/#10248501 $47.72 144 $0.33 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 5753 $43.48 #DIV/0!

18 CANNED, PEAS 6 Can Case, low sodium 56 SYS CLS 4092821 $52.68 6 $8.78 SENECA, #7022292929, 6/#10209063 $44.10 144 $0.31 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 5805 $28.80 #DIV/0!

19 CANNED, SALSA 6 Can Case, low sodium 25 DEL SOL 5965334 $30.74 6 $5.12 EMBASA, #7872, 6/#10209545 $54.09 144 $0.38 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

20 CANNED, TOMATO PASTE 6 Can Case, low sodium 112 SYS IMP 5096433 $32.44 6 $5.41 CHH, #1016, 6/#10210252 $27.05 144 $0.19 No Bid #DIV/0! OUR HOUSE 341 $27.17 #DIV/0!

21 CEREAL, ASSORTED FLAVORS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 GM 7072190 $29.67 60 $0.49 MALT O MEAL, 48/2OZ240172 $21.12 48 $0.44 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

22 CEREAL, BAR, CINNAMON TOAST CRUNCH whole grain, low sugar, low sodium, 96 EA Case 1000 GM 1898651 $30.68 96 $0.32 GENERAL MILLS, #45576, 96/1.42OZ203135 $30.02 96 $0.31 General Mills 45576000 $34.79 96 $0.36 GENERAL MILLS 45576 $31.64 96 $0.33

23 CEREAL, BAR, COCO PUFFS whole grain, low sugar, low sodium, 96 EA Case 1000 GM 1898891 $29.35 96 $0.31 GENERAL MILLS, #45577, 96/1.42OZ203136 $30.02 96 $0.31 General Mills 45577000 $34.79 96 $0.36 GENERAL MILLS 45577 $31.64 96 $0.33

24 CEREAL, BAR, GOLDEN GRAHAMS whole grain, low sugar, low sodium, 96 EA Case 1000 GM 1898935 $29.35 96 $0.31 GENERAL MILLS, #31913, 96/1.42OZ203121 $30.02 96 $0.31 General Mills 31913000 $34.79 96 $0.36 GENERAL MILLS 31913 $31.64 96 $0.33

25 CEREAL, BAR, TRIX low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 1000 GM 1898677 $29.35 96 $0.31 GENERAL MILLS, #31915, 96/1.42OZ203123 $30.02 96 $0.31 General Mills 31915000 $34.79 96 $0.36 GENERAL MILLS 31915 $31.64 96 $0.33

26 CEREAL, BOWL, CHEERIOS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 GM 6271514 $59.54 60 $0.99 GENERAL MILLS, #18448, 60/2OZ253535 $28.56 60 $0.48 General Mills 18448000 $33.11 60 $0.55 $ - #DIV/0!

27 CEREAL, BOWL, CHEERIOS, HONEY NUT whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 GM 7072190 $29.67 60 $0.49 GENERAL MILLS, #14882, 60/2OZ248632 $28.56 60 $0.48 General Mills 14882000 $33.13 60 $0.55 $ - #DIV/0!

28 CEREAL, BOWL, CINNAMON CHEX whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 GM 7072203 $29.67 60 $0.49 GENERAL MILLS, #14883, 60/2OZ248631 $28.56 60 $0.48 General Mills 14883000 $33.75 60 $0.56 $ - #DIV/0!

29 CEREAL, BOWL, CINNAMON TOAST CRUNCH whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 GM 7072170 $29.67 60 $0.49 GENERAL MILLS, #14886, 60/2OZ248634 $28.56 60 $0.48 General Mills 14886000 $33.13 60 $0.55 $ - #DIV/0!

30 CEREAL, BOWL, CINNAMON TOASTERS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 MALT OM 8786430 $19.85 48 $0.41 MALT O MEAL, #13820, 48/2OZ202851 $19.52 48 $0.41 Post 13820 $47.02 48 $0.98 MALT-O-MEAL 13820 $20.17 48 $0.42

31 CEREAL, BOWL, COCO PUFFS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 GM 7072182 $29.67 60 $0.49 GENERAL MILLS, #14885, 60/2OZ248633 $28.56 60 $0.48 General Mills 14885000 $33.13 60 $0.55 $ - #DIV/0!

32 CEREAL, BOWL, FROSTED FLAKES whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 MALT OM 2606093 $19.85 48 $0.41 MALT O MEAL, #955, 48/2OZ240239 $19.52 48 $0.41 Post 955 $40.51 48 $0.84 MALT-O-MEAL 955 $20.17 48 $0.42

33 CEREAL, BOWL, FROSTED SHREDDED WHEAT whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 KELLOGG 6199129 $54.41 70 $0.78 MALT O MEAL, #27149, 48/2OZ240171 $19.52 48 $0.41 Post 27149 $47.54 48 $0.99 POST 27149 $20.17 48 $0.42

34 CEREAL, BOWL, HONEY SCOOTERS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 MALT OM 2252783 $19.85 48 $0.41 MALT O MEAL, #8676, 48/2OZ203173 $19.52 48 $0.41 Post 8676 $39.19 48 $0.82 MALT-O-MEAL 8676 $20.17 48 $0.42

35 CEREAL, BOWL, LUCKY CHARMS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 2 GM 7072180 $29.67 60 $0.49 GENERAL MILLS, #14884, 60/2OZ248630 $28.56 60 $0.48 General Mills 14884000 $33.13 60 $0.55 $ - #DIV/0!

36 CEREAL, BOWL, MARSHMALLOW MATEYS whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 MALT OM 6973923 $19.85 48 $0.41 MALT O MEAL, #5940, 48/2OZ201560 $19.52 48 $0.41 Post 5940 $40.41 48 $0.84 MALT-O-MEAL 5940 $20.17 48 $0.42

37 CEREAL, BOWL, RICE KRISPIES whole grain, low sugar, 2 oz 1000 MALT OM 8734908 DISC DISC #VALUE! MFG DISC #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

38 CHEESE, CUP low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 1000 LOL 7000927 $70.14 140 $0.50 LAND O LAKES, #39911, 140/3OZ403651 $72.42 140 $0.52 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

39 Chips Baked SC&C Lays low sodium, must be smart snack compliance RUFFLES 6725362 $31.86 64 $0.50 RUFFLES, #56882, 60/.8OZ203718 $20.90 60 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

40 Chips, Baked Barbeque Lays low sodium, must be smart snack compliance BKDLAYS 8063190 $19.01 60 $0.32 LAYS, #32078, 60/.875OZ202892 $20.90 60 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

41 Chips, Baked Cheddar SC Lays low sodium, must be smart snack compliance RUFFLES 6725362 $31.86 64 $0.50 LAYS, #33627, 60/.875OZ202891 $20.90 60 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

42 Chips, Baked Crunchy FH Limon Cheetos low sodium, must be smart snack compliance CHEETOS 6798880 $31.86 64 $0.50 MFG DISC #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

43 Chips, Baked Lays low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 2 LAYS 6725273 $31.86 64 $0.50 LAYS, #33625, 60/.875OZ202893 $20.90 60 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!
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44 Chips, Baked Tostitos Scoops low sodium, must be smart snack compliance TOSTITO 6510388 $22.81 72 $0.32 TOSTITOS, #42537, 72/.875OZ200730 $25.08 72 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

45 CHIPS, CHEETOS, BAKED, CRUNCHY, CHEESE low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 2 CHEETOS 4360762 $33.32 104 $0.32 CHEETOS, #62933, 104/.875OZ208585 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

46
CHIPS, CHEETOS, BAKED, CRUNCHY, FLAMIN 
HOT

low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 CHEETOS 4360776 $33.32 104 $0.32 CHEETOS, #62984, 104/.875OZ208586 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

47 CHIPS, DORITOS, COOL RANCH RF low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 2 DORITOS 5073130 $23.07 72 $0.32 DORITOS, #36096, 72/1OZ200724 $25.08 72 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

48 CHIPS, DORITOS, FLAMAS RF low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 DORITOS 4383768 $23.07 72 $0.32 DORITOS, #62829, 72/1OZ239220 $25.08 72 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

49 CHIPS, DORITOS, NACHO CHEESE RF low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 2 DORITOS 6626774 $23.07 72 $0.32 DORITOS, #31748, 72/1OZ200720 $25.08 72 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

50 CHIPS, DORITOS, SPICY SWEET CHILI low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 DORITOS 7700812 $23.07 72 $0.32 DORITOS, #49093, 72/1OZ202527 $25.08 72 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

51 Chips, Funyuns low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 2 FUNYUNS 6725061 $31.86 64 $0.50 FUNYUNS, #66689, 104/.75OZ240175 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

52 CHIPS, LAYS, BAKED, BARBEQUE low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 BKDLAYS 8063190 $19.01 60 $0.32 LAYS, #32078, 60/.875OZ202892 $20.90 60 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

53 CHIPS, LAYS, BARBEQUE low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 2 LAYS 6743441 $32.20 64 $0.50 LAYS, #11044, 104/1OZ209347 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

54 CHIPS, LAYS, KETTLE, JALAPENO CHEDDAR low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 LAYS 2683098 $30.55 64 $0.48 LAYS, #25111, 64/1.375OZ209331 $32.94 64 $0.51 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

55 CHIPS, LAYS, PLAIN low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 2 LAYS 5511175 $33.32 104 $0.32 LAYS, #11045, 104/1OZ200694 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

56 Chips, Munchies Hot & Sweet low sodium, must be smart snack compliance FRITOS 7112553 $32.94 104 $0.32 QUAKER, #30291, 104/.875OZ249206 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

57 Chips, Munchis low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 2 MUNCHES 6786964 $31.86 64 $0.50 QUAKER, #36308, 104/.875OZ200728 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

58
CHIPS, RUFFLES, BAKED, SOUR CREAM 
CHEDDAR

low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 25 RUFFLES 6783429 $32.20 64 $0.50 RUFFLES, #56882, 60/.8OZ203718 $20.90 60 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

59 CHIPS, SUN CHIPS, MULTIGRAIN low sodium, 200 2 SUNCHIP 5073163 $32.94 104 $0.32 SUN CHIPS, #11151, 104/1OZ200698 $36.22 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

60 CHIPS, TORTILLA, ROUND 2oz, low sodium, must be 2gb 2000 WARNOCK 5899315 $35.66 120 $0.30 LA VENCEDORA, #ELR2-150, 150/2OZ209542 $18.40 150 $0.12 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

61 Chips, Tostitos Walking Taco low sodium, must be smart snack compliance 2 TOSTITO 4858688 $20.64 18 $1.15 TOSTITOS, #20510, 44/1.4OZ248603 $23.31 44 $0.53 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

62 Chips, Walking Taco Doritos low sodium, must be smart snack compliance DORITOS 4858678 DISC DISC #VALUE! DORITOS, #20518, 44/1.4OZ248602 $23.31 44 $0.53 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

63 COFFEE, CLASSIC 6 Can Case 10 2 CITVCLS 7887041 $108.88 6 $18.15 FOLGERS, #980094558, 6/51OZ248365 $90.68 60 $1.51 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

64 COFFEE, DECAFFEINATED 6 Can Case 5 CITVCLS 7887050 DISC DISC #VALUE! FOLGERS, #27515, 6/33.9OZ210123 $84.89 60 $1.41 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

65 CORNMEAL 25 Pound sack 5 2 QUAKER 7108262 $14.33 1 $14.33 THE LANGLOIS COMPANY, #453, 25LB201408 $21.70 113 $0.19 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

66 CRAISINS 200 Ea Case 100 OCNSPRY 2295190 DISC DISC #VALUE! OCEAN SPRAY, 200/1.16OZ203165 $51.76 200 $0.26 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

67 CROUTON, SEASONED whole grain, 200 EA Case 5 1 SYS CLS 7762299 $17.01 250 $0.07 SUGAR FOODS, #74627/595447, 250/.5OZ203332 $33.90 250 $0.14 No Bid #DIV/0! SUGAR FOODS 74627 $28.78 250 $0.12

68 CUP, APPLESAUCE must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving 200 SYS CLS 1484106 $32.71 72 $0.45 MOTTS, #10065615, 72/4.5OZ209163 $27.05 72 $0.38 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

69 CUP, DICED PEACHES light syrup, must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving 200 1 DELMONT 7199076 $41.12 72 $0.57 DOLE, #3073, 36/4OZ209244 $24.48 36 $0.68 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

70 CUP, DICED PEARS light syrup, must equal 1/2 cup fruit per serving 200 SYS CLS 7144733 $12.61 24 $0.53 DEL MONTE, #2005443, 72/4OZ410067 $46.79 72 $0.65 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

71 Cup, Ranch 1 MARZETI 4939476 $25.37 120 $0.21 MARZETTI COMPANY, #83984, 120/1OZ203044 $20.41 120 $0.17 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

72 CUPS, MARINARA 2.5 OZ, must equal 1/2 cup veg. 1500 REDGOLD 8185804 $31.92 250 $0.13 RED GOLD, #REDNA2ZC168, 168/2.5OZ405858 $56.89 168 $0.34 Red Gold REDNA2ZC168 $67.51 168 $0.40 $ - #DIV/0!

73 CUPS, SOY BUTTER 25 1 SUNBUTR 3649656 $73.39 140 $0.52 FOUR IN ONE, #SB200, 200/1.12OZTBD $55.58 200 $0.28 No Bid #DIV/0! SUNBUTTER 19368 $81.52 200 $0.41

74 FLOUR, ALL PURPOSE 50 pound 5 SYS CLS 8378111 $25.08 1 $25.08 GOLD MEDAL, #14314, 50LB100892 $27.64 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

75 FLOUR, WHITE, WHOLE WHEAT 50 pound 5 GOLDMDL 4014684 $18.90 1 $18.90 GOLD MEDAL, #58072, 50LB100898 $25.47 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

76 GATORADE, FRUIT PUNCH, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance 50 GATRADE 8567093 $12.16 24 $0.51 GATORADE, #12202, 24/12OZ203301 $13.05 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

77 GATORADE, GLACIER FREEZE, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance 50 GATRADE 8170963 $12.37 24 $0.52 GATORADE, #12006, 24/12OZ203300 $13.05 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

78 GATORADE, GRAPE, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance 50 GATRADE 6975987 $16.30 24 $0.68 GATORADE, #12203, 24/12OZ203299 $13.05 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

79 GATORADE, LEMON LIME, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance 50 GATRADE 3145101 $12.37 24 $0.52 GATORADE, #12463, 24/12OZ252794 $13.05 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

80 GATORADE, MIXED BERRY, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance 50 GATRADE 1133398 DISC DISC #VALUE! MFG DISC #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

81 GATORADE, ORANGE, G2 12OZ, must be smart snack compliance 50              6976023 $12.16 24 $0.51 GATORADE, #12204, 24/12OZ203298 $13.05 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

82 GRAVY, POULTRY low sodium, 100 TRIO 8877219 $44.20 8 $5.53 KENT PRECISION FOOD GROUP, #217T-T0700, 6/14.1OZTBD $16.56 396 $0.04 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

83 Juice Tropicana Fruit Medley Must be smart snack compliant TROPCNA 3860337 $10.12 15 $0.67 TROPICANA, #2145, 15/10OZ209745 $13.17 + CRV 15 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

84 Juice Tropicana Strawberry Kiwi Must be smart snack compliant TROPCNA 3860309 $10.12 15 $0.67 TROPICANA, #2144, 15/10OZ209746 $13.17 + CRV 15 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

85 JUICE, APPLE, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving 5000 SUNCUP 3902978 $7.92 40 $0.20 APPLE AND EVE, #86000TPF, 40/4.23OZ200022 $7.17 40 $0.18 SunCup 400305 $12.72 40 $0.32 SUNCUP 400305 $7.83 40 $0.20

86 JUICE, BERRY BERRY, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving 5000 SUNCUP 3903048 $7.92 40 $0.20 SUNCUP, #402505, 40/4.23OZ249259 $8.41 40 $0.21 SunCup 402505 $12.72 40 $0.32 SUNCUP 402505 $7.83 40 $0.20

87 JUICE, CRANBERRY RASPBERRY, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving 5000 APPLEVE 7057809 $7.10 40 $0.18 APPLE AND EVE, #86006TPF, 40/4.23OZTBD $7.17 40 $0.18 SunCup 402300 $12.72 40 $0.32 SUNCUP 402300 $7.83 40 $0.20

88 JUICE, FRUIT PUNCH, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving 5000 SUNCUP 3903038 $7.92 40 $0.20 APPLE AND EVE, #86001TPF, 40/4.23OZ200024 $7.17 40 $0.18 SunCup 400805 $12.72 40 $0.32 SUNCUP 400805 $7.83 40 $0.20

89 JUICE, GRAPE, SHELF STABLE 100% fruit, 4OZ, 1/2 cup fruit per serving 5000 SUNCUP 7012738 $7.92 40 $0.20 APPLE AND EVE, #86004TPF, 40/4.23OZ200028 $7.17 40 $0.18 SunCup 400505 $12.72 40 $0.32 SUNCUP 400505 $7.83 40 $0.20

90 JUICE, PROPEL, BERRY must be smart snack compliance 25 PROPEL 7381245 $14.26 24 $0.59 PROPEL, #169, 24/16.9OZ209757 $15.43 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!
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91 JUICE, PROPEL, GRAPE must be smart snack compliance 25 PROPEL 7389766 $14.26 24 $0.59 PROPEL, #173, 24/16.9OZTBD $15.43 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

92 JUICE, PROPEL, LEMON must be smart snack compliance 25 PROPEL 3479052 DISC DISC #VALUE! PROPEL, #167, 24/16.9OZ209759 $15.43 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

93 JUICE, PROPEL, STRAWBERRY KIWI must be smart snack compliance 25 PROPEL 7389756 $14.26 24 $0.59 PROPEL, #171, 24/16.9OZ209758 $15.43 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

94 Juice, Tropicana Apple Must be smart snack compliant TROPCNA 1605617 $19.72 24 $0.82 TROPICANA, #4850075824, 24/10OZTBD $17.97 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

95 Juice, Tropicana Orange Must be smart snack compliant TROPCNA 1606490 $17.53 24 $0.73 TROPICANA, #75715, 24/10OZ202144 $17.97 + CRV 24 #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

96 MILK, DRY, INSTANT 25 lb sack 5 SYS CLS 4231528 $81.01 1 $81.01 NO BID #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

97 MILK, LACTAID 100 DARIGLD 7346875 $25.48 6 $4.25 NO BID #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

98 Milk, Shelf Stable DAIRY P 4048423 NO BID NO BID #VALUE! GOSSNER, 27/8OZ203000 $12.35 27 $0.46 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

99 MILK, SHELF STABLE, CARTON case 25 1 HERSHEY 3885591 NO BID NO BID #VALUE! GOSSNER, 27/8OZ203000 $12.35 27 $0.46 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

100 MILK, SOY, ULTRA 8 OZ, 24 EA Case, 10G Protein 500 PACIFIC 3607452 $45.93 12 $3.83 KIKKOMAN INTERNATIONAL, #6183, 24/8OZ251320 $19.36 24 $0.81 No Bid #DIV/0! PEARL 6183 $19.37 24 $0.81

101 OIL, VEGETABLE all vegetable, 4 Gal Case 5 2 SYS REL 4119079 $42.27 1 $42.27 AVO, #V1128, 6/1GAL210233 $72.77 1536 $0.05 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

102 ORANGE, ZESTY SAUCE low sodium, 4 Gal Case 5 MINOR 7063860 $47.10 4 $11.78 MINOR'S, #439189/54742, 4/.5GAL201662 $46.69 256 $0.18 No Bid #DIV/0! MINORS 50000547425 $43.14 #DIV/0!

103 PACKET, BBQ SAUCE 50 HSRCCLS 4460689 $22.41 500 $0.04 PORTION PAC, #7160372781000, 200/12GM201902 $9.38 200 $0.05 No Bid #DIV/0! PPI 716037278106 $8.67 #DIV/0!

104 PACKET, HOT SAUCE 9 grams 50 CASACLS 6005037 $24.08 500 $0.05 FOUR IN ONE, #T392, 500/9GR251283 $15.81 500 $0.03 No Bid #DIV/0! SALSA DEL SOL716037000363 $20.60 500 $0.04

105 PACKET, KETCHUP low sodium 100 HEINZ 4136768 $19.24 1000 $0.02 KRAFT HEINZ FOODS CO, #130009848000, 1000/9GM405304 $21.28 1000 $0.02 No Bid #DIV/0! HEINZ 10013000984802$19.66 #DIV/0!

106 PACKET, MAYONNAISE 100 HEINZ 4534319 $18.07 200 $0.09 PORTION PAC, #7160372157000, 200/9GM201892 $10.76 200 $0.05 No Bid #DIV/0! PPI 716037215705 $9.95 200 $0.05

107 PACKET, MUSTARD 50 HSRCCLS 1608850 $21.03 1000 $0.02 PORTION PAC, #7160370539, 500/5.5GM201872 $10.84 500 $0.02 No Bid #DIV/0! PPI 716037053901 $10.02 500 $0.02

108 PACKET, RANCH DRESSING 100 SYS CLS 5112735 $16.57 200 $0.08 AMERICANA, #7160370023800, 200/12GM202633 $8.18 200 $0.04 No Bid #DIV/0! PPI 716037228101 $9.79 200 $0.05

109 PACKET, SUGAR 5 SYS CLS 4000899 $15.73 2000 $0.01 C&H SUGAR, #53378, 2000/.10OZ203551 $17.69 2000 $0.01 No Bid #DIV/0! SUGAR FOODS 72101 $22.26 2000 $0.01

110 PACKET, SUGAR SUBSTITUTE 5 SWTPLUS 5641725 $23.75 2000 $0.01 SWEET & LOW, #6052, 1500CT210162 $15.62 1500 $0.01 No Bid #DIV/0! SUGAR FOODS 83024 $20.34 2000 $0.01

111 PACKET, TAJIN, SEASONING low sodium 100 0.25 TAJIN 7011742 $53.28 1000 $0.05 TAJIN, #28805, 1000/.035209157 $48.97 1000 $0.05 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

112 PAN COATING, AEROSOL 6 Can Case 25 SYS CLS 4135380 $24.94 6 $4.16 PAM, #63111, 6/17OZ209378 $23.62 1464 $0.02 No Bid #DIV/0! PAM 6414463111 $21.83 6 $3.64

113 POP TARTS, STRAWBERRY whole grain, equal 1gb 500 KELLOGG 445062 $40.65 120 $0.34 KELLOGGS, #38000-55130, 120/1.76OZ202835 $40.85 120 $0.34 No Bid #DIV/0! KELLOGG'S 55130 $42.87 120 $0.36

114 POTATO, MASHED, INSTANT LOW SODIUM 100 BASICAM 315335 $72.63 12 $6.05 IDAHOAN FOODS, #314154b, 3.24LBCTN239906 $9.83 80 $0.12 No Bid #DIV/0! IDAHO PACIFIC 90510 $52.83 #DIV/0!

115 RAISELS, SOUR 1/4 cup fruit equivalent 100 RAISEL 2086029 $54.78 200 $0.27 NATIONAL RAISIN CO., #11526-8, 200/1.66OZTBD $78.23 200 $0.39 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

116 RICE, BROWN, PARBOILED 5 PAREXCL 2047177 $14.41 1 $14.41 RICELAND, #3520026225, 25LB203005 $14.44 48 $0.30 No Bid #DIV/0! UNCLE BEN'S 423510 $27.15 #DIV/0!

117 RICE, WHITE, PARBOILED 5 SYS IMP 4671350 $19.84 1 $19.84 RICELAND, #3520007553, 1/25LB248582 $13.68 48 $0.29 No Bid #DIV/0! UNCLE BEN'S 423508 $22.52 #DIV/0!

118 SALSA, DIPPING CUPS must meet .25 cup vegetable 1000 REDGOLD 7002707 $33.88 84 $0.40 RED GOLD, #REDSC2ZC84, 84/3OZ404013 $35.96 84 $0.43 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

119 SALT 5 SYS CLS 4540373 $5.83 1 $5.83 UNITED SALT CORP., #8423, 25LB210379 $7.51 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

120 SNACK, ANIMAL, CRACKERS must be 1gb/serving 5 KEEBLER 5640214 $28.76 150 $0.19 J & J SNACK FOODS, #39085, 200/1OZ203026 $32.52 200 $0.16 No Bid #DIV/0! J&J SNACKS $30.05 200 $0.15

121 SNACK, BAR, GRANOLA, CHOCOLATE CHUNK must be smart snack compliance 5 QUAKER 643209 $28.34 96 $0.30 QUAKER, #31186, 12/8CT209750 $30.76 96 $0.32 No Bid #DIV/0! NATURE VALLEY 11590 $39.46 120 $0.33

122 SNACK, BAR, GRANOLA, OAT AND HONEY must be smart snack compliance 5 NAT VLY 3660370 $43.57 108 $0.40 NATURE VALLEY, #33530, 6-18/1.5OZ200918 $53.90 108 $0.50 No Bid #DIV/0! NATURE VALLEY 33530 $51.42 108 $0.48

123 SNACK, BUG BITE, CRACKERS must be 1gb/serving 5 KELLOGG 444598 $46.83 210 $0.22 KEEBLER, #30100-55644, 210/1OZ202827 $51.41 210 $0.24 No Bid #DIV/0! KELLOGG'S 55644 $51.49 210 $0.25

124 SNACK, CHEX MIX, ASSORTED must be 1gb/serving 5 GM 1899077 $22.03 60 $0.37 GENERAL MILLS, #12400, 60/1.75OZ200878 $24.43 60 $0.41 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

125 Snack, Cookie Grandma's Blueberry low sodium, must be smart snack compliance GRANDMA 7091799 $26.13 80 $0.33 MFG DISC #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

126 Snack, Cookie Grandmas CC low sodium, must be smart snack compliance GRANDMA 7021474 $26.13 80 $0.33 GRANDMAS COOKIES, #66154, 80/1.22OZ240244 $28.72 80 $0.36 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

127 SNACK, CRACKERS, HONEY GRAHAM must be 1gb/serving 5 KELLOGG 2093213 $21.43 150 $0.14 MJM MARKETING, #300151, 150/3PK208146 $22.41 150 $0.15 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

128 SNACK, FRUIT ROLL UP 100% fruit, must be smart snack compliance 5 GM 5560271 $22.44 96 $0.23 GENERAL MILLS, #080918b, 72/0.5OZ239574 $18.22 72 $0.25 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

129 SNACK, GOLDFISH, CHEDDAR must be 1gb/serving 5 PEPFARM 6599405 $60.15 300 $0.20 PEPPERIDGE FARM, #18105, 300/.75OZ200290 $60.47 300 $0.20 No Bid #DIV/0! Pepperidge Farms200140018105 $70.16 300 $0.23

130 SNACK, GOLDFISH, GIANT CINNAMON must be 1gb/serving 5 PEPFARM 152884 DISC DISC #VALUE! PEPPERIDGE FARM, #26830, 300/.9OZ248553 $51.23 300 $0.17 No Bid #DIV/0! Pepperidge Farms200140026830 $56.51 300 $0.19

131 SNACK, GRAHAM, CHOCOLATE 5 KELLOGG 8354664 $30.52 150 $0.20 MJM MARKETING, #402001, 300/1OZ203017 $48.82 300 $0.16 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

132 SNACK, GRAHAM, STRAWBERRY must be 1gb/serving 5 MJM 1772631 $51.29 300 $0.17 MJM MARKETING, #405001, 300/1OZ203020 $48.82 300 $0.16 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

133 SNACK, GRAHAM, VANILLA must be 1gb/serving 100 MJM 4461810 $50.74 300 $0.17 MJM MARKETING, #404001, 300/1OZ203019 $48.82 300 $0.16 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

134 Snack, Heartzels low sodium, must be smart snack compliance ROLGOLD 1746093 $32.94 104 $0.32 ROLD GOLD, #15940, 104/.70OZ202761 $36.11 104 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

135 Snack, Popcorn Smart Foods WC low sodium, must be smart snack compliance SKINPOP 1230533 $53.69 60 $0.89 SMART FOODS, #28400309004, 72/0.5OZ249186 $25.08 72 $0.35 No Bid #DIV/0! PIRATE BOOTY10015665624079$34.47 72 $0.48

136 SNACK, RICE KRISPIES must be smart snack compliance 5 KELLOGG 2880189 $34.33 80 $0.43 KELLOGGS, #38000-11052, 80/1.41OZ203316 $36.70 80 $0.46 No Bid #DIV/0! SUPER BAKERY 9432 $22.37 50 $0.45

137 SNACK, SUNFLOWER SEEDS 1 OZ, 150 EA Case 250 SUNOPTA 3863113 $44.57 150 $0.30 SUNOPTA, #1105050/665547, 150/1OZ200446 $38.90 150 $0.26 No Bid #DIV/0! SUNRICH NATURALS1105050 $35.95 150 $0.24

138 SPICE, BAKING POWDER 6 Pound 5 CHFCOMP 5947031 $59.24 6 $9.87 CLABBER GIRL, #980343986, 2/22OZTBD $7.91 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!
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139 SPICE, BAKING SODA 12 EA Case 5 CLABGIR 2125421 $16.26 24 $0.68 RUMFORD, #01651/477446, 24/1LB209265 $17.22 756 $0.02 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

140 SPICE, CELERY SALT 1 EA Case 5 IMP/MCC 5228465 $44.00 6 $7.33 PACIFIC SPICE, #CEL12I, 19OZ202028 $4.72 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

141 SPICE, CHICKEN BASE 1 Pail 5 SYS IMP 4944492 $115.91 1 $115.91 THE LANGLOIS COMPANY, #103, 6/4LB201400 $49.94 1555 $0.03 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

142 SPICE, CHILI POWDER 1 EA Case 5 IMP/MCC 5228572 $137.87 3 $45.96 PACIFIC SPICE, #CHILPWD12I, 1LB209674 $7.48 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

143 SPICE, CHOPPED ONION, DEHYDRATED 15 pound 5 MC CORM 5013974 $67.58 1 $67.58 PACIFIC SPICE, #2OC15, 15LB202002 $74.35 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

144 SPICE, PAPRIKA 1 EA Case 5 SYS CLS 5236690 $60.74 3 $20.25 PACIFIC SPICE, #PAPC12I, 1LB202072 $7.25 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

145 SPICE, TACO SEASONING MIX low sodium 5 LAWRYS 4069217 $24.74 6 $4.12 KENT PRECISION FOOD GROUP, #547200/V411-D9190, 6/9OZ202875 $19.89 53 $0.38 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

146 STICKS, BEEF, HONEY PEPPERED 1.36oz, must be smart snack compliance 5 JACKLNK 3287895 $57.70 48 $1.20 HIGHLAND BEEF FARMS, #OW127, 24/0.5OZ239641 $15.52 24 $0.65 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

147 STICKS, TURKEY, HONEY PEPPERED 1.36oz, must be smart snack compliance 5 PRKJRKY 5255977 NO BID NO BID #VALUE! HIGHLAND BEEF FARMS, #OW128, 24/0.5OZ239642 $15.52 24 $0.65 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

148 SUGAR, BROWN 50 pound sack 5 BKRSCLS 1854926 $45.84 1 $45.84 C&H SUGAR, #404831, 25LB210294 $27.16 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

149 SUGAR, GRANULATED 50 pound sack 5 SYS CLS 4782694 $38.02 1 $38.02 C&H SUGAR, #404736, 50LB210298 $42.62 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

150 SUGAR, POWDERED 25 Pound sack 5 BKRSCLS 5825672 $45.53 1 $45.53 C&H SUGAR, #404867, 25LB210299 $30.98 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

151 TOSTADA, BOWL, SHELL whole grain 5 WARNOCK 2762425 $23.94 200 $0.12 WARNOCK, #21303, 200/.077202362 $29.15 200 $0.15 No Bid #DIV/0! $ - #DIV/0!

152 TUNA, LIGHT CHUNK, YELLOW FIN 5 PORTCLS 3494226 $86.51 6 $14.42 STARKIST, #402420/22120, 6/43OZ203409 $58.82 84 $0.70 No Bid #DIV/0! STARKIST 22120 $54.35 #DIV/0!

153 VINEGAR, WHITE 4 Gal Case 5 SYS CLS 4179768 $18.83 4 $4.71 GOLDEN STATE, #10064, 4/1GL202382 $10.87 N/A #VALUE! No Bid #DIV/0! RICH-N-ALL 3604526001 $12.28 #DIV/0!

154 WATER, BOTTLED, DRINKING 16.9OZ, CASE 3500 NIAGARA 9901031 $10.47 40 $0.26 CRYSTAL GEYSER, #35001, 35/16.9OZ248713 $5.12 35 $0.15 No Bid #DIV/0! PURE LIFE 68274-93471 $4.01 24 $0.17


