MC-30 MC-3000 No Bid S5.30 No Bid S3.40 MC-3000 No Bid S3.32 CRS-2P S4.00 S4.00 S5.31 Weight							
Plant Add. Cutbacks-1620 Woodson Rd St Louis	Vendor Name and Address	Missouri Petroleum Products			Peterson Oil Co		
Plant Add. Cutbacks-1620 Woodson Rd St Louis Plant add. 1613 Hwy AF Sullivan		1620 Woodson Rd			200 W. Euclid		
Emulsions- 3714 Big Bend Ind Ct St Louis		St Louis MO. 63114			Sullivan MO. 63080		
Emulsions- 3714 Big Bend Ind Ct St Louis Plant add. 1613 Hwy AF Sullivan Plant plant: price per gallon Plant add. 1613 Hwy AF Sullivan Plant plant: price per gallon Plant price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per Plant plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price per gallon Plant: price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job Plant: price plus \$25 / hour while on job							
Materials:		Plant Add. Cutbacks-1620 Woodson Rd St Louis					
MC-30 \$5.30 \$3.40 MC-3000 No Bid \$3.32 CRS-2P \$4.00 67% Asphalt 8.32 Unit Weight 8.32 \$3.00 65% Asphalt 8.4 CSS-1H \$3.75 62% Asphalt 8.35 Unit Weight 8.35 \$2.90 65% Asphalt 8.4 SS1-H \$3.60 N/A 8.35 N/A 8.4 Restocking Fee: 25% 25% 25% 25% Drop Trailer Fee: \$1,500.00 Application cost – as needed Per Unit price (price per gallon) Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job Delivered price per gallon/per mile: Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per \$.15 per gal freight delivered within Franklin County, 5000 gal minimum loads. First 1 1/2 hours n		Emulsions- 3714 Big Bend Ind Ct St Louis			Plant add. 1613 Hwy AF Sullivan		<u> </u>
MC-300 \$5.30 \$3.40 MC-3000 No Bid \$3.32 CRS-2P \$4.00 67% Asphalt 8.32 CSS-1H \$3.75 62% Asphalt 8.35 SS1-H \$3.60 Restocking Fee: 25% 25% Drop Trailer Fee: \$1,200.00 Application cost – as needed Per Unit price (price per gallon) Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job Delivered price per gallon/per mile: Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per S.15 per gal freight delivered within Franklin County, 5000 gal minimum loads. First 1 1/2 hours n	Matariala	Dick up at plant; price per celler			Dick up at plant; price per celler		
MC-3000 No Bid \$3.32 Unit Weight &\$3.00 &65% Asphalt &8.4 CSS-1H \$3.75 &62% Asphalt &8.35 Unit Weight &\$3.90 &65% Asphalt &8.4 SS1-H \$3.60 N/A & State & Sta							
CRS-2P \$4.00 Asphalt Weight 8.32 CSS-1H \$3.75 Asphalt Weight 8.32 Unit Weight 8.35 SS1-H \$3.60 Restocking Fee: \$25% Drop Trailer Fee: \$1,200.00 Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per		·			·		-
SS1-H S3.75 SS1-H \$3.60 Restocking Fee: Drop Trailer Fee: \$1,200.00 Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per	IVIC-3000	NO BIU		Unit	\$5.52		Linit
\$3.75	CRS-2P	\$4.00	1	Weight	\$3.00	1	Weigh
SS1-H \$3.60 N/A Restocking Fee: 25% 25% 25% Drop Trailer Fee: \$1,200.00 \$1,500.00 Application cost – as needed Per Unit price (price per gallon) Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job Delivered price per gallon/per mile: Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per S.15 per gal freight delivered within Franklin County, 5000 gal minimum loads. First 1 1/2 hours not set to price per gallon per mile:	CSS-1H	\$3.75		Weight	\$2.90	1	Unit Weigh 8.4
Application cost – as needed Per Unit price (price per gallon) Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Pelivered price per gallon/per mile: Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per \$1,500.00 Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job \$1,500.00 Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job \$1,500.00 Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job \$1,500.00 Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job \$1,500.00 \$1,	SS1-H	\$3.60			N/A		
Application cost – as needed Per Unit price (price per gallon) Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick-up price plus \$.50 / gal plus \$225 / hour while on job Delivered price per gallon/per mile: Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per S.15 per gal freight delivered within Franklin County, 5000 gal minimum loads. First 1 1/2 hours not provided the price of the price per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Such per gallon freight to p	Restocking Fee:	25%			25%		
Per Unit price (price per gallon) Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick up price plus \$0.50 per gallon and \$265 per hour portal to portal Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job Plant pick-up price plus \$0.50 pal plus \$225 / hour while on job	Drop Trailer Fee:	\$1,200.00			\$1,500.00		1
Delivered price per gallon/per mile: Add \$.18 per gallon freight to pick up at plant price. Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per \$.15 per gal freight delivered within Franklin County, 5000 gal minimum loads. First 1 1/2 hours n	Application cost – as needed Per Unit price (price per gallon)						
Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per County, 5000 gal minimum loads. First 1 1/2 hours n					, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,		
Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per County, 5000 gal minimum loads. First 1 1/2 hours n							
	Delivered price per gallon/per mile:	Includes 1.5 hours of unloading time, then \$130.00 per			County, 5000 gal minimum loads. Fi	rst 1 1/2 hc	urs no
						1	
							\vdash