Office Supply Price Sheet

Cascade School
Company/Bidder: |office ppli
i Unit Of Unit Unit
Doy Measure Cost Cost.
Binder - 1' Vinyl Round Ring Binder With Label Holder, Black, 2 Inside Pockets EACI 229 [$ 1.48
Binder - 1-1/2' Vinyl Round Ring Binder With Label Holder, Black, 2 Inside Pockets EACH 3.29 | no bid
Binder - 2' Vinyl Round Ring Binder With Label Holder, Black, 2 Inside Pockets EACH 469 | S 5.45
Binder - 3' Vinyl Round Ring Binder With Label Holder, Black, Two Inside Pockets EACH 5.89 | no bid
Binder - 4' Vinyl Round Ring Binder With Label Holder, Black, 2 Inside Pockets EACH - $ 7.47
Binder - 5' Vinyl Round Ring Binder With Label Holder, Black, 2 Inside Pockets EACH - 0 bid
Binder - 1' View (Pr ion) Binder, Black, Two Inside Pockets EACH 1.49 1.27
Binder - 1-1/2' View (Presentation) Binder, Black, Two Inside Pockets EACH 1.99 1.44
Binder - 2' View (Pr ion) Binder, Black, Two Inside Pockets EACH 2.19 291
Binder - 3' View (Pr ion) Binder, Black, Two Inside Pockets EACH 3.29 0 bid
Binder - 1' View (Pr ion) Binder, White, Two Inside Pockets EACH 1.49 1.27
Binder - 1-1/2' View (Presentation) Binder, White, Two Inside Pockets EACH 1.99 1.44
Binder - 2' View (Pr ion) Binder, White, Two Inside Pockets EACH 2.19 1.99
Binder - 3' View (Pr ion) Binder, White, Two Inside Pockets EACH 3.29 2.81
Data Binder - Hanging Data Binder, 6' Capacity, 8.50' x 12' Sheet Size, Post Fastener, Presstex, Light Blue EACH - no bid
Index - Legal Exhibit Dividers, Letter, Printed 1-25, White SET 2.99 | no bid
Index - Legal Exhibit Dividers, Letter, Printed 26-50, White SET 3.29 | no bid
Index - Legal Exhibit Dividers, Letter, Printed 51-75, White SET 3.49 | no bid
Index - Legal Exhibit Dividers, Letter, Printed 76-100, White SET 3.69 | no bid
Index - Legal Exhibit Dividers, Letter, Printed 101-125, White SET 3.49 0 bid
Indexes - Letter, Insertable Index, Multicolor Tabs, 8-Tab, Buff SET 0.79 0.66
Indexes - Letter, Insertable Index, Clear Tabs, 5- Tab, Buff SET 0.59 0.75
Indexes - A-Z Quick Index Dividers With Contents Page, Printed A-Z - 25 / Set, White Divider, Multicolor Tab SET 3.69 4.39
Tabs - Self-Adhesive Tabs with White Printable Inserts, Two Inch, Clear Tab, 25/ Pack PACKAGE 5.59 | no bid
Tabs - Self-Adhesive Tabs with White Printable Inserts, Two Inch, Assorted Tab, 25/ Pack PACKAGE 5.99 | no bid
Sheet Protectors - Heavyweight Polypropylene Sheet Protector, Non-Glare, 11 x 8 1/2, 100/BX BOX 559 [$ 7.79
Report Covers - Clear Front Report Cover, Tang Clip, Letter, 1/2' Capacity, Black, 25/Box BOX 17.10 | no bid
Report Covers - Twin-Pocket Portfolio, Embossed Leather Grain Paper, Assorted Colors, 25/Box BOX 9.16 [ $ 3.30
Transcript Covers - Deluxe Transcript Covers with Clear Front Cover, Black, 100/Box BOX 25.89 | no bid
Paper Clips - Smooth Finish, No. 1, Silver, 100/Box, 10 Boxes/Pack BOX 1.59 0.32
Paper Clips - Smooth, Wire, Jumbo, Silver, 100/Box, 10 Boxes/Pack BOX 5.19 5.70
Binder Clips - Small, Steel Wire, 3/8' Capacity, 3/4' Wide, Black/Silver, Dozen DOZEN 0.25 0.36
Binder Clips - Medium, Steel Wire, 5/8' Cap., 1-1/4' Wide, Black/Silver, Dozen DOZEN 0.68 0.69
Binder Clips - Large, Steel Wire, 1' Capacity, 2' Wide, Black/Silver, Dozen DOZEN 1.49 1.36
Flash Drive - 8GB Flash Drive, USB 3.0, Gray EACH 13.95 | no bid
Flash Drive - 16GB Flash Drive, USB 3.0, , Gray EACH 9.95 | no bid
Flash Drive - 32GB Flash Drive, USB 3.0, , Gray EACH 13.00 | no bid
Flash Drive - 64GB Flash Drive, USB 3.0, , Gray EACH 20.50 | no bid
Paper File Fasteners - Standard Two-Piece, Two Inch Capacity, 50/Box BOX 239 2.10
Push Pins - Colored Push Pins, Plastic, Rainbow, 3/8', 100/Pack PACKAGE 1.05 0.59
Rubber Bands - Size 18, 3 x 1/16, 1600 Bands/11b Pack PACKAGE 335 3.43
Rubber Bands - Size 32, 3 x 1/8, 820 Bands/11b Pack PACKAGE 3.42 3.43
Rubber Bands - Size 33, 3-1/2 x 1/8, 640 Bands/1lb Pack PACKAGE 3.49 0 bid
Rubber Bands - Size 64, 3-1.2 x 1/4, 320 Bands/11b Pack PACKAGE 3.47 3.43
Correction Tape - Non-Refillable, 1/6' x 394', White Tape EACH 1.69 1.70
Correction Pen - .24 0z./7ml, Double Ball Tip, White EACH 3.01 1.85
Correction Fluid - .68 oz Bottle, White, 12/ Pack EACH 0.94 12.82
Book Ends - Standard, 4 3/4 x 5 1/4 x 5, Heavy Gauge Steel, 9', Black PAIR 12.68 4.61
Clipboard - Hardboard Clipboard, 1-1/4' Capacity, Holds 8-1/2 x 11, Brown EACH 0.87 1.03
Clipboard - Hardboard Clipboard, 1-1/4' Capacity, Holds 8-1/2w x 14h, Brown EACH 1.56 1.20
Finger Tip - Rubber Finger Tips, Size 12, Medium/Large, Amber, 12/Pack PACKAGE 3.09 2.20
Sortkwik - Sortkwik Fingertip i 13/4 oz, Pink EACH 3.61 | no bid
Rolodex - Open Tray Card File with 24 A-Z Guides Holds 500 2 1/4 x 4 Cards, Black EACH - $ 28.60
Receipt Book - Money/Rent Receipt Books, 2-3/4 x 7 1/8, Three-Part Carbonless, 100 Sets/Book BOOK $ 11.19 | no bid
Pencil Cup - Big Pencil Cup, Plastic, 4 1/4 dia. x 5 3/4, Black EACH - $ 4.01
Clip Dispenser - Magnetic Clip Dispenser, Two Compartments, Plastic,21/2 x21/2x 3 EACH - no bid
Step File - Wire Step File Junior, Six Sections, 4 3/8 x 6 1/2 x 7 3/4, Black EACH $ 1095 | $ 5.91
Wall Pocket - Unbreakable Single Pocket Wall File, Letter, Smoke EACH $ 1194 | $ 11.43
Wall Pocket - Unbreakable Single Pocket Wall File, Legal, Smoke EACH - no bid
Wall Pocket - Vertical File System - 14.9' x 13.0" x 4.0' - Black, 3/Pack PACKAGE $ 1578 | $ 13.34
Business Card Holder - Holds 50 Cards, Black EACH - no bid
Card File, Vinyl, business EACH $ 7.56 0 bid
Organizer - Drawer Tray, 9 Section EACH $ 3.23 3.27
Letter Tray - Side Load Letter Desk Tray, Two Tier, Plastic, Black SET - 4.10
Legal Tray - Side Load Legal Desk Tray, Two Tier, Plastic, Black SET - 8.90
Letter Tray - Front Load Letter Desk Tray, Two Tier, Plastic, Smoke SET 8.77
Calculator - Canon MP21DX Color Printing Calculator - 12 Digit - 2 Color Display (Black/Red) - AC Supply Powered - 12.2'x 9' EACH 72.95 54.00
Calculator - Pocket Calculator, Dual-Power, 8 Digit(s), LCD, Battery/Solar Powered, 2.4'x 4.1" EACH 3.49 1.25
Stamp Pad - Foam Stamp Pad, 4 1/4 x 2 3/4, Black, 12 Each/Box EACH 1.89 11.52
Stamp Pad - Felt Stamp Pad, 4 1/4 x 2 3/4, Red, 12 Each/Box EACH 2.63 11.52
Ink - Stamp Pad Neat-Flo Bottle Inker, Two Ounces, Black EACH 2.99 2.39
Ink - Stamp Pad Neat-Flo Bottle Inker, Two Ounces, Red EACH 3.19 2.46
Ink - Stamp Pad Refill Ink for Clik! & Universal Stamps, 7ml-Bottle, Black EACH - no bid
Message Stamp - "COPY", Pre-Inked/Re-Inkable, Red EACH 6.22 | no bid
Message Stamp - " RECEIVED", Pre-Inked/Re-Inkable, Red EACH 6.27 [$ 33.33
Date Stamp - Rubber Stamp, Dater, Conventional, Type Size 1 EACH 5.69 | no bid
Date Stamp - Self-Inking Stamp, "RECEIVED" with Date, 1" x 1.63" Impression, Blue/Red Ink EACH 20.65 | no bid
Date Stamp - Self-Inking Date Stamp, 0.38" x 1.63", 4 Bands, Black EACH 12.88 | no bid
Date Stamp - Message/Date Stamp - "RECEIVED, FAXED, E-MAILED, PAID" - 0.38" x 1" Impression - 4 Bands - Blue, Red EACH 15.38 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Manila, 1/3 Cut Assorted, One-Ply Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 509 [$ 7.65
File Folders - Legal, Manila, 1/3 Cut Assorted, One-Ply Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 7.59 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Pink, 1/3 Cut Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 25.96 7.65
File Folders - Letter, Red, 1/ 3 Cut Top Tab, 100/ Box BOX 16.95 7.65
File Folders - Letter, Blue, 1/ 3 Cut Top Tab, 100/ Box BOX 16.95 7.65
File Folders - Letter, Yellow, 1/ 3 Cut Top Tab, 100/ Box BOX 16.95 7.65
File Folders - Letter, Orange, 1/ 3 Cut Top Tab, 100/ Box BOX 21.89 7.65
File Folders - Letter, Green, 1/3 Cut Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 16.95 7.65
File Folders - Legal, Blue, 1/3 Cut Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 27.59 | no bid
File Folders - Legal, Red, 1/3 Cut Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 27.59 | no bid
File Folders - Legal, Green, 1/3 Cut Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 27.59 | no bid
File Folders - Legal, Yellow, 1/3 Cut Top Tab, 100/Box BOX 27.59 | no bid
File Folders - Legal, Orange, 1/ 3 Cut Top Tab, 100/ Box BOX - no bid
File Folders - Legal, Pink, 1/ 3 Cut Top Tab, 100/ Box BOX - no bid
File Folders - Letter, Manila, Shelf Folders, Straight Cut, Single-Ply End Tab, 100/Box BOX 23.39 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Blue, Straight Cut, Reinforced End Tab, 100/ Box BOX 42.90 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Green, Straight Cut, Reinforced End Tab, 100/Box BOX 42.90 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Red, Straight Cut, Reinforced End Tab, 100/Box BOX 42.90 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Yellow, Straight Cut, Reinforced End Tab, 100/Box BOX 42.90 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Lavender, Straight Cut Rei End Tab, 100/Box BOX 42.90 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Pink, Reinforced End Tab Folders, Two Ply Tab, 100/ Box BOX 42.90 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Red, 2' Capacity Fastener Folders, Straight Tab, 50/Box BOX - no bid
File Folders - Letter, Manilla, End-Tab Folders, Straight Cut Tab, 14 Pt,, 12- 1/4'x9-1/2', 50/Box BOX $ 44.10 | no bid
File Folders-Letter, Manilla, end tab folders, 1/3 cut tab, 14 pt, 100/box BOX $ 37.43 | no bid
File Folders - Letter, Green, Pressboard Classification Folder, Six-Section, 10/Box BOX $ 28.15 | no bid




File Folders - Letter, Scarlet, Pressguard Classification Folders, Six-Section, 10/Box BOX S 28.15 | no bid
Hanging File Folders - Letter, Standard Green, 1/5 Tab, 25/Box BOX $ 519 [$ 7.60
Hanging File Folders - Legal, Standard Green, 1/5 Tab, 25/Box BOX $ 1119 [ § 8.43
Hanging File Folders - Letter, Standard Green, 3-1/2 Inch Hanging File_Pockets with Sides, 10/Box BOX S 49.95 | no bid
Hanging File Folder Tabs - Poly Tabs, 1/3' Cut, 3-1/2'x1/2', 25/PK, Clear PACKAGE $ 219 [$ 225
Hanging File Folder Tabs - Poly Tabs, 1/5' Cut Tab, 2-1/4'x1/2', 25/PK, Clear PACKAGE S 219 [$ 182
File Tabs - 1' x 11/2', Striped, Blue/Green/Red, Self-Stick Tabs, 66/Pack PACKAGE $ 7.29 | nobid
File Tabs - 1' x 1 1/2', Assorted Standard Colors, Self-Stick Tabs, 66/Pack PACKAGE $ 7.09 [$ 5.72
File Tabs - Printable Repositionable Plastic Tabs, 1 3/4 Inch, White, 80/Pack PACKAGE $ 8.29 | nobid
Drawer Frames - Letter Size, Screw-Together Hanging Folder Frame, 23- 26.77' Long EACH S 13.17 ] $ 3.29
Drawer Frames - Legal Size, Screw-Together Hanging Folder Frame, 23- 26.77' Long EACH s 12.87 | $ 4.24.
File Guides - Letter, Recycled Top Tab File Guides, Alpha, 1/5 Tab, Pressboard, 25/Set SET S 23.84 | no bid
File Guides - Legal, Recycled Top Tab File Guides, Alpha, 1/5 Tab, Pressboard, 25/Set SET S 28.05 | $ 21.01
ion Wallet - Letter, 3 1/2 Inch Expansion Wallets, Leather-Like Redrope, 10/Box EACH S 5.97 | nobid
Wallet - Legal, 3 1/2 Inch Expansion Wallets, Leather-Like Redrope, 10/Box EACH S 4.99 | no bid
Folder - Letter, Daily 1- 31 Open ing File, 31 Pockets, Leather- Like Redrope EACH S 14.99 | no bid
Folder - Legal, Daily 1- 31 Open ing File, 31 Pockets, Leather- Like Redrope EACH - no bid
Folder - Letter, ic A-Z, Open ing File, 21 Pockets, Leather-Like Redrope EACH S 1134 ]$ 10.51
Folder - Legal, A- Z Open ing File, 21 Pockets, Legal, Leather- Like Redrope EACH S 16.08 | no bid
Folder - Letter, Monthly Jan-Dec ing File, 12 Pocket, Leather-Like Redrope EACH S 11.36 | no bid
Folder - Legal, Monthly Jan-Dec ing File, 12 Pocket, Leather-_Like Redrope EACH S 21.59 | no bid
File Pockets - Letter, 3 1/2 Expansion Drop Front Pocket, Straight Tab, 25/Box EACH S 24.92[$ 112
File Pockets - Legal, 3 1/2 Inch Expansion Drop Front Pocket, 25/Box EACH S 2624 | $ 0.76
File Jackets - Letter, 11 Point Manila, 100/Box BOX $ 2398 [ $ 17.00
File Jackets - Legal, File Jackets, 11 Point Manila, 100/Box BOX $ 3544 $ 34.00
File Jackets - Letter, File Jackets with Two Inch Expansion, 11 Point Manila, 50/Box BOX S 26.55 | $ 14.50
File Jackets - Legal, File Jackets with Two Inch Expansion, 11 Point Manila, 50/Box BOX S 30.74 ] $ 15.50
Storage Boxes - Legal, String/Button Storage Box, Fiberboard, White, 12/Carton CARTON S 51.95 | $ 103.92
Storage Boxes - Letter/Legal, Economy Storage Box, Lift-Off Lid. White, 12/Ct EACH $ 18.19 | no bid
Storage Boxes - Letter/Legal, R-Kive Max Storage Box, Locking Lid, Woodgrain, 12/Carton CARTON S 55.95 | no bid
Shipping boxes-Corrugated shipping, 14x10x8 CARTON S 51.29 | no bid
Glue Stick - Glue Stic for Envelopes, .26 0z Stick EACH $ 0.66 | $ 0.27
Glue - Loctite Super Glue Gel, .07 Grams, 2 pk PACKAGE - $ 7.38
‘Tape - Invisible Tape, 3/4' x 1296', 1' Core, Clear ROLL $ 057 [ $ 0.63
Tape - General Purpose Masking Tape, 1 x 60 yards, 3' Core ROLL $ 125 [$ 0.99
Tape - Box Sealing Tape, 2'x 110 yards, 3' Core, Clear, 6/Box ROLL $ 233 [ 6.90
Tape - Filament Tape, .94' x 60 yards, 3' Core ROLL $ 469 | $ 371
‘Tape Dispenser - Desktop Tape Dispenser, 1' Core, Weighted Non-Skid Base, Black EACH S 151 ¢ 107
Envelope Moistener - Squeeze Bottle Moistener, 2 oz, Blue EACH $ 0.96 | $ 1.90
Mounting Squares - Precut Foam Mounting 1 Squares, Double-Sided, Permanent, 16 Squares/Pack PACKAGE - 3 114
Labels - Laser Printer Permanent Labels, 1 1/3' x 4, White, 1400/Box BOX $ 559 [$ 9.41
Labels - Address Labels for Copiers, 1 x 2-3/4, Bright White, 3300/Box BOX $ 5.59 | nobid
Labels - Laser Printer Permanent Labels, 1 x 2-5/8, White, 3000/Box BOX $ 6.19 [$ 9.24.
Labels - Laser Printer Permanent Labels, 1 x 4, White, 100 Sheets, 2000/Box BOX $ 559 [$ 9.41
Labels - Laser Printer Permanent Labels, 2 x 4, White, 1000/Box BOX $ 559 [$ 9.24.
Labels - Laser Pinter Permanent Labels, Full Sheet Letter 8.5'x 11', White, 100/Box BOX S 625 | $ 15.32
Labels - Print or Write Color-Coding Labels, 3/ 4in dia, Red, 1008/ Pack PACKAGE S 549 [ $ 191
Labels - Print or Write Color-Coding Labels, 3/4 in dia, Yellow, 1008/ Pack PACKAGE S 549 [ $ 191
Labels - Print or Write Color-Coding Labels, 3/4 in dia, Blue, 1008/Pack PACKAGE S 555 ¢ 188
Label Cartridge - For DYMO Label Writer Printer, Address Labels, 1- 1/ 8 3- 1/ 2, White, 700/ Box BOX S 4.25 | no bid
Labels - Brother Address Label - 1.14' Width x 2.42' Length - 800/Roll - White - 1/Roll ROLL S 4.55 | no bid
Labels-Avery, shipping label, 8.5x11 PACKAGE S 1337]$ 3.83
Reinforcements - Hole Reinforcements, 1/ 4’ Diameter, White, 200/ Pack BOX $ 137§ 0.64.
- Self- Adhesive Reinforcing Strips, 10 3/ 4 x 1, 200/ BX BOX S 21.33 | no bid
Seals - Inkjet Print or Write Notarial Seals, 2’ Diameter, Gold, 44/ Pack PACKAGE $ 225 | nobid
Post it-durable poly tabs. PACKAGE s 9.99 [ $ 454
Post-it - Standard Self-Stick Notes, 1- 1/ 2 x 2, Yellow, 12 100- Sheet Pad/ Pack PACKAGE S 6.95 | $ 5.15
Post-it - Standard Self-Stick Notes, 3 x 3, Yellow, 12 100- Sheet Pads/ Pack PACKAGE $ 995 [$ 11.52
Post-it - Standard Tape Flags in Dispenser, Yellow, 50 Flags/ Dispenser EACH $4.69 (pke) s 188
Post-it - Standard Tape Flags in Dispenser, Blue, 50 Flags/ Dispenser EACH $4.69 (pke) s 1.80
Post-it - Standard Tape Flags in Dispenser, Red, 50 Flags/ Dispenser EACH $4.69 (pkg) 3 1.80
Post-it - Standard Tape Flags in Dispenser, Green, 50 Flags/ Dispenser EACH $4.69 (pkg) 3 188
Post-it - Standard Tape Flags in Dispenser, Orange, 50 Flags/ Dispenser EACH $4.69 (pke) s 1.80
Message Tabs - "Sign Here" Arrow Message, 1/ 2" Flags, 4 Colors w/ Di: 120/Pack PACKAGE S 579 [$ 8.14
Punch - 30-Sheet Two-Hole Punch, 9/32" Holes, Black EACH $ 20.85 | $ 17.63
Punch - 12-Sheet Deluxe Two- and Three- Hole Adj Punch, 9/32" Holes, Black EACH s 21.04]$ 4.68
Punch - 40-Sheet Three-Hole Punch, Reduced Effort, 9/32" Holes, Black/Silver EACH S 41.83 | no bid
Ruler - Acrylic Plastic Ruler, 12", Clear EACH $ 1.99 [$ 037
Scale - Triangular Scale, Plastic, 12", Engineering, Color- Coded EACH S 13.87 | no bid
Scissors - All Purpose Scissors, Black, 8" EACH $ 081 [$ 122
Staples - Standard Chisel Point 210 Strip Count Staples, 5,000/ Box BOX $ 0.52 [ $ 071
Staples - S.F. 4 Premium Chisel Point 210 Count Full Strip Staples, 5,000/ Box BOX $ 219 [$ 2.97
Staples - High-Capacity Staples, 3/ 8 Inch Leg Length, 2500/ Box BOX $ 359 ¢ 234
Staples - Stanley® Bostitch 1/2" Heavy-Duty Staples, 85- Sheet Capacity, 1,000/ Box BOX S 4.99 | no bid
Staples - Heavy Duty, 150 Sheet Capacity, 5/8", 1000/Box BOX $ 5.49 | nobid
Staples - S.F. 13 Heavy- Duty 1/ 2 Inch Leg Length Staples, 90- Sheet Capacity, 1,000/ Box BOX S 691 [ $ 5.16
Staples - Swingline Optima Jam-Free Premium Staples - Standard 1/4" Leg, 3,750/Box BOX s 6.16 | $ 4.10
Stapler - Half Strip Stapler, 12-Sheet Capacity, Black EACH - $ 12.29
Stapler - Light-Duty Desk Stapler, 20-Sheet Capacity, Black, Full Strip EACH $ 333 (¢ 9.46
Stapler - Heavy-Duty Stapler, 160- Sheet Capacity, Black/ Gray EACH $ 4995 [$ 34.43
Stapler - Light-duty Stand-up Stapler, Reduced effort, Full-Strip, Black/Gray EACH $ 2619 | $ 10.36
Staple Remover - Jaw Style Staple Remover, Burgundy EACH $ 0.41 | no bid
Staple Remover - Heavy-Duty Staple Remover, Black EACH $ 12.19 | no bid
Staple Remover - Deluxe Jaw Style Staple Remover EACH $ 439 [§ 0.50
Staple Remover - Premium Blade Style Staple Remover, Satin Chrome Finish EACH $ 4.29 [§ 0.60
Letter Opener - L ight Hand Letter Opener, 9', Silver EACH $ 0.83 [$ 0.66
Letter Opener - Letter Slitter Hand Letter Opener w/ Concealed Blade, 2 1/ 2', White, 2/Pack EACH S 129 [$ 164
Plotter Paper - Designjet Bright White Inkjet Paper, 24 lbs., 36' x 150 ft, White ROLL S 18.63 | no bid
Plotter Paper - HP Universal Brand Paper Roll, 21 Ibs, 2’ Core, 24' x 150 ft, White EACH S 15.53 | no bid
Adding Tape - Adding Machine/ Calculator Roll, 16 Ib, 1/ 2' Core, 2- 1/ 4'x_150 ft, White, 100/ CT ROLL S 37.64 ] $ 53.00
‘Thermal Paper Rolls - For Verifone VX520 Credit Card Terminal, 50/Carton ROLL $ 34.57 | no bid
Pads - Letter, Perforated Edge Writing Pad, Canary, 50-Sheet, Dozen PAD $ 679 [$ 8.45
Pads - Legal, Perforated Edge Writing Pad, Canary, 50-Sheet, Dozen PAD $ 9.99 [ $ 11.02
Pads - 5 x 8 Perforated Edge Writing Pad, Jr. Legal Rule, 5 x 8, Canary, 50- Sheet, Dozen PAD s 4.89 [ $ 4.04
Steno Notebooks - Steno Book, Gregg Rule, 6 x 9, WHITE, 80 Sheets/Pad DOZEN $ 12.95 | § 8.26
Spiral Bound Notebook - College Rule, 8- 1/ 2 x 11, White, 100 Sheets/Pad EACH $ 538 [$ 136
Phone Message Books - Wirebound Message Books, 2 3/ 4 x 5, Two- Part Carbonless, 400 Sets/Book BOOK s 399 [$ 3.69
Index Cards - 3' x 5' Unruled Index Cards, White, 100/Pack PACKAGE $ 0.52 [ $ 056
Index Cards - 3' x 5' Ruled Index Cards, White, 100/Pack PACKAGE $ 0.52 [ $ 056
Index Cards - 4' x 6' Ruled Index Cards, White, 100/Pack PACKAGE $ 0.77 [ $ 071
Index Cards - 4' x 6 Unruled Index Cards, White, 100/Pack PACKAGE $ 0.77 [ $ 071
Eraser - Eraser Caps, 144/Box BOX $ 4.09 [$ 115
Eraser - Eraser Refills, 221, 3/Tube. PACKAGE s 1.05 | no bid
Eraser - Clic Eraser Pen-Style Eraser, 3/Pack PACKAGE $ 4.29 [$ 3.54
Eraser - Clic Eraser Pen-Style Eraser Refills, 2/Pack PACKAGE $ 1.69 | no bid
Dry Erase Eraser - Expo Dry Erase Marker Board Eraser - Charcoal Gray EACH $ 225 [ $ 2.03
i Sharpie, smear guard, yellow and pink, 12/box BOX $ 5.99 | nobid
- Brite Liner Grip XL Highli Chisel Tip, Fluorescent Yellow Ik, 12/Pk EACH S 819 [$ 6.06
- Assorted Colors, Chisel Tip, Fluorescent, 5/Set SET S 273 [$ 2.26
- Chisel Tip, Fluorescent Blue, Dozen DOZEN S 5.08 [ $ 3.06
- Chisel Tip, Fluorescent Orange, Dozen DOZEN S 521 [$ 6.24
- Chisel Tip, Fluorescent Green, Dozen DOZEN S 525 ] 3.06




Towelettes - Dry Erase Board Cleaning Wet Wipes, 6 x 9, 50/Container CONTAI [ $ 973 [ 631
Alcohol pads-cleanup, pr BOX s 5.19 | nobid
Markers - Low Odor Dry Erase Marker, Fine Point, Assorted, 4/Set SET $ 539 [$ 2.95
Markers - Low Odor Dry Erase Markers, Chisel Tip, Basic Assorted, 4/Set SET $ 244 [ $ 2.40
Markers - Permanent Markers, Chisel Tip, Black, Dozen EACH $ 310 [$ 3.30
Markers - Permanent Markers, Chisel Tip, Red, Dozen DOZEN $ 207 [$ 3.30
Markers - Red Porous Point Stick Pen, Red Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN s 13.82 [ $ 12.67
i - Brite Liner Highlj Chisel Tip, Fluorescent Yellow Ink, 12_per Pack DOZEN s 388 [$ 4.96
Pen - Counterfeit Bill Detector Pen for Use w/U.S. Currency EACH $ 1.44 | no bid
Pencils - Economy Woodcase Pencil, HB #2, Yellow Barrel, Dozen DOZEN $ 0.86 | $ 0.70
Pencils - Sharplet-2 Mechanical Pencil, 0.50 mm, Black Barrel DOZEN $ 23.34 | no bid
Pencils - Sharplet-2 Mechanical Pencil, 0.70 mm, Dark Blue Barrel DOZEN $ 22.03 | no bid
Pencils - Sharplet-2 Mechanical Pencil, 0.90 mm, Brown Barrel EACH - no bid
Pencils - Super Hi-Polymer Lead Refills, 0.5mm, HB, Black, 12 Leads/Tube TUBE $ 0.89 [ § 071
Pencils - Super Hi-Polymer Lead Refills, 0.7mm, HB, Black, 12 Leads/Pack TUBE $ 0.89 [ $ 071
Pencils - Super Hi-Polymer Lead Refills, 0.9mm, HB, Black, 15 Leads/Pack TUBE $ 0.89 [ $ 071
Pencils - Sharpwriter Mechanical Pencil, HB, 0.70 mm, Yellow Barrel, Dozen DOZEN s 343 [$ 3.02
Pens - Roller Ball Stick Dye-Based Pen, Blue Ink, Micro, Dozen, DOZEN $ 1233 ] 4.32
Pens - Roller Ball Stick Dye-Based Pen, Black Ink, Micro, Dozen DOZEN $ 1233 ] 4.32
Pens - Roller Ball Stick Dye-Based Pen Black Ink, Fine, Dozen DOZEN $ 1233 ] 4.32
Pens - Precise V5 Roller Ball Stick Pen, Needle Pt, Black Ink, 0.5mm Extra_Fine, Dozen DOZEN S 20.65 | $ 2038
Pens - Precise V5 Roller Ball Stick Pen, Needle Pt, Red Ink, 0.5mm Extra Fine, Dozen DOZEN S 20.85 | $ 2038
Pens - Standard Ballpoint Counter Pen, Black Ink, Medium EACH $ 234 [$ 2.20
Pens - Round Stic Grip Ballpoint Stick Pen, Red Ink, Fine, Dozen DOZEN $ 2.74 | nobid
Pens - Soft Feel Ballpoint Stick Pen, Red Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN $ 282 [$ 5.14
Pens - Soft Feel Ballpoint Stick Pen, Blue Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN $ 282 [$ 5.14
Pens - Soft Feel Ballpoint Stick Pen, Black Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN $ 282 [$ 5.14
Pens - Round Stic Ballpoint Stick Pen, Black Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN $ 1.05 [$ 136
Pens - Ballpoint Stick Oil- Based Pen, Blue Ink, Fine, Dozen DOZEN s 0.89 | no bid
Pens - Ballpoint Stick Oil- Based Pen, Black Ink, Fine, Dozen DOZEN s 0.89 | no bid
Pens - Ballpoint Stick Oil- Based Pen, Red Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN s 0.89 | no bid
Pens - Ballpoint Stick Oil- Based Pen, Black Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN s 0.94 | no bid
Pens - Ballpoint Stick Oil- Based Pen, Blue Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN s 0.94 | no bid
Pencil Sharpener - Compact Desktop Battery-Operated Pencil Black, Uses Four AA batteries EACH s 2758 | $ 6.40
Pens - Round Stic Ballpoint Stick Pen, Black Ink, Fine, Dozen DOZEN $ 1.05 [$ 136
Pens - Round Stic Ballpoint Stick Pen Blue Ink, Fine, Dozen DOZEN $ 1.05 [$ 136
Pens - Round Stic Ballpoint Stick Pen, Blue Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN $ 1.05 [$ 1.09
Pens - Clic Stic Ballpoint Retractable Pen, Black Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN S 439§ 5.51
Pens - Clic Stic Ballpoint Retractable Pen, Blue Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN S 439§ 5.51
Pens - Zebra Sarasa Roller Ball Retractable Gel Pen, Black Ink, Medium, 20 _per Box BOX S 2505 | $ 12.48
Sharpie - Permanent Marker, Fine Point, Black, Dozen DOZEN s 779 [$ 7.63
Sharpie - Permanent Marker, Extra Fine Point, Black, Dozen DOZEN s 779 [$ 7.63
Sharpie - Permanent Marker, Fine Point, Red, Dozen DOZEN s 779 [$ 7.63
Pens - Signo Gel RT Roller Ball Gel Pen, Black Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN s 17.19 | no bid
Pen Refill - Refill for G2 Gel, Dr. Grip Gel/ Ltd, ExecuGel G6, Q7, Fine Tip, Black, 2/ Pack PACKAGE S 1.21 | no bid
Pens - G2 Gel Roller Ball Pen, Retractable, Refillable, Red Ink, 0.7mm Fine, Dozen DOZEN S 17.95 | no bid
Pens - G2 Gel Roller Ball Pen, Retractable, Refillable, Black Ink, 0.7mm Fine, Dozen DOZEN S 17.95 | no bid
Pens - G2 Gel Roller Ball Pen, Retractable, Refillable, Blue Ink, 0.7mm Fine, Dozen DOZEN S 17.95 | no bid
Pens - Signo Gel 207 Roller Ball Gel Pen, Blue Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN s 16.95 | $ 19.15
Pens - Signo Gel GRIP Roller Ball Stick Gel Pen, Black Ink, Medium, Dozen DOZEN s 16.95 | $ 6.05
Ribbon - Data Products® R5110 Correctable Ribbon for IBM Wheelwriter Series Typewriters EACH S 5.69 | nobid
Ribbon - DPS-R1427 Compatible Ribbon, Calculator Ribbon, Black/Red EACH $ 2.99 | nobid
Ribbon - Calculator, R3027 Compatible Ribbon, Black/ Red EACH $ 0.99 | no bid
Ribbon - R1420 Compatible Ribbon, Black, Typewriter, (for use in Brother typewriter) EACH S 4.89 | no bid
Lift-Off Tape - Lift-Off Tape for use with IBM Selectric I1/111 Series and Others, 6/Box BOX - no bid
Batteries 'AA’ - Duracell® Alkaline 'AA” Batteries; 16-Pack EACH $7.89 (pack) s 16.84
Batteries 'AAA’ - Duracell® Alkaline 'AAA’ Batteries; 12-Pack EACH $7.89 (pack) s 12.63
Batteries "C" - Duracell® Alkaline "C” Batteries; 1.5V, 8-Pack EACH $6.89 (pack) s 4.60
Batteries "D" - Duracell® Alkaline "D" Batteries; 8-Pack EACH $8.89 (pack) s 4.60
Batteries "9V" - Duracell® Alkaline "9V" Batteries; 4-Pack EACH $14.89 (pack) s 18.28
Batteries "E2 Lithium" - Energizer® Specialty Batteries; e2 Lithium Photo Battery, 123, 3V, EACH EACH S 7.79 | nobid
CD-RW Discs - 700MB/80min, 12x, w/Jewel Cases, Silver, 5/Pack EACH $ 7.79 | nobid
€C$72100 CD-R Discs - 700MB/80min, 52, Spindle, Silver, 100/Pack PACKAGE $ 25.99 | no bid
CD-R Discs - 700MB/80min, 52x, w/Slim Jewel Cases, Silver, 10/Pack EACH $ 6.82 | nobid
DVD-R/RAM - Recordable DVD's, Rewri 1000 times, Capacity 9.4GB/Double-Sided, Each EACH - no bid
DVD+RW - Rewritable DVDs w/jewel case, Capacity 4.7GB/Single-Sided, 120 minute capacity, Each EACH S 11.63 | no bid
DVD-R - 47GB, 16x, Spindle, Silver, 50/Pack PACKAGE $ 19.95 | o bid
DVD-R - 8cm Minidisc DVD- R, 1.4GB, 4x, w/ Jewel Case, Silver, 3/ Pack PACKAGE - no bid
Photo Paper - Glossy Photo Paper, 60 Ibs., Glossy, 8-1/2 x 11, 50 Sheets/Pack PACKAGE $ 22.49 | no bid
CD/DVD Envelopes - CD/DVD Envelopes, Paper Envelope With Clear Poly Window, 50/Box BOX S 849 [ $ 9.34
Compressed Air Duster - Compressed Gas Duster, 7 0z Can EACH S 339 [$ 3.83
Surge Protector - Six- Outlet Surge , 1080 Joules, 6 ft. cord, Putty EACH $ 12.98 | no bid
Wireless mouse, logitech, m325 EACH $ 32.14 | nobid
Mouse Pad - Standard Mouse Pad, 8" x 9", Blue EACH $ 254 [$ 197
Wrist Rest - Memory Foam Mouse Pad/Wrist Rest, 1.0" x 7.9" x 9.3", Silver/Black EACH S 1076 | 12.53
Wrist Rest - PlushTouch Keyboard Wrist Rest with FoamFusion T 3.2"x 18.1", Microban Anti-Microbial Protection, Contoured, Black EACH s 1285 | $ 8.86
Calendar Refill - Desk Calendar Refill, 3-1/2" x 6", 2 Pages For Each Weekday EACH $ 1.99 [$ 1.42
Calendar Base - Base for E71750 Calendar Refills, 3 1/2" x 6", Black EACH $ 12.99 [ § 2.10
Calendar Refill - Compact Desk Calendar Refill, 3" x 3 3/4", 2 Pages For Each Weekday EACH s 749 [ $ 4.80
Calendar Base - Compact Desk Calendar Base, 3" x 3 3/4"for E919-50 Calendar Refills, Black EACH S 1119 [ § 8.75
Calendar - Desk Pad, 22" x 17", Non-Refillable, Ruled Daily Blocks, Vinyl Corners, Eyelets For Hanging, Jan-Dec EACH s 399§ 2.40
Calendar - Yearly Wall Calendar, Metal Bound, Unruled Daily Blocks, Hanging _Eyelets, 24" x 36", Blue Ink EACH - no bid
Appointment Book - Daily Appointment Book, 4-7/8" x 8", DayMinder, Nonrefillable, Ruled, One Day Per Page, 2 month reference blocks EACH s 13.49 | no bid
Book - 4-Person Daily Appt. Book, 7 7/8" x 11", DayMinder, Nonrefillable, Ruled, 1 Day /Page, 2 Month Ref. Blocks EACH s 11.70 | no bid
Book - Weekly Planner, 6-7/8" x 8-3/4", Nonrefillable, Ruled, One Week Per Spread, 12 month reference blocks EACH s 32.95 | no bid
Book - Weekly Appoi Book, 8-1/4" x 10 -7/8", Nonrefillable, Ruled, One Week Per Spread, 12 Month Reference Blocks EACH s 19.88 | no bid
Book - Weekly/Monthly Appoi Book, 8" x 9-7/8", Simulated Leather, Black EACH S 14.95 | no bid
Appointment Book - Monthly Planner, 6-7/8" x 8-3/4", Nonrefillable, Unruled, One Month Per Spread, 6 Month Reference Blocks, 16 Month Fiscal EACH - o bid
Appointment Book - Monthly Planner, 9" x 11", Nonrefillable, Unruled, One_Month Per Spread, 13 Month Jan-Jan, Telephone/Address Pages EACH - o bid
Appointment Book - Monthly Planner, 6-7/8" x 8-3/4", Nonrefillable, Unruled, 1 Month/Spread, 6 Month Reference Blocks, Memo Section EACH s 13.40 | o bid
Appointment Book - 3-Year Mo. Planner, 8-1/2" x 11", Refillable, Unruled, 1 Month/Spread, 6 Month Ref. Blocks, Yrly. Dividers. Sim. Leather, Black EACH S 52.95 | no bid
Book - Qui Monthly Planner, Jan. - Dec, 8 1/4" x 10_7/8", Black EACH S 24.95 | no bid
"Today Is" Wall Calendar - Refill, 6 5/8" x 9 1/8", 2013 EACH $ 13.49 | o bid
Book - 5-Year Monthly Planner, 8-1/2" x 11", Refillable, Unruled, 1 Month/Spread, Yrly. Dividers. Sim. Leather. Black EACH s 55.95 | no bid
Book - DayMinder Four-Person Group Appoi Book EACH $ 33.95 | no bid
Book Refill - Three- Or Five-Year Planner, Black, 9'x 11', 2015 Refill for 7023605 and 7029605 EACH - no bid
Book Refill - Three- Or Five-Year Planner, Black, 9'x 11', 2016 Refill for 7023605 and 7029605 EACH - no bid
Book Refill - Three- Or Five-Year Planner, Black, 9'x 11', 2017 Refill for 7023605 and 7029605 - **Available July, 2014** EACH - o bid
Book Refill - Three- Or Five-Year Planner, Black, 9'x 11', 2018 Refill for 7023605 and 7029605 EACH - no bid
Binding Combs - Plastic Comb Bindings, 5/16' Diameter, 40 Sheet Capacity, Black, 100 Combs/Pack BOX s 549 [ $ 291
Binding Combs - Plastic Comb Bindings, 3/8' Diameter, 55 Sheet Capacity, Black, 100 Combs/Pack BOX s 689 S 3.44
Binding Combs - CombBind Standard Spines, 1/2' Diameter, 85 Sheet Capacity, Black, 100/Box BOX s 955 [$ 5.28
Binding Combs - CombBind Standard Spines, 5/8' Diameter, 125 Sheet Capacity, Black, 25/Box BOX s 1048 [ $ 1.89
Binding Combs - CombBind Standard Spines, 3/4' Diameter, 150 Sheet Capacity, Black, 100/Box BOX s 1925 § 9.26
Binding Combs - CombBind Standard Spines, 1' Diameter, 200 Sheet Capacity, Black, 100/Pack BOX s 27.98 | $ 15.14
Binding Combs - CombBind Standard Spines, 1-1/2' Diameter, 320 Sheet Capacity, Black, 100/Box EACH S 52.96 | no bid
Phone Cord - Handset 12', dark gray EACH $ 2.81 | nobid
Wall Clock - Round Wall Clock, 12-1/2in, Black EACH $ 2297 12.56
Visitor Register Book - Visitor Register Book, Red Hardcover, 112 Pages, 8 1/2x 11 1/2 EACH S 63.98 | no bid
Notary Public Record Book - Burgundy Cover, 60 Pages, 8 1/2x 10 1/2 EACH $ 15.19 | no bid




Journal Books - Esselte Canvas Journal Books, 150 Sheet(s), Thread Sewn, 12.12' x 7.62' Sheet Size EACH $ 26.88 | no bid
Journal Book - Esselte Canvas Journal Book, 500 Sheet(s), Thread Sewn, 12.12' x 7.62' Sheet Size EACH $ 64.90 | no bid
Posterboard - White Poster Board, 28 x 22, 50/Carton EACH $ 2489 S 15.45
Waste Basket - 7 gallon EACH $ 486 |$ 5.16
Dry Erase Board - Quartet® Wood Framed Dry-Erase Board; 3'x2' EACH $ 49.80 | $ 14120
Cork Board - Quartet® Oak Finish Frame Cork Board; 36'x24' EACH $ 49.68 | $ 78.08
Floor Mats - Economy Carpet Chair Mat; 36x48', Standard Lip EACH S 19.95 | no bid
L ting Pouches - HeatSeal Laminating Pouches, 3 mil, Letter, 9 x 11 1/2, 100/Box BOX $ 2088 [$ 1132
L ting Pouches - HeatSeal Laminating Pouches, 5 mil, Legal, 9 x 14 1/2, 100/Box PACKAGE. $ 49.98 | no bid
L ting Pouches - HeatSeal Laminating Pouch, 11.25' x 17.25', 3mil, 25 Pack EACH $ 28.05 | no bid
Business Card Kit - Inkjet Matte Business Cards, 2 x 3 1/2, Ivory, 10/Sheet, 250/Pack PACKAGE. $ 15.19 | no bid
Shredder Oil - 12 oz. Bottle, for Oiling Shredder Blades EACH $ 6.19 | no bid
Name Badge Holders - Photo ID Badge Holder, Hori 4w x 3h, Clear, 25/Pack PACKAGE. $ 20.58 | no bid
Lanyards - Round Lanyards w/Bulldog Clips, 24/Package PACKAGE $ 10.65 | no bid
Hand sanitizer -pump bottle 12 oz. EACH 6.15 7.85
Desk File/sorter-20x dividersw-printed A-Z 8.5x 11 EACH 16.19 10.00
Envelope-Easy Close Business envelopes, 4 1/8x9 1/2 BOX 20.69 13.01
Envelope-Left Window Security-Tint Gummed #10 BOX 18.95 13.01
Envelope-gummed clasp, 6x9 PACKAGE 5.99 7.02
Envelope-self sealing, brown, 5x7 BOX - no bid
Envelope-self sealing, brown, 9x12 BOX S 13.81 2053
Envelope-Self Sealing, brown, 10x13 BOX S 15.82 | no bid
Envelope-Poly Button and string document, assorted colors, legal size PACKAGE - no bid
Envelope-Poly Button and string document, assorted colors, letter size PACKAGE - 0.82
Envelope-Poly Button and string document, 10.5x14 BOX - no bid




