AGENDA REPORT

CITY OF ALAMOGORDO
CITY COMMISSION

Meeting Date: 04/24/2018 Report Date: Report No: 3.

Submitted By: Veronica Ortega

Subject: Consider and act upon, award IFB 2018-02 Miscellaneous Foods, Dairy Products & Items for the
Alamogordo Senior Center Program to multiple vendors in the amount not exceed $177,419.52. ( Veronica
Ortega, Community Services Director)

Fiscal Impact:

Amount Budgeted: $65,000.00
$55,000.00

Fund: 071-8024-445-3260
071-8023-445-3260

Additional Fiscal Impact:

Recommendation: Award Sysco NM (188) One hundred Eighty eight items for an estimated total
$113,637.74. Award Shamrock Foods (74) Seventy four items for an estimated total $42,727.69. Award
Ben E. Keith (48) Forty eight items for an estimated total $11,594.80. Award Prices Creameries (6) Six
items for an estimated total of $9,459.29.

Bid amount estimated total $177,419.52

Background: IFB 2018-02 was advertised February 25, 2018 and opened March 27 2018. Four (4)
responsive bids were received. This IFB is awarded on an "item by item" basis to the low bidder meeting
specifications and requirements. Award will be fixed price, estimated quantity for a six (6) month period
commencing May 1st, 2018 through October 31, 2018.

Fiscal impact will be no more than budget. Total estimated bid of $177,419.52 is based on maximum bid
quantities. Orders are placed as items are needed, and will not exceed fiscal years budget.

Bid Tabulation attached




Est.

Shamrock Foods

Ben E Keith

Sysco

Prices

Creameries
Item| Qty Size Description

1 20 | 6-#10/per cs |Apples-sliced-solid pk-in water $39.77 $795.40] $31.48[ $629.68] $36.60( $732.00
2 20 | 6-#10/per cs |Applesauce, unsweetened $25.95 $519.00] $25.52 $510.32] $26.44 $528.80
3 8 6 - #10/per cs |Applesauce, Chunky $51.04 S408.32IN/A N/A No Bid No Bid

4 72 | 6-#10/per cs |Apricot-Halves-in light syrup $44.50| S$3,204.00] $41.49( $2,987.61] $37.87| $2,726.64
5 18 | 6-#10/per cs [Cherries-pitted-red-tart-in water $20.92 $376.56|N/A N/A No Bid [No Bid

6 6 6 - #10/per cs |Cranberry Sauce - whole $45.73 $274.38] $39.92 $239.52] $35.93( S$215.58
7 6 10 #/per cs  |Coconut-shredded $26.05 $156.30] $29.44 S$176.65] $19.08 $114.48
8 30 | 6-#10/per cs |Mixed Fruit - in light syrup $28.59 $857.70] $38.27| $1,148.06] $34.63| $1,038.90
9 10 | 6-#10/per cs |Oranges-Mandarin-in water $30.00 $300.00] $27.96| S$279.57] S$24.71| $247.10
10 72 | 6-#10/per cs |Peaches-diced-in light syrup $39.31| $2,830.32] $36.12| $2,600.52] $25.85| $1,861.20
11 72 | 6-#10/per cs |Pears-diced-in light syrup $36.40| $2,620.80] $37.88| $2,727.48] $40.56( $2,920.32
12 | 24 | 6-#10/percs |Pineapple-crushed-light syrup $28.16 $675.84] $36.40( $873.55] $28.96| $695.04
13 24 | 6-#10/per cs |Pineapple-tidbits-light syrup $30.45 $730.80] $32.74 $785.81| $24.31| $583.44
14 9 6 - #10/per cs |Plums-Purple-heavy syrup $32.08 $288.72| $42.43| S381.87] $33.95| $305.55
15 4 | 24-1#Iper cs |Raisins-seedless $69.58 $278.32] $43.70| S$174.80] S$42.11| $168.44
16 | 72 | 6-#10/percs |Tropical-Fruit-in light syrup $35.16| $2,531.52| $43.34| $3,120.77| $40.77| $2,935.44
17 5 |12 - 32 oz/per cqJuice - Lemon $36.38 S181.90IN/A N/A $23.64| $118.20
18 5 |12 - 46 oz/per cqJuice - Pineapple $37.44 $187.20] $23.37| S116.83] S$22.34| $111.70




19 6 6 - #10/per cs |Pie - Filling - Apple $56.34 $338.04] $47.44 S$284.65| $35.62 S$213.72
20 6 6 - #10/per cs |Pie - Filling - Cherry $89.75 $538.50] $47.44| S284.65] $50.37| $302.22
21 6 6 - #10/per cs |Pie - Filling - Peach $84.69 $508.14] $65.58 $393.48| $47.69| $286.14
Beans - Northern-White-Medium-
22 | 750 | 50#perbag [Cleaned $19.00| S14,250.00|N/A N/A $26.14| $19,605.00
23 6 6 - #10/per cs |Beans - Pinto-Dry-Triple Cleaned $24.10 $144.60] $23.01 S138.06] $28.97 $173.82
24 6 6 - #10/per cs |Beans - Pork-N-Beans $21.38 $128.28] $29.47| $176.84] $20.73| $124.38
25 6 6 - #10/per cs |Beans - Ranch - Style - in sauce $36.00 $216.00] $33.37| S$200.19] S$22.23 $133.38
26 15 | 6-#10/per cs |Beans - Three-Bean-Salad $29.40 S441.00IN/A N/A $43.71| $655.65
27 15 | 6-#10/per cs |Beets-Sliced-in juice $27.21 $408.15] $36.08 S$541.13] $24.86[ $372.90
28 5 6 - #10/per cs |Beets-Sliced-Pickled-in juice $30.31 S151.55|N/A N/A $30.95| $154.75
29 6 6-#10/per cs |Hominy-White-plain $21.98 $131.88] $23.38 S$140.26] $16.94 S101.64
30 3 6 - #10/per cs |Mushrooms - Stems & Pieces $36.02 $108.06] $35.20( $105.61] $20.67 $62.01
31| 15 | 6-#10/percs |Peas - Blackeyed, no snaps $23.57 $353.55| $27.47| S$412.10] $25.15| $377.25
32 5 6 - #10/per cs |Peppers - Jalapeno - Sliced $23.25 $116.25] $17.75 $88.76| $24.26( $121.30
33 6 | 6-#10/percs |Potato-Instant Granules-Complete $52.16 $312.96] $50.43| $302.58] $43.41| $260.46
34 | 27 | 6-#1l0/percs |Potato - Sweet - cut - in syrup $43.99| $1,187.73] $35.39] $955.45| $27.89| $753.03
35 6 | 6-#10/percs |Sauerkraut-shredded $27.56 $165.36] $29.72| S$178.32] $26.29( $157.74
36 5 6 - #10/per cs |Tomato - Ketchup $27.87 $139.35] $23.31| S116.56] $20.61| $103.05
37 4 | 6-#10/per cs |Tomato - Pizza - Sauce $25.88 $103.52] $27.63| $110.54] $23.75 $95.00
38 4 6 - #10/per cs |Tomato - Spaghetti - Sauce $38.92 $155.68] $25.41| S101.63] S$21.11 $84.44




39 | 10 | 6#10/percs |Tomato - Paste $33.21 $332.10] $31.32| S$313.23] S$28.44| $284.40
40 | 10 | 6-#10/percs [Tomato - Sauce $22.71 $227.10] $19.34| $193.44| $24.06( $240.60
41 | 15 | 6-#10/percs [Tomato - Stewed $25.53 $382.95| $21.78| S$326.77] S$24.14| $362.10
42 10 |48 - 6 oz/per cs|Juice - Tomato - low-sodium $21.05 $210.50] $18.06 $180.65| $14.41( S$144.10
43 10 | 48-6 oz/per cs [Juice - V8 - low-sodium $25.75 $257.50IN/A N/A $22.61| $226.10
44 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Cake-Chocolate $69.69 $348.45] $41.08| $205.38|No Bid No Bid

45 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Cake-Spice $66.73 $333.65|N/A N/A $51.03| $255.15
46 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Cake-White $24.05 $120.25] $40.05| $200.25] S$21.15| $105.75
47 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Cake-Yellow $71.50 $357.50] $40.70( $203.49] $21.15( $105.75
48 6 | 6-24 oz./per cs [Gravy - Beef - low-sodium $26.98 $161.88] $18.12| S108.71] S$28.89| $173.34
49 6 | 6-24 oz./per cs |Gravy - Chicken - low-sodium $27.20 $163.20|N/A N/A $34.43| $206.58
50 6 | 6-24 oz./per cs |Gravy - Turkey - low-sodium $27.64 $165.84] $17.53| S105.16] $15.19 $91.14
51 6 | 6-24 oz./per cs [Gravy - White - low-sodium $19.24 $115.44] $14.67 $88.00] $13.30 $79.80
52 5 6 - S#/boxes |Mix-Biscuit $32.32 $161.60] S$24.11| S120.54] $27.23| S136.15
53 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Mix - Brownie $79.51 $397.55] $41.02 S$205.11] $48.76( $243.80
54 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Mix - Cornbread $34.85 $174.25] $28.98| $144.89| $25.82( $129.10
55 5 6-5#/boxes  |Mix - Muffin - Variety No Bid |[No Bid N/A N/A $52.00| $260.00
56 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Mix - Potato - Augratin $56.58 $282.90] $46.91| S$234.57] $46.20( $231.00
57 5 6 - 5#/boxes |Mix - Potato - Scalloped $55.17 $275.85] $53.37 $266.83] $46.20( $231.00

Mix-Stuffing-Uncle-Ben's-or-equal-large
58 5 6 - 5#/boxes |bag $49.07 $245.35] $51.61| $258.06 $51.59 $257.95




59 5 50 #sack |Flour-Whole-Wheat $16.47 $82.35] S$12.23 $61.13] $68.02| $340.10
60 25 50 # sack  |Flour-White-All-Purpose $17.19 $429.75] S$12.66| S316.40] $12.87| S321.75
61| 10 25#sack |Commeal-Yellow $9.66 $96.60 $9.14 $91.40 $9.26 $92.60
62 2 25 #sack |Rice - Brown $28.60 $57.20] $27.59 $55.18] S$12.61 $25.22
63 6 25 #sack |Rice-Long-Grain-Wild $39.59 $237.54] $30.99 $185.94] S$24.31 $145.86
64 10 25 #sack |Rice-Parboiled $13.32 $133.20] $10.30| $103.01 $9.57 $95.70
65 5 5#/cont  [Rice-Instant $37.14 $185.70IN/A N/A No Bid No Bid

66 2 5#/cont  |Baking - Powder $6.75 $13.50|N/A N/A $51.91| $103.82
67 1 24 - 1#/box |Baking - Soda $15.52 $15.52] $15.65 $15.65| $14.51 $14.51
68 5 24 - 1#/box |Cornstarch $16.90 $84.50] $16.95 $84.73] $15.69 $78.45
69 3 20 - 1#/box |Yeast $51.00 $153.00] S$53.33[ $160.00] $51.38( S$154.14
70 9 200-2ct/case |Crackers - Low Sodium - Wheat No Bid |[No Bid N/A N/A $17.88| $160.92
71| 10 |[500- 2 ct/ case|Crackers - Saltines $12.66 $126.60] $14.19| $141.94 $8.57 $85.70
72 10 6-1#/ case |Base - Beef-low-sodium $30.15 $301.50] $38.23| $382.26] $40.65 $406.50
73 | 10 | 6-1#/case |Base- Chicken-Low-sodium $40.80 $408.00] $26.85| $268.49| $34.23| $342.30
74 | 10 6-1#/ case |Base - Turkey - Low-sodium $47.88 S478.80IN/A N/A No Bid No Bid

75 10 |12 - 50 oz/case [Soup-Cream-of-Chicken $45.41 $454.10] $40.82 $408.17| $30.75[ $307.50
76 10 |12 - 50 oz/case |Soup-Cream-of-Mushroom $45.00 S450.00] $40.49| S$404.95| $30.47( S304.70
77 5 |12 - 50 oz/case |Soup-Cream-of-Tomato $34.17 $170.85] $37.48 $187.42| $23.48( $117.40
78 5 24-20 oz/case |Coffee Creamer - canister $28.26 $141.30] $35.29| $176.45] $28.51| $142.55




79 5 200 ct/case |PC - Tartar - Sauce $9.97 $49.85] $16.57 $82.85] $19.85 $99.25
80 5 200 ct/case |PC - Ranch - Dressing $22.87 $114.35] $17.16 $85.81 S5.62 $28.10
81 5 200 cticase |PC - French - Dressing $13.10 $65.50|N/A N/A $15.59 $77.95
82 5 200 ct/case |PC - ltalian - Dressing $34.62 $173.10IN/A N/A $26.11| $130.55
83 5 200 ct/case |PC - Thousand - Island - Dressing $13.78 $68.90 $7.19 $35.97] $18.36 $91.80
84 5 200 ct/case |PC - Mayonaise - Packets $10.08 $50.40] $12.41 $62.04 $8.45 $42.25
85 5 200 ct/case |PC - Mustard - Packets $6.34 $31.70 $5.94 $29.68 $4.52 $22.60
86 5 200 ct/case |PC - Ketchup - Packets $24.66 $123.30] $10.28 $51.40] $15.16 $75.80
87 5 200 ct/case [PC - Sweet - Relish $13.73 $68.65] $13.92 $69.62| $17.76 $88.80
88 5 200 ct/case |PC - Assorted - Jellies $12.46 $62.30] $11.48 $57.42 S5.66 $28.30
89 5 2/1250/ case [PC - Sweet-n-Low-Packets $14.84 $74.20] $13.61 $68.06 $9.68 $48.40
90 5 2000/case |PC - Sugar - Packets $11.88 $59.40] $12.94 $64.68 $8.76 $43.80
91 5 100 cticase |PC - Peanut Butter - Packets $40.54 $202.70] $39.01| $195.05] $13.89 $69.45
92 5 100 ct/case |PC - Cheddar Cheese - Packets No Bid |[No Bid N/A N/A $15.70 $78.50
93 | 15 600 ct/case |PC - Promise-Margarine-or-equal $23.94 $359.10] $28.36| $425.38] $14.41| $216.15
94 | 20 | 30-1#/case |Margarine - Solids $24.88 $497.60] $21.93 $438.70] $25.11| S$502.20
95 4 3/1gallon  |Liquid Butter $34.54 $138.16] $31.40| S$125.61] $30.39| S121.56
96 20 3/1 gallon  |Olive Oil $17.01 $340.20] $79.57| $1,591.30] S$48.06( $961.20
97 6 35#/case  |PV - Liquid -Shortening $22.97 $137.82] $20.32 S$121.89] $19.73( S5118.38
Vegelene -Pan Spray - Can - Original
98 | 20 6cticase  |due to waste $17.22 $344.40] $27.28| S$545.65| $11.96( $239.20




99 5 24-20 oz/case |Sugar - Granulated - cannister $37.72 $188.60] $41.01 S$205.05| $59.06( $295.30
100| 10 50 #/sack  |Sugar - Granulated $27.46 $274.60] $23.24| S$232.39] $24.19( S241.90
101 5 12 - 2 #/case |Sugar - Brown $30.61 $153.05] $25.59( $127.93] $24.67| $123.35
102| 5 | 4-1galicase |LowFat-Coleslaw-Dressing $34.27 $171.35|N/A N/A $28.73| $143.65
103| s 4 -1 gal/case |FatFree - Italian - Salad - Dressing $25.95 $129.75] $23.54| S117.69] S$22.76( $113.80
104| s 4 -1 galicase |LowFat - French - Salad - Dressing $32.23 $161.15|N/A N/A $24.11| $120.55
105 5 4 -1 galicase [LowFat - Raspberry - Vinegarette $22.27 $111.35] $37.19 $185.97| $43.62 $218.10
106| s 4 -1 gal/case |LowFat - Thousand - Island $36.76 $183.80|N/A N/A $27.55| $137.75
107 5 4 -1 galicase [LowFat - Mayonaise $25.32 $126.60] $40.51 $202.53] $25.99( $129.95
108| 5 [18-3.2 oz/icase|Ranch - Dressing - Mix $20.11 $100.55| $23.74 S$118.71] $15.90 $79.50
109| 10 6-5# Honey $86.47 $864.70] $23.74 S$237.42| $68.02( $680.20
110| 4 12-12 0z |Tabasco - Sauce $153.91 $615.64] $66.28| $265.13] $64.87| $259.48
111 2 6 - #10/case |Mustard - Yellow - Prepared $18.56 $37.12] $65.57| $131.14] S11.61 $23.22
112 =2 4 -1 galicase |Vinegar - Distilled - White $6.69 $13.38 $6.74 $13.48] $11.29 $22.58
113 2 4 -1 galicase [Vinegar - Apple-Cider $28.18 $56.36] $26.28 $52.56| $14.57 $29.14
114 2 4 -1 galicase [Relish - Pickle $24.98 $49.96] $26.81 $53.61| $21.37 $42.74
115 2 4 -1 galicase [Relish - Sweet $27.23 $54.46| $28.44 $56.88] $25.72 $51.44
116| s 12 - 1 #/case |Marshmallow - MINI $19.56 $97.80] $22.09| $110.43] $19.69 $98.45
117 5 6 #/case  |Nuts - Almond - Sliced $53.39 $266.95] $38.24 $191.18] $37.71| $188.55
118] s 6 #/case  |Nuts - Walnut - pieces $52.79 $263.95] $32.38| S$161.88] $29.17| $145.85




119 5 6 - #10/case |Pudding - Banana - RTE $30.81 $154.05] $34.45 S$172.26] $26.26f $131.30
120 5 6 - #10/case [Pudding - Chocolate - RTE $31.51 $157.55] $34.46| 517231 $26.29( $131.45
121 5 6 - #10/case |Pudding - Lemon - RTE $22.89 $114.45]N/A N/A $27.72| $138.60
122 5 6 - #10/case |[Pudding - Tapioca - RTE $32.87 $164.35] $35.55| S177.75 $30.17( $150.85
123| 10 6 - #10/case |Pudding - Vanilla - RTE $30.60 $306.00] $34.45 $344.50] $26.35[ $263.50
124 5 |12 -24 oz/case|Gelatin - Citrus $27.16 $135.80] $30.05| S$150.27] $25.83| $129.15
125 5 |12 - 24 oz/case |Gelatin - Reds $27.16 $135.80] $29.54 S$147.69] $25.83| $129.15
126 10 20 #/case |Pasta - Egg-Noodles - medium $13.96 $139.60] $13.76] S$137.63] $10.66| S$106.60
127 10 20 #icase |Pasta - Elbow-Macaroni $14.50 $145.00] $14.97| $149.68] $13.01| $130.10
128 10 20 #/case  |Pasta - Lasagna-Noodles $16.39 $163.90] $15.16| S151.61] $11.54( S115.40
129| 10 20 #/case  |Pasta - Spaghetti $13.72 $137.20] $19.18 S$191.83] S$11.34 S113.40
130( 10 20 #/case  |Pasta - Tri-Colored - Noodle $21.94 $219.40] $24.18| $241.83 $9.19 $91.90
131 5 96 ct/case |Cereal - Cherrios-Honey-Wheat $39.86 $199.30] $37.49( $187.47| $36.24 $181.20
132 s 96 ct/case  |Cereal - Cornflakes $39.86 $199.30] $25.83| $129.14| $36.12( $180.60
133 5 96 ct/case |Cereal - Corn-Pops $39.86 $199.30IN/A N/A No Bid No Bid

134( s 96 cticase  |Cereal - Golden-Grahams $26.39 $131.95|N/A N/A $36.24| $181.20
135 5 96 ct/case |Cereal - Kix $37.84 $189.20IN/A N/A No Bid No Bid

136| s 96 ct/case  |Cereal - Raisin-Bran $26.39 $131.95] $39.32 $196.61] $36.12( $180.60
137 s 48cticase  |Cereal - Instant - Cream-of-Wheat $53.39 $266.95| $42.32| $211.61] $41.87| $209.35
138| 5 48 ct/case |Cereal - Instant-Oatmeal - Packets $9.96 $49.80 $9.56 $47.80 $9.39 $46.95




139 2 24 #icase |Cereal - Oatmeal - Quick - Cook $37.43 $74.86] $26.94 $53.87] $28.68 $57.36
140( 10 25# Crumbs - Panko - Bread $18.15 $181.50] $17.47| S174.73 $18.99( $189.90
141 15 12-1#bxs [Crumbs - Corn - Flake $36.81 $552.15IN/A N/A $34.21| $513.15
142 10 50z Spice - Chives - Freeze - Dried $5.35 $53.50 $7.23 $72.28] $33.18( $331.80
143 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Extract - Almond $20.44 $20.44 $4.51 $4.51] $18.02 $18.02
144 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Extract - Lemon $21.09 $21.09|N/A N/A $52.98 $52.98
145 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Extract - Vanilla $4.83 $4.83 $3.61 $3.61] $247.35| $247.35
146| s 3#cont |Spice - Flakes - Onion $6.93 S$34.65| $12.47 $62.34] $85.26( $426.30
147 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Flakes - Parsley $13.58 $13.58 $6.89 $6.89] S$33.52 $33.52
148 s 3#cont |Spice - Granulated - Garlic $27.63 $138.15] $26.55| S$132.77] $128.80| $644.00
149 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Ground - Cinnamon $7.60 $7.60 $5.17 $5.17] $52.02 $52.02
150 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Ground - Cloves $20.57 $20.57] $18.87 $18.87| S$110.82( $110.82
151 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Ground - Cumin $10.84 $10.84 $4.12 $4.12] $45.18 $45.18
152 1 16 ozea. |Spice - Ground - Pepper - Lemon $11.79 $11.79] $10.65 $10.65| $62.56 $62.56
153 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Powder - Chile $8.46 $8.46 $9.91 $9.91] $19.52 $19.52
154 1 16 oz ea. |Spice - Powder - Curry $11.62 $11.62] $11.67 $11.67 $57.50 $57.50
155| 10 16 oz ea. |Spice - Powder - Onion $6.90 $69.00 $4.29 $42.93] $37.80| $378.00
156 1 25 # Spice - Salt - Plain $7.27 $7.27 $5.21 $5.21 $5.15 $5.15
157 1 4 -1 galicase [Spice - Sauce - BBQ (like cattlemens) $32.18 $32.18] $45.05 $45.05| $35.82 $35.82
158 s 6 - #10/case |Spice - Sauce - Cheese - Nacho $35.10 $210.60] $43.67| S$262.00] $33.59 S201.54




159 6 6 - #10/case |Spice - Sauce - Alfredo Cheese No Bid |[No Bid $68.48| $410.90] $66.06| $396.36
160 1 4 -1 galicase |Spice - Sauce - Soy $36.03 $36.03] $18.74 $18.74] $30.89 $30.89
161 1 8 - .5 galicase [Spice - Sauce - Sweet - and - Sour $33.85 $33.85] $16.16 $16.16] $30.97 $30.97
162 1 4 -1 galicase |Spice - Sauce - Teriyaki $43.95 $43.95| $43.14 $43.14| $41.62 $41.62
163 1 4 -1 galicase |Spice - Sauce - Worchestershire $30.32 $30.32] S$16.65 $16.65| $23.64 $23.64
164| s 16 oz Spice - Seasoning - Big & Bold Mont. $11.13 $55.65] $17.66 $88.32| $42.32( S$211.60
165| 15 26 0z Spice - Seasoning - Smokey - Mesquite|  $15.45 $231.75IN/A N/A $39.26| $588.90
166| s 16 oz Spice - Seasoning - ltalian Blend $7.93 $39.65 $8.23 $41.14 $6.30 $31.50
167 1 16 oz Spice - Seasoning - Mrs. Dash No Bid |[No Bid $15.64 $15.64| $45.56 $45.56
168| s 16 oz Spice - Seasoning - Old Bay $6.29 $31.45 $6.10 $30.49] $49.31| $246.55
169 5 16 oz Spice - Seasoning - Poultry $9.80 $49.00] $35.11| $175.54| $44.85| $224.25
170 15 16 oz Spice - Seasoning - Taco $7.73 $115.95 $8.84| S$132.55 $51.87| $778.05
171 2 48 ct/case |Disposable - Shaker - Salt $16.35 $32.70] $14.67 $29.35| $13.81 $27.62
172 2 48 cticase |Disposable - Shaker - Black - Pepper $59.78 $119.56] $41.04 $82.09| $41.18 $82.36
173 9 |12 - 2.5 #/case [Frozen-Veg-Asparagus - Cuts and Tips | $42.48 $382.32] $35.32 $317.90] $66.67| $600.03
174 | 10 |[12- 2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Brocolli-Cuts $27.86 $278.60] $32.35( $323.55] $23.20( $232.00
175| 15 |12 - 2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Brocolli-Normandy $29.31 $439.65] $36.78 S$551.77| $32.24 $483.60
176| 15 |[12-2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Brussel-Sprouts $26.31 $394.65|N/A N/A $28.21| $423.15
177 | 15 |12 -2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Capri-Mix $27.71 $415.65] $21.38 $320.65| $22.23| $333.45
178 | 15 | 12-2#/case |Frozen-Veg-Carrots-Baby $22.57 $338.55] $21.71| S$325.65| $21.33| S319.95




179| 15 12 - 2 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Carrots-Sliced $16.89 $253.35] $23.78 $356.77| $16.10( $241.50
180 15 | 12-2#/case |Frozen-Veg-Cauliflower $27.12 S406.80] $26.41| $396.13] $22.44| $336.60
181| 15 12 - 2 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Collard-Greens No Bid |[No Bid N/A N/A $32.45| $486.75
182 | 15 |[12- 2.5 #/case [Frozen-Veg-Corn-Chuckwagon $28.65 $429.75] $26.41| S$396.13] $23.36( $350.40
183 | 15 96 - 3"/case |Frozen-Veg-Corn-on-Cob $19.78 $296.70] $25.60 $384.03] $18.90( $283.50
184 15 |[12- 2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Corn-Whole-Kernal $24.24 $363.60] $24.84 S$372.58] $21.95( S329.25
185| 15 12 - 2 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Green-Beans-Cut $25.12 $376.80] $22.58( $338.71] $18.96( $284.40
186| 15 5-5#/case |Frozen-Veg-Green-Chile-Chopped-Mild| $25.28 $379.20] $23.66| S$354.84] $21.95| $329.25
187 | 15 |12-2.5#/case |Frozen-Veg-Green-Peas $28.85 $432.75] $28.40( $425.97| $24.38 $365.70
188 15 |[12- 2.5 #/case [Frozen-Veg-Fajita-Mix $32.16 S482.40] $16.34| S245.16] $35.97| $539.55
189 | 15 |[12-2.5#/case |Frozen-Veg-ltalian-Mix $29.60 $444.00] $28.65| $429.68] $24.57| $368.55
190 5 |[12- 2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Stir-Fry-Mix $32.42 $162.10] $27.87| S$139.35] $25.90( $129.50
191| 15 |[12-2.5#/case |Frozen-Veg-Mixed-Vegetables $25.54 $383.10] $28.72 $430.81] $23.43| $351.45
192 15 |[12-2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Fried-Okra $19.19 $287.85] $16.91| $253.71] $38.36] S$575.40
193 6 | 12 - 2.5 #/case |Frozen - Veg-Breaded-Onion Rings $47.03 $282.18] $60.72 $364.32] $63.80[ $382.80
194 15 |[12-2.5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Oriental-Mix $30.82 $462.30] $27.87| $418.06] $19.62 $294.30
195| 15 |[12-2.5#/case |Frozen-Veg-Peas and Carrots $25.66 $384.90] $17.51| $262.58] $22.82 $342.30
196 15 6 - 5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Potato-French-Fries $22.91 $343.65] $20.75| S$311.29] $17.96| $269.40
197| 15 6 - 5 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Potato-Tater-Tots $28.86 $432.90] $35.85 S$537.74| $27.68 $415.20
198 15 5-5#/case |Frozen-Veg-Potato-Sweet-Potato-Fries |  $27.00 S405.00] $28.34| S425.16] $21.21| S318.15




199| 15 6-.5gallc [Frozen-Veg-Red-Chile-Sauce-Mild $19.32 $289.80] $23.46] $351.94] $19.43| $291.45
200| 15 |12-2.5 #icase |Frozen-Veg-Scandinavian-Mix $42.04 $630.60|N/A N/A $23.30 $349.50
201| 15 12 - 3 #/case |Frozen-Veg-Spinach-Chopped $35.41 $531.15] $32.87| $493.06] $30.13| $451.95
202 | 15 |12-2.5 #icase |Frozen-Veg-Squash-Yellow $38.62 $579.30] $27.18| S407.74| $33.19| S$497.85
203| 15 |12 -2.5#/case |Frozen-Veg-Squash-Zucchini $38.00 $570.00] $25.68 $385.16] $32.49 $487.35
204 15 2 -5#/case |Frozen-Bread-Hush-Puppies $17.80 $267.00] S$15.51| S$232.58] S$16.75| $251.25
205| 20 98 ct/case  |Biscuits - 2 0z. $30.51 $610.20] $27.53 $550.54] $25.27 $505.40
206| 5 120 cticase |Frozen-Cookies-Chocolate-Chip $23.59 $117.95] $41.63| S$208.17] $46.70f $233.50
207| s 120 cticase |Frozen-Cookies-Oatmeal-Raisin $22.89 $114.45| $45.11| $225.54] $46.70| $233.50
208| 5 120 ct/case |Frozen-Cookie-Peanut-Butter $37.00 $185.00] $65.11| $325.54| $64.56( $322.80
209 5 120 ct/case |Frozen-Cookies-Sugar $36.52 $182.60] $38.87| $194.35| $64.56 $322.80
210| s 6 - 6.5 #/case |Frozen-Fruit-Strawberries-Sliced $65.17 $325.85] $60.27| $301.34] $46.98( $234.90
211| s 20#/ case |Frozen-Fruit-Strawberries-Whole $52.37 $261.85| $17.45 $87.26] $37.79| $188.95
212 15 8-44# Frozen-Sauce -Alfredo $68.54| $1,028.10|N/A N/A $66.06] $990.90
213| 15 6 ct/case  |PreBaked - Pie - Pumkin $36.60 $549.00] $35.11| S$526.61] $26.19( $392.85
214 10 12 - 16 oz/cs |Topping - On Top - Vanilla - like Rich's $36.19 $361.90] $42.88| 5S428.82] S$45.46| $454.60
215| 15 |5doz. Large/cagEggs - Large - Raw $46.39 $695.85] $34.60( S$519.03] $36.80[ $552.00
216| 5 |12/12 ct patties |Eggs - Patties - 4" round $27.89 $139.45] $50.40( S$251.99| $33.01| S165.05
217| 20 144 ct Eggs-Boiled-in Brine $17.78 $355.60] $29.05 $581.08] $32.37 $647.40
218| 6 4 - bags/case |Eggs-Boil-in-Bag-Liquid-Egg $45.59 $273.54|N/A N/A $28.50| $171.00




Beef-Raw-Breaded-Chicken-Fried-

219 | 48 | 40-4 oz/case |Steak $34.89| $1,674.72] $31.26] $1,500.63 $21.11| $1,013.28
220| 8 # Beef-Cooked-all beef-Meatballs - 2 oz $40.44 $323.52] $32.95| $263.58] $25.12| $200.96
Beef-Cooked-Salisbury-Steak-NOT in
221| 36 | 40-4oz/case |gravy $35.84| $1,290.24] $37.05] $1,333.89 $67.32| $2,423.52
222 12 80 #/case  |Beef-Lean-Ground-85% $2.22 $26.64 $2.22 $26.65 $1.98 $23.76
223 2 | 40- 4 oz/case |Beef-Lean-Liver-Sliced-4 oz. slices $24.30 $48.601 $19.94 $39.87] $32.22 $64.44
224| 15 40 #/case  |Beef-Lean-Stew-Meat-3/4" cut $43.65 $654.75] S$43.16| S647.37] S$46.00( $690.00
225( 1800 # Beef-Lean-Boneless-Inside Round $3.04| S5,472.00 $4.15| $7,465.26 $3.01| $5,418.00
226 | 15 # Corned Beef $3.52 $52.80 $2.94 $44.05 $3.67 $55.05
Beef-Lean-Hamburger-Patties-all-beef-
227 2 40 - 4 oz/case |4-1 $33.69 $67.38] $29.97 $59.94 $46.84 $93.68
228 | 40 4 -1 #/case |Beef-Franks-4-1 $26.81| $1,072.40] $26.53| S1,061.05 $18.94| $757.60
Beef - raw - strips - for fajita -
229 | 16 10 #/case |seasoned $101.63| $1,626.08] $53.11| $849.68 $94.21| $1,507.36
Chicken-Boneless-Chicken-Breast- 4
230 1200 24ct-cs |oz. portion $43.48| $52,176.00] $28.74| $34,484.21] $26.16| $31,392.00
231| 60 10 #/case  |Chicken-Cooked-Diced $35.46| $2,127.60] $30.00] $1,800.00 $25.53| $1,531.80
232 | 150 96 ct Chicken - IQF - Legs avg 4.5 0z $27.52| $4,128.00] $55.25] $8,287.89 $32.87| $4,930.50
233 | 150 96 ct Chicken - IQF - Thighs avg 8 0z $55.76| $8,364.00] $50.29| S$7,544.21 $19.36| $2,904.00
234 | 18 10 #/case  |Chicken - raw-pulled-white/dark $39.72 $714.96] $27.58| $496.42 $33.51| $603.18
235 2 50 - 3 oz/case |Chicken-Raw-Breaded-Tenders/Strips $2.68 $5.36] $23.47 $46.95 $80.43| $160.86
Chicken - strips - raw-for fajita -
236| 16 10 #/case |seasoned $64.16| $1,026.56] S$35.05| $560.84] $43.15| $690.40
237 6 |6 - 66.5 oz/case|Fish-Canned-Salmon $82.63 $495.78IN/A N/A No Bid No Bid
238| 6 |6-66.5 oz/icase|Fish-Canned-Tuna $58.53 $351.18] $64.13| $384.78] $80.69( $484.14




239| 30 10 #/case  |Fish-Catfish-Nuggets-Breaded $22.98 $689.40IN/A N/A $30.49| $914.70
240| 30 10 #/case  |Fish-Cod-Unbreaded-4 oz. Portions $50.74| $1,522.20] $42.21] $1,266.32] $40.49| $1,214.70
241 15 10 #/case  |Fish-Shrimp-Breaded-NOT-popcorn $43.84 $657.60] $43.53 $652.89 $42.22| $633.30
242 10 10 #/case  |Fish-Sticks $25.87 $258.70] $25.58| $255.79 $26.28| $262.80
Fish-Talapia-Unbreaded-IQF- 4 oz
243 16 10 #/case  |portions $24.81 $396.96] $26.84| $429.47 $25.22| $403.52
244| 3 | 40-4ozlcase |Pork-Chops-Lean-bone-in-40z.portions|  $39.22 $117.66] $35.68| $107.05) $26.00 $78.00
Pork-Boneless-Pork-Loin-Roast-NOT
245 6 8- 10 #/case |Tied $1.57 $9.42 $1.78 $10.67 $1.47 $8.82
246 | 24 10 #/case  |Pork-Lean-Stew-Meat-3/4" cut $4.21 $101.04] $22.53| $540.63] $19.73| $473.52
247 75 # Pork-LowSodium-Bacon $43.87| $3,290.25|N/A N/A $75.61| $5,670.75
248 | 150 # Pork-LowSodium-Buffet Ham S2.04 $306.00|N/A N/A $3.23| $484.50
Pork-Raw-Sausage-Patties-like Jimmy
249 10 50-3 oz. Dean $18.10 $181.00] $26.40( $263.98 $13.31| $133.10
250| 5 104 Pork-Cooked-Sausage-Patties-2" $23.63 $118.15] S$31.62 S158.12] $14.63 $73.15
Pork-Raw-Sausage-Links-like Jimmy
251] 10 80-1 oz Dean $16.33 $163.30] $29.94 $299.35 $14.69| $146.90
252 | 120 40-40z |Pork-Boneless-Riblet $33.12| $3,974.40| S$46.73] S5,607.74] $43.74]| $5,248.80
253 | 240 # Turkey-Breast-Cooked $54.65(| $13,116.00 $3.10| $743.23 $2.57| $616.80
254 30 10 #/case  |Turkey-Ground $20.38 S$611.40IN/A N/A $14.45| $433.50
255| 600 # Turkey-Roast-Raw-in foil/bag $3.22| S$1,932.00IN/A N/A $3.20| $1,920.00
256 6 # Cheese-American - sliced $50.11 $300.66] $42.15( S$252.90] $43.86[ S263.16
257 | 15 40 #/lcase  |Cheese - Cheddar - Shredded $47.55 $713.25] $40.40| $605.97 $39.72| $595.80
Cheese - Mozarella - Skim Milk -
258 7 6 #/lcase  |Shredded $46.67 $326.69] $40.37| $282.56 $60.66| S424.62




259 6 6 #/case  [Cheese - Swiss $3.72 $22.32|N/A N/A $2.61 $15.66

260 2 10 #/case  |Cheese - Parmesan - Grated $43.18 $86.36]N/A N/A $35.27 $70.54

261 | 25,000 1/2 Pint  |1%LowFat-Pasteurized-Homo-Milk $16.42| $410,500.00|N/A N/A $11.40]| $285,000.00 $0.26| $6,500.00
262 | 12,000 1/2 Pint  |Fat-Free-Skim-Milk $16.42| $197,040.00|N/A N/A $9.64| $115,680.00 S0.26| $3,120.00
263 | 200 1/2 gal 2%LowFat-Pasteurized-Homo-Milk $4.73 $946.00|N/A N/A No Bid [No Bid $1.90f $380.00
264 72 1/2 gal Buttermilk $4.55 $327.60] $18.10( $1,302.97] $14.15| $1,018.80 $1.90 $136.80
265| 50 5# Tub Sour Cream $22.39| $1,119.50] $13.43| $671.51] $21.38| $1,069.00 $5.20| $260.00
266| 25 100 ct SourCream - 1 oz. Portions $18.01 $450.25|N/A N/A $9.47| $236.75|No Bid [No Bid

267 | 50 5# Tub LowFat - Cottage - Cheese $58.28| $2,914.00] $16.68| $833.87| $12.36| $618.00 $5.96 $298.00
268 | 500 4 0z. LowFat - Yogurt - all flavors $19.42| $9,710.00] $13.96( $6,978.49] $12.00| $6,000.00 $3.50( $1,750.00
269 | 50 5# Tub LowFat - Yogurt - all Flavors $16.11 $805.50|N/A N/A No Bid No Bid No Bid |No Bid

270 144 Dozen Ice-Cream-Cups-4 oz. Portions-C-S-V $8.96| $1,290.24|N/A N/A $19.99| $2,878.56 $7.20| $1,036.80
271 | 144 Dozen Sherbet-Cup-4 oz. Portions $7.72 $1,111.68|N/A N/A $10.81| $1,556.64 $7.20| $1,036.80
272 1 2-100/case |Styro - Tray - 3/comp with lid $19.78 $19.78] $18.93 $18.93] $11.23 $11.23

273 3 4/200/case  |Styro - 6/comp - tray $14.88 S44.64|N/A N/A $42.33| $126.99

274 2 4 -125/case |Styro - Plate - 9" $21.19 $42.38] $18.89 $37.78] $37.60 $75.20

275 2 8 - 125/case |Styro - Plate - 6" $41.03 $82.06] $18.98 $37.96] $37.53 $75.06

276 4 8 - 125/case |Styro - Bowl - 10 -120z. $28.84 $115.36] S$54.99( S$219.96] $31.39 S125.56

277 4 40 - 25/case |Styro - Cup - 10 oz. $22.65 $90.60] $26.51| $106.04] $25.95| $103.80

278 4 40 - 25/case |Styro - Cup - 8 oz. $19.36 $77.44] $20.82 $83.26| $20.37 $81.48




279 50 20 - 25/case |Styro - Food-Container - 8 0z. $43.22| $2,161.00] $31.92| $1,596.20] $37.45| $1,872.50
280 50 5-100/case | Food Cont.-Lid (compatible) $24.61| $1,230.50] $16.74| $836.96] $21.73| $1,086.50
281 50 | 20-125/case |Plastic-Food-Container - 4 oz. $59.16| $2,958.00] S31.41| $1,570.65] $40.99| $2,049.50
282| 50 | 20-125/case | Food Cont.-Lid (compatible) $46.24| S$2,312.00] $26.45| $1,322.28] $21.73| $1,086.50
283| 4 20-125/case |Plastic-Food-Container - 2 0z. $31.62 $126.48] $37.64| $150.57| $24.11 $96.44
284 4 20-125/case | Food Cont.-Lid (compatible) $30.48 $121.92] $36.25| S$145.00] $21.73 $86.92
285 6 50 ct/case |Plastic - Embossed - Apron $13.56 $81.36 $9.14 $54.85| $45.86| $275.16
286| 2 | 18X 3 Micase |Plastic - 18" - Food Wrap $22.87 $45.74] $20.80 S41.61] $13.45 $26.90
287 4 12 X 3 M/case [Plastic - 12" - Food Wrap $11.17 $44.68] $16.39 $65.57 $9.19 $36.76
288 3 250/case  |Plastic - Freezer - Bags - 1 gallon $16.62 $49.86] $21.28 $63.85] $12.81 $38.43
289 3 3-250/case |Plastic - Freezer - Bags - 1 Quart $15.85 $47.55] S$28.61 $85.83] $12.91 $38.73
290| 10 2 M/case [|Plastic - Sandwich-Bags-flip-top $21.49 $214.90|] $26.47| S264.67] S$11.65| $116.50
291 4 250/case  |KFS - 3 piece cutlery $17.33 $69.32| $23.86 $95.43| $21.54 $86.16
292 | 65 250/case  |Foil - Tray - 3/comp with lid $67.18| $4,366.70] $29.65| $1,927.39] $52.02| $3,381.30
293 2 18 X 50/case0' |Foil - Heavy-Duty - 18" $32.12 $64.24] $28.26 $56.52| $26.08 $52.16
Napkin-Dispenser-full fold-
294 6 20 pkicase |6%2Lx4%2Wx5YaH $50.61 $303.66] S$51.30 S307.83] $30.81| $184.86
295 8 500/case  |Paper Sacks - # 6 $11.22 $89.76] $10.66 $85.30 $7.70 $61.60
296| 3 1 M/case [Paper Liners (sheet pans) $34.88 $104.64] S$37.66| S112.99| $32.77 $98.31
297 2 30 - 250/case [Straws - unwrapped $45.30 $90.60] $12.66 $25.33] $25.51 $51.02
298| 5 144/case  |Hair Nets - light brown S14.74 $73.70] S$14.67 $73.37] $92.51| $462.55




Latex Free-Vinyl-gloves-extra-large-NO

299 1 10 - 100/case |powder $28.51 $28.51] $25.54 $25.54| $15.06 $15.06
Latex Free-Vinyl-Gloves-large-NO

300| 20 | 10-100/case |powder $28.31 $566.20] $25.54| $510.87] $15.03| $300.60
Latex Free-Vinyl-Gloves-medium-NO

301| 20 | 10-100/case |powder $28.17 $563.40] $25.54 S$510.87| $14.99( $299.80
Latex Free-Vinyl-Gloves-small-NO

302 2 10 - 100/case |powder $27.91 $55.82| $25.54 $51.09] $28.52 $57.04

303 5 20 - 25/case |Clear (HD 1.5 mil) 33 gal. Liner $20.52 $102.60] $22.97| S114.84] $16.45 $82.25

304| s 6 - 1 ga/casel |Bleach $12.38 $99.04] $11.88 $95.04 $8.84 $70.72

305 5 6 - 1 ga/casel |Pine Cleaner $26.54 $132.70IN/A N/A $26.91| $134.55

306| 15 4-1gal |Grease Cutter Plus $119.37| $1,790.55|] S$24.37| S$365.55| $19.45( S$291.75

307 5 15 pk/case |Nylon Soap Pads - SOS or equal $34.31 $171.55IN/A N/A $33.54| $167.70

308| 5 15 pkicase |Scour Pads - Green $5.31 $26.55 $6.43 $32.17 S$4.91 $24.55

309 5 12 cticase  |Steel Scrubbers $30.31 $151.55 $6.85 $34.24] $36.39| $181.95

310| 3 12 cticase  |Mop Heads $40.84 $122.52] $13.96 S$41.87| $12.51 $37.53

311 6 pair Oven Mitts $9.22 $55.32 $6.59 $39.52| $11.07 $66.42

312 1 12 pkicase |Rubber Gloves - 18" $12.40 $12.40|N/A N/A $77.27 $77.27

313 2 200 ct/case |Food Service Towel - Disposable $77.13 $154.26IN/A N/A $20.45 $40.90
Dishwashing Machine - Detergent - Low|

314 6 5 gallon pails |Temp $75.57 $453.42| $87.83| S526.96] $155.95| $935.70
Dishwashing Machine - Rinse-Aid - Low

315 6 5 gallon pails [Temp $103.04 $618.24] $113.07| S678.39] $273.18( $1,639.08
Dishwashing Machine - Sanitizer - Low

316 6 5 gallon pails |Temp $30.20 $181.20] S$53.58| S321.46] $71.48| 5$428.88

Size or units not
given for
comparison
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