Requesting Department: Fire Department

Solicitation No.: ITB#1912-14

BID TABULATION

Opening Date/Time: January 11, 2019; 2:00 PM

Description: Oconee County Fire Rescue Turn out Gear and Equipment

Leather
*Local Vendor Turnout Gear Boots Equipment Descri
ITEM 1 ITEM 7
(14 SETS) Coat, (500 ft)50" (500 ft)50°* ITEM 8 Apparent Low
Pant & ITEM 2 (30 EA) LED (25) Dble Layer ITEM 5 Couplings Couplings (2 prs for ea size) Bid Total
BIDDER'S NAME Suspender (10 PRS) Boots @ Alkaline Lights Hoods (25)Gear Bags Sections (yellow) Sections (red) FF Gloves (Vendor)
Bennett Fire Products
Company, Woodstock,
GA No Bid $4,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,100.00
NAFECO, Decatur, AL $39,172.00 No Bid $1,468.80 $599.00 $843.00 $999.10 $999.10 No Bid $4,310.00
MEC, Tifton, GA $34,440.00 No Bid $1,560.00 $575.00 $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35,015.00
Fireline, Winder, GA No Bid No Bid $1,740.00 $700.00 $925.00 No Bid No Bid $1,134.00 $1,134.00

Apparent Low Bid Total
(Iltem Number)

$34,440.00
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$4,100.00

$1,468.80
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.00
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$999.10 $1,134.00 $44,559.00

’
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Apparent Low Bid by Item Number
Apparent Low Bid by Vendor Total

Vendor presented no bid on item

Recorded By: Karen Barnett, Purchasing Officer Witness: Bruce Thaxton, Oconee Fire Chief




