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On the internet at www.sjrvmd.com.

NOTICE OF INTENDED DECISION

DATE: August 4, 2021
TO: All Respondents
FROM: Debi Edwards, Procurement Specialist

SUBJECT: Notice of Intended Decision

As a result of the Invitation for Bids 36983, Herbicides and Related Adjuvants for the Invasive Plant
Program staff will recommend to the District’s Governing Board at the regular Governing Board meeting
to be held on September 14, 2021, that multiple awards be made as shown on the attached Award
Summary (Attachment 2).

Award of each product was determined by the lowest per unit cost. The following products received tie
bids: Clearcast®, Aquathol® K, Aquathol® Super K, ProcellaCOR™ Avast! SC, Sonar® AS, Sonar One
TIGR®, Galleon* SC Vastlan™ and Milestone®VM, all respondents involved in a tie bid were certified
as drug free workplaces. Pursuant to District policy and the solicitation documents, the award of these
products were chosen by lot.

Attached please find the Bid Tabulation (Attachment 1), the Award Summary (Attachment 2) and a
document entitled “Notice of Rights” (Attachment 3), which describes certain rights you may have in
regard to the awarding of this Invitation for Bids. You should pay close attention to the time limitations
specified in the Notice of Rights.

If you have any questions or comments based on the above recommendation, please call me at (386) 329-
4866.

Enclosures

Attachment 1 — Bid Tabulation

Attachment 2 — Award Summary
Attachment 3 — Notice of Rights



ATTACHMENT 3 — NOTICE OF RIGHTS

Pursuant to 8120.57(3), Fla. Stat., and Rule 28-110.003, Fla. Admin. Code, any person adversely
affected by a District decision or intended decision to award a contract, or to reject all bids,
proposals, or qualifications, must file a Notice of Protest within 72 hours after receipt of the
decision or intended decision. Pursuant to §287.042(2)(c), Fla. Stat., any person who files an
action protesting the decision or intended decision must post with the District Clerk at the time of
filing the formal written protest a bond, cashier’s check, or money order made payable to the St.
Johns River Water Management District in an amount equal to one percent of the District’s
estimated contract amount.

Pursuant to 8120.57(3), Fla. Stat., and Rule 28-110.004, Fla. Admin. Code, the protester must
also file with the District Clerk a Formal Written Protest within ten days after the date the Notice
of Protest is filed with the District. The Formal Written Protest must state with particularity the
facts and law upon which the protest is based.

No additional time will be added for mailing. All filings must comply with Rule 28-106.104, Fla.
Admin. Code, and must be addressed to and received by the District Clerk at the District
Headquarters in Palatka, Florida within the prescribed time periods. The District will not accept
as filed any electronically transmitted facsimile pleadings, petitions, Notice of Protest or other
documents. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in §120.57(3), Fla. Stat., or failure
to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond will
constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Fla. Stat. Mediation under §120.573, Fla.
Stat., is not available.



Item Herbicide Brand Name Container Unit of Alligare, Helena Nutrien Red River SiteOne Winfield
Size Measure LLC Agri Enter | Solutions | Specialties |Landscape| United

1 |2,4-D Amine Weedar® 64 2.5 Gallon Gallon NoBid | $ 14.18[$ 1445( $ 1435|% 1784 |$ 1548

2 |2,4-D Amine Weedar® 64 30 Gallon Gallon NoBid | $ 13.71|{$ 1445| $ 13.96 NoBid [ $ 14.99
Ammononium salt of

3 [imazamox Clearcast® 1 Gallon Gallon NoBid | $ 22490({$ 22490 $ 22490 ($ 498.12[$ 224.90
Ammononium salt of

4 |imazamox Clearcast® 15 Gallon Gallon NoBid [ $ 224.90[{$ 22490 $ 224.90 No Bid [ $ 224.90
Ammononium salt of

5 [imazamox IMOX 1 Gallon Gallon | $ 230.00( $ 178.00[ $ 227.00 No Bid [ $ 149.33 No Bid
Ammononium salt of

6 |imazamox IMOX 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 179.25[ $ 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ammononium salt of

7 |imazapic Plateau® 1 Gallon Gallon | $ 100.00( $ 110.001$ 12250| $ 105.65 No Bid [ $ 135.71
Ammononium salt of

8 [|imazapic Plateau® 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 12250 | $ 104.89 No Bid [ $ 135.71

9 [Bark Oil with Dye Bark Oil 11.25 Gallon| Gallon No Bid $ 12.00( $ 9.90 | $ 12.48 NoBid [ $ 10.27

10 |Bark Oil without Dye [Bark Oil 11.25 Gallon| Gallon No Bid $ 12.37[ $ 9.70 | $ 11.89 NoBid [ $ 10.12

Alligare Anti-

11 |Defoaming Agent Foamer 1 Quart Quart No Bid $ 13.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 8.94 No Bid

12 |Defoaming Agent Fast Break® 1 Quart Quart No Bid $ 13.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 894 1% 1299
Dipotassium salt of

13 |endothall Aguathol® K 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 7850[$ 78.50 No Bid NoBid [ $ 78.50
Dipotassium salt of

14 |endothall Aquathol® K 250 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 46.90($ 76.90 No Bid NoBid [ $ 76.90
Dipotassium salt of Aquathol® Super

15 |endothall (granular) K 10 Pound Pound No Bid NoBid | $ 24.60 NoBid |$ 29.25|$% 24.60
Dipotassium salt of Aquathol® Super

16 |endothall (granular) K 20 Pound Pound No Bid $ 20.25($ 20.25 No Bid NoBid [ $ 20.25

17 |Diquat bromide Tribune 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 36.49($ 35.90 NoBid|[$ 4869 |% 40.99

18 |Diquat bromide Tribune 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid [ $ 35.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid

19 |Diquat bromide Tribune 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 |Florpyrauxifen ProcellaCOR™ 1 PDU PDU No Bid $ 4050({$ 4050 No Bid NoBid [ $ 40.50

21 |Flumioxazin Clipper™ 5 Pound Pound | $ 3500| $ 35.000$% 3750]| $ 39.00|$ 136.04$ 4455

22 |Flumioxazin Clipper SC 1 Gallon Gallon | $ 250.00( $ 395.00{ $ 27950| $ 328.48 | $1,137.84|$ 362.50

23 |Flumioxazin Schooner 5 Pound Pound | $ 35.00| $ 31.00($ 30.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 |Fluridone Alligar Fluridone 1 Gallon Gallon | $1,900.00[ $1,600.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 729.65 No Bid

25 |Fluridone Avast! SC 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $1,432.00{ $1,432.00 No Bid | $2,024.28 | $1,555.00

26 |Fluridone Sonar® AS 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $1,995.08( $1,995.08 | $ 1,995.08 No Bid | $1,995.08




27 |Fluridone (Pellet) Alligar Fluridone | 20 pound Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
28 |Fluridone (Pellet) Sonar One 20 Pound Pound No Bid $ 681.00{ $ 681.00 39.75 86.85 34.05
Sonar® PR
(Percision
29 |Fluridone (Pellet) Release) 20 Pound Pound No Bid $ 153.20( $1,153.20 38.44 No Bid 38.44
30 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) |Rodeo® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 29.11{$ 25.00 25.20 23.58 No Bid
31 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) |Rodeo® 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid [ $ 27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) |Rodeo® 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 2852|$% 25.00 24.98 23.70 No Bid
Roundup
33 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) |Custom 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 27.00 23.94 23.64 23.87
34 |[Hexazinone Velpar® L 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 11500{$ 72.95 72.85 No Bid No Bid
35 [Hexazinone Velpar® L 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Pronone Power
36 [Hexazinone Pellets 5.5 Pounds | Pounds No Bid NoBid [ $ 56.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Isopropylamine salt of
37 |imazapyr Arsenal® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 7294 $ 50.50 52.56 79.06 No Bid
Isopropylamine salt of
38 |imazapyr Arsenal® 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid [ $ 50.50 51.95 No Bid No Bid
Isopropylamine salt of |Ecomazapyr 2
39 |imazapyr SL 2.5 Gallon Gallon | $ 5425| $ 53.00 No Bid No Bid 79.06 No Bid
Isopropylamine salt of |Ecomazapyr 2
40 |imazapyr SL 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Isopropylamine salt of |Ecomazapyr 2
41 |imazapyr SL 30 Gallon Gallon | $ 5390 $ 53.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Isopropylamine salt of
42 |imazapyr Imazapyr 4 2.5 Gallon Gallon | $ 105.25| $ 112.75| $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Isopropylamine salt of
43 |imazapyr Imazapyr 4 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 111.50{ $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 [Methlyated Seed Oil |RRSI Sunset 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 16.67 No Bid 12.38 20.25 No Bid
DLZ® Droplet
45 [Methylated Seed Oil  [Landing Zone 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 25.00 No Bid No Bid 20.25 No Bid
46 [Metsulfuron Methyl Escort® XP 1 Pound Ounce No Bid $ 250 $ 2.48 2.58 5.67 3.67
47 |Oil with Dye Impel™ (red) 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 [Polymer Brace 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
49 [Polymer Syndetic 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.64
50 |[Sethoxydim TIGR® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 328.03[ $ 328.03 No Bid No Bid 328.03
51 |[Spreader/Sticker NB 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 32.00($ 43.00 24.89 24.84 No Bid
MSO
52 |[Spreader/Sticker Concentrate 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 16.67[$ 19.00 12.30 20.25 No Bid




53 |[Spreader/Sticker Atmos 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 850[|$% 19.99
54 [Sulfometuron methyl |Oust® Extra 64 Ounce Ounce No Bid $ 29.13[ $ 258 | $ 1.85 No Bid | $ 1.87
55 [Surfactant Silenergy 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 6811 $ 54.00 NoBid | $ 54.18[$ 59.99
56 |Surfactant StrickLock® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid [ $ 44.00
57 |Surfactant Liberate 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid [ $ 25.75 NoBid [ $ 20.81 No Bid
L1700
58 |Surfactant w/PH buffer |w/LeciTech 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid [ $ 25.00 NoBid [ $ 20.53 No Bid
L1700
59 |Surfactant w/PH buffer [w/LeciTech 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 22.00{$ 24.00 NoBid [ $ 19.98 No Bid
Systemic acetolactate
synthase inhibitor
60 |(ALS) (Aquatic) Galleon* SC 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $2,270.00{ $2,292.70 | $ 2,292.70 No Bid [ $2,292.70
61 |Triclopyr Vastlan™ 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 89.60 $89.60 | $ 89.60|$ 7335($% 89.60
62 |Triclopyr Garlon® 4 Ultra | 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 6559($ 7400 $ 65.10 | $ 73.35|$% 69.13
63 |Triclopyr Garlon® 4 Ultra 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 6559($ 7200 % 65.10 NoBid [ $ 69.13
64 |Triclopyr Trycera® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 80.00 No Bid NoBid [$ 73.35 No Bid
65 |Triclopyr Trycera® 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 |Triclopyr 2.5 Gallon Gallon [ $ 4700 $ 4488[($ 3578| $ 37.28 No Bid [ $ 40.49
Tri-
67 |isopropanolammonium |Milestone® VM 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 255.00{ $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 No Bid [ $ 300.00
68 |Wetting Agent Big Wet™ 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 1383[$ 12.14 No Bid NoBid [ $ 14.99
69 |Surfactant Cide-Kick 2.5 Gallon No Bid $ 20.00({$ 16.20| $ 2049 1% 7335|$% 19.30
Flumioxazin/2,4-D
70 |Amine Depth Charge 2.5 Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 57.50 No Bid | $ 414.10 No Bid
71 |Triclopyr Garlon 3-A 2.5 Gallon $ 4225| $ 3863[$ 5200|% 4782[$% 3426[$ 50.15




Container

Item Herbicide Brand Name Sive Cost/UOM
Awardee: Alligare LLC 01929
5 |Ammononium salt of imazamox IMOX 1Gallon [$ 230.00
7 |Ammononium salt of imazapic Plateau® 1Gallon [$ 100.00
22 |Flumioxazin Clipper SC 1Gallon |$ 250.00
Awardee: Helena Chemical 30880
1 |2,4-D Amine Weedar® 64 25Galon | $ 14.18
2 |[2,4-D Amine Weedar® 64 30 Gallon | $ 13.71
6 |Ammononium salt of imazamox IMOX 15Gallon [$ 179.25
13 |Dipotassium salt of endothall Aquathol® K 2.5 Gallon |$ 78.50
16 |Dipotassium salt of endothall (granular) Aquathol® Super K 20 Pound | $ 20.25
21 |Flumioxazin Clipper™ 5Pound |$ 35.00
24 |Fluridone Alligar Fluridone 1 Gallon $ 1,600.00
Sonar® PR (Percision
29 [Fluridone (Pellet) Release) ( 20 Pound |$ 15320
39 [Isopropylamine salt of imazapyr Ecomazapyr 2 SL 2.5 Gallon |$ 53.00
41 |lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr Ecomazapyr 2 SL 30 Gallon | $ 53.00
45 |Methylated Seed Oil Zone 25Gallon | $ 25.00
47 |0il with Dye Impel™ (red) 2.5Gallon | $ 20.00
61 |Triclopyr Vastlan™ 25 Gallon | $ 89.60
64 |Triclopyr Trycera® 2.5 Gallon | $ 80.00
65 |Triclopyr Trycera® 30 Gallon | $ 80.00
71 |Triclopyr Garlon 3-A 2.5Gallon | $ 38.63
Awardee: Nutrien Ag Solutions 62617
3 |[Ammononium salt of imazamox Clearcast® 1Gallon |[$ 224.90
9 |Bark Oil with Dye Bark Oil 11.25 Gallon| $ 9.90
10 [Bark Qil without Dye Bark Oil 11.25 Gallon| $ 9.70
14 |Dipotassium salt of endothall Aquathol® K 250 Gallon | $ 76.90
17 [Diquat bromide Tribune 25 Gallon | $ 35.90
18 |Diquat bromide Tribune 120 Tote | $ 35.85
20 |Florpyrauxifen ProcellaCOR™ 1 PDU $ 40.50
23 |Flumioxazin Schooner 5Pound [$ 30.65
25 |Fluridone Avast! SC 1Gallon |$ 1,432.00
28 |Fluridone (Pellet) Sonar One 20Pound [$ 681.00
30 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) Rodeo® 2.5 Gallon | $ 25.00
31 |Glyphosate (Aguatic) Rodeo® 15 Gallon | $ 27.50
36 |Hexazinone Pronone Power Pellets 5.5Pound | $ 56.50
37 |Isopropylamine salt of imazapyr Arsenal® 2.5 Gallon |[$ 50.50
38 [lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr Arsenal® 15 Gallon | $ 50.50
42 |lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr Imazapyr 4 2.5Gallon [ $ 100.00
43 |Isopropylamine salt of imazapyr Imazapyr 4 15 Gallon |$ 100.00
46 [Metsulfuron Methyl Escort® XP 1Pound |[$ 2.48
55 |Surfactant Silenergy 1Galon |$ 54.00
57 |Surfactant Liberate 1Gallon |$ 25.75
58 |Surfactant w/PH buffer L1700 w/LeciTech 1Gallon |$ 25.00
59 |Surfactant w/PH buffer L1700 w/LeciTech 25 Gallon | $ 24.00
66 |Triclopyr 25 Gallon | $ 35.78
68 |Wetting Agent Big Wet™ 2.5Gallon | $ 12.14




69 |Surfactant Cide-Kick 25 Gallon | $ 16.20
70 |Flumioxazin/2,4-D Amine Depth Charge 2.5Gallon | $ 57.50
Awardee: Red River 51009
8 |Ammononium salt of imazapic Plateau® 15Gallon | $ 104.89
26 |Fluridone Sonar® AS 1Gallon |$ 1,995.08
32 |Glyphosate (Aguatic) Rodeo® 30 Gallon | $ 24.98
34 |Hexazinone Velpar® L 25Gallon | $ 72.85
44 [Methlyated Seed Oil RRSI Sunset 2.5Gallon | $ 12.38
52 |Spreader/Sticker MSO Concentrate 2.5 Gallon | $ 12.30
54 |Sulfometuron methyl Oust® Extra 64 Ounce | $ 1.85
Systemic acetolactate synthase inhibitor (ALS
60 | Xquaﬂc) y (ALS) Galleon* SC 2.5Gallon |$ 2,292.70
62 |Triclopyr Garlon® 4 Ultra 2.5Gallon | $ 65.10
63 |Triclopyr Garlon® 4 Ultra 30 Gallon | $ 65.10
Awardee: Site One
11 |Defoaming Agent Alligare Anti-Foamer 1 Quart $ 8.94
33 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) 2.5 Gallon |$ 23.64
51 |Spreader/Sticker 1Gallon |$ 24.84
Awardee: Winfield United 49652
4 |Ammononium salt of imazamox Clearcast® 15Gallon | $ 224.90
12 |Defoaming Agent Fast Break® 1 Quart $ 12.99
15 [Dipotassium salt of endothall (granular) Aquathol® Super K 10 Poiund | $ 24.60
49 |Polymer Syndetic 1Galon |$ 26.64
50 |Sethoxydim TIGR® 25Gallon | $ 328.03
53 |Spreader/Sticker Atmos 2.5 Gallon | $ 19.99
56 |Surfactant StrickLock® 25 Gallon | $ 44.00
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