ATTACHMENT 1 - BID TAB SHEET

IFB 36938

- Herbicide s e Container | Unit of Alligare Helena Nutrien Ag | Red River Site One o

Size | Measure | 01929 30880 62617 51009 Winfield 49652
1 [2,4-D Amine Weedar® 64 2.5 Gallon Gallon NoBid | $ 14.18| $ 1445 ( $ 1435 $ 1784 | $ 15.48
2 (2,4-D Amine Weedar® 64 30 Gallon Gallon NoBid [ $ 13.71] $ 1445 | $ 13.96 No Bid | $ 14.99
3 [Ammononium salt of imazamox |Clearcast® 1 Gallon Gallon NoBid [ $ 22490 $ 22490 [ $ 22490 $ 498.12 [ $ 224.90
4 |Ammononium salt of imazamox |Clearcast® 15 Gallon Gallon NoBid [ $ 224.90[ $ 22490 | $  224.90 No Bid | $ 224.90
5 [Ammononium salt of imazamox  [IMOX 1 Gallon Gallon | $ 230.00] § 178.00] $ 227.00 No Bid | $ 149.33 No Bid
6 [Ammononium salt of imazamox [IMOX 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 179.25] $ 225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 [Ammononium salt of imazapic Plateau® 1 Gallon Gallon | $ 100.00| $ 110.00] $ 12250 [ $ 105.65 No Bid | $ 135.71
8 [Ammononium salt of imazapic Plateau® 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 12250 [ $  104.89 NoBid | $ 135.71
9 |Bark Oil with Dye Bark Oil 11.25 Gallon| Gallon No Bid $ 12.00[ $ 990 | $ 12.48 NoBid | $ 10.27
10 [Bark Oil without Dye Bark Oil 11.25 Gallon| Gallon No Bid 3 1237 $ 970 [ $ 11.89 No Bid | $ 10.12
11 [Defoaming Agent Alligare Anti-Foamer 1 Quart Quart No Bid $ 13.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 8.94 No Bid
12 [Defoaming Agent Fast Break® 1 Quart Quart No Bid 3 13.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 8941 $ 12.99
13 [Dipotassium salt of endothall Aquathol® K 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 78.50| $ 78.50 No Bid No Bid | $ 78.50
14 |Dipotassium salt of endothall Aquathol® K 250 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 46.90| $ 76.90 No Bid No Bid | $ 76.90
15 [Dipotassium salt of endothall Aquathol® Super K 10 Pound Pound No Bid NoBid | $ 24.60 No Bid | $ 2925 | $ 24.60
16 |Dipotassium salt of endothall Aquathol® Super K 20 Pound Pound No Bid 3 20.25] $ 20.25 No Bid No Bid | $ 20.25
17 [Diquat bromide Tribune 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 36.49] $ 35.90 No Bid | $ 4869 | $ 40.99
18 |Diquat bromide Tribune 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 35.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 [Diquat bromide Tribune 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid ITEM 19 NO BIDS
20 [Florpyrauxifen ProcellaCOR™ 1PDU PDU No Bid 3 40.50] $ 40.50 No Bid No Bid | $ 40.50
21 |Flumioxazin Clipper™ 5 Pound Pound | $ 35.00] § 35.00] $ 3750 | $ 39.00 | $ 136.04 | $ 44.55
22 [Flumioxazin Clipper SC 1 Gallon Gallon [ $ 250.00] $ 395.00{ $ 27950 [ $ 32848 | $ 1,137.84 [ $ 362.50
23 |Flumioxazin Schooner 5 Pound Pound | $ 35.00] $ 31.00] $ 30.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 [Fluridone Alligar Fluridone 1 Gallon Gallon | $ 1,900.00[ $ 1,600.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 729.65 No Bid
25 |Fluridone Avast! SC 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 1432001 $ 1,432.00 No Bid | $ 202428 [ $ 1,555.00
26 |Fluridone Sonar® AS 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 1995.08] $ 1,995.08 | $ 1,995.08 NoBid | $ 1,995.08
27 |Fluridone (Pellet) Alligar Fluridone 20 pound Pound No Bid ITEM 27 NO BIDS
28 [Fluridone (Pellet) Sonar One 20 Pound Pound No Bid 3 681.00] $ 681.00 | $ 39.75 | $ 86.85 | $ 34.05
29 [Fluridone (Pellet) Sonar® PR (Percision 20 Pound Pound No Bid 3 153.20| $ 1,153.20 | $ 38.44 NoBid | $ 38.44
30 [Glyphosate (Aquatic) Rodeo® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 29.11] $ 25.00 [ $ 2520 | $ 23.58 No Bid
31 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) Rodeo® 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 27.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 |Glyphosate (Aquatic) Rodeo® 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 2852 | 3 25.00 | $ 2498 | $ 23.70 No Bid
33 |[Glyphosate (Aquatic) Roundup Custom 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 27.00 $ 2394 | $ 2364 | $ 23.87
34 [Hexazinone Velpar® L 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 115.00] $ 7295 $ 72.85 No Bid No Bid
35 |Hexazinone Velpar® L 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid ITEM 35 NO BIDS
36 [Hexazinone Pronone Power Pellets 5.5 Pounds | Pounds No Bid NoBid | $ 56.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
37 |lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr |Arsenal® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 72.94] $ 5050 | $ 5256 | $ 79.06 No Bid
38 [lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr |Arsenal® 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 50.50 | $ 51.95 No Bid No Bid
39 |lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr |Ecomazapyr 2 SL 2.5 Gallon Gallon | $ 5425 $ 53.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 79.06 No Bid
40 (lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr |Ecomazapyr 2 SL 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
41 |Isopropylamine salt of imazapyr |Ecomazapyr 2 SL 30 Gallon Gallon | $ 5390 $ 53.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42 |1sopropylamine salt of imazapyr  [Imazapyr 4 2.5 Gallon Gallon [ $ 105.25[ § 112.75[ $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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43 |[lsopropylamine salt of imazapyr |Imazapyr 4 15 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 111.50] $ 100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
44 |Methlyated Seed Oil RRSI Sunset 2.5Gallon | Gallon No Bid 3 16.67 NoBid | $ 1238 | $ 20.25 No Bid
45 [Methylated Seed Oil DLZ® Droplet Landing 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 25.00 No Bid NoBid | $ 20.25 No Bid
46 [Metsulfuron Methyl Escort® XP 1 Pound Ounce No Bid 3 2.50] $ 248 | $ 258 (% 567 % 3.67
47 |[Oil with Dye Impel™ (red) 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48 [Polymer Brace 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid ITEM 48 NO BIDS

49 |Polymer Syndetic 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 26.64
50 [Sethoxydim TIGR® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 328.03| $ 328.03 No Bid No Bid | $ 328.03
51 |Spreader/Sticker NB 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 32.00] $ 4300 | $ 2489 | $ 24.84 No Bid
52 |Spreader/Sticker MSO Concentrate 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 16.67] $ 1900 | $ 1230 ( $ 20.25 No Bid
53 |[Spreader/Sticker Atmos 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $ 850 | $ 19.99
54 |Sulfometuron methyl Oust® Extra 64 Ounce Ounce No Bid 3 29.13[ $ 258 | $ 1.85 No Bid | $ 1.87
55 |Surfactant Silenergy 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 68.11[ $ 54.00 No Bid [ $ 5418 $ 59.99
56 [Surfactant StrickLock® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 44.00
57 |Surfactant Liberate 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 25.75 NoBid | $ 20.81 No Bid
58 [Surfactant w/PH buffer L1700 w/LeciTech 1 Gallon Gallon No Bid NoBid | $ 25.00 No Bid | $ 20.53 No Bid
59 |Surfactant w/PH buffer L1700 w/LeciTech 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 22.00] $ 24.00 No Bid | $ 19.98 No Bid
60 [Systemic acetolactate synthase Galleon* SC 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 2,270.000 $ 229270 $ 2,292.70 No Bid | $ 2,292.70
61 [Triclopyr Vastlan™ 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 89.60 $89.60 | $ 89.60 | $ 7335 % 89.60
62 |Triclopyr Garlon® 4 Ultra 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 65.59| $ 7400 | $ 65.10 | $ 7335 | $ 69.13
63 [Triclopyr Garlon® 4 Ultra 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 65.59] $ 7200 | $ 65.10 NoBid | $ 69.13
64 |[Triclopyr Trycera® 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 80.00 No Bid No Bid | $ 73.35 No Bid
65 |Triclopyr Trycera® 30 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66 [Triclopyr 2.5 Gallon Gallon 47.00] $ 44.88] $ 3578 [ $ 37.28 NoBid | $ 40.49
67 [Tri-isopropanolammonium Milestone® VM 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid $ 225.00] $ 300.00 | $ 300.00 No Bid | $ 300.00
68 [Wetting Agent Big Wet™ 2.5 Gallon Gallon No Bid 3 13.83[ $ 12.14 No Bid No Bid | $ 14.99
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