
HIGHLANDS COUNTY
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
PurchasinQ Department

AWARD TABULATION OF SEALED BIDS

ITB 11·029

SALE OF SURPLUS TIRES

Bid opening: 3/15/17

NUM TIRE SIZE I PRICE/EA LOCAL PREF. RANK

1 lOR22.5

GCR Tires and Service d2000 1

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $7.00 $7.35 2

2 llR24.5 I I
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $20.00 $21.00 1

GCR Tires and Service I $20.00 2

3 P265/70R16

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $2.00 1
GCR Tires and Service I No bid

4 18.4)( 34 I
GCR Tires and Service LJ2.000 I

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $17.00 $17.85 2
r--

5 llR 22.5

GCR fires and Service $25.00 I

Florida fire Terminal (LV) $20.00 $21.00 2

• lSS /70R22.S ,

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) I~~:d I

GCR Tires and Service

7 225/70R19.5 I
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) Nobid

GCR Tires and Service No bid

8 17.5 X 25

GCR Tires and Service $20.00 I
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $17.00 $17.85 2

9 l'.SR X 25

GCR Tires and Service $20.00 I
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $17.00 $17.85 2

I. 20.5 X 25 '. '

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $22.00 I
GCR Tires and service $20.00 2

11 23.5 X 25 ,
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $22.00 1
GCR Tires and Service $20,00 2

12 16.9 X 30 ,
Florida TIre Terminal (LV) $17.00 I I
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NUM TIRE SIZE PRICE/EA LOCAL PREF. RANK

GeR Tires and service No bid

13 18.4 X 30

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $17.00 1

GCR Tires and Service Nobid

14 llS 18SRl6

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $2.00 1

GCR Tires and Service Nobid

15 13.6-28 I
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $10.50 1

GCR Tires and service Nobid

1. 235/85R16

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $2.50 1
GCR Tires and service No bid

11 26.5R2S

GCR Tires and service $100.00 1

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $52.00 $54.60 2

18 235/7SR15

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $4.00 1

GCR Tires and Service No bid

19 245/7SR16 I

Florida Tire Terminal (LV) I $2.00 1

GCR Tires and Service No bid

20 22S/75R16
,

Florida Tire Terminal (LVI $2.00 1

GCR Tires and service Nobid

ZI 385/65R22.5

GCR Tires and Service $25.00 1
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) , $9.00 $9.45 2

ZZ 425/65R22.S I I

GCR Tires and Service I $30.00 1
Florida Tire Terminal (LV) $9.00 $9.45 2

Z3 lZ.4R24

Florida Tire Terminal (LVI $7.50 1
GCR TIres and Service No bid 2

PHONE E-VERIFY

3 941-739-7704 790331

5 863-425-5788 864246

VENDORS

GCR TIres & Service, 2964 63rd Ave. E. Bradenton, FL 3420

Florida TIre Terminal, 3015 Feagin Ave. Avon Park, Fl3382
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local Vendors are indicated by the designation (LV). Award based off of Local Preference is indicated by the designatiol

Local Preference was not used to award this bid.

RECOMMEND AWARDING TO BOTH BIDDERS, BASED ON PRICE AND AVAILABILITY FOR THE PERIOD 4/1/17·

03/31/2018.

Kyle Green, H Date

RECOMMENDATION APPROVED BY:

/h~ ~k1;;7
Jun~~BCCCOuntYAdfTilil-;,-,,-.-to-,--------;I>'#'o~.Lt-'l{.L-'
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