
   

Item  Description Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 Mobilization 1 LS $1,465.00 $1,465.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,220.00 $5,220.00

2 Traffic Control 1 LS $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $13,512.00 $13,512.00

3 Bonding, Misc. 1 LS $6,050.00 $6,050.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00

4 NPDES Monitoring 1 LS $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,117.00 $3,117.00

5 Grading Complete 1 LS $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $13,413.00 $13,413.00

6 Cut & Patch 6” Concrete Drive, Remove & Replace misc. items 60 SY $70.00 $4,200.00 $60.00 $3,600.00 $74.75 $4,485.00

7 Cut & Patch Asphalt Drives 85 SY $85.00 $7,225.00 $60.00 $5,100.00 $169.75 $14,428.75

8 4” GAB 285 SY $20.00 $5,700.00 $7.00 $1,995.00 $14.50 $4,132.50

9 Testing 1 LS $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $6,892.00 $6,892.00

10 Coordination with Natural Gas Company (Claxton Gas) 1 LS $1.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $800.00 $800.00

11 Underground Telephone Line Conflicts 1 LS $1.00 $1.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $800.00 $800.00

12 Watermain potentail conflict vertical drop (incl. fittings and restrained joints) 3 EA $2,750.00 $8,250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $6,375.00 $19,125.00

SUBTOTAL $44,692.00 SUBTOTAL $46,695.00 SUBTOTAL $96,925.25

1 Silt Fence - Sensitive 35 LF $5.00 $175.00 $5.00 $175.00 $3.50 $122.50

2 Silt Fence - Non Sensitive 6100 LF $1.35 $8,235.00 $1.00 $6,100.00 $2.45 $14,945.00

3 Construction Exit 1 EA $900.00 $900.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $550.00 $550.00

4 Dust Control/Temporary/Permanent Grassing / Mulching 1 LS $6,185.00 $6,185.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $12,800.00 $12,800.00

SUBTOTAL $15,495.00 SUBTOTAL $23,275.00 SUBTOTAL $28,417.50

1 1" Polyethylene Water Service Lateral - Horizontal Directional Drill 250 LF $24.50 $6,125.00 $30.00 $7,500.00 $36.75 $9,187.50

2 1" Polyethylene Water Service Lateral - Direct Bury (incl tapping saddle connection) 370 LF $20.25 $7,492.50 $20.00 $7,400.00 $30.00 $11,100.00

3 Jack and Bore--16" Carrier Pipe w/ spacers in 24” Steel Casing 70 LF $315.00 $22,050.00 $400.00 $28,000.00 $472.00 $33,040.00

4 16" PVC Water main (incl fittings) 5150 LF $36.50 $187,975.00 $40.60 $209,090.00 $39.50 $203,425.00

5 16” Restrained Joint Pipe 1140 LF $43.00 $49,020.00 $54.00 $61,560.00 $58.90 $67,146.00

6 16" Valve in Box 7 EA $5,360.00 $37,520.00 $6,600.00 $46,200.00 $6,875.00 $48,125.00

7 Connect to Existing 16" Water main 2 EA $3,865.00 $7,730.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,540.00 $3,080.00

8 Fire Hydrant Assembly 7 EA $3,995.00 $27,965.00 $5,000.00 $35,000.00 $3,979.00 $27,853.00

9 Water main Markers 12 EA $50.00 $600.00 $1,000.00 $12,000.00 $62.00 $744.00

SUBTOTAL $346,477.50 SUBTOTAL $410,750.00 SUBTOTAL $403,700.50

3a 16” Fusible PVC Directional Bore (replaces 80 LF jack and bore) 155 LF $142.00 $22,010.00 NO BID $0.00 $146.00 $22,630.00

4a 16” PVC Water main (incl fittings; replaces water main length using jack and bore) 5120 LF $36.50 $186,880.00 NO BID $0.00 $38.25 $195,840.00

SUBTOTAL $208,890.00 SUBTOTAL $0.00 SUBTOTAL $218,470.00

3 Jack and Bore--16" Carrier Pipe w/ spacers in 24” Steel Casing -70 LF $315.00 ($22,050.00) NO BID $0.00 $472.00 ($33,040.00)

4 16" PVC Water main (incl fittings) -5150 LF $36.50 ($187,975.00) NO BID $0.00 $39.50 ($203,425.00)

SUBTOTAL ($210,025.00) SUBTOTAL $0.00 SUBTOTAL ($236,465.00)

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN ALTERNATE USED

Schockley Plumbing, Inc. Griffin Contracting, Inc.

SECTION I - GENERAL

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM

SECTION I - GENERAL SECTION I - GENERAL

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM

COMPANY : Southeastern Civil, Inc.

SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)
SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM

SECTION I - GENERAL

SECTION II - EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)

SECTION II - EROSION & 

SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

SECTION II - EROSION & 

SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

SECTION II - EROSION & 

SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

$511,048.25

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN ALTERNATE 

USED

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN ALTERNATE 

USED

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN ALTERNATE 

USED

$474,305.00 $529,043.25

SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)

BID TAB - ITB No  18-006 - Blue Jay Road Water Main Extension

$474,305.00

                                                                                    GRAND TOTAL    - SECTIONS I, II AND III   : $406,664.50

                                                                                    GRAND TOTAL - ALTERNATE WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM : $405,529.50



   

Item  Description Est. Qty. Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1 Mobilization 1 LS $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $23,036.55 $23,036.55 $5,882.00 $5,882.00

2 Traffic Control 1 LS $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $12,615.20 $12,615.20 $7,294.00 $7,294.00

3 Bonding, Misc. 1 LS $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $7,331.34 $7,331.34 $6,500.00 $6,500.00

4 NPDES Monitoring 1 LS $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $6,431.00 $6,431.00 $4,329.00 $4,329.00

5 Grading Complete 1 LS $6,200.00 $6,200.00 $3,513.64 $3,513.64 $21,705.00 $21,705.00

6 Cut & Patch 6” Concrete Drive, Remove & Replace misc. items 60 SY $60.00 $3,600.00 $86.77 $5,206.20 $117.00 $7,020.00

7 Cut & Patch Asphalt Drives 85 SY $75.00 $6,375.00 $36.75 $3,123.75 $25.00 $2,125.00

8 4” GAB 285 SY $30.00 $8,550.00 $11.50 $3,277.50 $21.00 $5,985.00

9 Testing 1 LS $1,725.00 $1,725.00 $2,360.00 $2,360.00 $5,352.00 $5,352.00

10 Coordination with Natural Gas Company (Claxton Gas) 1 LS $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,176.00 $5,176.00

11 Underground Telephone Line Conflicts 1 LS $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,941.00 $2,941.00

12 Watermain potentail conflict vertical drop (incl. fittings and restrained joints) 3 EA $7,283.06 $21,849.18 $6,332.91 $18,998.73 $9,650.00 $28,950.00

SUBTOTAL $66,799.18 SUBTOTAL $89,893.91 SUBTOTAL $103,259.00

1 Silt Fence - Sensitive 35 LF $10.00 $350.00 $3.93 $137.55 $7.00 $245.00

2 Silt Fence - Non Sensitive 6100 LF $3.00 $18,300.00 $3.27 $19,947.00 $3.10 $18,910.00

3 Construction Exit 1 EA $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,882.00 $2,882.00

4 Dust Control/Temporary/Permanent Grassing / Mulching 1 LS $7,360.00 $7,360.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $19,576.00 $19,576.00

SUBTOTAL $28,010.00 SUBTOTAL $26,584.55 SUBTOTAL $41,613.00

1 1" Polyethylene Water Service Lateral - Horizontal Directional Drill 250 LF $27.74 $6,935.00 $48.90 $12,225.00 $35.00 $8,750.00

2 1" Polyethylene Water Service Lateral - Direct Bury (incl tapping saddle connection) 370 LF $27.24 $10,078.80 $37.27 $13,789.90 $30.60 $11,322.00

3 Jack and Bore--16" Carrier Pipe w/ spacers in 24” Steel Casing 70 LF $451.66 $31,616.20 $456.24 $31,936.80 $382.00 $26,740.00

4 16" PVC Water main (incl fittings) 5150 LF $48.37 $249,105.50 $50.44 $259,766.00 $58.00 $298,700.00

5 16” Restrained Joint Pipe 1140 LF $70.20 $80,028.00 $68.60 $78,204.00 $81.00 $92,340.00

6 16" Valve in Box 7 EA $6,244.42 $43,710.94 $13,018.63 $91,130.41 $8,059.00 $56,413.00

7 Connect to Existing 16" Water main 2 EA $4,409.83 $8,819.66 $13,518.00 $27,036.00 $4,117.00 $8,234.00

8 Fire Hydrant Assembly 7 EA $5,037.85 $35,264.95 $6,283.15 $43,982.05 $8,382.00 $58,674.00

9 Water main Markers 12 EA $74.01 $888.12 $341.16 $4,093.92 $141.00 $1,692.00

SUBTOTAL $466,447.17 SUBTOTAL $562,164.08 SUBTOTAL $562,865.00

3a 16” Fusible PVC Directional Bore (replaces 80 LF jack and bore) 155 LF $177.50 $27,512.50 $236.00 $36,580.00 $164.00 $25,420.00

4a 16” PVC Water main (incl fittings; replaces water main length using jack and bore) 5120 LF $48.37 $247,654.40 $50.44 $258,252.80 $58.00 $296,960.00

SUBTOTAL $275,166.90 SUBTOTAL $294,832.80 SUBTOTAL $322,380.00

3 Jack and Bore--16" Carrier Pipe w/ spacers in 24” Steel Casing -70 LF $451.66 ($31,616.20) $456.24 ($31,936.80) $382.00 ($26,740.00)

4 16" PVC Water main (incl fittings) -5150 LF $48.37 ($249,105.50) $50.44 ($259,766.00) $58.00 ($298,700.00)

SUBTOTAL ($280,721.70) SUBTOTAL ($291,702.80) SUBTOTAL ($325,440.00)

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM

Y-Delta, Inc. Potter Construction, LLC

SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)

SECTION I - GENERAL

$561,256.35

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM

SECTION I - GENERAL

SECTION II - EROSION & 

SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

SECTION II - EROSION & 

SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

E&D Contracting Services, 

Inc.

SECTION I - GENERAL

SECTION II - EROSION & 

SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM

SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)

$555,701.55 $681,772.54

$707,737.00

$704,677.00

$678,642.54

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN 

ALTERNATE USED

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN 

ALTERNATE USED

SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)

SECTION I - GENERAL

SECTION II - EROSION AND SEDIMENTATION CONTROL

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM

SECTION IV - WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM (ALTERNATE)

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN ALTERNATE USED

                                                                                    GRAND TOTAL    - SECTIONS I, II AND III   :

                                                                                    GRAND TOTAL - ALTERNATE WATER DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM :

BID TAB - ITB No  18-006 - Blue Jay Road Water Main Extension

SECTION III - WATER DISTRIBUTION 

SYSTEM - DEDUCTS WHEN 

ALTERNATE USED

COMPANY :


