
ASSOCIATED 

ASPHALT

SUMMERS 

TAYLOR

W-L 

CONSTRUCTION

ITEM # DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 EMULSIFIED ASPHALT - PICKED CRS-2 

(PER GAL.)

                          2.49  NO BID  NO BID 

2 Asphaltic Concrete - Picked Up D Grade 

(M108.02) 411D Mix #21 (Per Ton) Sand & 

Pea Gravel

 NO BID                       96.00                      108.30 

3 Asphaltic Concrete - Picked Up E Grade 

(M108.02) 411E Mix #3 (Per Ton) Topping

 NO BID                       95.00                      101.40 

4 Asphaltic Concrete / Bituminous - Picked Up 

A Grade (M108.03) 307A Mix 1-1/2 Big Binder

 NO BID                       82.00                        93.95 

5 Asphaltic Concrete / Bituminous - Picked Up 

B Grade (M108.03) 307B Mix #17 Regular 

Binder

 NO BID                       80.50                        94.80 

6 Asphaltic Concrete / Bituminous - Picked Up 

C Grade (M108.03) 307C Baby Binder

 NO BID                       84.50                        98.20 

7 Asphaltic Concrete / Bituminous - Picked Up 

CW Grade (M108.03) Topping

 NO BID                       93.00                        99.95 

8 B M Mix - Picked Up (Per Ton) Binder with 

Recycle

 NO BID                       81.00                        96.05 

9 76-22 Surface Mix D  NO BID                     105.70                      121.40 

10 76-22 Surface Mix E  NO BID                     101.70                      119.20 

11 Asphalt Cement - Blountville #2 AC-20 PG6422 

(Per Ton)
                      540.00  NO BID  NO BID 

BID TAB
DATE: 6/22/23                                                                                       

DEPT.: HIGHWAY                                                                                   

REQ.# 131240035(KD)                                                                                                                                                                           

FOR: ASPHALT & RELATED PRODUCTS


