OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
CITY OF KNOXVILLE, TENNESSEE

BID TABULATION FORM

DATE: 8/18/2021

DEPARTMENT: Public Works

TITLE: Concrete

BIDDERS

Non- lran DBE DBE Fiowable Fill- Flowabile Fili-
Collusian Divestment Form Option A Pickup Delivered
Affidavit orB?
APAC- Atlantic Inc dba Harrison 4 v v B $107.00 $127.00
Construction
PRI of East Tennessee, inc. v v v B No Bid $200.00

[ CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE TABULATION OF THE PROPOSALS THAT WERE RECEIVED




BIDDERS 4500 PSI Mix- 4500 PSI Mix- 4000 PSI 4000 PSI 3000 PSi 3000 Pst
Pickup Delivered Mix- Pickup Mix- Mix- Pickup Mix-
Delivered Delivered
APAC- Atlantic inc dba Marrison $129.00 $149.00 $127.00 $147.00 $125.00 $145.00
Construction
PRI of East Tennessee, Inc. No Bid $215.00 No Bid $210.00 No 8id $200.00




BIDDERS High Early High Early Fiber Fiber Additive Fiber Additive | Fiber Additive
Mix- Pickup Mix- Additive 1%- | 1%- Delivered 2%- Pickup 2%- Delivered
Delivered Pickup
APAC- Atlantic Inc dba Harrisan $151.00 $171.00 $7.50 $7.50 $15.00 $15.00
Construction
PRI of East Tennessee, Inc. No Bid $250.00 No Bid $5.00 No Bid $7.50




BIDDERS Fiber Fiber Calcium Calcium Calcium Calcium
Additive 3%- Additive Chloride Chioride Chioride Chloride
Pickup 3%- Additive 1%- | Additive 1%- Additive 2%- Additive 2%-
Delivered Pickup Delivered Pickup Delivered
APAC- Atlantic inc dba Harrison $22.50 $22.50 54.00 $4.00 $8.00 $8.00
Construction
PRI of East Tennessee, Inc. No Bid $10.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




BIDDERS Calcium Calcium
Chioride Chloride
Additive 3%- Additive
Pickup 3%-
Delivered
APAC- Atlantic Inc dba Harrison 512.00 $12.00
Construction
PRI of East Tennessee, Inc. No Bid No Bid




