Tulare City School District PAPER AND CHEMICAL
2019-2020
Proposal Worksheet CHEMICAL
Instructions: Indicate Delivered Cost per case in yellow highlighted columns for each item or group. SYSCO FOCUS PACKAGING PAND R
Estimated
Quantity Delivered Cost Per Manufacturer (or Delivered Cost Per Manufacturer (or Delivered Cost Per Manufacturer (or
Manufacturer Line No. pn Manufacturer Code Pack (cases) Case equivalent) Vendor Code Pack Case equivalent) Vendor Code Pack Case equivalent) Vendor Code Pack
Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack
CHEMICAL PRODUCTS ONLY if not as specified ONLY if not as specified ONLY if not as specified
CHEMCORE CHEMICAL 1 |WAREWASH 1 (All Temp. Detergent) w/PUMP 62605 5GAL 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.00 Chemcore 60950 5GAL NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE
CHEMCORE CHEMICAL 2 |WAREWASH 2 (Rinse) CHE62705 5GAL 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.00 Chemcore 61005 5GAL NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE
RATIONAL 3 |TABLET CARE CONTROL RINSE TABS 55145 BUCKET 16 NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.00 Rational 56.00.211 | 50/pail NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE
RATIONAL 4 |TABLET CARE CLEANER TABS 54438 BUCKET 16 NO BID NO BID NO BID $100.25 Rational 56.00.210A  [100/pail NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE
TIDE 5  |TIDESOAP PGC-02364 36LBS 40 $94.26 TIDE 8185 1 $120.00 Tide PGC-02364 | 36 LBS $102.00
CLASSIC 6 |BLEACH CHLORINE 5.25-6.0% AUTBLEACH 6/1GAL 64 $18.80 SYS CLS 11009105041 6 $9.00 HASA 2161 6/1GAL $9.50 HASA INC. HSA-2070 6/1/CS
VALUE PRODUCTS 7 |LAUNDRY DETERGENT LIQUID VAL2312 4/1GAL 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $53.25 Value Product 2312 4/1GAL $25.65 LUSEAUX LABORATORIES LUS-410 4/1/Cs
MICHEAL ESSENTIAL 8  |CHLORINE STRIPS CM-240 BOX 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.00 Micro Essential CM-240 BX $4.75
CHASE 9  |STAINLESS POLISH 433-411 12/180Z 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.25 Chase 433-4111 12/18 oz $23.80 CLAIRE MFG. CMC-CS227 12/140z/CS




