
Tulare City School District PAPER AND CHEMICAL
2019-2020 

Proposal Worksheet PAPER

Instructions: Indicate  Delivered Cost per case in yellow highlighted column (H) for each item or group. Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack ONLY if not as 
specifiedi n columns I, J, & K.

SYSCO FOCUS PACKAGING P AND R

Paper Products
Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack 

ONLY if not as specified
Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack 

ONLY if not as specified
Quote manufacturer, item code, and pack 

ONLY if not as specified

Manufacturer Line No.Item Description                                                                                                                                    Manufacturer Code Pack

Estimated 
Quantity
(Cases) Delivered Cost Per 

Case
Manufacturer (or 

equivalent) Vendor Code Pack
Delivered Cost Per 

Case
Manufacturer (or 

equivalent) Vendor Code Pack
Delivered Cost Per 

Case
Manufacturer (or 

equivalent) Vendor Code Pack

ACS 1 Scouring Pad Thin Green ACS-96-601 1/20 Case 4 $13.10 SYSCO SYS-S086A 1 $11.00 ACS ACS-96-601 1/20 Case $4.50
BAG CRAFT 2 Bag Sandwich Med DoubeView Bag PPC-300093 500/Case 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $114.00 BAG CRAFT BAG-300093 500/Case $71.70

BROWN PAPER 3 Bag Foil PTD Chicken 6x. 75x6.5 5A16 1M/Case 104
NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.20 BROWN PAPER 5A16 1M/Case $29.30 BAGCRAFT / PAPERCON PPC-444492 1000/CS

Not interested in 
alternate product

BROWN PAPER 4 Bag Foil PTD Chsbrgr 6x. 75x6.5 5A22 1M/Case 40
NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.20 BROWN PAPER 5A22 1M/Case $29.30 BAGCRAFT / PAPERCON PPC-300529 1000/CS

Not interested in 
alternate product

BROWN PAPER 5 Bag Foil PTD Hamburger 6x.75x6.5 5A04 1M/Case 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.20 BROWN PAPER 5A04 1M/Case $29.30 BAGCRAFT / PAPERCON PPC-300527 1000/CS
Not interested in 
alternate product

DIRECT LINK 6 Cup 4oz Clear PP Harmony Portion DLK-HP400 2500/Case 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.75 LOLLI CUP USA,INC FP-P400-PP 2500/Case $27.90
DIRECT PACK 7 Container Hinged Tangerine 6x6 DPI-COX-66-BB-TG 250/Case 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $36.40 DIRECT PACK DPI-COX-66-BB-TG 250/Case $37.95
DURABLE PACKAGING 8 Foil Container HI-Divider 3/Com 210-35-500 500/Case 26 NO BID NO BID NO BID $129.00 DURABLE PACKAGING 210-35-500 500/Case $41.90 HFA FOIL HFA-2045-35-250WL 250/CS
ELKAY 9 Bag Sandwich Zip-Lock Bag 6x6 1.2ml ELK-H07RC 1M/Case 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00 ELKAY ELK-H07RC 1M/Case $10.25 HANGUARDS HND-304985110 500/CS
FOL 10 Food Pail (Chinese) Micro White #16 16MWHITEM 450 CT 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.85 FOL 16MWHITEM 450 CT $29.85 GOLDEN WEST PAPER GWP-16FP-WMW 450/CS
FOOD HANDLER 11 Bag Zip Lock 1-Gallon 10x11 FDH-20-FH60 250/Case 4 $9.59 NOVELIS FDH-20-FH60 1 $13.85 INTERPLAST RZIP-GAL 250/Case $11.75 HANGUARDS HND-304985130 250/CS
FOOD HANDLER 12 Bag Zip-Lock Quart White Stripe 7x8 FDH-20-FH50 500/Case 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.50 GTS DWZ003 300/Case $11.85 ELKAY PLASTICS ELK-F20708Q 500/CS
FOOD HANDLER 13 Bag Sandwich Zip-Lock Bag 6.5x6" 2-FDH-20-FH40 500/Case 4 $15.28 SYS CLS 304985452 2 $8.00 GTS DWZ004 500/Case $10.25 HANGUARDS HND-304985110 500/CS
GENPAK 14 12oz Hinged Deli High Dome AD12F 200 CS 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.00 GENPAK AD12F 200 CS $19.50
GENPAK 15 8oz Hinged Deli High Dome AD08 200 CS 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.50 GENPAK AD08 200 CS $17.05
GENPAK 16 48oz Hinged Deli AD48 200 CS 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID $66.00 GENPAK AD48 200 CS $29.25
GENPAK 17 4oz Clear Hinged Deli Container AD04 400 CS 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.50 GENPAK AD04 400 CS $28.05
GENPAK PRO VIEW 18 3 Compartment Medium 8x8x3 Container PV243CO 150 CS 2 $11.82 SYS CLS YTD188S30000 150 $64.00 GENPAK PRO VIEW PV243CO 150 CS $53.40
GOLDMAX 19 Pizza Tripod Pizza Saver Stand GOL-20431 1M/Case 2 $14.41 WHALEN WPPTPR1 1000 $9.50 GOLDMAX GOL-20431 1M/Case $8.95

HANDI FOIL 20 Foil Sheets 12x10.75 JIF HFA-JIF-8960 6/500 Case 10 $69.23 SYS CLS W69370 12 $61.00 GTS 12POPS 6/500 Case $43.95 DIRECT LINK DLK-12550 3000/CS
HANDI FOIL 21 Foil 18X1000 Heavy Medallion HFA-JIF-8960 6/500 RL 6 $36.67 SYS CLS W69323 1 $46.50 INTERPLAST AFW18X1000H RL $34.95 DIRECT LINK DLK-18180 1/RL
HANGARD 22 Glove Latex LRG Flick-Lin Yelw 303400533 12 PR 4 $28.16 HANGARD 303400533 4 $5.50 SAFETY-ZONE GRFY-LRG-1C 12 PR $4.55 LIFE GUARD LIG-4204 12pr/DZN
HANGARD 23 Glove Latex Med Flick-Lin Yelw 303400532 12 PR 4 $66.97 HANGARD 303400532 4 $5.50 SAFETY-ZONE GRFY-MED-1C 12 PR $4.55 LIFE GUARD LIG-4203 12pr/DZN
HARMONY 24 Tray Lunch 5 comp Bagsse "Harmony Green" PNR-TL15 500/Case 3,200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.00 WALLACE PACKAGING USP-MFST-5 500/Case $34.95
HUHTAMAKI CHINET 25 Tray Red Plaid Carry Tray 1lb CHI-FT100 500/Case 140 $19.49 MPK FDS 35122040 1000 $13.45 SQP 6151 500/Case $13.35 GOLDEN WEST PAPER GWP-KB100 1000/CS
HUHTAMAKI CHINET 26 Tray Regal Design Plaid Carry Nested (middle) CHI-R963CT 500/Case 1,280 NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.00 SQP 6195 500/Case $18.20
IMEX 27 Container Food Container Compostable 12oz IMV-12BSB 500/Case 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID $54.00 ECO-PRODUCT EP-BSC12-WA 500/Case $44.25
IMEX 28 Container Food Container Compostable 16oz IMV-16BSB 500/Case 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID $59.00 ECO-PRODUCT EP-BSC16-WA 500/Case $50.65
IMEX 29 Cup Hot White 8oz IMV-8PCW 20/50/Case 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.00 LOLLI CUP USA,INC K-K508W 20/50/Case $28.40 must match line 32

IMEX 30 Lid Container PP 12-32oz (115mm)Compostable IMV-12BSL-PP 500/Case 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $58.00 ECO-PRODUCT EP-ECOLID-SPL 500/Case $27.10
IMEX 31 Lid Container PP 8oz Compostable IMV-8BSL-PP 1/M Case 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $74.00 ECO-PRODUCT EP-ECOLID-SPS 1/M Case $30.80 must match line 41

IMEX 32 Lid Hot White Sip Thur 8oz IMV-DLW8 1M/Case 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.00 LOLLI CUP USA,INC C-KDL508 1M/Case $24.65 must match line 29

INNOPAK 33 Bag Ice Printed 8# 11.5x18 W/ Drawstring 001218DI 500/Case 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 ELKAY PLASTIC H18PDS 500/Case $47.50 ELKAY PLASTICS ELK-H18PDS 500/CS
INTERPLAST 34 Glove Poly Disp LG GL-LG 10/100 Case 2 $11.72 SYS REL 303363273 4 $4.00 INTERPLAST GL-LG 10/100 Case $3.90 GOLDMAX GOL-1501 1000/CASE
INTERPLAST 35 Glove Poly Disp Med GL-M 10/100 Case 26 $11.72 SYS REL 303363272 4 $4.00 INTERPLAST GL-M 10/100 Case $3.90 GOLDMAX GOL-1502 1000/CASE
INTERPLAST 36 Glove Poly Disp SM GL-S 10/100 Case 2 $11.72 SYS REL 303363271 4 $4.00 INTERPLAST GL-S 10/100 Case $3.90 GOLDMAX GOL-1503 1000/CASE
INTERPLAST 37 Glove Poly Disp XLG GL-XLG 10/100 Case 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.00 INTERPLAST GL-XLG 10/100 Case $14.00 GOLDMAX GOL-14201 5000/CS
KARI-OUT 38 Lid Board for 3 Comp Foil 473903 500/Case 26 NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.00 KARI-OUT 473903 500/Case $41.90 HFA FOIL HFA-2045-35-250WL 250/CS
KRAFT 39 Pizza Box Stock Print K/K 16" 16PIZPLBR 50/BD 30 $22.45 SYS CLS 16PIZPLBR 50 $19.40 GTS 16PIZPLBR 50/BD $16.75
LOLLI CUP USA,INC 40 Container DBL Poly Paper Wht 8oz LOLC-KDP8W 1M/Case 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.50 LOLLI CUP USA,INC LOLC-KDP8W 1M/Case $39.15 EATERY ESSENTIALS EES-YGTC08W-D95 1000/CS
LOLLI CUP USA,INC 41 Container Food Container Compostable 8oz KE-KDPSW 1M/Case 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $76.50 ECO-PRODUCT EP-BSC8-WA 1M/Case $54.95 IMEX VISION IMV-8BSB 1000/CS must match line 31

LOLLI CUP USA,INC 42 Cup Pete (parfait) Clr 16oz (98mm) C-KC16TU 1M/Case 30
NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.00 LOLLI CUP USA,INC C-KC16TU 1M/Case $35.80 EATERY ESSENTIALS EES-PTC16 1000/CS

Manufacturer must 
match line 42, 46, 47

LOLLI CUP USA,INC 43 Cup Portion BLK PP 3.25oz LLC-P325-PPB 2500/Case 16 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.50 LOLLI CUP USA,INC LLC-P325-PPB 2500/Case $32.25
LOLLI CUP USA,INC 44 Cup Portion BLK PP 5.50oz FP-550-PPB 2500/Case 28 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.75 LOLLI CUP USA,INC FP-550-PPB 2500/Case $38.95
LOLLI CUP USA,INC 45 Lid Clear 3.25-5.5oz FP-PL400-PE 2500/Case 58 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.50 LOLLI CUP USA,INC FP-PL400-PE 2500/Case $26.50

LOLLI CUP USA,INC 46 Lid Flat No Slot For 12-24 98mm parfait LLC-KC626TS-NH 1M/Case 26
NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.30 LOLLI CUP USA,INC LLC-KC626TS-NH 1M/Case $17.15

Manufacturer must 
match line 42, 46, 47

LOLLI CUP USA,INC 47 Parfait Insert 4oz (98mm) C-PI4 1M/Case (Karat) 26
NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.75 LOLLI CUP USA,INC C-PI4 1M/Case (Karat) $21.10 EATERY ESSENTIALS EES-VPTC-IST98 1000/CS

Manufacturer must 
match line 42, 46, 47

NETCHOICE 48 Glove Medium Vinyl P/F Serving NET-754631 10/100 Case 120 $26.51 SYS CLS 304362812 10 $22.00 SAFETY-ZONE GVP9-MED-1 10/100 Case $17.45
NETCHOICE 49 Glove X-Large Vinyl P/F NET-754639 10/100 Case 6 $26.51 SYS CLS 304362814 10 $22.00 SAFETY-ZONE GVP9-XL-1 10/100 Case $17.45
PACTIV 50 Container Hingd 9x9x33Comp YTD199030000 150/Case 92 $11.99 SYS CLS YTD199S30000 150 $12.85 PACTIV YTD199030000 150/Case $11.95
PACTIV 51 Container Plas Hng Blk/Cl Oct 7.75X2 12094 150/Case 8 $39.83 PACTIV 12094 150 $92.00 PACTIV 12094 150/Case $65.45 SOLO SOL-865624-PS94 100/CS
PACTIV 52 Container Plas Hng Sand Wed Y11334 255 CT 40 $30.90 PACTIV Y11334 1 $55.50 PACTIV Y11334 255 CT $38.90 ANCHOR ANC-4511019 250/CS
PAPERCUTTERS 53 Butcher Wrap White 101424 18/40# PCT-101421 1300/Roll 4 $48.86 PAPCON 165018 1 $26.50 PAPERCUTTERS 101418 1300/Roll $21.75
PATTERSON PAPER 54 Pan Liner (Nova) 16x24 Quilon N49-142405 1M/Case 62 $51.67 SYSCO 019010SYS 1 $27.20 NOVA N49-142405 1M/Case $26.90 PATERSON PAT-2405161-0000 1000/CS
PRECESSION LIGHTING 55 Heat Lamp Bulb Shatter Resistant TBBR40T 1 EA 150 $105.44 SATCOLT S4885 12 $11.40 WESTERN LIGHTSOURCE A3204 1 EA NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE NO QUOTE



SCA 56 Towel White Tork Roll 8" SCA-290089 6/700/Case 4 $45.98 TORKADV 290089 6 $43.25 SCA SCA-290089 6/700/Case $43.85
SOLARIS 57 Towels Harmony Soft Kitchen Roll 2 Ply SLS-HS41504 30/85/Case 6 $22.74 SYS CLS HB1990A-SYS 30 $25.00 BWK 6272 30/85/Case $20.25
SYSCO CLASSIC 58 Bag Plas 8x4x18 CRL 304985546 1000 CT 18 $14.79 SYS CLS 304985546 1 $32.00 ELKAY PLASTIC 10G-084018 1/MIL 1000 CT $21.80 ELKAY PLASTICS ELK-7G084018 1000/CS
SYSCO IMP 59 Lid Plas Clr F/3-4oz Prtin Cup YLS3FRSYS 120 CT 12 $21.73 SYS IMP YLS3FRSYS 20 N/B SYSCO IMP YLS3FRSYS 120 CT $28.50 DIRECT LINK DLK-HPLID345 2500/CS
SYSCO 60 Bag Paper Brown 8# 17810SYS 500 CT 15 $12.26 ERTHPLS 17810SYS 1 $12.75 DURO BAG BAG-GK8-500 500 CT $10.50 AJM PACKAGING AJM-8LB 500/BD
SYSCO 61 Cover Bun Rack Clr Roll 303679973 50 CT 17 $13.79 SYS CLS 303679973 50 $12.65 INTERPLAST BRC52X80 50 CT $10.85 UNISTAR PLASTICS USP-BPC5280 50/CS
SYSCO 62 Rack Cover Bun Clr Roll 303679973 50 CT 32 $13.79 SYS CLS 303679973 50 $12.65 INTERPLAST BRC52X80 50 CT $10.85 UNISTAR PLASTICS USP-BPC5280 50/CS
SYSCO CLASSICS 63 Foil Almn Roll Hvy Wgt 1000 Ft W69323 1 Roll 4 $37.85 SYS CLS W69323 1 $46.50 INTERPLAST AFW18X1000H RL $34.95 DIRECT LINK DLK-18180 1/RL
THE SAFETY ZONE* 64 HairNet Bouffant Wht 24" DBWH-24-1 10/100 Case 25 $14.34 SYS CLS 305111221 5 $26.20 THE SAFETY ZONE* DBWH-24-1 10/100 Case $21.75 GOLDMAX GOL-2024-1 1000/CS
THE SAFETY ZONE* 65 Beard Net Cover Restraint White Regular DBRD-1000XL 10/100/Case 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.00 THE SAFETY ZONE* DBRD-1000XL 10/100/Case $23.20 CELLUCAP CEL-BP-400R 1000/CS
WALLACE PACKAGING 66 Kit School, Lunch Sp Nap Straw 3600 1M/Case 2,392 $11.72 PACKER 1000 $10.85 WALLACE PACKAGING 3600 1M/Case $10.45 NUTRIBON NTR-SH3A 1000/CS
WORLD CENT 67 Cup Souffle Clear - Compostable 2oz WOR-CP-CS-2S 2M/Case 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.00 ECO-PRODUCT EP-PC200 2M/Case $28.95 FABRIKAL FAB-GPC200 2000/CS
WORLD CENT 68 Lid Souffle Clear Lid 2oz-Compostable 2M WOR-CPL-CS-2S 2M/Case 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID $53.00 ECO-PRODUCT EP-PCLID 2M/Case $24.50 FABRIKAL FAB-GXL250PC 2000/CS


