USD 250 Pittsburg Community Schools Bid Results - Non Instructional Paper

2020-2021 Bid

Vendor Bid Results #1 Roll Tissue #2 Roll Towels #3 Folded Towels
Bid Winners
Vendor Name Vendor City/State 250 cases 250 cases 1,200 cases
4 State Maintenance Coffeyfille, KS 7,632.50 4,235.00 16,308.00
Hugo’s Industrial Supply, Inc. Independence, KS 8,067.50 4,200.00 17,172.00
Marrone's, Inc. (domiciliary K.S.A Supp. 72-6760) Pittsburg, KS no bid
Nu-Life Labs (A) Lenexa, KS 9,072.50 4,897.50 19,908.00
Nu-Life Labs (B) Lenexa, KS 8,972.50 4,697.50 18,228.00
Nu-Life Labs (C) Lenexa, KS
Springfield Janitor Supply Springfield, MO 7,637.50 4,325.00 16,800.00
Henry Kraft Mercantile no bid
Hillyard no bid
Osborn Paper Company no bid
Safety First Supply Co. LLC no bid
Pur-O-Zone no bid
Williams - Lafe T Williams & Assoc. (A) no bid
Bottom Dollar (bid A) no bid
Veritiv no bid
Southwest Paper Company Wichita KS no bid

Totals 28,175.50




