TABULATION OF BIDS

FOR

20-237-ITB

WATER METERS OF POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT (DISC OR PISTON), SINGLE JET TURBINE, ELECTRONIC-SMALL
(ULTRASONIC, ELECRROMAGNETIC, OR FLUIDIC OSCILLATOR AND ELECTRONIC-LARGE (ULTRASONIC OR
ELECTOMAGNETIC) TYPES WITH ABSOLUTE ENCODED REGISTERS LINKED TO AN ITRON QUICK CONNECTOR

AS WELL AS APPURTENCES TO INCLUDE STRAINERS AND ERTS

BIDS were opened by Francine Morris, Procurement Officer, at 3:00 P.M. on. July 15, 2020

Name of Bidder Positive Single Jet Electronic Electronic Strainers ITRON ERTS Bid Total
Displacement Turbine Meters (Small) | Meters (Large)
Meters Meters
BADGER METER, INC $265,348.25 No Bid $15,660.00 No Bid $47,137.78 No Bid $328,146.03
CONSOLIDATED PIPE
AND SUPPLY COMPANY, No Bid No Bid $15,637.50 $74,676.23 No Bid No Bid $90,313.73
INC
FERGUSON
ENTERPRISES, LLC dba $326.385.92 No Bid $16,189.25 $142,292.39 $76,494.75 No Bid $561,362.31
FERGUSON ’ '
WATERWORKS
KAMSTRUP WATER . . . . .
METERING, LLC No Bid No Bid 17,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $17,560.00
METRON FARNIER, LLC No Bid $852,200.00 No Bid No Bid $51,575.00 No Bid $903,775.00
MOUNTAIN STATES PIPE
& SUPPLY $365,548,78 $26,829.00 $7,274.4 $140,035.43 $76,494.64 No Bid $616,182.25
UNITED SYSTEMS & $332 750.00
SOFTWARE, INC ’ : No Bid $18,425.00 $126,350.00 $88,350.00 $201,600.00 $767,475.00
Bids Reviewed By: _Frazcine Morvis

Francine Morris, Procurement Officer
Arlington County Government
Office of the Purchasing Agent




