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C-1-143 PADDLE STYLE DISPENSER FOR ROLL PAPER TOWEL, MODEL VISTA 

GEORGIA PACIFIC #54338 
24 EA

-$               

Georgia Pacific 
#54338 

35.50/852.00
GP GPT54338 33.76/810.24 Empress TD021501-

AA02 48.71$     1,169.04$         
C-3-176 Green Brite Brand Multi-Carpet Cleaner; 4 Gal. Per Case 40 EA

-$               

Canbara # 1110 
10.45/418.00

No Bid

ABC 6474415A 4/cs 31.18$     1,247.20$         
C-4-177 Green Rinse Floor Neutralizer - 4 Gal. Per Case 32 EA

-$               

Chemcore # 82001 
4.80/153.60

Spartan SPA3029-04-C 
23.29/745.28 ABC 6357415ADFE 

4/cs 22.94$     734.08$            
C-4-179 FOAMING HAND SANITIZER GALLON JUGS 32 EA

-$               

Noble 46.89/1500.48
DEB # 56205 
12.95/414.40

Spartan SPA3338-04 
17.69/566.08 PERFORMANCE 

PP0236-C4001 27.44$     878.08$            
D-01-105 SWING LINE SQUARE CONTAINER, Continental 25 Gal. (without lid) 

Product #25BE - Beige
12 EA

-$               

Continental # 25BE 
58.00/696.00

No Bid

-$                  
D-01-38

DUST PAN, Metal w/12" lip (12”W x 7-1/2”D) Carlisle #36236

12 EA

ABCO 00203 12/pk 4.57$             54.86$            

BWK #04212 
5.45/65.40

Impact IMP4212-90 
3.31/39.72

IMPACT 4216-EA 8.75$       105.00$            
D-01-39

DUST MITT; Rubbermaid Flex-Duster Model # RCP – T499 (Cotton)

12 EA

-$               

RCP -T499 
9.00/108.00

Rubbermaid RCPT49900WH 
6.04/72.48

-$                  
D-01-40

ROUND DUSTER, with Extendable Handle; Extendable handle; 
CONTINENTAL #E001000

12 EA

-$               

UNG-COBW0 
7.35/88.20

Carlisle CSM36340414 
Carlisle CSM3654000 

3.74/44.88 IMPACT 3103-EA 5.88$       70.56$              
D-01-43

BOTTLES-SPRAY BOTTLE ONLY, Continental #924B (24 oz.)

200 EA

-$               

Impact #5024WG-
EA .57/114.00

Renown REN05120 
.60/120.00 IMPACT 5024WG-

EA 0.75$       150.00$            
D-01-44

TRIGGER SPRAYER ASSEMBLY ONLY (For 24 oz. Bottle)  Continental 
#902BW7; 8”

300 EA

-$               

Impact #5906 
.58/174.00

Impact IMP4800-90 
.47/141.00

IMPCAT 5906 0.75$       225.00$            
D-02-26

FLOOR PADS, 20” Heavy Scrubbing (Green) (5 Per Case) KAMO 
MANUFACTURING #MMM08413

80 EA

Norton 800352 
5/pk 1.63$             130.40$          

Performance # 
PGRE20 

3.00/240.00

Renown REN02023 
3.42/273.60 PERFORMANCE 

PCREZO 13.53$     1,082.40$         
D-02-27

FLOOR PADS, 20” High Performance Stripping (Black) (5 Per Case) KAMO 
MANUFACTURING #MMM08382

180 EA

Norton 80013 5/pk 1.79$             322.20$          

NorthernPad 
#662610-52005 

3.00/540.00

Renown Ren020099 
4.41/793.80

AMERICO 430520 25.29$     4,552.20$         
D-02-28 FLOOR PADS, 20” Polishing (White) (5 Per Case) KAMO 

MANUFACTURING #020082001
80 EA

Norton 80064 5/pk 1.63$             130.40$          

Performance # 
PWH20 3.00/240.00

Renown REN02068 
3.42/273.60 PERFORMANCE 

PWHZO 13.53$     1,082.40$         
D-02-30 S -1 Gal, 6/C COMBO SPONGE MOP, Continental 6012-F 12 EA

-$               

Continental # 6012 
30.00/360.00

Continental CON6012 
20.42/245.04

-$                  
D-02-31

SPONGE MOP, Refill, Continental 6112-F 2 PER PKG COMBO SPONGE 
MOP

12 EA

-$               

Contnental # 6112 
30.00/360.00

Continental CON6112-F 
18.13/217.56

ACS 586 6/10 CT 17.18$     206.16$            
D-02-33 GENERAL PURPOSE SCOURING PADS, Impact Product # 7135; 10 pads per 

pkg.; 6 pkg./cs; 900 total pads (60 pads/ case)
360 EA

Norton 80064 5/pk 1.63$             586.80$          

ACS #S86 
.30/108.00

Renown REN02116 
.75/270.00

-$                  
D-02-35 CLEANSER – BAR KEEPERS FRIEND; 14 oz. (48 Per Case) 144 EA

-$               

CPC #14278           
21 oz 24/cs 
1.15/165.60

Colgate Palmolive CGP14278           
1.11/159.84

-$                  
D-06-16 GRIP SEALER - 1 Gal, 6/Cs 144 EA

-$               

#1C6504 65-GL 
Grip Sealer 

10.54/1517.76

Canberra #1001 
18.25/2628.00

Cleansource GLS10470401 
8.78/1264.32

ABC 696705SA 
5GAL 61.18$     8,809.92$         

D-06-17 FLOOR FINISH SUPER GLOSS - 1 Gal. 6/Cs 240 EA

-$               

#1C29004 290 
Super Gloss 

10.81/2594.40

Sierra Noble 
15.89/3813.60

Mission #1000 
17.15/4116.00

Cleansource GLS13070401 
9.54/2289.60 ABC 696705SA 

5GAL 61.18$     14,683.20$       
D-07-15 FLOOR WAX STRIPPER EXTRA HEAVY- 1 Gal, 6/Cs 144 EA

-$               

#1C27004 270 
Super Strip 
6.30/907.20

Mission # 5616 
5.50/792.00

CleanSource            
FLKCL808-4G-012-C16 

8.16/1175.04
ABC 656241PA 4/1 
GAL 45.29$     6,521.76$         

D-08-11 STERILIZED WIPING RAGS - White Cotton; Terry Cloth Reclaimed (Only 10 
lb. Box) AMERICAN TEXTILE # 5123

260 CS

-$               

Hospeco           #340-
10 14.00/3640.00

Hospital Specialty CO 
HOS537-10     14.54/3780.40

-$                  
D-08-8 TRASH CAN LINERS – Large Poly Bags – High Density; 38” x 60” (17 

Microns)  Color:  Natural, Coreless Rolls (200 per case)
700 CS

-$               

386017- AAP 
200/cs 

31.20/21840.00

#CP3860NR-A 
18.00/12600.00

#CP3860NR-B 
20.80/14,560.00

Olympian 6016064 
22.89/16,023.00

Allstate                      
# H36017N 

21.25/14,875.00

INT-3860-XXH, 
Sample # D-08-8A 

Aluf/IBS 
22.98/16,086.00

INT-3860-X-HVY 
Sample #D-08-8B 

Aluf/IBS 
19.14/13,398.00

INT-3860-H Sample 
#D-08-8C Aluf/IBS 

17.72/12,404.00

INT-3860-MED 
Sample #D-08-8D 

Aluf/IBS 
15.68/10,976.00

Allstate Plastics H386017N 
22.99/16,093.00 WEST COAST 

TRADING 200 CT 
H7740045 26.82$     18,774.00$       

UPC 6055 
16.25/11375.00

UPC 6067 18.70/13090.00

D-08-9

WASTEBASKET LINERS – Small Poly Bag  - High Density; 30” x 37” (10 
Microns)  Color:  Natural, Coreless Rolls (500 per case)

200 CS

-$               

303710-AAP 500/cs 
22.58/4515.00

#CP3037N10R 
1680/3360.00

Olympian 3710064 
17.89/3,578.00

Allstate                      
# H303710N 

21.25/14875.00

INT--3037 Med, 
Sample # D-08-9A 

Aluf/IBS 
17.18/3,436.00

INT-3037-Reg 
Sample #D-08-9B 

Aluf/IBS 
14.24/2,848.00

INT-3037-Reg 
Sample #D-08-9B 

Aluf/IBS 
14.24/2848.00

INT-3037-Reg 
Sample #D-08-9B 

Aluf/IBS 
14.24/2,848.00

Allstate Plastics H303710N 
16.46/3,292.00

WEST COAST 
TRADING 500 CT 
H774400 24.68$     4,936.00$         

UPC 3037 
14.90/2980.00
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D-09-5 MULTI-FOLD PAPER TOWELS;  White; Georgia-Pacific Envision Mfg. 
#20204 (16 pack per case)

144 CS

-$               

Central Poly #200B 
14.40/2073.60

Cascade #H124 
16/250/cs 

16.95/2440.80
GP GPT20204 18.40/2649.60

EMPRESS H400011 18.24$     2,626.56$         
D-09-6 FACIAL TISSUES – Two-Ply; White; Georgia Pacific Mfg. # 48100 (30 boxes 

per case)
400 CS

-$               

Central Poly #BP 
10030 

10.61/4244.00

Royalty # RP-FT 
30100 

12.00/4800.00
GP GPT48100 20.94/8376.00

EMPRESS FT301002 14.12$     5,648.00$         
D-09-7 KING CAN LINERS  - Poly Bags 1.5 Mil (50” x 43”) Color:  Black Continental 

#1924 (100 per Case)
80 CS

-$               

5043XH-AAP 
100/cs 

17.98/1438.40

Allstate 
#L504315K15 
21.25/1700.00

INT-5043-Super Exh, 
Sample # D-09-7A 

Aluf/IBS 
22.84/1,827.20

INT-5043-Exh 
Sample #D-09-7B 

Aluf/IBS 
20.22/1,617.60

INT-5043-XH 
Sample #D-09-7C 

Aluf/IBS 
18.74/1.499.20

INT-5043-XH 
Sample #D-09-7C 

Aluf/IBS 
18.74/1.499.20

Allstate Plastics L504315K-
100 25.89/2071.20

-$                  
D-10-1 TOILET SEAT COVERS  - Half Fold (White Paper) Health Gards # HG-5000 

(250 Per Pack)  (20 Packs per Case)
600 PKG

-$               

Royalty # RP-
HFTSE-20P 
1.18/708.00

Renown REN03800 
25.53/15,318.00 EMPRES ETSL 

120500 28.53$     17,118.00$       
D-10-2 TOILET TISSUE - 2-ply  ; Georgia Pacific Roll Master – (770 sheets per Roll; 

48 rolls per case) for Roll Master Dispenser Model # 19027
612 CS

-$               

Mororx# 
TP487502V 

35.00/21420.00

GP GPT19027 
48.71/29,710.52

-$                  
D-10-3 PLEATED WATER CUPS, Solo #450, 3-1/2 oz. (100 cups per box/ 5000 cups 

per case)
3 CS

-$               

Genpak #W450F 
2500/cs 

55.00/165.00

SOLO CUP COMPANY 
SOL450-2050 102.25/306.75

GENPAK W45OF 62.66$     187.98$            
D-10-4 PAPER TOWELS 12-ROLL PER CASE 350' ROLL 1200 CS

-$               

Marcal #P720N 
15.99/19188.00

Lavek BT 550N 
15.89/19,068.00

Cascade #H235 350' 
12rl/cs 

16.00/19200.00

GP GPT26401 
28.41/34,092.00

NOVA NOVA350N 14.76$     17,712.00$       
D-WALL-45 MOP HANDLE, WOOD, Quick Change (12 Per Case) (7" Head - 60" Handle); 

Impact #WH93
108 EA

ABCO 01205-NB 
6/pk 3.82$             412.56$          

ABCO #01204-NE-
EA 5.35/577.80

Renown REN02379 
5.40/583.20

ABCO 01204-NB-EA 5.69$       614.52$            
D-WALL-49 Dust Mop Handle, Clip On 15/16” dia x 5’ Wood Model CARLISLE # 4585000 48 EA

ABCO 01406-NB 
12/pk 3.77$             180.96$          

ABCO #01406-NE-
EA 5.65/271.20

CleanSource PMR120000 
5.38/258.24

ABCO 01406-NB-EA 5.65$       271.20$            
D-WALL-55 BUCKET, IMPACT #5510R 24 EA

-$               

Impact # 5510 
6.00/144.00

Rubbermaid Commercial 
RCP296300RD 8.25/198.00

IMPACT 5510 6.25$       150.00$            
D-WALL-56 VEHICLE BRUSH, Polystyrene 2-1/2” Wide and 1-1/2” Thick.  Trim 2-1/2” – 

Length 14”; Carlisle #361234
12 EA

ABCO BH-18009 10.89$           130.68$          

ABCO #BH-18009-
EA 11.00/132.00

Carlisle Sanitary Maintenance 
CSM3649700 12.01/144.12

ABCO BH-18009 EA 11.06$     132.72$            
D-WALL-59 UTILITY BRUSH 20” handle, Crimped Synthetic Bristle Carlisle #365056 12 EA

-$               

Winco #BRN-20P 
5.95/71.40

Renown REN03949 
3.12/37.44

WINCO BRN-20P 6.25$       75.00$              
D-WALL-63 COUNTER BRUSH; Plastic 13” Black Polypropylene Block (Trim 2-3/8”) 

CONTINENTAL # E408208
12 EA

ABCO 00100 12/pk 1.48$             17.76$            

Continental 37732 
4.89/58.68

No Bid
Renown REN03943 

2.67/32.04

-$                  
D-WALL-64 BRASS-SQUEEGEE HOLDER 10 EA

-$               

Unger #GS000-EA 
8.00/80.00

UNGER ENTERPRISES 
UNGGS000 4.82/48.20

UNGER 65000-EA 8.50$       85.00$              
D-WALL-65 SQUEEGEE W/BRASS CHANNEL 16" 24 EA

-$               

Unger #GS400-EA 
14.00/336.00

UNGER ENTERPRISES 
UNGGC400 5.85/140.40

UNGER 65400 -EA 13.88$     333.12$            
D-WALL-66 SQUEEGEE RUBBER REFILL 16" 24 EA

-$               

Unger # RT400-
Pack 2.30/55.20

UNGER ENTERPRISES 
UNGRT400 1.81/43.44 UNGER RT400 

PACK 27.33$     655.92$            
D-WALL-69 TOILET BOWL BRUSH SYNTHETIC - 21" HANDLE (48/Case), Carlisle 

#36100624
24 EA

ABCO 00017 
12/PK 0.58$             13.92$            

AMCO #BH-18001-
EA 1.50/36.00

Renown REN03926 
1.93/46.32 ABCO BH-18001 - 

EA 1.30$       31.20$              
D-WALL-71 LAMBSWOOL DUSTER TELESCOPIC CARLISLE # 4573300 96 EA

ABCO BH-19005 
12/PK 0.58$             55.68$            

Impact # 3106-S     
33"-60"    

8.00/768.00

Renown REN05259 
4.89/469.44

IMPACT 306 -EA 8.13$       780.48$            
D-WALL-72 FEATHER DUSTER 24" Overall Length CARLISLE 3 4574300 48 EA

ABCO BH-19002 
12/PACK 2.79$             133.92$          

Impact # 4603-EA 
8.50/408.00

Impact Products IMP4603-90 
6.18/296.64

IMPACT 4603 -EA 9.00$       432.00$            
D-WALL-74 SINGLE EDGE RAZOR BLADES Single Edge, 100 Blades Per Box #UNG-

SRB3
6 BX

-$               

UNG-SRB3 
15.00/90.00

Stanley 556131 5.68/34.08
UNGER 5RB30-BX 14.84$     89.04$              

D-WALL-75 RAZOR BLADE SCRAPER # USR50 72 EA

-$               

UNGER #SR500 
2.25/162.00

WARNER TOOL PRODUCTS 
835762 1.08/77.76

UNGER SR500-EA 2.40$       172.80$            
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D-WALL-76 PUTTY KNIFE 1 1/2" Width 72 EA

-$               

Impact # 3200 
2.60/187.20

WARNER TOOL PRODUCTS 
786534 1.44/103.68

IMPACT 3200 2.76$       198.72$            
D-WALL-77 KEY- BAK STAINLESS CHAIN-KEY HOLDER w/24" Stainless Steel Chain  

#0005-011
48 EA

-$               

Key-Bak #0003-011 
20.00/960.00

HY-KO PRODUCTS 801106 
5.06/242.88

-$                  
D-WALL-78 UTILITY SCRUB N' STRIP PAD - For Kleenfast Pad Holder WEBSTURANT 

3 3998541     (5 per Box)
60 EA

-$               

Boardwalk #403 
.85/51.00

Renown REN02108 .58/34.80

-$                  
D-WALL-80 PUMICE SCOURING STICK, PORCELAIN/TILE 60 EA

-$               

Pumice Co. #PUM -
12 1.95/117.00

U.S. PUMICE COMPANY 
559004 1.64/98.40

HSP 12-TAN 24.12$     1,447.20$         
D-WALL-84 BROOM, SYNTHETIC - STRAIGHT CUT- HARD YELLOW BRISTLE 

Carlisle # 4564304
12 EA

-$               

No Bid
Carlisle CSM4564304 

15.18/182.16

-$                  
D-WALL-85 BROOM, SYNTHETIC - ANGLE CUT- SOFT BLACK BRISTLE Carlisle # 

4065000
12 EA

ABCO BR-
1024MH 12/PK 2.79$             33.48$            

No Bid
Carlisle CSM4065000 

5.26/63.12

-$                  
D-WALL-86

HANDLE - 60"  no threads, for Squeegee or Window Brush; CLEAN IT 
SUPPLY #BWK125

5 EA

ABCO 01113 
12/PK 1.77$             21.24$            

ABCO #01102-EA 
2.50/12.50

Renown REN03989-LB 
1.73/8.65

ABCO 0102 EA 2.25$       11.25$              
D-WALL-92 24" DUST MOP REFILLS - DISPOSE PREMIER #120400 36 EA

ABCO DD-
91524W 12/PK 2.02$             72.72$            

ABCO #DMTL - 
13524W-EA 
5.30/190.80

Renown REN02424 
4.93/177.48 ABCO - DMTL-

13524W -EA 5.63$       202.68$            
D-WALL-93 36" DUST MOP REFILL - DISPOSE PREMIER #120420 204 EA

ABCO DD-
91536W 12/pk 
32.24 32.24$           6,576.96$       

ABCO #DMTL - 
13536W-EA 
7.10/1448.40

Cleansource PMR120420 
4.55/928.20 ABCO - DMTL-

13536W - EA 7.56$       1,542.24$         
E-1-100 VACUUM BAGS – PAPER; For Pro-Pack Vacuum Cleaner; Coach Vac. / 

Super Coach Vac. / Mega Vac-6; Media Filer #100331 2-ply, 10 Quart; 10 per 
pkg, 20 pkg. per case

6000 EA

-$               

Pro-Team #100331 
.90/5400.00

Renown REN08051 
7.39/44,340.00

-$                  
E-1-101 DRUM DOLLY for 32 or 44 Gal. Garbage Can; Continental #3255 (Twist-on) 40 EA

-$               
Continental 3255 

28.29/1155.60

Lavex# 
274TCDOLLY 
20.00/800.00

Appeal APP15502 
24.72/988.80

IMPACT 7708-EA 29.87$     1,194.80$         
E-1-105 LID for 32 GAL. GARBAGE CAN 9 EA

-$               

Continental 
#3201BY 8.00/72.00

Continental CON3201GY 
7.66/68.94

IMPACT 7733-3 EA 9.76$       87.84$              
E-1-91 DOORMAT, LARGE BLACK FINGERTIP  32" X 39" 42 EA

Apache 39-372-
0900-32X39 19.65$           825.30$          

Direct Mat 
35.89/1507.38

Catcus #35-3239 
40.00/1680.00

No Bid

-$                  
E-1-92 DOORMAT SMALL - BLACK FINGERTIP 24''x32'' 200 EA

Apache 39-372-
0900-24x32 11.45$           2,290.00$       

Guardian 
9.49/1898.00

Catcus #35-2432  
23.50/4700.00

Crown Mats & Matting 
10131158 40.74/8148.00

-$                  
E-1-93 MOP BUCKET, Plastic 44 Qt. Continental #403-3YW; Yellow; with Casters 12 EA

-$               

No Bid No Bid

-$                  
E-1-97 MOP WRINGER – DOWN PRESS, 32 Oz., Continental Co. #SW7YW 8 EA

-$               

No Bid
Continental CONSW7YW 

67.92/543.36 IMPACT 44/2635-3Y -
EA 83.51$     668.08$            

E-2-106 WASTEBASKET (Round) 44-3/8” – Continental #4438BE; Beige; 6/cs 144 EA

-$               
Continentel 4438BE 

16.89/2432.16

Impact # 7703-15 
41QT 8.70/1252.80

No Bid IMPACT 7703-15 9.23$       1,329.12$         
E-2-107 WASTEBASKET (Rectangular) 28-1/8” Qt. Continental #2818BE; Beige; 

12/cs
36

-$               
Continentel 2818BE 

5.89/212.84

Impact # 7702-15-
EA 5.00/180.00

Continental CON2818BE 
3.39/122.04

IMPACT 7702-15-EA 6.38$       229.68$            
E-2-108 SOILED NAPKIN CAN- METAL WHITE - FLOOR UNIT IMPACK 

PRODUCT 1115
30 EA

-$               

Hospeco # 2201 
20.00/600.00

Impact Products IMP1115-90 
28.91/867.30

IMPACT 1115-EA 36.82$     1,104.60$         
E-2-94 MOP BUCKET, Plastic 35 Qt. Continental #335-3YW; Yellow; with Casters 2 EA

-$               
Continental 335-347 

64.89//129.78

Impat # 2635=3Y 
45.00/90.00

Continental Commercial 
Products CON335-3YW 

40.80/81.60
-$                  

E-2-95 MOP PLASTIC BUCKET With/CASTERS 26 qt. 2 EA

-$               

Impact # 2635-3Y 
45.00/90.00

No Bid
IMPACT 74/2636-3Y -
EA 47.16$     94.32$              

E-3-112 Toilet Tissue Dispenser – SAN JAMAR MODEL # GLSMR3300TBK 30 EA

-$               

San Jamar 
#R3500TBK 
24.50/735.00

San Jamar R3500TBK 
22.67/680.01

San Jamar R3500TBK 24.46$     733.80$            



Awarded
Low Bid- Not to 

Spec

Equivalent 
Product to Bid 

Specs - Low Bid

Order does not 
meet Min order 
requirements - 
given to next 

lowest bid Minimum Qty Requried

Brand and Product Unit Extention Brand and Product Unit Ext.

Unipak "B"

TULARE CITY SCHOOL DISTRICT

600 NORTH CHERRY ST.

TULARE, CALIFORNIA 93274

BID NO. 2018/2019 - DUE Thursday , April 19, 2018 – 2:00 P.M. - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

DESCRIPTION -- Bid on Brand Specified or its equal--specify your brand 
in column provided.

UNITQTY
Central Poly Corp. 

"A"
Champion 

Chemical Co
All American Poly

Central Poly Corp. 
"B"

Interbora 
Packaging "D"

Interbora 
Packaging "A"

AFP Valley FoodInterbora 
Packaging "B"

Unipak "A"
ConServ Flag 

Company
Interbora 

Packaging "C"
Focus Supply Works

E-3-116 CHEWING GUM REMOVER Coolant Aerosol Spray  7oz., (12 per case) 48

-$               

Chase # 433410 
5.5oz 12/cs 
2.05/98.40

Appeal APP12731 2.47/118.56
ABC 45241PA 12/9 
OZ 28.24$     1,355.52$         

E-3-117 WD-40 Lubricant Spray; 9 oz. Aerosol 12

-$               
WD-40 490026 
48.89/586.68

WD 40 # 
WDF490026 
5.35/64.20

WD-40 1030258 4.00/48.00
ABC 451820PA 12/20 
OZ 38.82$     465.84$            

E-3-120 TOILET BOWL DEODORANT- One Piece Disposable Plastic Container, BIG 
"D" INDUSTRIES # 601 (4 Oz.) 12 Per Box; 12 Boxes per Case 

384 EA

-$               

Hospeco # 06411 
.80/307.20

Big D Industries BGD677 
11.20/4300.80

-$                  
E-3-121 FURNITURE POLISH  - Lemon Wax Polish-18 oz. Aerosol can (12 Per Case) 60 EA

-$               

Chase #4334109 
17oz 12/cs 

2.20/132.00
Appeal APP12733 2.64/158.40

ABC 458620FA 
12/20OZ 32.94$     1,976.40$         

E-3-122 DISINFECTANT SPRAY 16 oz. Aerosol Can (12 Per Case) 228 EA

-$               

Chase # 4334104 
16.5oz 2.20/501.60

Claire MFG CLMCL081 
3.13/713.64 ABC 483720 LA 12 

CT 36.47$     8,315.16$         
E-3-124 AIR FRESHENER AEROSOL SPRAY 1 UN 180 EA

-$               

Chase # 4334113 
15oz 12/cs 

2.35/423.00
Appeal APP12732 3.01/541.80

ABC 461620 FA 
12/20 OZ 38.82$     6,987.60$         

E-3-126 Dust Mop Treatment; 16 oz. (12/case) Aerosol Spray Can 36 EA

-$               

Chase # 4385152 
18oz 2.35/84.60

Betco BET0352300 
3.31/119.16

CHASE 5152 41.51$     1,494.36$         
E-3-145 LOBBY DUST PAN - CARLISE SANITARY # 36141003 12 EA

ABCO DP-00204E 
20/pk 4.58$             91.64$            

Impact #2600-EA 
8.00/96.00

Appeal APP18109 3.80/45.60

IMPACT 2600-EA 8.45$       101.40$            
F-2-170 KING KAN (Whole Unit) Continental 65 Gallon; with lid; Product #5765BN – 

Brown
4 EA

-$               

No Bid No Bid

-$                  
F-3-151 BOWL MOP SQUEEGEE w/Built-in Wringer Impact #3600 (72 per case) 72 EA

-$               

Impact #3600-EA 
1.50/108.00

IMPACT PRODUCTS 
IMP3605-90 1.23/88.56

IMPACT 3600-EA 1.70$       122.40$            
F-3-152 DUST MASK, Disposable Non-Toxic; Impact Co.  #7300 (50 masks per box)  

(One size fits all)
6 EA

Cordova CDM-2 
20/pk 2.15$             646.43$          

Impact · 7300B-BX 
6.50/39.00

Honey Well 294299 
5.26/31.56

IMPACT 7300B-BX 6.70$       40.20$              


