

QR #2020-03 Sports Turf Field Fertilizer and Chemicals

Due: 2/18/2020

| Item No.     | Item   | Qty | Unit   | SiteOne Landscape Supply LLC |                  | Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC |        | Harrell's LLC    |          | Howard Fertilizer & Chemical Company, Inc. |                  | Low Bids by Line Item |        |                  |           |                   |            |          |
|--------------|--|-----|--------|------------------------------|------------------|------------------------------|--------|------------------|----------|--|------------------|-----------------------|--------|------------------|-----------|-------------------|------------|----------|
|              |  |     |        | Price                        | Total            | Price                        | Total  | Price            | Total    | Price                                      | Total            |                       |        |                  |           |                   |            |          |
| 1            | Lesco Professional Turf Fertilizer 18-0-18 or Equivalent | 280 | BAGS   | 19.40                        | 5,432.00         |                              | 16.50  | 4,620.00         |          | 14.99                                      | 4,196.64         | AWD                   | 15.10  | 4,228.00         |           | 4,196.640         |            |          |
| 2            | Lesco Florida Friendly Fertilizer or Equivalent          | 300 | GALS   | 9.01                         | 2,703.00         |                              | No Bid | No Bid           |          | 8.98                                       | 2,692.80         | AWD                   | 18.58  | 5,575.20         |           | 2,692.800         |            |          |
| 3            | Lesco Carbon Pro-L or Equivalent                         | 40  | GALS   | 132.50                       | 5,300.00         | AWD                          | No Bid | No Bid           |          | No Bid                                     | No Bid           |                       | 17.75  | 710.08           | C-REJ     | 5,300.000         | Low -REJ   |          |
| 4            | Dow Dimension 2EW – Herbicide or Equivalent              | 15  | GALS   | 215.50                       | 3,232.50         | B1                           | AWD    | 231.50           | 3,472.50 |  | 215.50           | 3,232.50              | B      | 215.50           | 3,232.50  | B                 | 3,232.500  | Tie Bids |
| 5            | Tribute Total or Equivalent                              | 48  | OUNCES | 60.00                        | 2,880.00         |                              | 58.80  | 2,822.40         | A-1      | AWD  | 60.00            | 2,880.00              |        | 60.00            | 2,880.00  |                   | 2,822.400  |          |
| 6            | Lesco Methylated Seed Oil or Equivalent                  | 30  | GALS   | 21.24                        | 637.20           |                              | 38.00  | 1,140.00         |          | 16.80                                      | 504.00           |                       | 14.38  | 431.52           | AWD       | 431.520           |            |          |
| 7            | Solugreen Ammonium Sufate 21-0-0 or Equivalent           | 12  | BAGS   | 16.90                        | 202.80           |                              | 21.00  | 252.00           |          | 12.85                                      | 154.20           |                       | 11.97  | 143.64           | AWD       | 143.640           |            |          |
| 8            | Topchoice Insecticide or Equivalent                      | 60  | BAGS   | 139.00                       | 8,340.00         |                              | 139.00 | 8,340.00         |          | 126.50                                     | 7,590.00         | B                     | 126.50 | 7,590.00         | B, Dt     | 7,590.000         | Tie Bids   |          |
| 9            | Triple Crown T&O Insecticide or Equivalent               | 30  | GALS   | 260.00                       | 7,800.00         |                              | 255.00 | 7,650.00         |          | AWD  | 260.00           | 7,800.00              |        | 260.00           | 7,800.00  |                   | 7,650.000  |          |
| 10           | Acelepryn Insecticide or Equivalent                      | 4   | GALS   | 2,023.00                     | 8,092.00         | B1                           | AWD    | No Bid           | No Bid   |  | 2,023.00         | 8,092.00              | B      | 2,023.00         | 8,092.00  | A-2, B            | 8,092.000  | Tie Bids |
| 11           | Daconil Action Flowable Fungicide or Equivalent          | 40  | GALS   | 81.00                        | 3,240.00         | B1                           | AWD    | 81.00            | 3,240.00 |  | 81.00            | 3,240.00              | B      | 81.00            | 3,240.00  | B                 | 3,240.000  | Tie Bids |
| 12           | Heritage Action Fungicide or Equivalent                  | 5   | LBS    | 333.00                       | 1,665.00         | B1                           | AWD    | 333.00           | 1,665.00 |  | 333.00           | 1,665.00              | B      | 333.00           | 1,665.00  | B                 | 1,665.000  | Tie Bids |
| 13           | Mirimichi Green Cardonizpn Soil Enhancer or Equi         | 20  | Tons   | 672.46                       | 13,449.20        |                              | No Bid | No Bid           |          | 540.00                                     | 10,800.00        | AWD                   | No Bid | No Bid           |           | 10,800.000        |            |          |
| 14           | Bayer Revolver Herbicide or Equivalent                   | 21  | JUGS   | 595.00                       | 12,495.00        |                              | 588.50 | 12,358.50        |          | AWD  | 595.00           | 12,495.00             |        | 595.00           | 12,495.00 |                   | 12,358.500 |          |
| 15           | Tiger 90CR Sulphur 0-0-0-90 or Equivalent                | 40  | BAGS   | 14.99                        | 599.60           |                              | No Bid | No Bid           |          | 16.42                                      | 656.80           |                       | 12.38  | 495.20           | AWD       | 495.200           |            |          |
| 16           | Lesco Professional Turf Fertilizer 0-0-20 or Equival     | 100 | BAGS   | 17.40                        | 1,740.00         |                              | No Bid | No Bid           |          | 13.69                                      | 1,369.28         |                       | 13.53  | 1,353.00         | AWD       | 1,353.000         |            |          |
| 17           | Lesco Tracker Spray Indicator Dye or Equivalent          | 28  | JUGS   | 44.28                        | 1,239.84         | AWD                          | 70.00  | 1,960.00         |          | 61.77                                      | 1,729.56         |                       | 96.84  | 2,711.52         |           | 1,239.840         |            |          |
| 18           | Roundup ProMax Herbicide or Equivalent                   | 30  | JUGS   | 56.95                        | 1,708.50         |                              | 64.45  | 1,933.50         |          | No Bid                                     | No Bid           |                       | 51.34  | 1,540.07         | A-3       | 1,540.074         |            |          |
| 19           | SureGuard SC Herbicide or Equivalent                     | 64  | OUNCES | 8.61                         | 550.91           | AWD                          | 8.61   | 550.95           |          | 8.61                                       | 550.95           |                       | 8.61   | 550.95           |           | 550.912           |            |          |
| 20           | Lesco CrossXCheck Plus or Equivalent                     | 20  | GALS   | 39.99                        | 799.80           | AWD                          | 41.63  | 832.60           |          | 51.72                                      | 1,034.40         |                       | 45.00  | 900.00           |           | 799.800           |            |          |
| 21           | PRO Limestone Pelleted or Equivalent                     | 20  | BAGS   | 7.61                         | 152.20           | AWD                          | No Bid | No Bid           |          | 14.39                                      | 287.80           |                       | 8.06   | 161.20           |           | 152.200           |            |          |
| <b>TOTAL</b> |  |     |        |                              | <b>82,259.55</b> |                              |        | <b>50,837.45</b> |          |  | <b>70,970.93</b> |                       |        | <b>65,794.88</b> |           | <b>76,346.026</b> |            |          |

Incomplete

Incomplete

Incomplete

Total per low responsive, responsible vendor

**24,272.252**

**22,830.90**

**17,689.44**

**11,553.43**

**76,346.026**

Incomplete - Vendor did not bid on all items.

A-1 Correction in addition (unit price quoted for 6 ounces, unit price requested for one ounce)

A-2 Correction in addition (unit price quoted for half gallon, price requested price for one gallon)

A-3 Vendor quoted price for 2.5 gallon (unit price requested for 1.67 gallon)

B Tie Bids

B1 Tie broken by date and time quote received.

Dt Tie broken by delivery time after receipt of purchase order

C Item 3, Vendor offered product that was not equal to specifications.

REJ - Reject

AWD- Awarded, 03/16/2020

Revised 3/16/2020

