ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT COMMERCIAL/RESIDENTIAL ABATEMENT PROJECTS

Vendor Registry Quote# EE DEMOLITIONS 2019-11-21

Open Date: 11/22/2019 Close Date:  11/26/2019 2:00 p.m.
Walk Through Date: 11-22-19 8:30 a.m.
Emerald Larry Gates Meadows
Purchase Coast Demo Const. HHH Const | Webster Const. Maint. Demo
Project Address Order # Bid Amount |Bid Amount [Bid Amount |Bid Amount Bid Amount |Bid Amount
1 |821 FREEDOM RD., CENTURY NO BID| $20,000.00[ $25,000.00 $18,500.00| $10,800.00| $11,000.00
2 |591 LENGO ST. $13,850.00] $12,000.00[ $12,500.00) $9,000.00 $8,500.00] $8,000.00
3 |1531 BEDGOOD LN. $8,773.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $6,000.00] $9,000.00
4 16962 ROLLING HILLS RD. NO BID $8,500.00! $8,600.00 $16,000.00] $12,275.00, $12,000.00
5 (5501 PIPELINE RD. NO BID| $9,350.00[ $12,700.00 $19,000.00 $9,700.00] $9,500.00
8 |5 FLYNN DR. $8,112.00[ $12,000.00) $9,957.00 $10,000.00 $6,600.00] $6,450.00
9 |112 BRIGADIER ST. NO BID $8,000.00| $11,295.00 $11,000.00 $8,600.00|  $8,200.00
10 (11 COUSINEAU RD $8,248.00 $5,450.00 $6,900.00 $12,500.00 $5,500.00] $6,000.00
11 (209 S 2ND ST. $8,698.00 $7,500.00 $6,404.00 $9,700.00 $5,400.00] $5,000.00
12 (4953 MARTHA AVE $9,268.00 $6,400.00 $6,548.00 $10,000.00 $6,700.00] $6,500.00
13 |4100 LILLIAN HWY NOBID| $19,000.00| $35,000.00) $17,000.00 $7,800.00 $7,500.00
14 (4450 MOBILE HWY $16,667.00] $25,000.00| $26,072.00 $37,000.00| $13,000.00| $12,000.00
15 (3803 W LEE ST. $8,904.00( $20,000.00| $6,844.00 $7,800.00 $4,700.00] $4,500.00
16 (3310 W DESOTO ST. $11,216.00| $18,000.00| $14,780.00 $23,000.00 $6,200.00 $6,000.00
17 |2909 W LEE ST. $16,038.00] $25,000.00[ $27,126.00) $37,000.00| $12,000.00| $11,800.00
18 (2219 W BOBE ST $6,820.00 $4,750.00 $4,800.00 $7,500.00 $4,900.00| $4,850.00
19 (2201 WARREN JERNIGAN PL $12,206.00] $13,000.00[ $14,085.00) $15,000.00 $9,700.00{ $9,000.00

RESULTS ARE UNDER REVIEW AND NOT FINAL UNTIL ALL INSURANCE AND PERMITTING REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN
CONFIRMED DO NOT COMMENCE ANY WORK OR OBTAIN ANY PERMITS UNITL YOUR PURCHASE ORDER HAS BEEN

RECEIVED FROM ESCAMBIA COUNTY.

CONSENT



