



CITY OF KNOXVILLE

OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
CITY OF KNOXVILLE, TENNESSEE

QUOTE TABULATION FORM

DATE: August 29, 2018 TITLE: Public Space Furniture

DEPARTMENT: Public Service

	BBNSports	Columbia Cascade Company	Bliss Products	Contract Furniture Alliance	Park Warehouse	Grounds for Play	Howdy Equipment
Metal ADA Picnic Table- 46" Round, Black	884.98	2,940	950.00	761.73	572.73	835	N/A
Metal Picnic Table- 46" Round, Black	899.98	3,290	980.00	841.32	603.44	839	N/A
Bench without Back- 8', Black	799.98	1,455	885.00 or 1,300.00	1,427.50	1,180.93	1,303	1,270
Bench without Back- 6', Black	699.98	1,185	915.00 1,070.00	1,224.00	940.93	815	1,095
Concrete Cube Bench Dimension 19" x 17" x 18"	No Bid	N/A	420	450.25	444.81	N/A	N/A
Concrete Bench Dimension 48" x 18" x 18"	No Bid	N/A	640	683.10	561.24	N/A	N/A
Concrete Bench Dimension 95" x 24" x 18"	No Bid	N/A	No Bid	977.43	622.46	N/A	N/A

I CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE TABULATION OF THE BIDS THAT WERE RECEIVED

Julie [Signature]