
ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT
COMMERCIAL/RESIDENTIAL ABATEMENT PROJECTS
WALK-THROUGH 12/20/19 BID DATE 12/3019

PROJECTS SOUTHERN MEADOWS BONNERS SULA ENGLISH COLLINS ALFRED CAS ANDALA

GIRL MAINT HAULING ENERGY BRO’S LAND MORRIS ENT

603 S 2ND AVE $500.00 $750.00 $900.00 $850.00 $850.00 $680.00 $475.00 $450.00 $645.00
1290 MILLS AVE. $1,800.00 $2,000.00 $1,750.00 NO BID $1,850.00 $2,700.00 $3,105.00 $2,500.00 $1,825.00
1007 BARTOW AVE. $2,700.00 $2,500.00 $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID $2,500.00 $1,752.00 $2,750.00 $1,940.00
2800 DONLEY ST. $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,500.00 NO BID $900.00 $1,275.00 $1,800.00 $785.00

5 HAVEN CT. $6,500.00 $8,000.00 $3,800.00 NO BID N0 BID $8,500.00 $7,828.00 $6,500.00 $3,150.00

19 PEN HAVEN DR. $3,500.00 $2,900.00 $3,000.00 NO BID $774.00 $1,700.00 $4,111.00 $1,500.00 $1,175.00

39 PEN HAVEN DR. $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $6,500.00 NO BID $677.00 $10,500.00 NO BID $8,500.00 $2,560.00

70 NORWOOD DR. $2,200.00 $4,000.00 $4,500.00 NO BID $2,789.00 $5,000.00 $775.00 $5,500.00 $1,590.00

3700 MOBILE HWY $10,500.00 $7,200.00 $5,500.00 NO BID $8,125.00 $8,500.00 $12,325.00 $10,000.00 $5,600.00
1016 N Q ST. $10,500.00 $2,700.00 $4,500.00 NO BID $1,376.00 $1,200.00 $3,000.00 $1,250.00 $1,495.00
1503 W LAKEVIEW AVE. $3,500.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 NO BID $1,376.00 $4,800.00 NO BID $6,000.00 $1,940.00
2209 W JORDAN ST. $500.00 $350.00 $900.00 $1,200.00 $546.00 $600.00 $1,325.00 $850.00 $945.00
2402 W JORDAN ST. $2,800.00 $2,900.00 $2,500.00 NO BID $1,774.00 $2,500.00 $1,635.00 $2,200.00 $925.00

700 W YONGE ST. PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED

923 ARTESIAN AVE $1,200.00 $225.00 $850.00 $950.00 $674.00 $400.00 $675.00 $450.00 NO BID

6296 RAMBLER DR $15,000.00 $5,800.00 $5,750.00 NO BID $9,724.00 $9,500.00 NO BID $5,950.00 NO BID

749 BROOK MEADOW LN $1,800.00 $3,200.00 $2,500.00 NO BID $724.00 $1,950.00 $3,175.00 $1,500.00 NO BID

8512 POND AVE $600.00 $400.00 $750.00 $850.00 $624.00 $700.00 $500.00 $800.00 NO BID
7434 CORA LN PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED PULLED
7501 STILLER LAKE RD $1,800.00 $700.00 $2,850.00 $1,500.00 $2,274.00 $1,950.00 $1,025.00 $1,500.00 NO BID
4451 BRIDGET LN $1,500.00 $3,500.00 $900.00 NO BID $875.00 $3,800.00 $3,200.00 $5,000.00 NO BID
228 CHEROKEE TRL $500.00 $375.00 $900.00 $850.00 $774.00 $400.00 $1,105.00 $850.00 $780.00

224 EDISON DR. $2,300.00 $1,700.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $524.00 $2,700.00 $3,705.00 $2,000.00 $3,200.00

308 GARFIELD DR $1,200.00 $375.00 $1,700.00 $1,200.00 $1,874.00 $650.00 $699.00 $750.00 $880.00

1029 WEBSTER DR. $5,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,500.00 $1,500.00 $786.00 $1,350.00 $408.00 $1,200.00 $825.00 NED
1203 EDISON DR. $400.00 $325.00 $700.00 $1,200.00 $524.00 $500.00 $325.00 $750.00 $160.00

1231 RIO GRANDE CIR $400.00 $200.00 $700.00 $750.00 $317.00 $175.00 $500.00 NO BID $160.00
1270 CHEYENNED CIR $300.00 $300.00 $700.00 $850.00 $374.00 $175.00 $500.00 NO BID $160.00
313 MASS AVE $700.00 $1,300.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $1,074.00 $1,200.00 $3,232.00 NO BID $1,375.00
1304 N GREEN ST. NO BID $600.00 $1,500.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $500.00 NO BID NO BID $625.00

RESULTS ARE UNDER REVIEW AND NOT FINAL UNTIL ALL INSURANCE AND PERMITTING REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN CONFIRMED

DO NOT COMMENCE ANY WORK OR OBTAIN ANY PERMITS UNTIL YOUR PURCHASE ORDER HAS BEEN RECEIVED FROM

ESCAMBIA COUNTY 


