OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
DATE: 9/18/2018 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
QUOTE TABULATION FORM

QUOTE BOC #:
QUOTE ON: Police Recruit  Leathergear
DEPARTMENT: Police
AWARDED 7O :
|

BIDDERS Baton | Holder Handcuffs Flashlight Charger
GT Distributors $102.81 ! $17.35 No Bid $127.03 $38.63
Summit Uniform $118.95 $26.52 $22.53 $105.99 $44.78
Galts $123.65 $28.00 $20.61 $150.00
NAFECO $151.00 $33.75 $26.00 $153.00 $44.00

No Bid $19.71 $127.83 $106.80

Ltawmen's & Shooters $101.01
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Lawmen's & Shooters | No Bid
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I CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE
TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 9/18/2018 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
QUOTE TABULATION FORM
QUOTE DOC #:
QUOTE ON: Police Recruit  Leathergear
DEPARTMENT: Paolice
AWARDED TO :
|
I
BIDDERS Holder for Flashlight | Whistle Rubber Guard Inner Beit Outer Beit
I
GT Distributor $34.52 No Bid No Bid $10.91 $24.64
Summit Uniform $39.98 $8.39 $2.28 $10.24 $23.14
Galls $42.00 $5.00 No Bid $12.00 $24.00
NAFECO $44.00 $6.60 $1.00 $14.00 $30.00
tawmen & Shooters $36.99 $5.45 $11.58 No Bid No Bid

Lawmen & Shooters

Must order 12

Must order 12

t CERTIFY THAT THIS 15 A TRUE AND ACCURATE

TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.
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OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT

DATE: 9/18/2018 CITY OF KNOXVILLE TENNESSEE
QUOTE TABULATION FORM
QUOTE DOC #:
QUOTE ON: Police Recruit  Leathergear
DEPARTMENT: Police
AWARDED TO:
i
| 4 Pack
BIDDERS Hoister | Magazine Poudcl Handcuff Pouch Keepers Spray Carrier
_
GT Distributor $92.93 $29.89 $21.73 $8.04 No Bid
Summit Uniform $119.07 $31.20 $20.41 $7.54 $18.48
Galls $119.19 $35.14 $21.00 $10.00 $24.00
NAFECO $130.00 $40.55 $26.00 $10.00 $24.50
No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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{ CERTIFY THAT THIS IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE

TABULATION OF THE QUOTES THAT WERE RECEIVED.




