Quote Tabulation

RFQ 2018-643

Electric Warehouse Inventory
Opened January 16, 2018, 1:00 PM

Purchase order issued to: GrayBar and Western United (specific items by vendor are those which are not colored in the price column)

BORDER STATES GRAYBAR STUART C IRBY WESTERN UNITED
Item Description Quantity Unit Brand Price Each Total Delivery Brand Price Each Total Delivery Brand Price Each Total Delivery Brand Price Each Total Delivery
12 to 14 Week
1 |crossplate Anchor Joslyn 13524-3/4 20 each J0s $ 65.15 | $ 1,303.00 No Bid Maclean 68.17 | $ 1,363.40 | C RO €€ | Hubbell $ 4425 | $ 885.00 Stock
2 - 3 Week:
2 |3/8 Guy Wire-250’ coils 3/8 HS Class A 1000 feet GUY S 038 (S 378.21 National Strand S 0.41 410.00 AROee s Alanware 047 |$ 466.00 | 3 Weeks ARO |National Standard | $ 0.29 | $ 290.00 Stock
) X 5 to 8 Weeks
3 |8 ft Fiberglass Maclean GCC15-96R 50 each MPS S 29.12 [ $ 1,456.00 Grid Power Prod S 21.23 1,061.50 | 8 Weeks ARO Maclean 26.81 (S 1,340.50 P Aluma Form S 19.25 | $ 962.50 Stock
5 to 8 Week:
4 |% x 8 Three Eye Anchor Rods Joslyn 17328 50 each MPS S 2568 | $ 1,284.00 Grid Power Prod S 15.20 760.00 | 8 Weeks ARO Maclean 24.76 | S 1,238.00 oARoee s Hubbell S 16.00 | $ 800.00 Stock
X 6 to 8 Weeks
5 |3/8 Guy Preforms Preform GDE-1107 200 each PRF S 264 (S 528.00 Grid Power Prod S 2.08 416.00 | 1 Week ARO Preformed 274 |$ 548.00 P Preform S 214 (S 428.00 Stock
X . 5 to 8 Weeks
6 |Poly Riser Arrestor MPS ZRP010-0C00100 15 each MPS S 4182 | S 627.30 No Bid Maclean 4336 | $ 650.40 P Hubbell S 3350 (S 502.50 2-3 Weeks ARO
X 5 to 8 Weeks
7 |9kV Arrestor 50 each CHN S 3338 | $ 1,669.00 Grid Power Prod S 25.34 1,267.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 33.28 (S 1,664.00 P Hubbell S 27.50 | S 1,375.00 3-5 Weeks ARO
X 5 to 8 Weeks
8 |[5/8 x 20” DA Bolt 100 each CHN S 336 (S 336.00 Grid Power Prod S 2.03 203.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 2.87|$ 287.00 P Aluma Form S 240 (S 240.00 2-3 Weeks ARO
X 5 to 8 Weeks
9 |[5/8 x 22” DA Bolt 100 each CHN S 353 (S 353.00 Grid Power Prod S 2.14 214.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 293 (S 293.00 P Aluma Form S 255 (S 255.00 2-3 Weeks ARO
o . 5 to 8 Weeks
10 |5/8 x 10” Oval Eye Bolt 100 each CHN S 4.01|S$  401.00 Grid Power Prod S 2.20 220.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 336 (S 336.00 D Hubbell S 290 (S 290.00 Stock
” . 5 to 8 Weeks
11 |5/8 x 12” Oval Eye Bolt 100 each CHN S 412 |S  412.00 Grid Power Prod S 231 231.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 381 (S 381.00 D Hubbell S 3.10 S 310.00 Stock
” . 5 to 8 Weeks
12 |5/8 x 14” Oval Eye Bolt 50 each CHN S 429|S$ 21450 Grid Power Prod S 2.48 124.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 3.03($S 151.50 D Hubbell S 3.28 (S 164.00 Stock
" . 5 to 8 Weeks
13 |5/8 x 16” Oval Eye Bolt 50 each CHN S 456 |S  228.00 Grid Power Prod S 2.70 135.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 344 (S 172.00 D Hubbell S 362 181.00 Stock
" . . 5 to 8 Weeks
14 |5/8 x 16” Machine Bolt 100 each CHN S 2.00(S$ 200.00 Grid Power Prod S 1.52 152.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 181 ($ 181.00 D Hubbell S 157 |$ 157.00 Stock
5 to 8 Week:
15 [Crossarm Saddle Pin Hubbell HPS 14322 100 each CHN S 17.24 | $ 1,724.00 Grid Power Prod S 13.51 1,351.00 | 8 Weeks ARO Maclean 17.26 | $ 1,726.00 OAROEE s Hubbell S 13.45 | $ 1,345.00 2-3 Weeks ARO
5 to 8 Week:
16 |Pole Top Pin Chance C206-106/18” L 1” Thread 100 each CHN S 8.14 S  814.00 Grid Power Prod S 7.43 743.00 | 1 Week ARO Hubbell 8.15 (S 815.00 ° AROEE s Hubbell S 7.15 (S 715.00 2-3 Weeks ARO
” . 5 to 8 Weeks
17 |% x 4” Lag Screw 200 each CHN S 0.69 |$ 138.00 Grid Power Prod S 0.38 76.00 | 1Week ARO Maclean 072 S 144.00 D Hubbell S 0.56 | S 112.00 Stock
3 -4 Week: 5 to 7 Week:
18 |60” Span Brace J4730A or RAGO18 100 each No Bid Alumaform $ 16.10 1,610.00 AR ge s Aluma Form 16.96 | $ 1,696.00 | °'° AR oee * |Aluma Form $ 14.25 | $ 1,425.00 | 3-4 Weeks ARO
” o q . 5 to 8 Weeks
19 |18” Fiberglass Ext C-C, E 25 each No Bid No Bid Maclean 19.88 | $ 497.00 ARO Hughes S 1065 | $ 266.25 2-3 Weeks ARO
. 5 to 8 Weeks
20 |5/8 Oval Eyenut 100 each MPS S 1.86 | $  186.00 Grid Power Prod S 1.18 118.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 161 (S 161.00 D Hubbell S 130 S 130.00 Stock
. 8 to 10 Weeks
21 |HDSO-47 Deadend Shoe 6-2/0 100 each MPS S 10.10 | $ 1,010.00 Grid Power Prod S 6.48 648.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 847 |S 847.00 e McClean S 8.20 (S 820.00 Stock
. 5 to 8 Weeks
22 |2x2 Square Washers 1000 each CHN S 0.38|S$  380.00 Grid Power Prod S 0.20 200.00 | 1 Week ARO Maclean 0.27 | S 270.00 D Hubbell S 0.26 | S 260.00 Stock
$13,642.01 $0.00 9,939.50 S 15,227.80 S 11,913.25
Total Bid Comparison Including 5% NM State Preference: $12,959.91 $0.00 9,442.53 S 14,466.41 S 11,317.59
Total Bid Comparison Including 10% Resident Veteran Preference N/A N/A N/A N/A N /A




