Traffic Division - ADA Curb Ramp Upgrades C. Bargaineer Gulf Beach
BID VERIFICATION Construction | Construction
Bid Item
No. |item Unit Unit Price Unit Price
1 New Curb Ramp installed Plus Mobilization EA NO BID $700.00
2 Install 4' Fiber Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk LF NO BID $17.00
3 Install 5' Fiber Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk LF NO BID $21.00
4 Install 6' Fiber Reinforced Concrete Sidewalk LF NO BID $25.00
5 Install Curb and Gutter LF NO BID $17.00
6 ADA warning mats, surface mount, installed 2x3 EA NO BID $150.00
7 Mobilization/Demobilization multiple sites EA NO BID $400.00
8 Remove existing sidewalk up to 6" thick SY NO BID $10.00
9 Remove & Repour by Hand Existing Broken Curb & Gutter LF NO BID $20.00
10 Remove Existing concrete SY NO BID $10.00
11 Remove Existing Curb LF NO BID $5.00
12 Dirt & Soil (Earth work CcY NO BID $18.00
13 Saw Cut Existing Concrete Up to 6" thick LF NO BID $3.00
14 Sod SY NO BID $4.00
15 Erosion control silt fence, type Il LF NO BID $2.00
16 Erosion control silt fence, type IV LF NO BID $4.50
17 Hay bale Installed EA NO BID $16.00
18 Seed & Mulch SY NO BID $2.00

BIDS VERIFIED ON March 23, 2020 BY:

Don Christian
Program Manager
Escambia County Engineering Department - Traffic Division

Chris Bargaineer
Construction's bid is
considered a "NO BID"
because they did not use
the revised bid tab that was
uploaded onto Vendor
Registry on 3/16/2020




