ESCAMBIA COUNTY ENVIRONMENTAL ENFORCEMENT
COMMERCIAL/RESIDENTIAL ABATEMENT PROJECTS

EE LOTS 2020-3-19
WALK-THROUGH 3/19/2020
BID DATE: 3/24/20202

PROJECTS

1096 RIVER ANNEX RD
7911 MOBILE HWY.

6135 N BLUE ANGEL PKWY
1377 RULE ST.

8001 UNTREINER AVE
8722 CHEMSTRAND RD
8415 LOFTON DR

8 PLEASANT AVE

206 LOUSIANNA DR

933 NEW WARRINGTON RD
121 LOVETT PL

5405 ADMIRAL DOYLE RD
30 TEAKWOOD DR

21 N MERRITT ST

1109 MILLS AVE

801 DECATUR AVE

908 CALHOUN AVE

1610 BLAKELY AVE.

1600 BLK BLAKELY AVE
1614 BLAKELY AVE

19 N JAMAICA ST

22 LINCOLN RD

35 N CARVER DR

12 MINDORO CIR

700 EDWARDS

CASTELLANI
HAULING

$3,400.00
$3,700.00
$12,000.00
NO BID
$7,000.00
$5,400.00
PULLED
$2,100.00
$1,800.00
$15,000.00
$8,400.00
$1,700.00
$3,000.00
$900.00
$1,300.00
$600.00
$800.00
$1,200.00
$1,200.00
$1,200.00
$700.00
$700.00
$1,000.00
$700.00
$1,800.00

WELT
DEMO

$3,149.00
$2,149.00
$8,200.00
$5,800.00
$3,849.00
$4,249.00
PULLED
$1,649.00
$5,349.00
NO BID
$5,349.00
$1,649.00
$2,000.00
$450.00
NO BID
NO BID
$450.00
$350.00
$450.00
$550.00
$350.00
$350.00
$850.00
NO BID
NO BID

MEADOWS
MAINT

$4,700.00
$1,800.00
$5,500.00
$3,700.00
$4,000.00
$6,500.00
PULLED
$4,200.00
$2,300.00
$9,000.00
$3,000.00
$1,700.00
$1,100.00
$400.00
$900.00
$3,000.00
$200.00
$500.00
$200.00
$500.00
$300.00
$200.00
$300.00
$600.00
$1,700.00

BR

SULA

BONNERS ENERGY

$2,650.00
$3,500.00
$7,500.00
$3,000.00
NO BID
$5,000.00
PULLED
$2,500.00
$2,850.00
$8,500.00
$2,850.00
$1,500.00
$1,250.00
$1,000.00
$1,600.00
$2,000.00
$950.00
$1,000.00
$1,000.00
$1,000.00
$650.00
$750.00
$1,000.00
$900.00
$1,475.00

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
PULLED
NO BID
$2,500.00
NO BID
NO BID
$2,500.00
$1,200.00
$1,450.00
$1,850.00
NO BID
$650.00
$1,200.00
$1,000.00
$1,800.00
$1,500.00
$1,400.00
$1,000.00
$850.00
NO BID

COMMON
AREA

$4,200.00
$2,750.00
$5,100.00
$4,000.00
$3,500.00
$7,500.00
PULLED
$4,500.00
$2,500.00
$8,799.00
$3,500.00
$2,000.00
$1,500.00
$400.00
$1,500.00
$3,250.00
$300.00
$500.00
$300.00
$600.00
$400.00
$300.00
$600.00
$1,200.00
$1,750.00

BEACH BUM COLLINS
RENOVATION LAND CLEAR

$2,745.00 NO BID
$2,650.00 $1,850.00
$11,000.00 $3,200.00
$3,300.00 NO BID
$3,000.00 NO BID
$3,500.00 $1,800.00
PULLED PULLED
$2,450.00 $1,450.00
$600.00 $300.00
$17,500.00 $9,500.00
NO BID NO BID
$450.00 $400.00
$240.00 $1,200.00
$200.00 $180.00
$320.00 $750.00
$145.00 $225.00
$170.00 $225.00
$240.00 $200.00
$195.00 $200.00
$240.00 $200.00
$170.00 $325.00
$170.00 $200.00
$600.00 $200.00
$195.00 $650.00
$645.00 $1,500.00

RESULTS ARE UNDER REVIEW AND NOT FINAL UNTIL ALL INSURANCE AND PERMITTING REQUIREMENTS HAVE BEEN CONFIRMED
DO NOT COMMENCE ANY WORK OR OBTAIN ANY PERMITS UNTIL YOUR PURCHASE ORDER HAS BEEN RECEIVED FROM

ESCAMBIA COUNTY
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