Florence County EMS RFQ 02-17/18

Henry L_owest
MMS Boundtree Schein Lowest Quoted Quoted
MFEG PN Item Description UoM Medical Medical Medical Quad Med Moore Medical EMP Vermed Price Vendor
YANKAUER SUCTION TIP Boundtree
16107 W/VENT 20/BX BX $ 7.00| $ 6.80 | $ 9.60 | $ 840 $ 63.40 7.25 $ 6.80 Medical
SMART CAPNOLINE + CO2
ORAL/NASAL
ADULT/INTUBATED Boundtree
010210 [\eor connpcTorw/oz| FA | $ 1144]8 869 |$ 1055|$ 10.15 $ 8.69 |10 o
TUBING 100/BX
MICROSTREAM BRAND
FILTERLINE SET, CO2
SAMPLING LINE, NON Boundtree
010579 HUMIDIFIED, INTUBATED EA $ 10371 $ 797 |1 $ 882 % 9.20 $ 7.97 Medical
ADULT/PEDIATRIC 50/CS
MICROSTREAM BRAND
NEEDLE 20GA X 1" Boundtree
NN-2025R 100/BX BX $ 2771 $ 2711 % 3.06 | % 299 [ $ 5.18 3.55 $ 2.71 Medical
NEEDLE 21GA X 1" Boundtree
8881 100/BX BX $ 2771 $ 2641 % 306 $ 299 [ $ 5.18 3.55 $ 2.64 Medical
Boundtree
4806 SUCTION CATHETER 6F EA $ 0171 $ 012 | $ 0201 % 022 (% 0.25 0.13 $ 0.12 Medical
4808  |SUCTION CATHETER 8F EA |$  017|$ 012|$ 020 $ 022 | $ 0.25 0.13 $ 0.12 Eﬂoe‘:jr;ggee
4812  |SUCTION CATHETER 12F EA |$  017|$ 012|$ 020 $ 022 | $ 0.25 0.13 $ 0.12 Eﬂoe‘:jr;ggee
4814  |SUCTION CATHETER 14F EA |$  017]$ 012|$ 020 $ 022 | $ 0.25 0.13 $ 0.12 Eﬂoe‘:jr;ggee
4816  |SUCTION CATHETER 16F EA |$  017|$ 012|$ 020 $ 022 | $ 0.25 0.13 $ 0.12 Eﬂoe‘g;g;lree
PAPER FOR PHILIPS MRX Boundtree
9.89803E+11 MONITOR BX $ 7483 $ 4395 $ 4580 | $ 79.00 | $ 48.14 370.00 [ $ 165.00 | $ 43.95 Medical
Adult Nebulizer w/tee Boundtree
1882 tubing and mouth piece. BX $ 31.00( $ 3000 |$ 5250 | $ 38.00 | $ 50.00 33.75 $ 30.00 .
Medical
50/bx
Protectiv Acuvance Safety Boundtree
3358 Cath 142X2" 50/bx EA $ 211 $ 195 | $ 198 | $ 2331 9% 2.99 1.90 $ 1.95 Medical
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Henry Lowest
MMS Boundtree Schein Lowest Quoted Quoted
MFG PN  Item Description UOM Medical Medical Medical Quad Med Moore Medical EMP Vermed Price Vendor
Green Line Miller Boundtree
5-5333-00 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 0 BX $ 7460 | $ 6960 |$ 8540 $ 83.80 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 Medical
premature 20/bx
Green Line Miller Boundtree
5-5333-01 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 1 BX $ 7460 | $ 69.60 | $ 85.40 | $ 8380 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 .
. Medical
infant 20/bx
Green Line Miller Boundtree
5-5333-02 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 2 BX $ 7460 | $ 6960 |$ 8540 $ 83.80 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 .
. Medical
child 20/bx
Green Line Miller Boundtree
5-5333-03 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 3 BX $ 7460 | $ 6960 |$ 8540 $ 83.80 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 .
) Medical
Adult Medium 20/bx
Green Line Miller Boundtree
5-5333-04 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 4 BX $ 7460 | $ 6960 |$ 8540 $ 83.80 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 .
Medical
Adult Large 20/bx
Green Line Macintosh Boundtree
5-5332-01 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 1 BX $ 7460 | $ 6960 |$ 8540 $ 83.80 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 .
Medical
Infant 20/bx
Green Line Macintosh Boundtree
5-5332-02 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 2 BX $ 7460 | $ 6960 |$ 8540 $ 83.80 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 .
. Medical
Child 20/bx
Green Line Macintosh Boundtree
5-5332-03 |Laryngoscope Blade Size 3 BX $ 7460 | $ 6960 |$ 8540 $ 83.80 | $ 11240 | $ 72.50 $ 69.60 .
Medical
Adult M_ed 20/b_x
5-5332-04 |0recn Line Macintosh BX |$ 7460|$% 6960 |$ 8540 |S$ 8380 |$ 11240 | $ 7250 $ 69.60 | oounctree
Larvngoscope Blade Size 4 Medical
MICRO MIST NEBULIZER Boundtree
301-203 W/ELONGATED CS $ 51911 $ 4050 | $ 9150 | $ 42.50 272.5/case of 20 $ 40.50 Medical
PEDIATRIC AEROSOL
Please price LG
) Alcohol Pads 200/bx 26.20/CS-Med 1.41 Med 26.20/CS-Med |Boundtree
& MZS‘;E; NO 150bxs/cs €S |8 2670\ j9gpics-1g|® 20009 28.80 2.95 Lg 49.80/CS-Lg  |Medical
BIG-A  |Bone Injection Gun Adult EA NoBid |$ 6365|$ 67.27|$ 71.75 | $ 7464 | $ 65.00 $ 63.65 Eﬂoe%?g;[ee
EXTRICATION COLLAR Boundtree
000281000 [ADJUSTABLE 16 SETTINGS CS $ 15965| $ 14580 [ $ 14730 $ 150.90 | $ 17430 | $ 147.50 $ 145.80 Medical

30/CS ACE PERFIT AMRBII
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EXTRICATION COLLAR Bounditree
000281106 [ADJUSTABLE PEDIATRIC CS $ 15965( $ 14580 | $ 147301 $ 167.70 | $ 17430 | $ 147.50 $ 145.80 Medical
30/CS ACE MINI
AMBU SPUR II BVM Bounditree
530213000B |PEDIATRIC W/ TODDLER EA $ 13.20| $ 12.00 | $ 1236 | $ 195.00 | $ 167.28 | $ 15.00 $ 12.00 .
Medical
MASK 12/CS
Saline Flush Syringe 10ml . Boundtree
2T0806 100/bx 4BX/CS BX $ 2860 $ 31.00 [ $ 31.02 No Bid $ 4628 | $ 33.00 $ 31.00 Medical
123124  |NPASIZe 24FRLATEXFREE| gy 1 ¢ 2050|s  1070|$ 2410 s 16.00 | $ 2160 | $ 11.37 $ 10.70 |Boundtree
10/bx Medical
123132 |NPASiZe SZFRLATEXEFREE| oy | ¢ oh50] ¢ 1070 | $ 2410 $ 16.00 | $ 21.60 | $ 11.37 $ 10.70 |Boundtree
10/bx Medical
123136  |\PASize 36FR Latex Free BX |$ 2050|$ 1070 | $ 2410 $ 16.00 | $ 21.60 | $ 11.37 $ 10.70 |Boundtree
10/bx Medical
Suction Catheter 18FR coil
Boundtree
4818 packed w/ control valve. CS $ 850 $ 6.00 | $ 9.65 | $ 11.00 $ 6.35 $ 6.00 .
50/cs Medical
4810 SUCTION CATHETER10FR | o 1 ¢ g5 g 600|$ 1000 $ 11.00 $ 6.39 $ 6.00 |Boundtree
50/bx Medical
MEGAMOVER 1500
TRANSPORT UNIT 40 X 80 Boundtree
51926 NONWOVEN POLY WHITE CS $ 155.29 (155.20/CSof 100 $ 17178 | $ 176.60 | $ 19420 | $ 162.54 155.20/CS of 10 Medical
1500 LB CAPACITY, 14
HANDLES 10/CS
ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE Bounditree
1-7330-25 |(ET) 2.5 MM, UNCUFFED BX $ 7.18( $ 7.00 | $ 1640 | $ 15.20 $ 17.00 $ 7.00 Medical
WITH STYLET 10/BX
OPA Size 100mm Berman Boundtree
1-1508-00 [Airways Brand EA $ 0191 $ 012 | $ 025 $ 0211 9% 0241 % 0.13 $ 0.12 Medical
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED
01126 | FOURNIQUETS,LATEX ) PACKOr) ¢ = 45601 ¢ 500|$ 6818 775 | $ 980 | $ 110 $ 1.10 |[EMP
FREE BX
112-6152 2‘5??553?” LUERLOCK]  py  |s  1360|$  1979|$  498|$ 1435 | $ 1067 | $ 12.15 $ 12.15 |EMP
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Betadine Prep Pads micro
1108 bacterial, non irritating BX 3.30 357 | $ 316 | $ 360 (% 341 [ $ 2.99 $ 2.99 |EMP
100/bx
8881225315 Eg;ﬁ:ﬂymedlezsga BX 47.00 1100 | $ 4365 | $ 1225 | $ 48.66 | $ 10.18 $ 10.18 |[EMP
BANDAGE TRIANGULAR 40
23040  |[INX40INX56IN 12/BX BX 3.80 336|$  312|$ 269 | $ 3.89 | $ 3.00 $ 3.00 |EMP
20BX/CS
SHARPS CONTAINER OLD
STYLE SQUARE RED 4.7
184R QUART 10 IN X 6 IN X 7.75 cs 70.82 6420 |$ 9456 | $ 115.80 103.92 b ea/ case of 20 for $71.00) | $ 42.60 |[EMP
IN 12/CS
123120 lf(‘)\/Sé(LAIRWAYZOFR BX 20.50 2150 | $  24.10 15.90 21.60 11.24 $ 11.24 |EMP
123126 |NPA SIZE 26FR 10/BX BX 20.50 2150 | $  24.10 15.90 21.60 11.24 11.24 |EMP
038-94-310y |-MA Size 1. Single patient BX 69.40 62.30 172.00 35550 60.72 60.72 |[EMP
use. 10/bx
038-94-315U tliAlSSjii's'Smglepat‘ent BX 69.40 6230 | $ 17200 $ 35550 $ 60.72 $ 60.72 |EMP
038-94-320U tliAls(;jij' Single patient BX 69.40 6230 | $  172.00 | $ 355.50 $ 60.72 $ 60.72 |EMP
038-94-325U tiAlséz/ii's'S‘“glepat‘ent BX 69.40 6230 | $ 17200 $ 35550 $ 60.72 $ 60.72 |EMP
038-94-330U tiAf(;Z/ij Single patient BX 69.40 6230 | $  172.00 | $ 355.50 $ 60.72 $ 60.72 |EMP
038-94-340U EiAf(;Z/Zj Single patient BX 69.40 6230 | $  172.00 | $ 355.50 $ 60.72 $ 60.72 |EMP
038-94-350U EiAf(;Z/Zi Single patient BX 69.40 6230 |$ 17200|$ 35550 $ 60.72 $ 60.72 |EMP
Disposable Razors 50/bx
4251 O BX 15.33 1700 | $ 1562 | $ 1742 | $ 20.00 | $ 0.36 $ 0.36 |[EMP
OPA Size 40mm Berman
121901  |Airways Brand. EA 0.19 012|$ 025|$ 021 $ 024 | $ 0.09 $ 0.09 [EMP
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED
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MMS Boundtree Schein Lowest Quoted Quoted
MFG PN  Item Description UOM Medical Medical Medical Quad Med Moore Medical EMP Vermed Price Vendor
OPA Size 50mm Berman
1-1508-50 |Airways Brand. EA 0.19 0.12 025 $ 021 % 0.24 0.09 $ 0.09 |EMP
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED
OPA Size 60mm Berman
1-1508-60 |Airways Brand EA 0.19 0.12 025 $ 021 % 0.24 0.09 $ 0.09 |EMP
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED
OPA Size 80mm Berman
1-1508-80 |Airways Brand EA 0.19 0.12 025 $ 021 % 0.24 0.11 $ 0.11 |EMP
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED
OPA Size 90mm Berman
1-1508-90 |Airways Brand EA 0.19 0.12 025 $ 021 % 0.24 0.11 $ 0.11 |EMP
INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED
PEDIATRIC NASAL Henry Schein
MS-24101 CANNULA 50/BX BX 17.26 25.00 882 (% 1550 | $ 21.00 12.50 $ 8.82 Medical
NEEDLE 25GA X 1" Henry Schein
9004470 100/BX BX 4.00 3.77 316 | $ 550 ( $ 7.76 3.55 $ 3.16 Medical
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF Henry Schein
NAVY SIZE 11 ADULT EA 11.12 10.99 6.89 [ $ 1930 | $ 10.59 11.25 $ 6.89 Medical
20/CS PROSPHYG 775
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF Henry Schein
NAVY SIZE 9 CHILD EA 11.12 10.99 1031 | $ 1930 | $ 14.58 11.25 $ 10.31 Medical
PROSPHYG 775
BD 3CC 23Gx1" SFTY Henry Schein
305905 SLEEVE 50/bx BX 16.11 17.66 1009 | $ 1040 | $ 16.84 17.75 $ 10.09 Medical
LUBRICATING JELLY 3GM Henry Schein
1250 144/BX BX 5.66 8.71 483 | $ 599 ( $ 6.54 6.25 $ 4.83 Medical
HYFIN VENT CHEST SEAL Henry Schein
10-0037 TWIN PACK (North EA 12.10 13.95 1044 | $ 1230 | $ 12.12 12.25 $ 10.44 .
. Medical
American Rescue)
Oxygen mask, adult,
elongated, high .
2101 Concintratior%, total non- cs 31.58 34.50 3150 | $ 33.50 No Bid $ 31,50 |Henry Schein

rebreathing, reservoir bag,
50/cs VENTLAB BRAND

Medical
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01¢vo111-cs |0 TWo Disposable CPAP, EA |$ 5554|$ 4059 |$ 2852|$ 3180 35.40 $ 28,52 |Henry Schein
Large Adult Medical
AMBU SPUR Il BVM
INFANT W/ TUBE Henry Schein
540211000 RESERVIOR INFANT MASK EA $ 1320 $ 1265 | $ 1207 | $ 16.30 | 167.26/case of 12 12.65 $ 12.07 Medical
12/CS _
Bite Stik Plastic Disposable | EA | $ 029 $ 037|$ 022|$ 0.44 | $ 0.24 0.36 $ 0.22 m’érizasl‘:he'”
Body bag, adult, 38 in. x 96 Henrv Schein
BBDE-50-CF [in., white, envelope zipper, EA No Bid $ 16.00 | $ 716 | $ 810 | $ 7.68 7.47 $ 7.16 Y
. Medical
chlorine free, toe tag 24/cs
Cloth surgical tape, Hypo-
153g-1 |0k 1in.x10yards, BX |$  953($ 792|$  757|$ 35.80 | $ 11.88 8.48 $ 7,57 |Henry Schein
hypoallergenic 12ea/bx Medical
12bx/cs (144ea/cs)
Head Immobilizer Henrv Schein
101 MultiGrip Adult 50/cs I- CS $ 22235 No Bid $ 193.00| $ 19.25 | $ 222.50 214.68 $ 193.00 Y
Medical
TEC MFG
BANDAGE ADHESIVE Henrv Schein
CLOTH 1IN X 3IN 100/BX BX $ 153 $ 299 ( $ 118 | $ 22400 | $ 27.36 1.92 $ 1.18 .y
Medical
12BX/CS
Thomas E.T. Tube Holder Henry Schein
600-10000 Adlt 25/bx BX 3 66.40 | $ 66.25 | $ 62.00 | $ 1299 | $ 2.79 2.75 $ 62.00 Medical
600-20000 | nomas E.T.Tube Holder BX |$ 6640|$  6625|$% 6200]$ 82.50 | $ 2.79 2.75 $ 62.00 |Hienry Schein
Pedi 25/bx Medical
SMART CAPNOLINE,
PEDIATRIC, NON .
Henry Schein
007269 INTUBATED, ORAL NASAL BX $ 39385| $ 34475 $ 33500 | $ 357.50 507.18 $ 335.00 Medical
W/OXYGEN TUBING
25/BX
NAIL POLISH REMOVER Henry Schein
B71200 PAD 100/BX BX $ 352 $ 3.66 | $ 327 | % 390 | $ 3.65 3.85 $ 3.27 Medical
Conforming gauze, self Henrv Schein
adhering, 6" kling 6/bg BX |$ 1055| $ 12.24 | $ 472 | $ 10.00 | $ 33.44 12.15 $ 472 |\ 00 diZaI

8bgs/box
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252051  |Ambu Face Mask Neonatal | EA | $  1.43 1.87 1.38 165 | $ 207 | $ 1.96 $ 1.38 az':jri’c’asl"he'”
252052  |Ambu Face Mask Infant EA |$ 143 1.84 1.38 165 | $ 207 | $ 1.96 $ 1.38 m’:{i’c’asl‘:he'”
252053  |Ambu Face Mask Toddler EA |$ 143 1.84 1.38 165 | $ 207 | $ 1.96 $ 1.38 m’:{i’c’asl‘:he'”
252054  |Ambu Face Mask Adult EA | $ 143 1.84 1.38 165 | $ 207 | 8 1.96 $ 1.3g |Henry Schein
Small Medical _
252055  |Ambu Face Mask Medium EA |$ 143 1.84 1.38 165 | $ 207 | % 1.96 $ 1.38 I\Hﬂzr(‘jrié’asl'd‘e'”
252056  |Ambu Face Mask Large EA |$ 143 1.84 1.38 165 | $ 207 | $ 1.96 $ 1.38 I\Hﬂzr;riza?‘:he'”
ST100  |Sharps Trap EA No Bid 1.52 143 165 | $ 154 | $ 153 $ 1.43 I\Hﬂzrériza?‘:he'”
11405  |Cold PackInstant 4x7 BX |$ 936 40.93 4.05 9.25 | $ 11.74 | $ 7.18 $ 4,05 |Henry Schein
24 /BX Medical
SAFETY SPECTACLES FOR Henry Schein
605B VISITORS CLEAR 12/BX BX $ 12.84 10.20 9.48 22.68 16.56 (1.38 only sold each) $ 9.48 Medical
Adult Forceps EA |$ 406 3.42 3.21 369 | $ 347 | $ 413 $ 3.21 K'/Izr;riza‘cl":he'”
Oxygen nasal cannula,
adult, conventional style, Henrv Schein
1107 clear flared nasal prongs, 7 CS $ 12.17 11.70 8.82 13.00 No Bid $ 8.82 .y
. Medical
ft tubing 50ea/cs
VENTLAB BRAND
Triple Antibiotc Oint Henry Schein
1182 144x.50m 144 /bx BX $ 11.11 11.20 6.34 865 $% 1409 | $ 12.05 $ 6.34 Medical
) 10cc syringe w/locking luer . Henry Schein
4617100V-02 B-Braun Brand 100,/bx BX $ 7.90 9.00 3.98 7.15 No Bid $ 3.98 Medical
Burn Sheets 60"x96" Must Henrv Schein
MS-BS0033 |meet NFPA standard 702. EA $ 1.64 1.84 1.32 144 $ 6.26 | $ 2.11 $ 1.32 .y
. Medical
Individually wrapped
3501 >X9 STERILE ABDOMINAL CS $ 31.27 39.80 60.00 46.00 | $ 45,12 40 $ 31.27 [MMS Medical

PADS 20BX/CS
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305188 lﬁgggf 19GAX1 BX |$  277|$ 400|$ 528 299 | 3 5.24 | $ 3.55 $ 2.77 |MMS Medical
9004473 1;153(1)5/1)]31;? 23GAX 1 BX |$  277|$ 344 |$ 306 299 | s 518 | $ 3.55 $ 2.77 |MMS Medical
Conforming Stretch Gauze .
N BX |$  944|$ 2680 | $ 4208 | $ 1040 | $ 16.80 | $ 9.75 $ 9.44 |MMS Medical
RESTRAINT STRAP SEAT
DD1109-BK |BELT BUCKLE METAL EA |$  632|$ 699 |$ 7358 6.75 $ 32.00 $ 6.32 [MMS Medical
BLACK 1 PIECE 9 FT
100/103/030 |ET Tube uncuffed with BX |$ 1350|$ 1550 | $ 1640 | $ 1530 | $ 17.10 | $ 16.25 $ 13.50 [MMS Medical
stylet, 3.0 10/bx
100/103/040 |ET Tube, uncuffed with BX |$ 1350|$ 1550 [ $ 1640 | $ 1530 | $ 17.10 | $ 16.25 $ 13.50 |MMS Medical
stylet, 4.0 10/bx
34300 235&01\1 TUBINGO/32X6') gy | 3888 4750 | $  79.96 | $ 49.00 | $ 55.45 | $ 58.00 $ 38.88 |MMS Medical
RESTRAINTS, DELUXE _
501110 |58 D RNG PR |$  316|$ 344 |$ 3468 343 | $ 365 | $ 3.80 $ 3.16 |MMS Medical
Disposable Splints 3/8"
center foam size 18"x9"
Morrison Brand *MUST EA $ 133 $ 149 | $ 147 | $ 1.49 $ 2.85 $ 1.33 [MMS Medical
HAVE CENTER FOAM &
LOOP HOLES**
Reusable Cuff Thigh EA |$ 533|% 1653 |$ 3164 $ 6.75 $ 6.79 $ 5.33 |[MMS Medical
EXTENSION WITH AMSAFE
AE3108  |NEEDLELESS INJECTION cS |$ 8666|$ 13600 |$ 13376 | $ 88.00 13200 | $  436.00 $ 86.66 |MMS Medical
SITE 8 IN 100/CS
Pediatric partial non .
2201 breather, 76t tubing. 50/cs cS |[$ 3399]8$ 3529 [$ 5150 | $ 34.50 $ 55.65 $ 33.99 |MMS Medical
2113-10250 |0 TubesizeS0mmCuffed | o | o 45501 1690 |  16.40 | $ 16.40 | $ 18.20 | $ 16.98 $ 13.80 |[MMS Medical
w/stylet 10/bx
2113-10260 |0 Tubesize 60mmCuffed | o | o 45501 1690 |  16.40 | $ 16.40 | $ 1820 | $ 16.98 $ 13.80 |[MMS Medical
w/stylet 10/bx
2113-10270 |07 Tubesize70mmeuffed | o | o 4301 1690 |  16.40 | $ 16.40 | $ 1820 | $ 16.98 $ 13.80 |[MMS Medical

w/stylet 10/bx




Florence County EMS RFQ 02-17/18

Henry Lowest
MMS Boundtree Schein Lowest Quoted Quoted
MFG PN  Item Description UOM Medical Medical Medical Quad Med Moore Medical EMP Vermed Price Vendor
2113-10280 BT TubesizeBOmmeuffed | gy} g g5 1690 [$ 1640 |$ 1640 |$ 18.20 16.98 $ 13.80|MMS Medical
w/stylet10/bx
2113-10290 |ET Tube size S.0mmeuffed) gy | g 4544 1690 [$ 1640 |$ 1640 |$ 18.20 16.98 $ 13.80|MMS Medical
w/stylet 10 /bx
IV Arm boards Morrison
Brand Disposable 18"
constructed with a EA $ 0.69 084 $ 147 | $ 1.24 0.88 $ 0.69 [MMS Medical
corrugated core and thick
foam.
Glucose Gel 15mg, .
Strawberry, 3/pk, 12pks//cs PK $ 3.21 370 | $ 10.00 | $ 5.25 3.65 $ 3.21 |MMS Medical
50622AB0O |Vinyl 5ft straps EA $ 6.32 798 (% 738 | $ 7.05 17.97 $ 6.32 |MMS Medical
5060230 Cloth 7ft straps EA $ 6.61 No Bid $ 7.53 No Bid 19.97 $ 6.61 |MMS Medical
3354 i;éii’/lci_PLY 100/BX CS 3 53.33 164.64 | $ 5593 $ 63.60 | $ 99.24 62.75 $ 53.33 |MMS Medical
9-0212-70 ;Tgfigl/)g{CER 15FR COUDE BX 3 31.10 4070 | $ 4404 | $ 62.60 | $ 8.68 42.50 $ 31.10 IMMS Medical
g710  |>82l Sharps Containter EA |$ 395 665|$  443|$ 6.20 No Bid $ 3.95 |MMS Medical
Medical Action Brand
901010 OR |Thermometer Probe Covers .
05031 10pks/bx BX $ 8.83 918 | $ 85.60 | $ 11.20 9.15 $ 8.83 IMMS Medical
MMS
. Medical,
CARPUJECT HOLDER 2024 EA $ 0.02 002|% 0.03 No Bid $ 0.25 0.02 $ 0.02
Boundtree,
EMP
MMS
. Medical,
CARPUJECT HOLDER 2024 EA $ 0.02 002|% 0.03 No Bid 0.02 $ 0.02
Boundtree,
EMP
IV SALINE 0.9% SOLUTION Moore
E8000 1000ML BAGS B-BRAUN CS No Bid 59.88 | $ 91.50 No Bid $ 26.64 No Bid $ 26.64 Medical

BRAND 12/CS
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BAXTER IV SOLUTION . . . Moore
2B0062 D5W. 250ML_36/CS CS No Bid $ 168.84 [ $ 221.92 No Bid $ 129.96 No Bid $ 129.96 Medical
VENI-GARD IV DRESS, Moore
705-4431 100/BX Sbxs/case CS $ 16667 $ 176.75 | $ 22055 | $ 168.35 | $ 4776 | $ 185.00 $ 47.76 Medical
BLOOD PRESSURE CUFF Moore
NAVY SIZE 10 SMALL EA $ 1112 | $ 1099 | $ 1259 | $ 1930 | $ 1059 | $ 11.45 $ 10.59 Medical
ADULT PROSPHYG 775
Child Forceps EA |$  372|$ 320 321|$ 369 | $ 318 | $ 3.99 $ 3.18 mggirfal
NEEDLELESS IV SET, 10
MS-83375 DROP/ML 83' 50/CS CS 61.12 $ 72.96 | $ 98.00 | $ 56.50 66 $ 56.50 |Quad Med
608306 gﬁg];[éEgLESS [VSET, 60 CS $ 60.77 | $ 87.00 | $ 8250 | $ 59.00 $ 59.00 |Quad Med
COBALT X GLOVES, LATEX
N211 FREE, SIZE SMALL CS $ 7890 | $ 7140 | $ 71.60 | $ 61.00 | $ 73.60 | $ 65.45 $ 61.00 [Quad Med
COBALT X GLOVES, LATEX
N212 FREE, SIZE MEDIUM CS $ 7890 | $ 7140 | $ 71.60 | $ 61.00 | $ 73.60 | $ 65.45 $ 61.00 [Quad Med
COBALT X GLOVES, LATEX
N213 FREE, SIZE LARGE CS $ 7890 | $ 7140 | $ 7160 | $ 61.00 | $ 73.60 | $ 65.45 $ 61.00 |Quad Med
COBALT X GLOVES, LATEX
N214 FREE, SIZE X LARGE CS 78.90 71.40 71.60 61.00 73.60 65.45 61.00 |Quad Med
7112 LANCETS BX 8.60 0.13 1451 6.70 13.53 9.38 6.70 |Quad Med
Cloth Tape Hypo Allergenic
7137 Size 1/2" 24/bx BX $ 793 $ 840 | $ 757 $ 749 | $ 1184 | $ 8.15 7.49 |Quad Med
BD 1cc 25gax1" SAFETY
305903 SLEEVE 50/bx BX $ 1937 $ 1895 | $ 1651 ( $ 1190 | $ 1817 | $ 21.00 $ 11.90 |Quad Med
DIN1515X |IO Needle 15ga EA $ 19.15| $ 8.47 1% 1778 | $ 815 [ $ 2042 | $ 9.55 $ 8.15 |Quad Med
DIN1518X |IO Needle 18ga EA $ 21.09| $ 8.47 1% 17811 $ 815 [ $ 2045 | $ 9.55 $ 8.15 |Quad Med
0.B.KIT BAG EA $ 4781 $ 446 | $ 580 [ $ 389 [ $ 6.51 ] % 5.25 $ 3.89 |Quad Med
MICRO MIST NEBULIZER
W/ELONGATED ADULT
1885 AEROSOL MASK, 7 FT CS $ 46.66 | $ 4400 | $ 80.50 | $ 4250 | $ 69.98 | $ 52.25 $ 42.50 [Quad Med
TUBING AND ST

CONNECTOR 50/CS




Florence County EMS RFQ 02-17/18

Henry Lowest
MMS Boundtree Schein Lowest Quoted Quoted
MEG PN Item Description UOoM Medical Medical Medical Quad Med Moore Medical EMP Vermed Price Vendor
Contour POC Tst Strip
7099C 50/btl 24btl/bx BX 14.44/ptl | $ 369.36 343.92 14/btl 15.29/btl 15.5/btl 14.00 |Quad Med
Angel Wing Needle 21gx . .
8881225299 3/4 12"GRN 50/cs BX $ 47.00 No Bid 43.65 12.30 48.66 No Bid 12.30 |Quad Med
Angel Wing Collection Set .
8881225307 23X3/4 50 /cs BX $ 4700 $ 40.00 43.65 12.30 48.66 No Bid 12.30 |Quad Med
Convenience Bag, BioHoop,
BH1100H |>0¢C¢-2000cc Emesis and PK |$ 1933|$% 18.25 17.86 7.49 680.27 | $ 19.55 7.49 |Quad Med
Hazardous Waste Bag,
W/Hook 12/pk 40pk/cs
26280 42}8(/:](3:3;((1% LL MONOJECT BX $ 640 $ 8.80 2.10 2.01 14.08 | $ 15.35 2.01 [Quad Med
Blunt tip cannula BD Brand
303390 TWIN PACK Drug vial BX $ 40221 $ 42.00 37.32 19.86 4165 | $ 43.45 19.86 |Quad Med
adapter 100/bx
8884413605 [Vaseline Gauze 12/bx BX $ 708 $ 9.36 6.84 5.25 062 $ 9.50 5.25 |Quad Med
Dispoable Splints 3/8"
center foam size 34"x19" EA $ 353 $ 3.65 3.00 1.65 $ 4.77 1.65 |Quad Med
Morrison Brand
AMBU SPUR II BVM ADULT
520211000 W/ M MASK 12/CS CS $ 127.00( $ 120.60 109.20 118.44 13344 | $ 115.23 118.44 |Quad Med
1620-003 ([Pediatric EKG pads 30/BX BOX $ 446 $ 4.77 8.93 4.20 19059 | $ 4.95 4.20 |Quad Med
Snap Foam Electrode
31013926 530ECG 30/pk 20pks/bx BX $ 88.63( $ 97.80 86.00 3.99 91.80| $ 90.17 3.99 [Quad Med
110.00/box of
26702 Needle Butterfly 19GX3/4 BX $ 12.31 500 44.96 12.27 15.92 | 10.18 50/box 12.27 |Quad Med
Trauma Dressing 30"
NON21459 [designed for multi trauma, EA $ 075 $ 0.73 1.40 0.69 118 | $ 0.99 0.69 |Quad Med
sterile.
18" Cardboard Splint
k
w/center foam. *MUST EA |$  133]$ 1.49 1.47 1.10 $ 287 1.10 |Quad Med

HAVE CENTER FOAM AND
LOOP HOLES**




Florence County EMS RFQ 02-17/18

Henry Lowest
MMS Boundtree Schein Lowest Quoted Quoted
MFG PN  Item Description UOM Medical Medical Medical Quad Med Moore Medical EMP Vermed Price Vendor
TAPE ADHESIVE 3IN X 10
1583-3  |YARDS 4/BX 10BX/CS BX |$ 953 $ 1227 |$ 1065 $ 749 | $ 118.90 12.33 7.49 |Quad Med
DURAPORE
EMS shears, black, 7 1/4 in,
safety bandage tip, fully EA |$  075]$ 079|$ 082S 0.65 | $ 8.46 0.66 0.65 |Quad Med
autoclavable, surgical
stainless steel blades
IV CATH 16G X 1.25"
3042 PROTECTIV 50/bx BX $ 74441 $ 84.00 | $ 7150 | $ 69.50 | $ 89.67 81.61 69.50 [Quad Med
IV CATH 14G X 1.25"
3048 PROTECTIV 50/bx BX 3 74441 $ 84.00 | $ 7829 | $ 69.50 | $ 89.67 81.61 69.50 [Quad Med
IV CATH 22G X 1.00"
3050 PROTECTIV 50/bx BX $ 74441 $ 84.00 | $ 7150 | $ 69.50 | $ 89.67 81.61 69.50 [Quad Med
IV CATH 24G X 0.75"
3053 PROTECTIV 50/bx BX $ 74441 $ 84.00 | $ 7150 | $ 69.50 | $ 89.67 81.61 69.50 [Quad Med
IV CATH 18G X 1.25"
3055 PROTECTIV 50/bx BX $ 74441 $ 84.00 | $ 7150 | $ 69.50 | $ 89.67 81.61 69.50 [Quad Med
IV CATH 20G X 1.25
3056 PROTECTIV 50/bx BX $ 74441 $ 84.00 | $ 7150 | $ 69.50 | $ 89.67 81.61 69.50 [Quad Med
153g.1  |cloth Tape Hypo Allergenic | oy 1 ¢ 953 g 1596 | $ 1450 | $ 749 | $ 11.88 7.88 7.49 |Quad Med
Size 2" 12/bx
484410  |Duction Canister 1200cc EA |$  276|$ 272$  284|$ 257 | $ 3.18 2.95 257 |Quad Med
Capacity Bemis Brand
Dispoable Splints 3/8"
center foam size 24"x14"
Morrison Brand ** MUST EA $ 353 $ 235 | % 207 | $ 1.40 3.60 1.40 |Quad Med
HAVE CENTER FOAM AND
LOOP HOLES**
AIRWAY ROLL-STD. . Quad Med
ORANGE EA No Bid $ 56.95 [ $ 2089 $ 17.50 17.50 17.50 and EMP
ADULT MULTIFUNCTION
ELECTRODE PADS FOR
D309 MRX, FR2, XLT, PLUG BX $ 13330 $ 20710 | $ 21420 ( $ 139.60 | $ 103.92 207.15 19 19 Vermed

STYLE CONNECTION, 1PR,
10 PRS/BOX
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PEDIATRIC PLUS PADS
p3z1  |(PLUGSTYLES ST/BX) FOR| = by NoBid |$ 11070 |$ 11453 |$ 69.80 $  11415| 20 20 Vermed

USE ON MRX, AND XL ONLY
5/BX




