CONTRACT: C21-3053-TDD

Dex Imaging

Copier Maintenance Agreement
EXPIRES:06/14/2026 w/ yearly renewals

SECOND AMENDMENT TO THE AGREEMENT BETWEEN OKALOOSA
COUNTY, FLORIDA AND DEX IMAGING, L1L.C
CONTRACT NO. €C21-3053-TDD

This Second Amendment fo the Agreement between Okaloosa County, a political subdivision of
the State of Florida (the “County”), and Dex Imaging, LLC (the “Contractor”), executed this

£ dayof (g&d pof~ 2024, 1s made a part of the original Agreement dated March 15,
2021, Contract No, C21-3053-TDD (the “original Agreement”), incorporated herein by reference.
The County and Contractor hereby agree as follows:

1. The County and Contractor wish to amend item 1 under Additional Terms and Conditions of
the original Agreement, as amended, to reflect the following:

All payments for lease services shall be made payable to Wells Fargo Vendor Financial
Services, LLC, P.O. Box 3072, Cedar Rapids, IA 52406-3072.

2. OTHER PROVISIONS REMAIN IN EFFECT. Except as specifically modified herein, all
terms and conditions of the original Agreement between the parties, dated March 135, 2021,
and any amendments thereto, shall remain in full force and effect,

3. CONFLICTING PROVISIONS. The terms, statements, requirements, or provisions
contained in this Amendment shall prevail and be given superior cffect and priority over any
conflicting or inconsistent terms, statements, requirements or provisions contained in any other
document or attachment.

IN WITNESS WHEREOYF, the parties hercto have executed this Amendment on the day
and year first written above.

DEX IMAGING, LLC:

BY:

Signature

R
Cuwas b@apluf

Print Name

OKALOOSA COUNTY, FLORIDA

: ! Digitally signed by
De R Ita ! DeRita Mason
Date: 2024,10,08
BY: Mason 7 08:06:28-05'00'

DeRita Mason, Purchasing Manager

Contract No. C21-3053-TDD




PROCUREMENT/CONTRACT/LEASE
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Approved as written:

Date:

Grants Coordinator: Suzarmme Ulloa

Risk Management Revigw

Approved as written: /\y{:j jff’“ 14 ?’Q ﬁ_}‘i}’dﬁ V»i,,f\w:%‘ vy iy%f}“?“’g 1 {m ; '{,\‘gL

Date:

Risk Manager or designee: Lydia Garcia

County Attorney Review

Sel prigeedl Qde A oate: AC 3

County Attorney: Lynn Hoshihara, Kexry Parsons or Designee

Approved as written:

Department Funding Review
Approved as written:

Date:

IT Review (if applicable)
Approved as written:

Date:

Revised September 22, 2020




DeRita Mason

-
From: Lynn Hoshihara
Sent: Monday, August 19, 2024 1.07 PM
To: DeRita Mason; Leslie McGhee
Cc Kerry Parsons
Subject: Re: Assignment and Assumption: Dex/Wells
Attachments: (21-3053-TDD amendment 1 8.19.24.docx

DeRita,
With the attached changes, this is approved.
Lynn

Lynn M. Hoshihara
County Attorney
Okaloosa County, Florida

Please note: Due to Florida's very broad public records laws, most written communications to or from County employees regarding
County business are public records, available to the public and media upon request. Therefore, this written e-mail communication,
including your e-mail address, may be subject to public disclosure.

From: DeRita Mason

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2024 2:45:55 PM

To: Lynn Hoshihara; Leslie McGhee

Cc: Kerry Parsons

Subject: RE: Assignment and Assumption: Dex/Wells

Good afternoon,

Please review and approve the attached.
Thank you,

DeRita Mason

DeRita Mason, CPPO, CPPB, NIGP-CPP
Purchasing Manager

Okaloosa County Purchasing Departruent
5479A Old Bethel Road

Crestview, Florida 32536

Office:(850) 689-5960 Exi. 6966

Cell: (850) 826-8010




