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Typewritten Text
          EXHIBIT B:



Recommendation of Award Chain Link 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name

Fencing Per Foot 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High

Fencing with Top Rail $13.00 $14.00 $15.00 $16.00 $18.00 $12.96 $16.28 $17.00 $18.50 $24.00 $12.50 $14.50 $17.00 $17.50 $24.00
Fencing without Top 
Rail $13.00 $14.00 $15.00 $16.00 $18.00 $9.66 $12.96 $16.76 $17.00 $21.00 $11.50 $13.50 $16.00 $16.50 $23.00
Fencing with Top 
Wire $13.00 $14.00 $15.00 $16.00 $18.00 $10.03 $13.24 $16.86 $17.56 $22.00 $11.85 $13.85 $16.35 $16.85 $23.35
Fencing witout Top 
Wire $13.00 $14.00 $15.00 $16.00 $18.00 $9.66 $12.96 $16.76 $17.00 $21.00 $11.50 $13.50 $16.00 $16.50 $23.00
Removal of Existing 
Fencing $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $1.00 $1.25 $1.25 $1.50 $2.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.50 $1.50
Install Corner Post, 
Each $75.00 $80.00 $90.00 $120.00 $150.00 $85.09 $124.00 $130.00 $190.00 $240.00 $85.00 $120.00 $130.00 $180.00 $210.00

Install End Post, Each $50.00 $60.00 $75.00 $100.00 $125.00 $76.32 $114.70 $125.00 $180.00 $210.00 $80.00 $110.00 $110.00 $200.00 $200.00
Three (3) Stand Barb 
Wire $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $0.90 $1.25 $1.30 $1.40 $2.00 $0.25 $1.25 $1.45 $1.45 $1.45
Four (4) Foot Wide 
Walk Gate $250.00 $300.00 $400.00 $500.00 $600.00 $248.07 $295.00 $300.00 $360.00 $410.00 $200.00 $275.00 $305.00 $350.00 $400.00
Ten (10) Foot Double 
Drive Gates $600.00 $700.00 $800.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $489.39 $578.32 $594.00 $609.00 $648.00 $500.00 $550.00 $550.00 $600.00 $600.00
Twelve (12) Foot 
Double Drive Gates $600.00 $700.00 $800.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $542.00 $650.00 $685.00 $695.00 $725.00 $550.00 $600.00 $600.00 $650.00 $850.00
Twelve (12) Foot 
Wide Roll Gate $700.00 $800.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $755.00 $892.00 $897.00 $957.00 $1,105.00 $900.00 $950.00 $1,000.00 $1,100.00 $1,400.00
Twenty (20) Foot 
Wide Roll Gate $1,200.00 $1,500.00 $1,700.00 $2,000.00 $2,300.00 $944.00 $1,220.00 $1,235.00 $1,290.00 $1,500.00 $1,100.00 $1,350.00 $1,405.00 $1,250.00 $1,500.00
Twenty (20) Foot 
Wide Swing Gate $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $794.00 $877.00 $888.00 $948.00 $1,076.00 $750.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL
9 Gauge Galvanized Chain Link Fencing, Fencing Materials, and Accessories

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

$32,309.00 $25,018.93 $26,250.60Section Subtotal



Recommendation of Award Chain Link 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Fencing Per Foot 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High

Fencing with Top Rail $11.00 $12.00 $13.00 $14.00 $16.00 $11.96 $15.03 $16.00 $17.00 $22.00 $9.50 $10.50 $15.00 $15.50 $20.00
Fencing without Top 
Rail $11.00 $12.00 $13.00 $14.00 $16.00 $9.16 $11.96 $15.76 $16.00 $20.00 $8.00 $9.00 $13.00 $13.50 $19.00
Fencing with Top 
Wire $11.00 $12.00 $13.00 $14.00 $16.00 $9.66 $12.24 $15.86 $16.56 $21.00 $8.25 $9.50 $13.25 $13.75 $19.00
Fencing witout Top 
Wire $11.00 $12.00 $13.00 $14.00 $16.00 $9.16 $11.96 $15.76 $16.00 $20.00 $8.00 $9.00 $13.00 $13.50 $19.00
Removal of Existing 
Fencing $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $1.00 $1.25 $1.25 $1.50 $2.00 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $1.00 $1.00
Install Corner Post, 
Each $50.00 $60.00 $75.00 $90.00 $100.00 $85.00 $124.00 $130.00 $190.00 $240.00 $55.00 $75.00 $95.00 $115.00 $145.00

Install End Post, Each $40.00 $45.00 $60.00 $75.00 $90.00 $76.32 $114.70 $125.00 $180.00 $210.00 $50.00 $70.00 $90.00 $110.00 $140.00
Three (3) Stand Barb 
Wire $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $0.90 $1.25 $1.30 $1.40 $2.00 $0.25 $1.25 $1.45 $1.45 $1.45
Four (4) Foot Wide 
Walk Gate $125.00 $150.00 $200.00 $200.00 $250.00 $244.00 $280.00 $295.00 $355.00 $405.00 $200.00 $265.00 $300.00 $340.00 $400.00
Ten (10) Foot Double 
Drive Gates $250.00 $350.00 $450.00 $500.00 $500.00 $480.00 $570.00 $584.00 $598.00 $638.00 $490.00 $535.00 $535.00 $590.00 $590.00
Twelve (12) Foot 
Double Drive Gates $600.00 $750.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $539.00 $560.00 $574.00 $588.00 $628.00 $515.00 $560.00 $560.00 $615.00 $615.00
Twelve (12) Foot 
Wide Roll Gate $600.00 $750.00 $900.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $750.00 $887.00 $887.00 $947.00 $1,095.00 $650.00 $715.00 $715.00 $785.00 $785.00
Twenty (20) Foot 
Wide Roll Gate $750.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $934.00 $1,200.00 $1,225.00 $1,280.00 $1,490.00 $725.00 $775.00 $775.00 $850.00 $850.00
Twenty (20) Foot 
Wide Swing Gate $750.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $788.00 $870.00 $878.00 $938.00 $1,066.00 $700.00 $950.00 $950.00 $950.00 $1,150.00

Section Subtotal $20,648.60

11 1/2 Gauge Galvanized Chain Link Fencing, Fencing Materials, and Accessories

$22,554.00 $24,364.94



Recommendation of Award Chain Link 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Fencing Per Foot 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High 4' High 6' High 7' High 8' High 10' High

Fencing with Top Rail $14.00 $15.00 $16.00 $17.00 $18.00 $14.78 $18.16 $24.92 $25.92 $30.06 $14.00 $16.00 $18.50 $19.00 $25.50
Fencing without Top 
Rail $13.00 $14.00 $16.00 $17.00 $18.00 $10.09 $13.56 $19.56 $20.56 $24.36 $13.00 $15.00 $17.50 $18.50 $24.50
Fencing with Top 
Wire $13.00 $14.00 $16.00 $17.00 $18.00 $10.74 $13.97 $20.03 $21.03 $25.42 $13.00 $15.00 $17.50 $18.50 $24.50
Fencing witout Top 
Wire $13.00 $14.00 $16.00 $17.00 $18.00 $10.09 $13.56 $19.56 $21.56 $24.36 $13.00 $15.00 $17.50 $18.50 $24.50
Removal of Existing 
Fencing $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $1.00 $1.25 $1.25 $1.50 $2.00 $0.50 $0.50 $0.50 $1.00 $1.00
Install Corner Post, 
Each $70.00 $80.00 $90.00 $100.00 $120.00 $125.00 $155.00 $170.00 $190.00 $255.00 $85.00 $105.00 $125.00 $140.00 $145.00

Install End Post, Each $50.00 $60.00 $75.00 $90.00 $100.00 $110.00 $145.00 $155.00 $169.00 $225.00 $80.00 $100.00 $120.00 $135.00 $140.00
Three (3) Stand Barb 
Wire $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $3.00 $1.20 $1.35 $1.50 $1.75 $2.00 $0.25 $1.65 $1.65 $2.00 $2.00
Four (4) Foot Wide 
Walk Gate $250.00 $300.00 $350.00 $350.00 $450.00 $340.00 $385.00 $425.00 $450.00 $475.00 $250.00 $300.00 $350.00 $400.00 $450.00
Ten (10) Foot Double 
Drive Gates $600.00 $700.00 $800.00 $800.00 $900.00 $557.00 $695.00 $705.00 $785.00 $825.00 $500.00 $550.00 $600.00 $650.00 $700.00
Twelve (12) Foot 
Double Drive Gates $900.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,100.00 $689.00 $789.00 $989.00 $1,189.00 $1,389.00 $600.00 $650.00 $650.00 $700.00 $700.00
Twelve (12) Foot 
Wide Roll Gate $900.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,100.00 $885.00 $1,050.00 $1,097.00 $1,127.00 $1,555.00 $850.00 $900.00 $900.00 $950.00 $950.00
Twenty (20) Foot 
Wide Roll Gate $1,200.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,800.00 $1,113.00 $1,444.00 $1,657.00 $1,934.00 $2,100.00 $925.00 $975.00 $975.00 $1,025.00 $1,025.00
Twenty (20) Foot 
Wide Swing Gate $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,700.00 $1,800.00 $2,000.00 $1,033.00 $1,116.00 $1,242.00 $1,695.00 $1,895.00 $750.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,250.00

Section Subtotal $32,079.00 $33,726.09 $24,069.55

9 Gauge Vinyl Finish Fencing, Fencing Materials, and Accessories



Recommendation of Award PVC 19-B-116KT

Design Height Width Size Thickness White Beige White Beige White Beige

Two Rail Ranch 4 ft 96" 2" x 6" Econo $9.00 $10.00 $12.41 $14.28 $11.00 $13.20

Two Rail Ranch 4 ft 96" 2" x 6" Premium $10.00 $11.00 $13.14 $15.10 $11.00 $13.20

Three Rail Ranch 4 ft 96" 2" x 6" Econo $10.00 $11.00 $17.36 $19.95 $16.00 $19.20

Three Rail Ranch 4 ft 96" 2" x 6" Premium $11.00 $12.00 $18.19 $20.92 $16.00 $19.20

T-11 Privacy 4 ft 73" 7/8" x 11.3" 0.05 $16.00 $17.00 $24.42 $26.96 $19.00 $22.80

Tongue and Groove 4 ft 72" 7/8" x 6" 0.063 $17.00 $18.00 $20.81 $23.12 $20.00 $24.00

Countess 4 ft 72"
7/8" x 1 1/2"

7/8/" x 6"
.070
.063 $17.00 $18.00 $23.10 $25.41 $18.50 $22.20

T-11 Privacy 6 ft 73" 7/8" x 11.3" 0.05 $19.00 $20.00 $28.43 $31.05 $23.00 $27.60

Tongue and Groove 6 ft 72" 7/8" x 6" 0.063 $18.00 $19.00 $25.28 $27.59 $23.00 $27.60

Countess 6 ft 72"
7/8" x 1 1/2"

7/8/" x 6"
.070
.063 $21.00 $23.00 $29.25 $31.94 $20.00 $24.00

Post 7 ft n/a 5" x 5" 0.16 $20.00 $22.00 $24.27 $26.17 $29.75 $35.70

Post 9 ft n/a 5" x 5" 0.16 $24.00 $25.00 $26.64 $34.71 $35.50 $42.60

Gate Post with 
Channel 7 ft n/a 5" x 5" 0.16 $20.00 $21.00 $128.00 $130.00 $92.25 $110.70

Gate Post with 
Channel 9 ft n/a 5" x 5" 0.16 $20.00 $21.00 $138.00 $140.00 $102.25 $122.70

Cap - Flat n/a n/a 5" x 5" 0.16 $1.00 $1.00 $1.60 $1.80 $0.50 $0.65

Vendor Name

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL



Recommendation of Award PVC 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL

Cap - Gothic n/a n/a 5" x 5" 0.16 $5.00 $6.00 $7.62 $8.46 $6.50 $7.80

Cap - Ball n/a n/a 5" x 5" 0.16 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $7.00 $6.50 $7.80

Gate T-11 Privacy 4 ft n/a n/a n/a $125.00 $140.00 $330.34 $359.91 $350.00 $425.00

Gate T-11 Privacy 5 ft n/a n/a n/a $150.00 $150.00 $436.74 $481.55 $450.00 $545.00

Gate T-11 Privacy 8 ft n/a n/a n/a $250.00 $300.00 $750.00 $875.00 $650.00 $785.00

Gate T-11 Privacy 10 ft n/a n/a n/a $350.00 $400.00 $944.00 $1,200.00 $850.00 $1,025.00

Gate Tongue & Grove 4 ft n/a n/a n/a $125.00 $200.00 $520.22 $578.03 $350.00 $425.00

Gate Tongue & Grove 5 ft n/a n/a n/a $150.00 $200.00 $693.63 $751.43 $450.00 $545.00

Gate Tongue & Grove 8 ft n/a n/a n/a $250.00 $400.00 $1,000.00 $1,225.00 $650.00 $785.00

Gate Tongue & Grove 10 ft n/a n/a n/a $300.00 $350.00 $1,100.00 $1,275.00 $850.00 $1,025.00

Gate Countess 4 ft n/a n/a n/a $200.00 $250.00 $424.19 $453.15 $350.00 $425.00

Gate Countess 5 ft n/a n/a n/a $250.00 $300.00 $547.16 $588.41 $450.00 $545.00

Gate Countess 8 ft n/a n/a n/a $500.00 $500.00 $800.00 $900.00 $650.00 $785.00

Gate Countess 10 ft n/a n/a n/a $500.00 $500.00 $900.00 $1,125.00 $850.00 $1,025.00

$7,345.00 $19,387.74 $16,231.70Section Subtotal



Recommendation of Award Other Fencing 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name
Field and 
Barbed Wire

Fencing With 
Barbed Wire

Fencing Without 
Barbed Wire
Fencing With 
Four (4) Strand 
Babred Wire

Corner Post 
Assembly
Pull and End 
Post Assemblies
In-Line Brace 
Assembly

Section Total
Split Rail Wood 
and Vinyl

Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl Wood Vinyl
11' Split Rail, 
Diamond Shape No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 $9.00 $2.28 $2.33 $2.18 $2.22 $2.32 $2.42 $7.00 $14.50 $7.00 $14.50 $8.50 $17.50

5'4" Line Post No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $15.00 $3.56 $3.65 $3.38 $3.50 $3.75 $3.96 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $13.50 $8.50 $17.00

5'4" End Post No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $15.00 $3.56 $3.65 $3.38 $3.50 $3.75 $3.96 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $13.50 $8.50 $17.00

5"4" Corner Post No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $15.00 $3.56 $3.65 $3.38 $3.50 $3.75 $3.96 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $13.50 $8.50 $17.00

6'6" Line Post No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 $16.00 $4.06 $4.09 $3.88 $4.09 $3.95 $4.65 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $13.50 $8.50 $17.00

6'6" End Post No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 $16.00 $4.06 $4.09 $3.88 $4.09 $3.95 $4.65 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $13.50 $8.50 $17.00

6'6" Corner Post No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.00 $16.00 $4.06 $4.09 $3.88 $4.09 $3.95 $4.65 $7.00 $13.50 $7.00 $13.50 $8.50 $17.00

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Delivered to County Site 
(per linear ft)

No Bid

Picked up by County
(per linear ft)

Delivered to County Site 
(per linear ft)

Picked up by County
(per linear ft)

Delivered and Installed by 
Vendor (per linear ft)

No Bid $9.00

Delivered (each) Picked-Up (each) Installed (each)

$25.00

No Bid

No Bid

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Delivered to County Site 
(per linear ft)

Picked up by County
(per linear ft)

Delivered and Installed by 
Vendor (per linear ft)

Delivered and Installed by 
Vendor (per linear ft)

$9.00

$9.00

$25.00

$15.00

$105.00 $80.00 $155.00

$100.00 $75.00 $150.00

Delivered (each) Picked-Up (each) Installed (each)

$230.00

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL

Delivered to County Site 
(per linear ft)

Picked up by County
(per linear ft)

Delivered and Installed by 
Vendor (per linear ft)

No Bid

No Bid

Delivered to County Site 
(per linear ft)

Picked up by County
(per linear ft)

Delivered and Installed by 
Vendor (per linear ft)

$1.58 $1.50 $3.25

Delivered (each) Picked-Up (each) Installed (each)

$160.00 $110.00

$1.75

$1.48

$1.55

$65.00 $50.00

Delivered to County Site 
(per linear ft)

Picked up by County
(per linear ft)

Delivered and Installed by 
Vendor (per linear ft)

$3.55

$1.25 $2.75

$2.82 $2.52 $4.50

$2.70 $2.40 $4.20

$1.56 $1.44 $2.94

$150.00

$120.00 $105.00 $175.00

$75.00 $60.00 $155.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$92.00 $1,190.08 $973.66



Recommendation of Award Other Fencing 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL
3 Rail Board 
Fence No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 $10.00 $6.70 $9.50 $5.70 $9.10 $8.20 $11.67 $4.75 $8.50 $4.75 $8.50 $5.50 $13.50
Railing 1 1/2" x 
5 1/2" x 16' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.00 $7.00 $1.05 $1.36 $0.80 $1.24 $1.49 $1.42 $0.85 $2.25 $0.85 $2.25 No Bid No Bid

Section Total

Silt and Safety

6' Centers

8' Centers

10' Centers
Black Silt Ditch 
Blocks w/ 8' 
Wire Back 14 
GA Wire Mesh
Orange Safety 
Fence - Light 
Orange Safety 
fence - Heavy 
Saf-T-Edge 
(smooth top) 
Floating 
Turbidity Barrier 
Floating 
Turbidity Barrier 
Staked Turbidity 
Barrier

6' Metal T-Post

3' Stakes (wood)

3' Stakes (metal)
Cormer Post 
Assembly

No Bid

No Bid $4.00

No Bid

$25.00

No Bid

No Bid

$15.00

No Bid

$12.00

No Bid

$12.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4.00

$4.00

No Bid

$3.00

No Bid

$4.00

No Bid

Delivered (per linear 
ft) Picked (per linear ft) Installed (per linear 

ft)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Installed (per linear 
ft)

$208.00 $211.54

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Delivered (per linear 
ft) Picked (per linear ft) Installed (per linear 

ft)

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$9.00

$3.00

$4.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Delivered (per linear 
ft) Picked (per linear ft)

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$519.70

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid



Recommendation of Award Other Fencing 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL

End Line Brace

Section Total

$12.00 No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid No Bid

$111.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid



Recommendation of Award Timber and Trex 19-B-116KT

Unit of 
Measure 4 ft High 6 ft High 8 ft High 4 ft High 6 ft High 8 ft High 4 ft High 6 ft High 8 ft High

Stockage Linear Ft $13.00 $13.00 $16.00 $22.75 $22.75 $12.50 $12.50 $21.50
Shadow Box Linear Ft $14.00 $14.00 $17.00 $24.75 $24.75 $14.50 $14.50 $23.50
Stockade - 4 ft Wide Gate Each $200.00 $200.00 $250.00 $385.00 $385.00 $250.00 $285.00 $350.00
Shadow Box - 4 ft Wide Gate Each $200.00 $200.00 $200.00 $405.00 $405.00 $250.00 $285.00 $350.00
Stockade - 6 ft Wide Gate Each $225.00 $225.00 $280.00 $585.00 $585.00 $300.00 $315.00 $400.00
Shadow Box - 6 ft Wide Gate Each $225.00 $225.00 $280.00 $605.00 $605.00 $300.00 $315.00 $400.00

Cost Cost Cost
$3.00 $16.50 $35.00

$24.00 $100.35 $271.58
$15.00 $57.27 $202.00
$10.00 $13.58 $202.00
$20.00 $18.84 $202.00
$10.00 $58.19 $202.00
$2.00 $2.66 $101.00
$0.10 $0.45 $0.50

Post Cap, each

Timber Fencing

Trex 

1 5/8" Exterior Wood Screws, each

5" x 5" Post, 108" length

4 x 4.9" Top rail, 91" length

1" x 5.75" Interlocking Picket, 67" length

1" x 5.75" Bottom Rail, 91" length

Aluminum Bottom Rail, 90 1/2" length

Fence Bracket, each

Section Subtotal

Section Subtotal $84.10 $267.84 $1,216.08

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

$2,797.00 $4,055.00 $3,899.00



Recommendation of Award Gates Operator Parts 19-B-116Kt

Vendor Name

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange 
Blossom Trail
Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL

Gate Operator Parts
Elite SL3000UL 1/2 HP Roll Gate Operator No Bid $1,910.35 $3,300.00
Elite CSW200ULA 1/2 HP Swing Gate Operator No Bid $2,186.57 $3,200.00
Hy-Security 222EX=HY-O222-XS-St No Bid $10,484.39 $10,800.00
Barrier Mega Arm No Bid $2,074.15 $3,200.00
DK Telephone Entry System 1812 plus No Bid $1,384.86 $1,150.00
American Access Key Pad with Intercom No Bid $480.59 $850.00
American Access Key Pad ADV1000 w/ Latch Code No Bid $404.23 $800.00
AKL Key Pad 480 Codes No Bid $239.54 $600.00
Intercom 3 Button Stateion No Bid $215.59 $950.00
SOS/YELP Emergency Access No Bid $530.80 $650.00
Pedestal Plate for Operator No Bid $274.99 $350.00
Concrete Pad, per sq ft No Bid $32.06 $45.00
Gooseneck Pedestal for Key Pad No Bid $134.74 $320.00
Emeron Safety Eye No Bid $209.06 $550.00
Exit Want with 100' Lead No Bid $260.50 $600.00
Loops No Bid $152.71 $750.00
Loop Detectors No Bid $124.26 $300.00
Wiring Harness ONLY for Loop Detectors No Bid $24.28 $85.00
Blades and Sealers for Loops No Bid $122.92 $65.00
DK Mag Lock 1200lb No Bid $257.45 $600.00
DK Mag Lock 600lb No Bid $222.05 $650.00
DK L&Z Bracket set for 600lb or 1200lb Mag Lock No Bid $92.77 $205.00
7 Day Timer No Bid $71.86 $300.00
Antenna Extension Kit 15' No Bid $27.55 $65.00
41 Chain per ft No Bid $2.98 $6.50
41 SS Chain per ft No Bid $16.02 $35.00
Low Voltage Surge Supressor No Bid $83.88 $400.00
High Voltage Surge Supressor No Bid $61.66 $400.00
Telephone Surge Supressor No Bid $95.33 $415.00p g
ADV1000l No Bid $48.44 $85.00
Step Down Transformer for ADV1000 No Bid $191.44 $85.00
Receiver No Bid $70.92 $150.00
Single Button Transmitter No Bid $29.00 $55.00
2 Button Transmitter No Bid $35.00 $65.00
Malleable Cantilever Rollers No Bid $0.00 $300.00
LoadMaster Mylor Cantilver Rollers No Bid $136.52 $350.00

Section Total No Bid $22,689.46 $32,731.50



Recommendation of Award Repairs and Service Calls 19-B-116KT

Vendor Name
Repairs and Service Calls

Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit
Repair and/or Removal of Fencing During 
Regular Working Hours (Monday-Friday, 7am - $60.00 Per man hour $60.00 Per man hour $55.00 Per man hour
Repair and/or Removal of Fencing After 
Regular Working Hours (Monday-Friday, After $80.00 Per man hour $78.00 Per man hour $75.00 Per man hour
Repair and/Removal of Fencing on Weekends 
and County Recognized Holidays $95.00 Per man hour $98.00 Per man hour $95.00 Per man hour

Core Drilling Labor Rate $80.00 Per man hour $90.00 Per man hour $50.00 Per man hour
Service Call for Repair Work, Removal, and 
Installation Jobs $250.00 Per service call $220.00 Per service call $200.00 Per service call

Installation of Temporary Fencing $7.00 Per linear foot $6.00 Per linear foot $3.50 Per linear foot

Installation of PDS Slats or Equal $9.00 Per linear foot $9.92 Per linear foot $10.00 Per linear foot

Motorized Gate Preventative Maintenance $300.00 Per gate $220.00 Per gate $315.00 Per gate

Fence Direct
9867 S Orange Blossom Trail

Orlando, FL

Hill's Fencing
915 E Ohio Ave
Lake Helen, FL

Sterling Enterprises
PO Box 714

Lake Helen, FL
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