
 
ARLINGTON COUNTY, VIRGINIA 

OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT 
2100 CLARENDON BOULEVARD, SUITE 500 

ARLINGTON, VIRGINIA 22201 
 

NOTICE OF RENEWAL 

 

TO: JACKSON & COKER LOCUMTENENS, LLC 

       100 SHOCKOE SLIP, FL 2 

       RICHMOND, VA 23219-4100 

DATE ISSUED: SEPTEMBER 1, 2022 

CURRENT REFERENCE NO: 23-DHS-R-358 

CONTRACT TITLE: 
TEMPORARY MEDICAL 
WORKERS 

  
THIS IS A NOTICE OF A RIDER CONTRACT AND NOT AN ORDER.  NO WORK IS AUTHORIZED UNTIL THE 

VENDOR RECEIVES A VALID COUNTY PURCHASE ORDER ENCUMBERING CONTRACT FUNDS. 
 
Arlington rides the Lead Agency’s contract referenced below for the goods and services so referenced. 
The contract documents consist of this notice and terms and conditions of the Lead Agency Agreement 
including any attachments or amendments thereto.  
 
LEAD AGENCY NAME: COMMONWEALTH OF VIRGINIA  
LEAD AGENCY CONTRACT NUMBER: 720-4937-8023-23-CTR004825 (FORMER 720-4937-8023-23) 
EFFECTIVE DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2023 
EXPIRES: AUGUST 31, 2024 
RENEWALS: THREE (3) ONE (1) YEAR RENEWALS REMAIN.   
COMMODITY CODE(S): 96269, 94848 
LIVING WAGE: N 
 
ATTACHMENTS: 
ATTACHMENT A – COMMONWEALTH OF VIRGINIA CONTRACT MODIFICATION NO. 1 
 
EMPLOYEES NOT TO BENEFIT: 
NO COUNTY EMPLOYEE SHALL RECEIVE ANY SHARE OR BENEFIT OF THIS CONTRACT NOT AVAILABLE TO THE 
GENERAL PUBLIC. 

  

 

VENDOR CONTACT:   AMANDA MOORE VENDOR TEL. NO.:  (678) 277-3050 

EMAIL ADDRESS: ALMOORE@JACKSONCOKER.COM   

 

COUNTY CONTACT:   HAMZA YASIN – DHS  

COUNTY CONTACT EMAIL: HYASIN@ARLINGTONVA.US 

 

COUNTY TEL. NO.: 

 

(703) 228-5250 

 



COMMONWEALTH of VIRGINIA

NELSON SMITH
COMMISSIONER

DEPARTMENT OF
BEHAVIORAL HEALTH AND DEVELOPMENTAL SERVICES

Post Office Box 1797
Richmond, Virginia   23218-1797

Telephone (804) 786-3921
Fax (804) 371-6638

www.dbhds.virginia.gov

CONTRACT MODIFICATION

Date: June ��, 2023

Contract Number: 720-4937-8023-23-CTR004825

Renewal Number: 1 of 4

Modification Number: 01

Issued By: Department of Behavioral Health and Developmental Services
Procurement and Administrative Services
1220 Bank Street
Richmond, VA 23219

Contractor: JACKSON AND COKER LOCUMTENENS LLC

Commodity Description: Temporary, as needed, Medical Employees

This Supplemental Agreement is entered into pursuant to the provision of the basic contract and any contract 
modifications.  

1. Whereas the Commonwealth desires to renew the performance period of the contract; now, therefore,
it is agreed that the contract performance period shall be renewed from September 1, 2023 through
August 31, 2024��ZLWh�D����&3,�LQFrHDsH.

The Contractor shall not exceed the purchase order amount without the approval of the Purchasing
Agency. Should an increase be warranted, the Purchasing Agency will issue a change order to the
purchase order.

Description of Modification; effective immediately:

2� Reference contract number 720-4937-8023-23; delete in its entirety and replace with updated contract
number, 720-4937-8023-23-CTR004825.

3� Reference page 14, Section. VI. SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS, eVA ORDERS AND

CONTRACTS Paragraph; delete in its entirety and replace with the following:

eVA ORDERS AND CONTRACTS: The contract may result in multiple purchase order(s) with the

applicable eVA transaction fee assessed for each order.
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4. Reference page 16, Section V. GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS, DEFAULT Paragraph;
delete in its entirety and replace with the following:

DEFAULT: In case of failure to deliver goods or services in accordance with the contract terms and
conditions, the Commonwealth, after due oral or written notice, may terminate this contract and procure
all goods and/or services contracted for, from other sources and hold the contractor responsible for any
resulting additional purchase and administrative costs.  This remedy shall be in addition to any other
remedies which the Commonwealth may have.

Except for the changes provided herein, all other terms and conditions of this contract remain 
unchanged and in full force and effect.

CONTRACTOR:  JACKSON AND COKER 
LOCUMTENENS LLC

PURCHASING AGENCY:  Department of 
Behavioral Health and Developmental Services

BY: BY:

PRINTED NAME: PRINTED NAME:

TITLE: TITLE:

DATE: DATE:
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Vendor Name:  Jackson and Coker Holdings LLC
3% price 
increase

2023-2024 
contract 
pricing

Line Lot - Line Description
Region 1 - Lot 1

1 Physician�–�On-site,�full�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
2 Physician�–�On-site,�part�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
3 Physician�–�On-site,�evening $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
4 Physician�–�On-site,�weekend $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
5 Physician�–�On-site,�overtime $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
6 Physician�–�On-site,�holiday $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
7 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
8 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
9 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�evening $200.00 $6.00 $206.00

10 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
11 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
12 Physician�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
13 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
14 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�part�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
15 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
16 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
17 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
18 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
19 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
20 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
21 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�evening $239.12 $7.17 $246.29
22 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $239.12 $7.17 $246.29
23 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
24 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
25 Dentist�–�On-site,�full�time
26 Dentist�–�On-site,�part�time
27 Dentist�–�On-site,�evening
28 Dentist�–�On-site,�weekend
29 Dentist�–�On-site,�overtime
30 Dentist�–�On-site,�holiday
31 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
32 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
33 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
34 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
35 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
36 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
37 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
38 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
39 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
40 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
41 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
42 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
43 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
44 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
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45 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
46 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
47 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
48 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
49 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
50 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
51 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
52 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
53 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
54 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
55 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
56 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
57 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
58 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
59 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
60 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
61 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
62 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
63 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
64 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
65 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
66 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24

Lot 2 : Region 2 - Lot 2
1 Physician�–�On-site,�full�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
2 Physician�–�On-site,�part�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
3 Physician�–�On-site,�evening $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
4 Physician�–�On-site,�weekend $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
5 Physician�–�On-site,�overtime $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
6 Physician�–�On-site,�holiday $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
7 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
8 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
9 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�evening $200.00 $6.00 $206.00

10 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
11 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
12 Physician�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
13 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
14 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�part�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
15 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�evening $239.12 $7.17 $246.29
16 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�weekend $239.12 $7.17 $246.29
17 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
18 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
19 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
20 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
21 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
22 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
23 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
24 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
25 Dentist�–�On-site,�full�time NO BID
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26 Dentist�–�On-site,�part�time NO BID
27 Dentist�–�On-site,�evening NO BID
28 Dentist�–�On-site,�weekend NO BID
29 Dentist�–�On-site,�overtime NO BID
30 Dentist�–�On-site,�holiday NO BID
31 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
32 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
33 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
34 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
35 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
36 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
37 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
38 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
39 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
40 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
41 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
42 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
43 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
44 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
45 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
46 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
47 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
48 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
49 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
50 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
51 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
52 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
53 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
54 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
55 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
56 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
57 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
58 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
59 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
60 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
61 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
62 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
63 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
64 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
65 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
66 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24

Lot 3 : Region 3 - Lot 3
1 Physician�–�On-site,�full�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
2 Physician�–�On-site,�part�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
3 Physician�–�On-site,�evening $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
4 Physician�–�On-site,�weekend $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
5 Physician�–�On-site,�overtime $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
6 Physician�–�On-site,�holiday $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
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7 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
8 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
9 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�evening $200.00 $6.00 $206.00

10 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
11 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
12 Physician�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
13 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
14 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�part�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
15 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
16 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
17 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
18 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
19 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
20 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
21 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
22 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
23 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
24 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
25 Dentist�–�On-site,�full�time NO BID
26 Dentist�–�On-site,�part�time NO BID
27 Dentist�–�On-site,�evening NO BID
28 Dentist�–�On-site,�weekend NO BID
29 Dentist�–�On-site,�overtime NO BID
30 Dentist�–�On-site,�holiday NO BID
31 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
32 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
33 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
34 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
35 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
36 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
37 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
38 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
39 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
40 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
41 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
42 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
43 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
44 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
45 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
46 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
47 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
48 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
49 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
50 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
51 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
52 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
53 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
54 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
55 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
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56 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
57 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
58 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
59 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
60 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
61 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
62 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
63 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
64 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
65 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
66 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24

Lot 4 : Region 4 - Lot 4
1 Physician�–�On-site,�full�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
2 Physician�–�On-site,�part�time $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
3 Physician�–�On-site,�evening $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
4 Physician�–�On-site,�weekend $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
5 Physician�–�On-site,�overtime $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
6 Physician�–�On-site,�holiday $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
7 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
8 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
9 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�evening $200.00 $6.00 $206.00

10 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
11 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
12 Physician�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
13 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
14 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�part�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
15 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
16 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
17 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
18 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
19 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
20 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
21 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
22 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
23 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
24 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
25 Dentist�–�On-site,�full�time NO BID
26 Dentist�–�On-site,�part�time NO BID
27 Dentist�–�On-site,�evening NO BID
28 Dentist�–�On-site,�weekend NO BID
29 Dentist�–�On-site,�overtime NO BID
30 Dentist�–�On-site,�holiday NO BID
31 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
32 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
33 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
34 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
35 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
36 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
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37 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
38 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
39 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
40 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
41 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
42 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
43 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
44 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
45 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
46 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
47 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
48 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
49 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
50 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
51 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
52 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
53 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
54 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
55 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
56 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
57 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
58 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
59 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
60 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
61 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
62 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
63 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
64 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
65 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
66 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24

Lot 5 : Region 5 - Lot 5
1 Physician�–�On-site,�full�time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
2 Physician�–�On-site,�part�time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
3 Physician�–�On-site,�evening $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
4 Physician�–�On-site,�weekend $210.00 $6.30 $216.30
5 Physician�–�On-site,�overtime $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
6 Physician�–�On-site,�holiday $307.50 $9.23 $316.73
7 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
8 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $200.00 $6.00 $206.00
9 Physician�–�Telemedicine,�evening $200.00 $6.00 $206.00

10 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $205.00 $6.15 $211.15
11 Physician�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
12 Physician�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $300.00 $9.00 $309.00
13 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
14 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�part�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
15 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
16 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
17 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
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18 Psychiatrist�–�On-site,�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
19 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
20 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $236.12 $7.08 $243.20
21 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine,�evening $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
22 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $239.15 $7.17 $246.32
23 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
24 Psychiatrist�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $354.18 $10.63 $364.81
25 Dentist�–�On-site,�full�time NO BID
26 Dentist�–�On-site,�part�time NO BID
27 Dentist�–�On-site,�evening NO BID
28 Dentist�–�On-site,�weekend NO BID
29 Dentist�–�On-site,�overtime NO BID
30 Dentist�–�On-site,�holiday NO BID
31 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
32 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
33 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
34 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
35 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
36 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
37 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
38 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
39 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
40 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
41 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
42 Family�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
43 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
44 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�part�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
45 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
46 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
47 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
48 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�On-site,�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
49 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
50 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
51 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine,�evening $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
52 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $148.00 $4.44 $152.44
53 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
54 Psychiatric�Nurse�Practitioner�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $222.00 $6.66 $228.66
55 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
56 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�part�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
57 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
58 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
59 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
60 Physician�Assistant�–�On-site,�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
61 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�full�time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
62 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�part-time $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
63 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine,�evening $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
64 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�weekend $150.32 $4.51 $154.83
65 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�–�overtime $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
66 Physician�Assistant�–�Telemedicine�-�holiday $225.48 $6.76 $232.24
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