
 CONTRACT, LEASE, AGREEMENT CONTROL FORM 
 
 
Date:     04/07/2022 
 
Contract/Lease Control #:  C22-3161-GM 
 
Procurement#:   ITB GM 09-22 
 
Contract/Lease Type: CONTRACT 
 
Award To/Lessee: LEWIS WALKER ROOFING, INC. 
 
Owner/Lessor:    OKALOOSA COUNTY  
 
Effective Date:    04/01/2022 
 
Expiration Date:  ONE YEAR FROM NOTICE TO PROCEED 
 
Description of     
Contract/Lease: 41 NEW ROOFS FOR ROLLING PINE TOWNHOMES IN 

CRESTVIEW FLORIDA 
 
Department: GROWTH MANAGEMENT 
 
Department Monitor: KAMPERT 
 
Monitor's Telephone #: 850-609-7180 
 
Monitor's FAX # or E-mail: EKAMPERT@MYOKALOOSA.COM 
 
  
Closed:    
     
Cc: Finance Department Contracts & Grants Office 
 
 
 
 



NOTICE TO PROCEED 

TO: Lewis Walker Roofing, Inc. 

PROJECT: C22-3161-GM, ITB GM 09-22 

DESCRIPTION: 41 New Roofs for Rolling Pine Townhomes in Crestview Florida 

You are hereby notified you are able to commence WORK in accordance with the Agreement dated March 15, 
2022. The Work will be substantially completed within 365 calendar days after the Notice To Proceed date. The 
Work will be completed and ready for final payment in accordance within 365 calendar days after the Notice To 
Proceed date. 

You are required to return an acknowledged copy of this NOTICE TO PROCEED to the OWNER: Okaloosa 
County Purchasing, Attention: Jesica Darr, 5479A Old Bethel Road, Crestview, FL 32536, within 10 days from 
the date this NOTICE TO PROCEED is fully executed. 

3-+<-- 111 ,2022 Dated this J day of(\ ..-c:M. 

OKALOOSA COUNTY BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
OWNE 

ACCEPTANCE OF NOTI 

Receipt of the above NOTICE TO PROCEED is hereby acknowledged. 

Date of Commencement of Work~: -~I =A~p=r=il-, ~2=0=22~--

Company Name 

This the ;l?) day of [}() 0 vda ,2022 

Signature 



PROCUREMENT/CONTRACT/LEASE 
INTERNAL COORDINATION SHEET 

Procurement/Contract/Lease Number: rn:s ~M l) ~-<"'22Tracking Number: L{c;/ D- 2... 
Procurement/Contractor/Lessee Name:Lewi~ Walkevl<oo0119 1~ant Funded: YEX NO_ 

Purpose: L\ l N tW Rciof ~ £»: ( 12-o ll ~~]. v\Q_ l() \J'(V) hDM\QS f . im PL 
Date/Term: /2 (V}(IDJh~ Rb ¥\_~Ip 1. JM' GREATER THAN $100,000 

Department#: 1700 6 Q 2. � GREATER THAN $50,000 

Account#: S 94 56l 3. D $50,000 OR LESS 

Amount:S 2Y 0,,91 v~~~ ~££:rp1!~ 
Department:fuvvrhMiwl... Dept. Monitor Name: tll 1o-tf to-.~ 

Purchasing Review 
Procurement or Contract/Lease requirements are met: 

~~ CROO--'<Y 4 · E-do,2.e:re, L, Date: 
Purchasing Manager or designee Jeff Hyde, DeRita Mason, Jesica Darr, Angela Efheridge 

2CFR Compliance Review ntrequired) I\/\ I' to· Ir) Cl Q_( 
Approved as written: ~ t~ Grant Name: _'-'--~~tl~D_Q~I~ \ 

&u'1.CiVtV\Q_U1lo°'- CA.<\-- '-l '-~ frv1Date: c)QN '2Jo ,W0L 
Grants Coordinator 

Risk Management Review 
Approved as written: ~ {5' ~ 

Date: 
Risk Manager or designee Lisa Price 

\-<'.' \rJ:-sf 1 (Wt L»fif°'- · o.._ l( ( ~ 2-\ pW' 

County Attorney Review 
Approved as written: ~ £~ 

L>-l N 'N '-'ibsh 1 

1 l,,-'O,.v~ u\. t I 'L '. I ~Pm Date: [ bC.61 2.§T?~l,, 
County Attorney Lynn Hoshihara, Kerry Parsons or Designee 

Deparfme,;i.t-Funding Review 
Approved as written: {) • \ 'u~ ~~ A 

Arv h= u c . L l . \ L-\ y-eJo ( 2JJ 2 Date: 
(0 .' D~ A,-Y'-. 

IT Review (if applicable) \ ---, f I 

Apprr>vArl rH." \Alr-i trr./ 
.,..,-, l(~" 't\-\JL,V mbr ' / /tA ~~ I \JcAlJ)~ate: ~· --~·· ' 

Revised September 22, 2020 



Jesica Darr 

From: Suzanne Ulloa 

Sent: Wednesday, January 26, 2022 4:09 PM 

To: Jesica Darr; Jeffrey Hyde; DeRita Mason; Kristina LoFria; Kerry Parsons 

Cc: Lynn Hoshihara; Karen Donaldson; Mindy Kane; Abra McGill 

Subject: RE: Draft Contract Review and Approval Requested by 3 February 2022 

Approved from a grants perspective. 

Purchasing & Grants Coordinator 
Okaloosa County 
Purchasing Department 
5479A Old Bethel Road 
Crestview, FL 32536 
Phone: /850) 689-5960 
DIRECT EXT. 6971 

Please note: Due to Florida's very broad public records laws, most written communications to or from County employees regarding County 
business are public records, available to the public and media upon requesf. Therefore, this written e-mail communication, including your 
e-mail address, may be subject to public disclosure 

From: Jesica Darr 
Sent: Wednesday, January 26, 2022 12:30 PM 
To: Jeffrey Hyde <jhyde@myokaloosa.com>; De Rita Mason <dmason@myokaloosa.com>; Kristina LoFria 
<klofria@myokaloosa.com>; Kerry Parsons <kparsons@myokaloosa.com>; Suzanne Ulloa <sulloa@myokaloosa.com> 
Cc: Lynn Hoshihara <lhoshihara@myokaloosa.com>; Karen Donaldson <kdonaldson@myokaloosa.com>; Mindy Kane 
<mkane@myokaloosa.com>; Abra McGill <amcgill@myokaloosa.com> 
Subject: Draft Contract Review and Approval Requested by 3 February 2022 

Good Afternoon ! 

Please see the draft contract for 1TB GM 09-22, 41 New Roofs for Rolling Pine Townhomes in Crestview 

Florida. 

The word document is just the contract itself. The PDF holds the contract and all attachments. 

Please send back approval NLT Thursday, 3 February, if possible. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. Thank you ! Have a good day! 

1 
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Jesica Darr 

From: Kristina LoFria 

Sent: Wednesday, January 26, 2022 1 :21 PM 

To: Jesica Darr 

Subject: RE: Draft Contract Review and Approval Requested by 3 February 2022 

Jesica, 

Good afternoon, This is approved by Risk. 

Thank You 

~~ 
Public Records & Contract Specialist 
302 N Wilson St Suite 301 
Crestview, Florida 32536 
klofria@myokaloosa.com 
850-689-5979 

For Cl LL tviLl/\,g.s weLLl/\,e.S.s -pLec;i.se vL.sLt: 
vittp:/ /www. V¾tJOR~ loos:.~ .00V1A.lwellvces:.s:. 

"When the winds of adversity blow against your boat, just adjust your sail." 

"Don't aim for success if you want it; just do what you love and believe in, and it will come naturally." David Frost 

Please note: Due to Florida's very broad public records laws, most written communications to or from county employees 
regarding county business are public records, available to the public and media upon request. Therefore, this written e­

mail communication, including your e-mail address, may be subject to public disclosure. 

From: Jesica Darr <jdarr@myokaloosa.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, January 26, 2022 12:30 PM 
To: Jeffrey Hyde <jhyde@myokaloosa.com>; DeRita Mason <dmason@myokaloosa.com>; Kristina LoFria 
<klofria@myokaloosa.com>; Kerry Parsons <kparsons@myokaloosa.com>; Suzanne Ulloa <sulloa@myokaloosa.com> 
Cc: Lynn Hoshihara <lhoshihara@myokaloosa.com>; Karen Donaldson <kdonaldson@myokaloosa.com>; Mindy Kane 

<mkane@myokaloosa.com>; Abra McGill <amcgill@myokaloosa.com> 
Subject: Draft Contract Review and Approval Requested by 3 February 2022 

Good Afternoon ! 

1 
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Jesica Darr 

From: Lynn Hoshihara 

Sent: Monday, February 7, 2022 12:13 PM 

To: Jesica Darr 

Subject: Re: Draft Contract Review and Approval Requested by 3 February 2022 

Attachments: Contract 1TB GM 09-22 41 New Roofs 2.7.22.docx 

Jesica, 

Attached are my changes. With these changes, this contract is approved as to legal sufficiency. 

Lynn 

Lynn M. Hoshihara 

County Attorney 

Okaloosa County, Florida 

Please note: Due to Florida's very broad public records laws, most written communications to or from County employees regarding 
county business are public records, available to the public and media upon request. Therefore, this written e-mail communication, 
including your e-mail address, may be subject to public disclosure. 

From: Jesica Darr 
Sent: Wednesday, January 26, 2022 1:30:19 PM 
To: Jeffrey Hyde; De Rita Mason; Kristina LoFria; Kerry Parsons; Suzanne Ulloa 
Cc: Lynn Hoshihara; Karen Donaldson; Mindy Kane; Abra McGill 
Subject: Draft Contract Review and Approval Requested by 3 February 2022 

Good Afternoon ! 

Please see the draft contract for 1TB GM 09-22, 41 New Roofs for Rolling Pine Townhomes in Crestview 

Florida. 

The word document is just the contract itself. The PDF holds the contract and all attachments. 

Please send back approval NLT Thursday, 3 February, if possible. 

Please let me know if you have any questions. Thank you ! Have a good day! 

Respectfully, 

Jesica 

1 



Jesica Darr 

From: Abra McGill 
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 10:03 AM 
To: Jesica Darr 
Subject: RE: 1TB GM 09-22 Request NLT Friday 11 February please 

Attachments: 1TB GM 09-22 41 New Roofs AGENDA ITEM.docx 

Good Morning, 

If Purchasing can take this to the board that would be great. I have filled in the highlighted items, see attached. 

Note: Invoices will be paid by Realty House when there is adequate program income collected from rent for the 
month. In the event there is not enough rent collected to cover the monthly cost then an invoice should be 
submitted to the County and that will be paid using program income from the NSP grant. 

Regards, 

Abra L. McGill 
Grants and Housing Programs Coordinator, Okaloosa County BCC 
Tel: (850) 609-7024 
amcgill@myokaloosa.com www.myokaloosa.com 
1250 N Eglin Pkwy Ste 301, Shalimar, FL 32579 

PLEASE NOTE: Florida has a very broad public records law. Email communications to or from Okaloosa County 
employees are considered public records and are available to the public and media upon request. Your e-mail 
communications, including your email address, are subject to public disclosure. This email is intended for Ille 
addressee(s) indicated above only. If you have received this email in error, pletise delete it immediately 

From: Jesica Darr 
Sent: Tuesday, February 8, 2022 4:44 PM 
To: Abra McGill <amcgill@myokaloosa.com> 
Cc: Jesica Darr <jdarr@myokaloosa.com> 
Subject: 1TB GM 09-22 Request NLT Friday 11 February please 

Abra, 

Good Afternoon ! 

I have the contract ready for this effort to send to the contractor for review and signature. Previously, I was 

awaiting some of their documentation. 

• Would you like the Purchasing Dept. to take this item to the Board or would you like your department 

to take it? Also, I haven't filled in the agenda word document yet. Please see it attached. 

1 
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. LEWIWAL02 JCOSTELLO 
ACORD" DATE (MM/D0/YYYY) 

I....------ CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE I 2/10/2022 

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS 
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES 
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED 
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. 

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. 
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on 
this certificate does not confer rlahts to the certificate holder in lleu of such endorsementlsl. 

PRODUCER 

Hub International Florida 
1117 Thomasville Road 
Tallahassee, FL 32303 

INSURED 

Lewis Walker Roofing, Inc. 
3229 SW Main Boulevard 
Lake City, FL 32025 

~QNTACT 
E• 

I f,itjg,NJo, Ext): (850) 386~1111 [ Fffc. NoJ,(850) 385-9827 
~6'bt~AQ: 

INSURER/SI AFFORDING COVERAGE NAIC# 

INSURER A :lronshore Sr ecialty Companv 25445_~ 
INSURER a : AmGuard Insurance Comnanv 42390 
INSURER c: Builders Mutual Insurance Comnanv 10844 
INSURERD: 

INSURER E: 

INSURERF: 

11JDL 1~: SD 1~!-!~~ TYPE OF INSURANCE POLICY NUMBER 

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER· REVISION NUMBER· 
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD 
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACTOROTHERDOCUMENTWITHRESPECTTOWHICHTHIS 
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN ISSUBJECTTOALL THE TERMS, 
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAlD CLAIMS. 

A COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY JC. D CLAIMS·MADE [K] OCCUR 
'--
L .... 

~ 

~~r AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER, 

POLICY [KJ ~r8r � LOC 

QTUER: 

B 
1 AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY 

L. ANY AUTO --
~ 

OWNED 
AUTOS ONLY ,_l(_ SCHEDULED 

AUTOS 

X 
~ ~ll\-'l?soNLY ,_l(_ ~ffi"aii'/Ji.~ 

A JC. UMBRELLA LIAB ~OCCUR 
EXCESS LIAS CIJ\IMS-MADE 

DED I X ! RETENTION$ 10,000 
C WORKERS COMPENSATION 

AND l;MPLOYC:RS' LIABILITY 

ANY PROPRIETORJPARTNERIEXECUTIVE 
~FICERIMEjM~rn EXCLUDED? 

andatory n ) 

YIN [HJ 
N/A 

gli~~rtff~~ igWciPERATIONS below 

RCS0094500 

LEAU291245 

RUS0032500 

WCP106049403 

POLICY EXP .. ~g)B£'!!:.ff_ LIMITS 

11000,000 EACH OCCURRENCE ' 
3/22/2021 3/22/2022 R~~~~J?e~~~!~~--ru ___ ~ 100,000 

5,000 MED EXP IAnu o~e "erson) ' 1,000,000 PERSONAL & ADV INJURY • . 2,000,000 GENERAL AGGREGATE 

2,000,000 PRODUCTS. COMP/OP AGG s 
s 

1 fe~~~b~t~~tflNGLE LIMIT I, 1,000,000 

3/22/2021 3/22/2022 BOD!l Y INJURY /Per oen;.onl s 
BODILY INJURY I Par accident I $ 

f~?~[~d"Zit~AMAGE I • 

s 
$ 5,000,000 EACH OCCURRENCE 

3/22/2021 3/22/2022 I, AGGREGATE 

s 5,0001000 
XI!;!;;!,\.,,.,.,,, I 19,(H· 

8/8/2021 8/8/2022 1,000,000 E.L. EACH ACCIDENT s 
1,000,000 E.L. DISEASE~ EA EMPLOYEI ' 1,000,000 E.l. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT $ 

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS/ LOCATIONS I VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Addltional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space ls required) 

CONTRACT#: C22-3161-GM 
LEWIS WALKER ROOFING, INC. 

I 41 NEW ROOFS FOR ROLLING PINE TOWNHO MES 
IN CRESTVIEW FLORIDA 
EXPIRES: 1 YEAR FROM NTP 

CERTIFICATE HOLDER 

Okaloosa County Board of County Commissioners 
5479A Old Bethel Road 
Crestview, FL 32536 

' 

CANCELLA 

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE 
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS, 

ACORD 25 (2016/03) © 1988~2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved. 
The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD 

http:g)B�'!!:.ff
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LEWIS WALKER ROOF ING, INC 
ALERT] This entity is only available FOR OFFICIAL USE ONLY. 

DUNS Unique Entity ID 

117152347 

Purpose of Registration 

All Awards 

Physical Address 

3229 SW Main BLVD 

Lake City, Florida 32025~0201 

United States 

Doing Business as 

(blank) 

Congress!onal District 

Florida 02 

MPIN 
"**0 2345 

SAM Unique Entity ID 

TZENJDRDMW93 

Expiration Date 

Jun 15, 2022 

Mairtng Address 

PO Box2147 

Lake City, Florida 32056 

United States 

Division Name 

(blank) 

State/ Country of Incorporation 

Florida I United States 

CAGE/NCAGE 

8NOR6 

Registration Status 

Actlve 

Division Number 

(blank) 

URL 
(blank) 

Registration Dates 

Activation Date Submission Date Initial Registration Date 

Jun 22, 2021 Jun 15, 2021 Apr 15, 2020 

Entity Dates 

Entity Start Date Fiscal Year End Close Date 

Aug 24, 1999 Dec31 

Immediate Owner 

CAGE Legal Business Name 

(b/anl,) (blank) 

Highest Level Owner 

CAGE Legal Business Name 

(blank) (blanl<) 

Executive compensation 

ln your business or organization's preceding completed fiscal year, did your business or organization (the legal entity to which !his specific SAM record, 

represented by a DUNS number, belongs) receive both of the following: 1. 80 percent or more of your annual gross revenues in U.S. federal contracts, 

subcontracts, Joans, grants, subgranls, and/or cooperative ngreements and 2. $25,000,000 or more In annual gross revenues from U.S. federal contracts, 

subcontracts, loans, grants, subgrants, and/or cooperative ~1greements? 

No 

Does the pub Uc have access to information about the compensation of the senior executives In your business or organization (the legal entity to which this 

specific SAM record, represented by a DUNS number, belongs) through periodic reports filed under section 13(a) or 15{d) of the Securlties Exchange Act of 

1934 (15 U.S.C. 78m(a), 78o(d)) or sectlon 6104 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986? 

Not Selected 

Proceedings Questions 

Is your business or organization, as represented by the DUNS Number on this entity regfstration, responding to a Federal procurement opportunity that 

contains the provision at FAR 52.209-7, subject to the clause In FAR 52,209-9 In a current Federal contract, or app!ylng for a Federal grant opportunity 

whlch contains the award tenn and condition described in 2 C.F.R. 200 Appendix XII? 

Yes 

Does your business or organization, as represented by the DUNS number on this specific SAM record, have current active Federal contracts and/or grants 

with total value 0ncluding any exerclsed/unexerclsed options) greater than $10,000,000? 

No 

Within the last five years, had the business or organization (represented by the DUNS number on this speclfic SAM record) and/or any of Its princlpals, in 

connection with the award to or performance by the business or organization of a Federal contract or grant, been the subject of a Federal or State (1) 

criminal proceeding resulting in a conviction or other acknowledgment of fault; (2) civil proceeding resultlng in a finding of fault with a monetary fine, penalty, 

reimbursement, restitution, and/or damages greater than $5,000, or other acknowledgment of fault; and/or (3) administrative proceeding resultlng ln a 







AGREEMENT BETWEEN OKALOOSA COUNTY, FLORIDA 
AND LEWIS WALKER ROOFING, INC. 

THIS AGREEMENT (hereinafter referred to as the "Agreement") is made this 15•h , day of 
March , 2022, by and between Okaloosa County, a political snbdivision of the state of Florida, 

(hereinafter referred to as the "County"), with a mailing address of 1250 N. Eglin Parkway, Suite 100, 
Shalimar, Florida, 32579, and Lewis Walker Roofing, Inc., a Florida Profit Corporation authorized to do 
business in the State of Florida (hereinafter referred to as "Contractor") whose Federal I.D. # is 20-8357503. 

RECITALS 

WHEREAS, the County is in need of a contractor to provide 41 New Roofs for Rolling Pine 
Townhomes in Crestview, Florida ("Services"); and 

WHEREAS, pursuant to the Okaloosa County Purchasing Manual, the County issued an hwitation 
to Bid to competitively procure the Services and received responses to perform these Services. A copy of 
the procurement and Contractor's response to the procurement is included as Attachment "A"; and 

WHEREAS, Contractor is a certified and insured entity with the necessary experience to provide 
the desired Services; and 

WHEREAS, the County wishes to enter into this Agreement with Contractor to provide the 
Services to the Comity for an estimated amount of Two hundred-forty thousand and nine-hundred­
shieen Dollars($ 240,916.00), as further detailed below in Attachment "B". 

NOW THEREFORE, in consideration of the promises and the mutual covenants herein, the 
parties agree as follows: 

1. Recitals and Attachments. The Recitals set forth above are hereby incorporated into this 
Agreement and made part hereof for reference. T11e following documents are attached to this Agreement 
and are incorporated herein. 

Attachment "A" - 1TB GM 09-22 and Contractor's Response; 
Attachment "B" - Bid Sheet 
Attachinent "C" - Insurance Requirements; 
Attaclnnent "D" - Special Conditions Federal Requirements with EEO and Davis-Bacon Act 
Attaclunent "E" - General Grant Funding Special Proposal Conditions 
Attachment "F" - Title VI list of pertinent nondiscrimination acts and authorities; 
Attachment "G" - Scrutinized Companies Certification 

2. Services. The services to be performed by the Contractor are further detailed in the Contractor's 
proposal attached as Attaclm1ent "A" and incorporated herein by reference. The Services shall be 
performed by Contractor to the full satisfaction of the County. Contractor agrees to have a qualified 
representative to audit and inspect the services provided on a regular basis to ensure all services are being 
perfonned in accordance with the County's needs and pursuant to the tenns ofthis Agreement and shall 
report to the County accordingly. Contractor agrees to immediately inform the County via telephone and 
in writing of any problems that could cause dan1age to the County. Contractor will require its employees 
to perform their work in a manner befitting the type and scope of work to be performed. 

CONTRACT#: C22-3161-GM 
LEWIS WALKER ROOFING, INC. 
41 NEW ROOFS FOR ROLLING PINE TOWNHOMES 
IN CRESTVIEW FLORIDA 
EXPIRES: 1 YEAR FROM NTP 

http:240,916.00
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