
CONTRACT, LEASE, AGREEMENT CONTROL FORM 

Date: 10/29/2021 

Contract/Lease Control#: C22-3125-IT 

Procurement#: 

Contract/Lease Type: 

Award To/Lessee: 

Owner/Lessor: 

Effective Date: 

Expiration Date: 

Description of: 

Department: 

Department Monitor: 

Monitor's Telephone #: 

Monitor's FAX # or E-mail: 

Closed: 

Cc: BCC RECORDS 

PIGGYBACK 

AGREEMENT 

GLAZE COMMUNICATIONS SERVICES, INC. 

OKALOOSA COUNTY 

07/06/2021 

06/30/2023 

VIDEO SURVEILLANCE SECURITY SYSTEMS 

IT 

SAMBENEDETTO 

850-651-7570 

DSAMBENEDETTO@MYOKALOOSA.COM 

mailto:DSAMBENEDETTO@MYOKALOOSA.COM


----------- ----------

PROCUREMENT/CONTRACT/LEASE 
INTERNAL COORDINATION SHEET 

Procure~ent/Contract/Lease Number: 1"3 0 Tracking !'Jumber: --=---'-----

NOProcurement/Contractor/Lessee Name: (f{q2e_ ~ vtra~~//'(;Jed: YES 

Purpose: v\d it? SUI'\/f ,' ) , l(nc-e s---ecuYl4 t '-I J}f~_J 
Date/Term: Ur 30 2,D 2._3 1. ~ GREATER THAN $100,000 

Department#: 0 /I/ 2. 0 GREATER THAN $50,000 

Account#: * blJI '-I/~_) 3. 0 $50,000 OR LESS 

Amount: ~ '-/(/~ t7Cl)-C~ 

Department: ________---J-- T Dept. Monitor Name: SOI 1n b{)J,J__ c;lt}-F{) 

Purchasing Review 
act/Lease requirements are met: 

Date: {a - 1-2-~ 
Jeff Hyde, DeRita Mason, Jesica Darr, Angela Etheridge 

2CFR Compliance Review (if required) 

Approved as written: /Vt) {-(> c/./( ,t,J _;L:!J:Name 

Grants Coordinator 

Department Funding Review 
Approved as written: 

Date: ______ 

IT Review (if applicable) 
Approved as written: 

Date: ______ 

Revised September 22, 2020 

~_/;;;;:;RedftAcJ,Approved as written: 

Date: 
Risk Manager or designee Lisa Price 

Approved as written: 

County Attorney Lynn Hoshihara, Kerry Parsons or D~signee 
Date: 



DeRita Mason 

From: Lisa Price 

Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 2:46 PM 

To: DeRita Mason 

Subject: RE: Glaze Communications Piggyback agreement 

Glaze communications is approved by Risk. 

Lisa Price 
Risk Management 
Public Records & Contracts Specialist 
302 N Wilson Street, Suite 301 
Crestview, FL. 32536 
(850) 689-5979 
lprice@myokaloosa.com 

"We are forever indebted to those who have given their lives that we might be free." 
Ronald Reagan 

For all things Wellness please visit: 
http://\vww.myokaloosa.com/wellncss 

Due to Florida's very broad public records laws, most w1itten communications to or from county employees regarding county 
business are public records, available to the public and metlia upon request. Therefore, this ·written e-mail comnumfr·ation, 
in duding your e-mail address, may be suf~ject to public disclmmre. 

From: DeRita Mason <dmason@myokaloosa.com> 
Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 2:08 PM 
Cc: Lisa Price <lprice@myokaloosa.com> 
Subject: RE: Glaze Communications Piggyback agreement 

Lisa, I don't think you ever approved this. Can you take a look at it today? 
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mailto:dmason@myokaloosa.com
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DeRita Mason 

From: Kerry Parsons 
Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 1:54 PM 

To: DeRita Mason; Lynn Hoshihara 

Cc: Lisa Price 
Subject: Re: Glaze Communications Piggyback agreement 

The substance of the documents is approved for legal purposes. However, in accordance with your Purchasing 
manual you need something in writing from Escambia Schools stating that piggybacking/cooperative 

purchases are permissible for this contract. 

Kerry A. Parsons 
Chief Assistant County Attorney 
Okaloosa County, Florida 

From: DeRita Mason 
Sent: Wednesday, June 9, 2021 3:25:55 PM 
To: Lynn Hoshihara 
Cc: Kerry Parsons; Lisa Price 
Subject: Glaze Communications Piggyback agreement 
Good afternoon, 
Please review and approve the attached. See email attached from Escambia County Schools-they do not issue contracts, 

the RFP serves as the contract. 

Thank you, 

DeRita Mason 

DeRita Mason, CPPB, NIGP-CPP 
Senior Contracts and Lease Coordinator 
Okaloosa County Purchasing Department 
5479A Old Bethel Road 
Crestview, Florida 32536 
(850) 689-5960 
dmason@myokaloosa.com 
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mailto:dmason@myokaloosa.com


DeRita Mason 

From: Romero, David < DRomero@ecsdfl.us> 

Sent: Monday, June 21, 2021 3:00 PM 

To: DeRita Mason 

Cc: Jeffrey Hyde; Doug Taylor 

Subject: Re: FW: Video Surveillance Security Systems - Glaze Communications 

DeRita Mason, 

Good morning! We are in support of others piggybacking off of RFP 180206 as long as Glaze Communication 
also gives their consent. According to the language as written, there is no need for written approval on our end. 
If you need written approval for your purposes, please draft a letter and send it to me for review and signature. 

Thank you in advance, 

On Thu, Jun 17, 2021 at 2:52 PM DeRita Mason <dmason@myokaloosa.com> wrote: 

Good afternoon, 
We are in the process of getting the vendor to sign off on the piggyback of your contract with Glaze. Based on 
the RFP, we need to obtain written approval in order to piggyback off of your contract. 
Can you please email back that approval so that we have it for our records? 

Thank you, 

DeRita Mason 

DeRita Mason, CPPB, NIGP-CPP 
Senior Contracts and Lease Coordinator 
Okaloosa County Purchasing Department 
5479A Old Bethel Road 
Crestview, Florida 32536 
(850) 689-5960 
dmason@myokaloosa.com 

"Please note: Due to Florida's very broad public records laws, most written communications to or from County 
employees regarding County business are public records, available to the public and media upon request. 
Therefore, this written e-mail communication, including your e-mail address, may be subject to public 
disclosure." 

-----Original Message-----
From: Jeffrey Hyde <jhyde@myokaloosa.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 9, 2021 12:54 PM 
To: DeRita Mason <dmason@myokaloosa.com> 
Subject: FW: FW: Video Surveillance Security Systems - Glaze Communications 
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JSCA.,1 nNGLAZCOM-01.....---, 
DATE (MM/DONYYYJ ACORD" CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE I 2/11/2021"---' 

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS 
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES 
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED 
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. 

If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed. 
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on 
this certificate does not confer rinhts to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s). 

~QN.!,:'CT Arlene Elizabeth Gardner 

IMPORTANT: 

PRODUCER 
Undeiwood Anderson & Assoc., Inc. I 'AXfl:8,N:o, Ext•: (850} 434-5526 iAJC, No•,(850) 438-0330 
2302 North 9th Ave E0 MAIL . arlenemunderwoodanderson.com Pensacola, FL 32503 

NAIC#INSURERtSI AFFORDING COVERAGE 

10190INSURER A: Southern Owners Insurance 
32700INSURER B: Owners Insurance Co INSURED 

INSURER C:Glaze Communications Setvices, Inc. 
1864 Cowen Rd INSURER D: 
Gulf Breeze, FL 32563 

INSURERE: 

INSURER F: 

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 
THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD 

INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT VvlTH RESPECT TO \1\/HICH THIS 
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, 
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS. 

I~§~ TYPE OF INSURANCE l~~_D_!. l~.I!~_!\ POLICY NUMBER 
POLICYEFF POLICY EXP LIMITS 

A X COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY EACH OCCURRENCE $ 
1,000,000 

- ~ CLAIMS-MADE [K] OCCUR X 78891193 2/12/2021 2/12/2022 DAMAGE T9_RENTE~n __ , 
I 300,000 

-
X EPL MEO EXP /An" one nerson\ $ 

10,000 

- PERSONAL & ADV INJURY $ 
1,000,000 

~ 

~'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER GENERAL AGGREGATE $ 
2,000,000 

POLICY □ ~ffi □ LOC PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG $ 
2,000,000 

OTHER 
HIRED NON OWNED I 1,000,000 

B ~TOMOBILE LIABILITY 
G,_OMBINED_.SINGLE Lt.All 

$ 
1,000,000 

X ANY AUTO 14289119304 2/12/2021 2/12/2022 BODILY INJURY tPernersonl $ 
- O\NNEO - SCHEDULED 
- AUTOS ONLY ~ AUTOS BODILY INJURY IPer accident\ $ 

- ~LR/c°s ONLY ~ ~8-\",§s'm/r_~ )p~?~&~d"Zit~AMAGE $ 

$ 

A X UMBRELLA UAB ~ OCCUR 
EACH OCCURRENCE $ 

3,000,000 
-

EXCESS UAB CLAIMS-MADE 14289119305 2/12/2021 2/12/2022 AGGREGATE $ 

OED I X I RETENTION $ 10,000 Employ Liab agg $ 
3,000,000 

WORKERS COMPENSATION I~~~----- l [ 2JH-
AND EMPLOYERS' LIABILITY YIN 
ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE 

□ 
E.L EACH ACCIDENT ' 

fil'"FICER/MEMB'Ffl EXCLUDED? NIA 
andatory in N ) E.L DISEASE. EA EMPLOYEE ' 

If yes. describe under 
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT $ 

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS I LOCATIONS I VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space Is required) 
RE: Jobs per network Cabling & repair contract 
Blanket Additional Insured If required per written contract wtth regard to General Liability (primary & noncontributory}. 

CERTIFICATE HOLDER 

Okaloosa County 
602-C North Pearl Street 
Crestview, FL 32536 

I 

REVISION NUMBER· 

CANCELLATION 

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE 

THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN 
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS. 

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

$L 
© 1988-2015 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.ACORD 25 (2016/03) 

The ACORD name and logo are registered marks of ACORD 

https://arlenemunderwoodanderson.com


CONTRACT: C22-3125-IT 
GLAZE COMMUNICATONS SERVICES, INC. 
VIDEO SURVEILLANCE SECURITY SYSTEMS 
EXPIRES: 06/30/2023 

COOPERATIVE (PIGGYBACK) PURCHASE AGREEMENT 
BETWEEN OKALOOSA COUNTY, FLORIDA AND 

ESCAMBIA COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT 
NO.180206 

OKALOOSA COUNTY, Florida, pursuant to Section 20 of the Okaloosa County 
Purchasing Manual, now desires to enter into a Cooperative Purchase Agreement (Piggyback) to 
provide Video Surveillance Security Systems to/for Okaloosa County (the "Services"). Under the 
same terms and conditions as the agreement between Escambia County School District and Glaze 
Communications Services, 1nc. ("Contractor"), Contract Number 1802061 (the "Agreement"), 
attached hereto as Exhibit "A" and incorporated by reference, with a date of expiration ofJune 30, 
2023, which Agreement resulted from a competitive procurement. 

Okaloosa County has reviewed the Agreement and proposal results and agrees to the terms 
and conditions and further agrees that proposed pricing is fair and reasonable. Contractor hereby 
agrees to provide such services and prices to Okaloosa County under the same price(s), terms and 
conditions as the referenced Agreement above. All references in the agreement between the parties 
shall be assumed to pertain to and are binding upon Contractor and Okaloosa County. All 
references in the Agreement to "Escambia County School District" or shall be substituted with 
"Okaloosa County, Florida". 

The parties further agree that exclusive venue of any legal or equitable action that arises 
out of or relates to this agreement or the contract shall be the appropriate state court in Okaloosa 
County, Florida, in any such action, Florida law shall apply. 

Any record created by either party in accordance with this Contract shall be retained and 
maintained in accordance with the public records law, Florida Statutes, Chapter 119. 

IF THE CONTRACTOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE 
APPLICATION OF CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, TO THE 
CONTRACTOR'S DUTY TO PROVIDE PUBLIC RECORDS RELATING 
TO THIS CONTRACT, CONTACT THE CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC 
RECORDS AT OKALOOSA COUNTY RISK MANAGEMENT 
DEPARTMENT 302 N. WILSON ST., CRESTVIEW, FL 32536 PHONE: (850) 
689-5977 riskinfo@myokaloosa.com. 

Contractor must comply with the public records laws, Florida Statute chapter 119, specifically 
Contractor must: 

1. Keep and maintain public records required by the County to perform the service. 
2. Upon request from the County's custodian of public records, provide the County with a 

copy of the requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied within a 
reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost provided in chapter 119 Florida 
Statutes or as otherwise provided by law. 
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