GENERAL SERVICES CONTRACT CONTRACT NO. 0218-0930-EEA

THE PARTIES TO THIS CONTRACT are the City of Daytona Beach, a Florida municipal corporation (the "CITY"), and Eurofins Eaton Analytical, LLC., a foreign limited liability company ("CONTRACTOR").

In consideration of the mutual covenants herein contained, the Parties agree as follows:

Section 1. Scope of Services. CONTRACTOR will provide laboratory testing services, Lots 6 and 8, to the CITY as further described in Exhibit A, attached hereto and incorporated herein by reference.

Section 2. Reserved

Section 3. Fees and Payments; Limitations.

- (a) Unless the Exhibits specifically provides for reimbursement of expenses, the Fee described herein will be CONTRACTOR's sole compensation for the services to be provided.
- (b) The CITY will pay CONTRACTOR up to \$7,920.00 based on the Bid Schedule attached hereto as Exhibit B.
- (c) Except for any expenses specifically provided for in the Exhibits, CONTRACTOR will be solely responsible for all of costs CONTRACTOR incurs in meeting its obligations herein.
- **Section 4.** Billing; Manner of Payment. In addition to requirements for payment established by applicable federal, state, or local law including the City Code, payment terms are as follows:
- (a) No payment will be due for services performed until CONTRACTOR submits a proper invoice. CONTRACTOR will submit invoices only for services provided and accepted in accordance with the requirements of this Contract. CONTRACTOR may invoice the CITY no more frequently than monthly, and no sooner than 30 days after the Effective Date.
- (b) The CITY will pay based on the unit prices set forth in the Exhibits for work completed by CONTRACTOR during the period billed, provided that such work is reflected on CONTRACTOR's invoice.
- (c) In order to be considered proper, the invoice must include all information and documentation that the CITY may need to verify the accuracy of the invoice and the amount of payment due based on the specific requirements of this Contract. Where

payment is for the cost incurred for certain reimbursables (such as for subcontractors or air travel), the invoice must include proof that CONTRACTOR has paid such costs.

- (d) The CITY will within 30 days after receipt of an invoice notify the CONTRACTOR that the invoice is improper, or pay CONTRACTOR the amount due.
- **Section 5. Standard of Performance.** CONTRACTOR's services will at a minimum meet the level care and skill ordinarily used by members of CONTRACTOR's profession performing the type of services provided herein within the State of Florida.
- Section 6. Relationship between Parties. This Contract does not create an employee-employer relationship between the CITY and CONTRACTOR. CONTRACTOR is an independent contractor of the CITY and will be in control of the means and the method in which the requested work is performed. As an independent contractor, CONTRACTOR will be solely responsible for payment of all federal, state and local income tax, and self-employment taxes, arising from this Contract; and CONTRACTOR agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the CITY from any obligations relating to such taxes. The CITY will not make deductions from payments due, for such taxes, or for social security, unemployment insurance, worker's compensation, or other employment or payroll taxes. CONTRACTOR will also responsible for the performance of CONTRACTOR's subcontractors.
- **Section 7. Documents.** All reports, estimates, logs, original drawings, and other materials furnished, prepared or executed by CONTRACTOR during the term of and in accordance with the provisions of this Contract will be the property of the CITY and delivered to the CITY upon demand or, if no demand has previously been made, upon completion of the particular task for which such materials were prepared, executed, or otherwise required.

Section 8. Public Records.

- (a) To the extent applicable, CONTRACTOR will comply with the requirements of Florida Statutes Section 119.0701, which include the following:
- (1) Keeping and maintaining public records that the CITY requires for performance of the service provided herein.
- (2) Upon the request of the City Clerk of the CITY, (i) providing the City Clerk with a copy of requested public records or (ii) allowing inspection or copying of the records, within a reasonable time after receipt of the City Clerk's request, at a cost that does not exceed the cost provided in Ch. 119, Florida Statutes, or as otherwise provided by law.
- (3) Ensuring that public records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public records disclosure requirements are not disclosed except as authorized by

law until completion of this Contract, and following such completion if CONTRACTOR fails to transfer such records to the CITY.

(4) Upon completion of this Contract, keep and maintain public records required by the CITY to perform the service. CONTRACTOR will meet all applicable requirements for retaining public records. All records stored electronically must be provided to the CITY upon request from the City Clerk, in a format that is compatible with the CITY's information technology systems.

IF THE CONTRACTOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE APPLICATION OF CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, TO THE CONTRACTOR'S DUTY TO PROVIDE PUBLIC RECORDS RELATING TO THIS CONTRACT, CONTRACTOR MUST CONTACT THE CITY CLERK, WHOSE CONTACT INFORMATION IS AS FOLLOWS:

(Phone) 386 671-8023 (Email) clerk@codb.us

(Address) 301 S. Ridgewood Avenue Daytona Beach, FL 32114

(b) Nothing herein will be deemed to waive CONTRACTOR's obligation to comply with Section 119.0701(3)(a), Florida Statutes, as amended by Chapter 2016-20, Laws of Florida (2016).

Section 9. Effective Date and Term.

The Effective Date of this Contract is the date on which the last Party signs it. The Term of this Contract is 2 years, commencing on the Effective Date. The CITY will have the option to renew this Contract for up to 2 Terms of 6 months each, by providing CONTRACTOR written notice at least 60 days before the end of the current Term.

If this Contract specifically provides that some or all of CONTRACTOR's services will be required only after issuance of a CITY work authorization, any work authorizations previously issued by the CITY will remain in effect after the expiration of this Contract unless the CITY terminates this Contract dues to CONTRACTOR's material breach after notifying CONTRACTOR to suspend such services as provided below.

Section 10. Termination of Contract.

- (a) The CITY may by written notice to CONTRACTOR terminate this Contract, in whole or in part, at any time, either for the CITY's convenience or because of the failure of the CONTRACTOR to fulfill its contractual obligations.
- (1) Before terminating for convenience, CITY must provide CONTRACTOR at least 30 day's advance notice of termination. This Contract will

terminate automatically and without need for further notice upon the expiration of the notice period.

(2) Before terminating due to CONTRACTOR's material breach of its contractual obligations, CITY must provide CONTRACTOR prior written notice, specifying the breach and demanding CONTRACTOR remedy the breach within 10 days of the notice, or within such longer period as may be reasonably required if the nature of the breach is that it cannot be remedied within 10 days of notice. This Contract will terminate automatically and without need for further notice if CONTRACTOR fails to remedy the material breach within the period described in the CITY's notice of breach.

In either instance described above, upon termination CONTRACTOR will immediately discontinue all services affected, unless the notice directs otherwise, and deliver to the CITY all data, drawings, specifications, reports, estimates, summaries, and any and all such other information and services of whatever type or nature as may have been accumulated by CONTRACTOR in performing this Contract, whether completed or in process.

- (b) If the termination is for convenience, CONTRACTOR will be paid compensation for authorized services performed to the date of termination. If termination is due to CONTRACTOR's material breach, the CITY reserves all rights and remedies it may have under law due to such breach. Among other things, the CITY may take over the work and prosecute the same to completion by other agreements or otherwise; and in such case, the CONTRACTOR will be liable to the CITY for all reasonable additional costs occasioned to the CITY thereby.
- (c) If after notice of termination for the CONTRACTOR's failure to fulfill contractual obligations it is judicially determined by a court of law that the CONTRACTOR had not so failed, the termination will be conclusively deemed to have been effected for the CITY's convenience. In such event, adjustment in payment to CONTRACTOR will be made as provided in subsection (b) of this Section for a termination for convenience.
- (d) The rights and remedies of CITY provided for in this Section are in addition and supplemental to any and all other rights and remedies provided by law or under this Contract.
- **Section 11.** Suspension of Services. If the notice of material breach issued by the CITY pursuant to the preceding Section so directs, CONTRACTOR will suspend services immediately upon receipt thereof, other than the work required to remedy the material breach.
- **Section 12. Indemnification.** CONTRACTOR will indemnify and hold harmless the CITY, including the CITY's officers, employees, and agents, from liabilities, damages, losses, and costs, including, but not limited to, reasonable attorneys' fees, to the extent caused by the negligence, recklessness, or intentionally wrongful conduct of CONTRACTOR, or CONTRACTOR's officers, employees, or agents, including

subcontractors and other persons employed or use by CONTRACTOR in the performance of this Contract. This indemnification agreement is separate and apart from, and in no way limited by, any insurance provided pursuant to this agreement or otherwise.

Section 13. Insurance. CONTRACTOR will provide and maintain at CONTRACTOR's own expense, insurance of the kinds of coverage and in the amounts set forth in this Section. All such insurance will be primary and non-contributory with the CITY's own insurance. In the event any request for the performance of services presents exposures to the CITY not covered by the requirements set forth below, the CITY reserves the right to add insurance requirements that will cover such an exposure.

(a) Coverage and Amounts.

- (1) Workers Compensation Insurance as required by Florida Statutes, Chapter 440, Workers' Compensation Insurance, for all employees of CONTRACTOR, employed at the site of the service or in any way connected with the work, which is the subject of this service. The insurance required by this provision will comply fully with the Florida Workers' Compensation Law and include Employers' Liability Insurance with limits of not less than \$500,000 per occurrence. Any associated or subsidiary company involved in the service must be named in the Workers' Compensation coverage.
- (2) Liability Insurance, including (i) Commercial General Liability coverage for operations, independent contractors, products-completed operations, broad form property damage, and personal injury on an "occurrence" basis insuring CONTRACTOR and any other interests, including but not limited to any associated or subsidiary companies involved in the work.

THE COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY INSURANCE POLICY WILL NAME THE CITY AS AN ADDITIONAL INSURED. Contractor's Commercial General Liability insurance policy shall provide coverage to Contractor, and City when required to be named as an additional insured either by endorsement or pursuant to a blanket additional insured endorsement, for those sources of liability which would be covered by the latest edition of the standard Commercial General Liability Coverage Form (ISO Form CG 00 01) without the attachment of any endorsements excluding or limiting coverage for Products/Completed Operations, Independent Contractors, Property of City in Contractor's Care, Custody or Control or Property of City on which contracted operations are being performed, Explosion, Collapse or Underground hazards (XCU Coverage, Contractual Liability or Separation of Insureds. When City is added as additional insured by endorsement, ISO Endorsements CG 20 10 and CG 20 37 or their equivalent shall be used to provide such Additional Insured status.

(3) Professional Liability Insurance, insuring CONTRACTOR and other interests, including, but not limited to, any associated or subsidiary companies involved in the work, for errors or omissions in the performance of professional services to be rendered pursuant to this Contract. The limit of liability will be no less than \$1,000,000.

(Professional Liability coverage will be provided on an Occurrence Form or a Claims Made Form with a retroactive date equal to at least the first date of this agreement and with a two year reporting tail beyond the annual expiration date of the policy).

Unless specifically waived hereafter in writing by the Risk Manager, Contractor agrees that the insurer shall waive its rights of subrogation, if any, against the City on each of the foregoing types of required insurance coverage.

The limit of liability for each policy will be a combined single limit for bodily injury and property damage of no less than \$1,000,000 per occurrence. If insurance is provided with a general aggregate, then the aggregate will be in an amount of no less than \$1,000,000. The Risk Manager for the CITY may authorize lower liability limits for the automobile policy only, at the Risk Manager's sole discretion.

(b) Proof of Insurance. CONTRACTOR will furnish proof of insurance acceptable to the CITY prior to or at the time of execution of this Contract. CONTRACTOR will not commence work until all proof of such insurance has been filed with and approved by the CITY. CONTRACTOR will furnish evidence of all required insurance in the form of certificates of insurance which will clearly outline all hazards covered as itemized above, the amounts of insurance applicable to each hazard, the expiration dates.

If requested by the CITY, CONTRACTOR will furnish copies of the insurance contracts to support the certificates of insurance and the copies of said insurance must be acceptable to the CITY.

- (c) Cancellation; Replacement Required. CONTRACTOR will file replacement certificates 30 days prior to expiration or termination of the required insurance occurring prior to the acceptance of the work by the CITY. If a required policy is canceled without CONTRACTOR's prior knowledge CONTRACTOR will immediately notify the CITY immediately upon becoming aware that a required insurance coverage has been canceled for any reason, and promptly replace the canceled policy. The CITY expressly reserves the right or replace the canceled policy at CONTRACTOR's expense of CONTRACTOR fails to do so.
- (d) Termination of Insurance. CONTRACTOR may not cancel the insurance required by this Contract until the work is completed, accepted by the CITY and CONTRACTOR has received written notification from the Risk Management Division of the CITY that CONTRACTOR may cancel the insurance required by this Contract and the date upon which the insurance may be canceled. The Risk Management Division of the CITY will provide such written notification at the request of CONTRACTOR if the request is made no earlier than two weeks before the work is to be completed.
- **(e)** Liabilities Unaffected. CONTRACTOR's liabilities under this Contract will survive and not be terminated, reduced or otherwise limited by any expiration or termination of insurance coverages. Similarly, CONTRACTOR's liabilities under this

Contract will not be limited to the extent of by the existence of any exclusions or limitations in insurance coverages, or by CONTRACTOR's failure to obtain insurance coverage.

CONTRACTOR will not be relieved from responsibility to provide required insurance by any failure of the CITY to demand such coverage, or by CITY's approval of a policy submitted by CONTRACTOR that does not meet the requirements of this Contract.

Section 14. Notice. Unless otherwise expressly agreed herein, all notices, requests, and demands to or upon the Parties will be delivered by hand, delivered by a courier service, provided to a nationally recognized delivery service for overnight delivery, transmitted to a receiving fax machine followed by hard copy within two days, or by U.S. mail, postage prepaid by registered or certified mail, return receipt requested, to the addresses set forth herein:

To the CITY:

JoAnn Macrina, Deputy Utilities Director

Daytona Beach Utilities

125 Basin Street, Suite 204

Daytona Beach, FL 32114

Fax: 386-671-8501

To CONTRACTOR

Matthew Hartz, Director of Operations

Eurofins Eaton Analytical, LLC

110 S Hill Street

South Bend, IN 46617

Fax: 574-233-8207

provided, however, that either Party may change the person or address designated for receipt of the Party's notices, by providing written notice to the other Party.

Section 15. Personnel. CONTRACTOR represents that CONTRACTOR has or will secure at CONTRACTOR's own expense, all personnel required in performing the services under this Contract. Such personnel will not be employees of or have any contractual relationship with the CITY.

All personnel engaged in the work will be fully qualified and will be authorized under state and local law to perform such services.

Section 16. CITY's Responsibilities. The CITY agrees to make available for review and use by the CONTRACTOR, reports, studies, and data relating to the services required. The CITY will establish a project manager to meet periodically with the CONTRACTOR to facilitate coordination and ensure expeditious review of work product.

Section 17. Limitation on Waivers. Neither the CITY's review, approval, or acceptance of, or payment for, any of the services provided by CONTRACTOR, will be construed to operate as a waiver of the CITY's rights under this Contract. CONTRACTOR will be and always remain liable to the CITY in accordance with applicable law for any and all damages to the CITY caused by the CONTRACTOR's negligent or wrongful provision of any of the services furnished under this Contract.

Failure of the CITY to exercise any right or option arising out of a breach of this Contract will not be deemed a waiver of any right or option with respect to any subsequent or

different breach, or the continuance of any existing breach. Furthermore, the failure of the CITY at any time to insist upon strict performance of any condition, promise, agreement or understanding set forth herein will not be construed as a waiver or relinquishment of the CITY's right to insist upon strict performance of the same condition, promise, agreement or understanding at a future time.

Section 18. Dispute Resolution. If a dispute exists concerning this Contract, the Parties agree to use the following procedure prior to pursuing any judicial remedies.

- (a) Negotiations. A Party will request in writing that a meeting be held between representatives of each Party within 14 calendar days of the request or such later date that the Parties may agree to. Each Party will attend and will include, at a minimum, a senior level decision maker (an owner, officer, or employee of each organization) empowered to negotiate on behalf of their organization. The purpose of this meeting is to negotiate in the matters constituting the dispute in good faith. The Parties may mutually agree in writing to waive this step and proceed directly to mediation as described below.
- (b) Non-Binding Mediation. Mediation is a forum in which an impartial person, the mediator, facilitates communication between parties to promote reconciliation, settlement, or understanding among them. Within 30 days after the procedure described in Subsection (a) proves unsuccessful or the Parties mutually waive the subsection (a) procedure, the Parties will submit to a non-binding mediation. The mediation, at a minimum, will provide for (i) conducting an on-site investigation, if appropriate, by the mediator for fact gathering purposes, (ii) a meeting of all Parties for the exchange of points of view and (iii) separate meetings between the mediator and each Party to the dispute for the formulation of resolution alternatives. The Parties will select a mediator trained in mediation skills and certified to mediate by the Florida Bar, to assist with resolution of the dispute. The Parties will act in good faith in the selection of the mediator and give consideration to qualified individuals nominated to act as mediator. Nothing in this Contract prevents the Parties from relying on the skills of a person who also is trained in the subject matter of the dispute or a contract interpretation expert. Each Party will attend will include, at a minimum, a senior level decision maker (an owner, officer, or employee of each organization) empowered to negotiate on behalf of their organization.

If the Parties fail to reach a resolution of the dispute through mediation, then the Parties are released to pursue any judicial remedies available to them.

Section 19. General Terms and Conditions.

- (a) Amendments. Except as otherwise provided herein, no change or modification of this Contract will be valid unless the same is in writing and signed by both Parties.
- **(b) Assignments and Subcontracting.** No assignment or subcontracting will be permitted without the CITY's written approval.

- (c) Compliance with Laws and Regulations. In providing all services pursuant to this Contract, CONTRACTOR will abide by all statutes, ordinances, rules, and regulations pertaining to, or regulating the provisions of, such services including those now in effect and hereafter adopted. Any violation of said statutes, ordinances, rules, or regulations will constitute a material breach of this Contract and will entitle the CITY to terminate this Contract immediately upon delivery of written notice of termination to the CONTRACTOR.
- (d) Truth in Negotiations Certificate. CONTRACTOR hereby certifies that the wages and other factual unit costs supporting the compensation herein are accurate, complete, and current at the time of this Contract.
- (e) No Third Party Beneficiaries. There are no third party beneficiaries of CONTRACTOR's services under this Contract.
- (f) Contingency Fee. CONTRACTOR warrants that it has not employed or retained any company or person, other than a bona fide employee working solely for CONTRACTOR, to solicit or secure this Contract and that it has not paid or agreed to pay any person, company, corporation, individual or firm, other than a bona fide employee working solely for CONTRACTOR, any fee, commission, percentage, gift, or any other consideration, contingent upon or resulting from the award or making of this Contract.
- (g) Nondiscrimination. CONTRACTOR will not discriminate against any employee or applicant for employment because of race, color, sex, or national origin. CONTRACTOR will take affirmative action to ensure that applicants are employed and the employees are treated during employment without regard to their sex, race, creed, color, or national origin. Further, CONTRACTOR agrees to comply with all local, state, and federal laws and ordinances regarding discrimination in employment against any individual on the basis of race, color, religion, sex, national origin, physical or mental impairment, or age. In particular, CONTRACTOR agrees to comply with the provisions of Title 7 of the Civil Rights Act of 1964, as amended, and applicable executive orders including, but not limited to, Executive Order No. 11246.
- (h) Principles in Construing Contract. This Contract will be governed by and construed in accordance with the laws of the State of Florida. Captions and paragraph headings used herein are for convenience only, are not a part of this Contract and will not be deemed to limit or alter any provisions hereof or to be relevant in construing this Contract. The use of any gender herein will be deemed to be or include the other genders, and the use of the singular herein will be deemed to be or include the plural (and vice versa), wherever appropriate. If any word, phrase, clause, sentence or provision of the Contract, or the application of same to any person or set of circumstances is for any reason held to be unconstitutional, invalid or unenforceable, that finding will only effect such word, phrase, clause, sentence or provision, and such finding will not affect the remaining portions of this Contract; this being the intent of the Parties in entering into the Contract; and all provisions of the Contract are declared to be severable for this purpose.

- (i) Venue. The exclusive venue for any litigation arising out of this Contract will be Volusia County, Florida if in state court, or the U.S. District Court, Middle District of Florida if in federal court.
- (j) Litigation Costs. Except where specifically provided herein, in case of litigation between the Parties concerning this Contract, each party will bear all of its litigation costs, including attorney's fees.
- (k) Force Majeure. A force majeure event is an act of God or of the public enemy, riots, civil commotion, war, acts of government or government immobility (whether federal, state, or local) fire, flood, epidemic, quarantine restriction, strike, freight embargo, or unusually severe weather; provided, however, that no event or occurrence will be deemed to be a force majeure event unless the failure to perform is beyond the control and without any fault or negligence of the Party charged with performing or that Party's officers, employees, or agents. Whenever this Contract imposes a deadline for performing upon a Party, the deadline will be extended by one day for each day that a Force Majeure event prevents the Party from performing; provided, however, that the Party charged with performing and claiming delay due to a Force Majeure event will promptly notify the other Party of the Event and will use its best efforts to minimize any resulting delay.
- (I) Jury Trial Waived. THE PARTIES HEREBY WAIVE THEIR RESPECTIVE RIGHTS TO A JURY TRIAL OF ANY CLAIM OR CAUSE OF ACTION BASED UPON OR ARISING OUT OF THIS CONTRACT, OR ANY DEALINGS BETWEEN THE PARTIES. THE SCOPE OF THIS WAIVER IS INTENDED TO BE ALL ENCOMPASSING OF ANY DISPUTES BETWEEN THE PARTIES THAT MAY BE FILED IN ANY COURT AND THAT RELATE TO THE SUBJECT MATTER, INCLUDING WITHOUT LIMITATION, CONTRACT CLAIMS, TORT CLAIMS, BREACH OF DUTY CLAIMS AND ALL OTHER COMMON LAW AND STATUTORY CLAIMS.
- (m) Authority to Bind CONTRACTOR. The undersigned representative of CONTRACTOR represents and warrants the he or she is fully authorized to bind CONTRACTOR to the terms and conditions of this Contract.
- (n) Incorporation of ITB and Proposal. The CITY's Invitation to Bid 0118-0880, and the CONTRACTOR's responsive proposal are incorporated herein by reference as Composite Exhibit C. Composite Exhibit C is not attached but will remain on file in the Office of the City Clerk. In case of conflicts between the ITB and Proposal, the ITB will govern. In case of conflicts between Composite Exhibit C and other provisions of this Contract, including Exhibits A and B, this Contract will govern.

Balance of this page intentionally left blank

(o) Integration. This Contract represents the entire agreement of the parties with respect to the subject matter hereof. No representations, warranties, inducements or oral agreements have been made by either Party except as expressly set forth herein, or in other contemporaneous written agreements.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties through their undersigned representatives have caused this Contract to be executed in duplicate original.

THE CITY CONTRACTOR

By: Which Chipholm City Manager

By: _____ Matthew Hartz

Title: Director of Operations
Date: 17, 2,018

Attest// \ L

∟etitia LaMagna, City Clerk

Approved as to legal form:

Зу: ______

obekt Jagger, Oty Attorney

EXHIBIT A

SCOPE OF WORK FOR DTS PILOT TESTING

1. Background

a. <u>Introduction:</u> The City of Daytona Beach has partnered with Florida Department of Environmental Protection and St. John's River Water Management District to investigate the feasibility of purifying water to drinking water quality in order to create more beneficial uses of reclaimed water beyond traditional land application.

This pilot requires extensive testing during the process and on the water purified by the process. This testing is to ensure that the water has been sufficiently purified to meet federal drinking water standards. As this data is also going to be reviewed by all stake holders in determining future regulations, NELAC/TNI certification in the state of Florida is required where applicable.

- b. The Utilities Department is operating the pilot and will be the end user of the data, but will be sharing data with other agencies and institutions.
- c. The project is set to begin in late April, early May 2018, and will run for two consecutive years. The process includes ultrafiltration, reverse osmosis, and advanced oxidation using peroxide and UV light. The end product will meet federal drinking water standards.
- d. The term "Contractor" means the Laboratory awarded the Contract.

2. Contractor Requirements

- a. The Contractor will self-perform all tests listed on Table A, using the method(s) indicated for that test. The Contractor will not subcontract any tests.
- b. Where appropriate and applicable, the Contractor must analyze samples using methods approved in either 40 CFR Parts 136 and 141. For analytes not listed in the tables of 40 CFR Parts 136 and 141, the Contractor must use a method appropriate for and accepted by the analytical industry. Laboratories must submit method(s) used with each report
- c. Laboratories must submit proposed MDL with each report. Preferred MDLs are listed in Chapter 62-302 F.A.C.
- d. The Contractor will provide Turn-around-Times (TAT) for each analyte with each report.
- e. Laboratories will provide NELAC/TNI compliant reports to the City electronically in accordance with the TAT, and in any case, no less frequently than every 30 calendar days.

3. Scope of Work

- a. The Contractor will provide sample kits (bottles/containers with applicable preservative and cooler) for each site by sampling event. The number of sites per testing event is listed on Table A. The Contractor will prepare sample kits and will ship kits to the City within 3 days of request.
- b. City personnel will collect all samples, will package appropriately to prevent damage or leakage, and will ship via Fed Ex back to the Contractor for analysis. Samples will be collected at the rate described in Table A. Contractor will provide reports within the TAT specified for the analyte.
- c. Additional tests may be ordered at the same unit price during the term of the Contract or during any renewal option exercised.

TABLE A

	_	Number of Sites per	Total number of sample	Total Number of
Parameter / Package	Frequency	Testing Event	events	samples
Lot 1	A 11.	4	6	24
Chlorate	Once every 4 months	4	6	12
Perchlorate	Once every 4 months	2	6	
1-1 Dichloroethanes	Once every 4 months	2	6	12
Acetone with 1-1 Dichloroethanes	Once every 4 months	2	6	12
Ethylene Glycol	Once every 4 months	2	6	12
NDMA	Once every 4 months	6	6	36
1,4 Dioxane	Once every 4 months	3	6	18
Formaldehyde	Once every 4 months	2	6	12
Total Organic Carbon	Once per week	5	104	520
Metals(Ca,MG,K,Si,Na,Fe,Sr)	Once per week	3	104	312
TOX	Once per week	3	104	312
Dissolved Manganese	Once per month	2	24	48
Dissolved Iron	Once per month	2	24	48
Grease & Oil	Once per month	2	24	48
Total Sulfide	Once per month	2	24	48
Lot 2				
Helminth Ova	Once every 3 months	2	8	16
Cryptosporiudium	Once every 3 months	2	8	16
Giardia	Once every 3 months	2	8	16
Lot 3				
Chlorophyll A	Once every 4 months	2	6	12
Lot 4				
Enteric Virus	Once every 3 months	2	8	16
Lot 5, Primary/ secondary DW				
standards				
Inorganics without Asbestos	Once every 2 months	2	12	24
Secondary Contaminants	Once every 2 months	2	12	24
Disinfection By-products	Once every 2 months	2	12	24
Volatile Organics	Once every 2 months	2	12	24
Synthetic Organics	Once every 2 months	2	12	24
Lot 6				
Radionuclides	Once every 2 months	2	12	24
Lot 7				
SDI	Once per week	2	104	208
Lot 8				
Asbestos	Once every 2 months	2	12	24

		Total		Total Cost (#	Around Time in		
	Parameter / Package	Number of samples	Cost per Test	or samples X Cost per test)	Calendar Days	Method	MDL
	Lot 1						
1.1	1.1 Chlorate	24	\$ 30.00	\$ 720.00	14	EPA 300.0	6 ug/L
1.2	1.2 Perchlorate	12	\$ 50.00	\$ 600.00	14	EPA 314	0.254 ug/L
1.3	1.3 1-1 Dichloroethanes	12	\$ 45.00	\$ 540.00	14	EPA 524.2	0.2 ug/L
1.4	Acetone with 1-1 1.4 Dichloroethanes	12	\$ 45.00	\$ 540.00	14	EPA 524.2	See attached
1.5	Ethylene Glycol	12	\$ 175.00	\$ 2,100.00	14	RD100	NA
1.6	1.6 NDMA	36	\$ 150.00	\$ 5,400.00	14	EPA 521	0.67 ng/L
1.7	1,4 Dioxane	18	\$ 90.00	\$ 1,620.00	14	EPA 522	0.02 ug/L
1.8	Formaldehyde	12	\$ 125.00	\$ 1,500.00	14	EPA 556	2 ug/L
1.9	1.9 Total Organic Carbon	520	\$ 25.00	\$ 13,000.00	14	SM 5310C	0.2 mg/L
1.10	Metals(Ca,MG,K,Si,Na,Fe,Sr)	312	\$ 56.00	\$ 17,472.00	14	EPA 200.7/200.8	See attached
1.11	1.11 TOX	312	\$ 85.00	\$ 26,520.00	14	SM 5320B	1.128 ug/L
1.12	1.12 Dissolved Manganese	48	\$ 14.00	\$ 672.00	14	EPA 200.8	0.193 ug/L
1.13	1.13 Dissolved Iron	48	\$ 14.00	\$ 672.00	14	EPA 200.7	0.0056 mg/L
1.14	1.14 Grease & Oil	48	\$ 45.00	\$ 2,160.00	14	SM 1664A	0.80 mg/L
1.15	1.15 Total Sulfide	48	\$ 20.00	\$ 960.00	14	SM 4500-S-2D	0.04 mg/L
	TOTAL LOT 1			\$ 74,476.00			

	Г	Т				乛	ſ	T			
											ļ
									:		
MDL											
Method			!								
Around Time in Calendar Days											
Total Cost (# of samples X Test Cost per test)			\$	\$	\$	\$			\$		\$
Cost per Test			\$ NO BID						\$ NO BID		\$ NO BID
Total Number of samples			16	16	16				12		16
Parameter / Package		Lot 2	2.1 Helminth Ova	2.2 Cryptosporiudium	2.3 Giardia	TOTAL LOT 2		LOT 3	3 Chlorophyll A	LOT 4	4 Enterirc Virus
			2.1	2.2	2.3				e e		4

, 2018
MARCH 29, 2018 7
ITB 218-0930 PAGE 5 OF 7
ADDENDUM 1

Grand Total: \$123,868.00

	Parameter / Package	Total Number of samples	Cost per Test	Total Cost (# of samples X Cost per test)	Time in Calendar Days	Method	MDL
1							
	LOT 5						
7	Primary/ secondary DW	7.0	~	۴			Line intentionally left blank to correspond with Table A format
5.2	Inorganics without Asbestos	24	\$ 167.00	\$ 4,008.00	14	Various	See attached
33	5.3 Secondary Contaminants		\$ 180.00	\$ 4,320.00	14	Various	See attached
4.	5.4 Disinfection By-products	24	\$ 270.00	\$ 6,480.00	14	Various	See attached
5.5	5.5 Volatile Organics	24	\$ 76.00	\$ 1,824.00	14	Various	See attached
9.6	5.6 Synthetic Organics	24	\$ 1,035.00	\$ 24,840.00	14/21	Various	See attached
	TOTAL LOT 5			\$ 41,472.00			
1							
	LOT 6						
9	6 Radionuclides	24	\$ 210.00	\$ 5040.00	14/28	Various	See attached
	1017						
7	7 SDI	208	\$ NO BID	\$			
	Lot 8						
∞	8 Asbestos	24	\$ 120.00	\$ 2,880.00	21	EPA 100.2	0.2 MFL
1							

1.4 Acetone w/ 1,1-Dichloroethane	MDL
Acetone	2.0 ug/L
1,1-Dichloroethane	0.2 ug/L
1.10 Metals	MDL
Calcium	0.05 mg/L
Iron	0.02 mg/L
Magnesium	0.02 mg/L
Potassium	0.02 mg/L
Silica	0.03 mg/L
Sodium	0.02 mg/L
Strontium	0.04 ug/L
5.2 Metals ICP-MS	MDL
Antimony	0.08 ug/L
Arsenic	0.4 ug/L
Barium	0.3 ug/L
Beryllium	0.05 ug/L
Cadmium	0.3 ug/L
Chromium	0.09 ug/L
Copper	0.5 ug/L
Lead	0.08 ug/L
Selenium	2 ug/L
Thallium	0.02 ug/L
5.3 Metals ICP/ICP-MS	MDL
Aluminum	2 ug/L
Copper	0.5 ug/L
Manganese	0.8 ug/L
Silver	0.03 ug/L
Zinc	0.8 ug/L
Iron	0.02 mg/L
5.4 Disinfection By-Products: HAA	MDL
Dibromoacetic acid	0.4 ug/L
Dichloroacetic acid	0.4 ug/L
Monobromoacetic acid	1 ug/L
Monochloroacetic acid	2 ug/L
Trichloroacetic acid	0.4 ug/L
5.4 Disinfection By-Products: THM	MDL
Bromodichloromethane	0.1 ug/L
Bromoform	0.1 ug/L
Chloroform	0.1 ug/L
Dibromochloromethane	0.1 ug/L

5.5 Volatile Organics	MDL
1,1,1,2-Tetrachloroethane	0.2 ug/L
1,1,1-Trichloroethane	0.1 ug/L
1,1,2,2-Tetrachloroethane	0.1 ug/L
1,1,2-Trichloroethane	0.1 ug/L
1,1-Dichloroethane	0.2 ug/L
1,1-Dichloroethylene	0.2 ug/L
1,1-Dichloropropylene	0.3 ug/L
1,2,3-Trichlorobenzene	0.3 ug/L
1,2,3-Trichloropropane	0.1 ug/L
1,2,4-Trichlorobenzene	0.3 ug/L
1,2,4-Trimethylbenzene	0.1 ug/L
1,2-Dibromo-3-chloropropane (DBCP)	0.1 ug/L
1,2-Dibromoethane (EDB)	0.1 ug/L
1,2-Dichlorobenzene	0.1 ug/L
1,2-Dichloroethane	0.1 ug/L
1,2-Dichloropropane	0.1 ug/L
1,2-Xylene	0.1 ug/L
1,3 + 1,4-Xylene	0.2 ug/L
1,3,5-Trimethylbenzene	0.1 ug/L
1,3-Dichlorobenzene	0.1 ug/L
1,3-Dichloropropane	0.1 ug/L
1,4-Dichlorobenzene	0.1 ug/L
2,2-Dichloropropane	0.2 ug/L
2-Chlorotoluene	0.1 ug/L
4-Chlorotoluene	0.1 ug/L
4-Isopropyltoluene	0.1 ug/L
Benzene	0.1 ug/L
Bromobenzene	0.1 ug/L
Bromochloromethane	0.1 ug/L
Bromodichloromethane	0.1 ug/L
Bromoform	0.1 ug/L
Bromomethane	0.2 ug/L
Carbon tetrachloride	0.2 ug/L
Chlorobenzene	0.1 ug/L
Chloroethane	0.4 ug/L
Chloroform	0.1 ug/L
Chloromethane	0.3 ug/L
cis-1,2-Dichloroethylene	0.1 ug/L
cis-1,3-Dichloropropylene	0.1 ug/L
Dibromochloromethane	0.1 ug/L
Dibromomethane	0.1 ug/L
Dichlorodifluoromethane	0.3 ug/L
Dichloromethane	0.3 ug/L
Ethylbenzene	0.3 ug/L
Hexachlorobutadiene	0.1 ug/L
Isopropylbenzene	0.1 ug/L
	0.2 ug/L
n-Butylbenzene	0.1 ug/L
	0.1 ug/L
Methyl-t-butyl ether (MTBE)	0.2 ug/L 0.1 ug/L

Naphthalene	0.3 ug/L
sec-Butylbenzene	0.1 ug/L
Styrene	0.2 ug/L
tert-Butylbenzene	0.1 ug/L
Tetrachloroethylene	0.3 ug/L
Toluene	0.1 ug/L
trans-1,2-Dichloroethylene	0.5 ug/L
trans-1,3-Dichloropropylene	0.1 ug/L
Trichloroethylene	0.2 ug/L
Trichlorofluoromethane	0.2 ug/L
Vinyl chloride	0.2 ug/L
5.6 Carbamates	MDL
Aldicarb	0.1 ug/L
Aldicarb sulfone	0.2 ug/L
Aldicarb sulfoxide	0.1 ug/L
Carbaryl	0.1 ug/L
Carbofuran	0.1 ug/L
3-Hydroxycarbofuran	0.1 ug/L
Methomyl	0.1 ug/L
1-Naphthol	0.3 ug/L
Oxamyl	0.1 ug/L
5.6 Herbicides	MDL
2,4,5-TP (Silvex)	0.07 ug/L
2,4-D	0.1 ug/L
Dalapon	0.3 ug/L
Dinoseb	0.07 ug/L
Pentachlorophenol	0.03 ug/L
Picloram	0.03 ug/L
5.6 Pest/PCBs	MDL
Aroclor 1016	0.08 ug/L
Aroclor 1221	0.19 ug/L
Aroclor 1232	0.23 ug/L
Aroclor 1242	0.26 ug/L
Aroclor 1248	0.1 ug/L
Aroclor 1254	0.1 ug/L
Aroclor 1260	0.2 ug/L
Chlordane	0.1 ug/L
Toxaphene	1.0 ug/L

5.6 SVOCs	MDL
1-Methylnaphthalene	0.01 ug/L
2-Methylnaphthalene	0.02 ug/L
4,4'-DDD	0.01 ug/L
4,4'-DDE	0.01 ug/L
4,4'-DDT	0.01 ug/L
Acenaphthene	0.01 ug/L
Acenaphthylene	0.02 ug/L
Alachlor	0.01 ug/L
Aldrin	0.01 ug/L
alpha-Chlordane	0.01 ug/L
Anthracene	0.01 ug/L
Atrazine	0.02 ug/L
Benzo(a)anthracene	0.01 ug/L
Benzo(a)pyrene	0.01 ug/L
Benzo(b)fluoranthene	0.01 ug/L
Benzo(g,h,i)perylene	0.02 ug/L
Benzo(k)fluoranthene	0.01 ug/L
Bromacil	0.10 ug/L
Butachlor	0.02 ug/L
Butylbenzylphthalate	0.2 ug/L
Chlorothalonil	0.01 ug/L
Chrysene	0.01 ug/L
Cyanazine	0.03 ug/L
Desethylatrazine	0.07 ug/L
Desisopropylatrazine	0.02 ug/L
Di(2-ethylhexyl)adipate	0.6 ug/L
Di(2-ethylhexyl)phthalate	0.6 ug/L
Di-n-butylphthalate	0.2 ug/L
Di-n-octylphthalate	0.02 ug/L
Diazinon	0.03 ug/L
Dibenzo(a,h)anthracene	0.01 ug/L
Dieldrin	0.02 ug/L
Diethylphthalate	0.02 ug/L
Dimethoate	0.2 ug/L
Dimethylphthalate	0.02 ug/L
Endrin	0.01 ug/L
EPTC	0.02 ug/L
Fluoranthene	0.02 ug/L
Fluorene	0.01 ug/L
gamma-BHC (Lindane)	0.01 ug/L
gamma-Chlordane	0.01 ug/L
Heptachlor	0.02 ug/L
Heptachlor epoxide	0.01 ug/L
Hexachlorobenzene	0.02 ug/L
Hexachlorocyclopentadiene	0.02 ug/L
Indeno(1,2,3-cd)pyrene	0.02 ug/L
Malathion	0.01 ug/L
Methoxychlor	0.01 ug/L
Metolachlor	0.01 ug/L
Metribuzin	0.01 ug/L

Molinate	0.01 ug/L
Naphthalene	0.01 ug/L
Parathion	0.09 ug/L
Phenanthrene	0.02 ug/L
Prometryn	0.02 ug/L
Propachlor	0.02 ug/L
Pyrene	0.01 ug/L
Simazine	0.02 ug/L
Terbacil	0.02 ug/L
Thiobencarb	0.01 ug/L
trans-Nonachlor	0.01 ug/L
Trifluralin	0.01 ug/L
6 Radionuclides	MDL
Gross Alpha/Beta - 900.1/SM7110B	2.69 pCi/L
Ra 226 - 7500Ra B	0.5 pCi/L
Ra 228 - 7500Ra D	0.7 pCi/L
Total U - EPA 200.8	0.02 ug/L

Composite Exhibit C is not attached. It will be kept on file in the Office of the City Clerk.



CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE

DATE (MM/DD/YYYY) 05/17/2018

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such endorsement(s).

PRODUCER	1-800-300-0325	CONTACT Michelle Gruis				
Holmes Murphy & Assoc - CR		PHONE (A/C, No, Ext)	FAX (A/C, No): 866-	231-7822		
201 First Street SE, Suite 700		E-MAIL ADDRESS	mgruis@holmesmurphy.	com		
Zor First Street Say Sares 700		INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE			NAIC#	
Cedar Rapids, IA 52401	INSURER A:	HDI Global Insurance	Company	41343		
INSURED		INSURER B	Phoenix Insurance Com	pany	25623	
Eurofins Eaton Analytical, LLC	INSURER C. Travelers Property Casualty Company of			25674		
TEO De el Oche Buler Guito 100		INSURER D. AXA Corporate Solutions Assurance				
750 Royal Oaks Drive, Suite 100	INSURER E					
Monrovia, CA 91016		INSURER F				

COVERAGES CERTIFICATE NUMBER: 52843869

REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD INDICATED NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS, EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS

	OLU	SIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH	ADDLIS		Elling Concrete that There bears	POLICY EFF			
INSR			INSD V		POLICY NUMBER	(MM/DD/YYYY)	POLICY EXP (MM/DD/YYYY)	LIMITS	5
A	х	CLAIMS-MADE X OCCUR			GLD1313803	01/01/18	01/01/19	EACH OCCURRENCE DAMAGE TO RENTED PREMISES (Ea occurrence)	\$ 1,000,000 \$ 1,000,000
		ODANINO-NIADE OGGEN						MED EXP (Any one person)	\$ 10,000
				l				PERSONAL & ADV INJURY	\$ 1,000,000
	GEN	N'L AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER						GENERAL AGGREGATE	\$ 2,000,000
		POLICY PRO- JECT X LOC						PRODUCTS - COMP/OP AGG	\$ 2,000,000
		OTHER		1					\$
В	AUT	OMOBILE LIABILITY			HNCAP162D6535PHX18	01/01/18	01/01/19	COMBINED SINGLE LIMIT (Ea accident)	\$ 1,000,000
	х	ANY AUTO						BODILY INJURY (Per person)	\$
		ALL OWNED SCHEDULED AUTOS		1				BODILY INJURY (Per accident)	\$
		HIRED AUTOS AUTOS						PROPERTY DAMAGE (Per accident)	\$
									\$
A	х	UMBRELLA LIAB X OCCUR			CUD1314003	01/01/18	01/01/19	EACH OCCURRENCE	\$ 15,000,000
j		EXCESS LIAB CLAIMS-MADE				İ		AGGREGATE	\$ 15,000,000
1		DED X RETENTION \$ 10,000		1					\$
C		RKERS COMPENSATION			HC2JUB157D379518	01/01/18	01/01/19	X PER OTH- STATUTE ER	
1	ANY	PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUTIVE	N/A					E L EACH ACCIDENT	\$ 1,000,000
	(Mar	ndatory in NH)	N/A					E L DISEASE - EA EMPLOYEE	\$ 1,000,000
	If ye	s, describe under CRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below						E L DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT	\$ 1,000,000
D	_	llution Liability			XFR0077075LI	01/01/18	01/01/21	Per Claim/Aggregat	5,000,000
A	Pro	ofessional Liability			EOD1313903	01/01/18	01/01/19	Per Claim/Aggregat	5,000,000
1	(C	laims Made Coverage)							

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (ACORD 101, Additional Remarks Schedule, may be attached if more space is required)

The City of Daytona Beach is included as an Additional Insured on the General Liability as required by written contract with the insured, per policy terms and conditions. Waiver of Subrogation applies in favor of the City of Daytona Beach when required by written contract with the insured, per policy terms and conditions.

CERTIFICATE HOLDER	CANCELLATION
Daytona Beach Utilities	SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.
125 Basin Street, Suite 204	AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
Daytona Beach, FL 32114 USA	Kari Cooling

© 1988-2014 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

THIS ENDORSEMENT CHANGES THE POLICY. PLEASE READ IT CAREFULLY.

ADDITIONAL INSURED – OWNERS, LESSEES OR CONTRACTORS – SCHEDULED PERSON OR ORGANIZATION

This endorsement modifies insurance provided under the following:

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY COVERAGE PART

SCHEDULE

Name Of Additional Insured Person(s) Or Organization(s)	Location(s) Of Covered Operations
As required by written contract or agreement	

- A. Section II Who is An Insured is amended to include as an additional insured the person(s) or organization(s) shown in the Schedule, but only with respect to liability for "bodily injury", "property damage" or "personal and advertising injury" caused, in whole or in part, by:
 - 1. Your acts or omissions, or
 - The acts or omissions of those acting on your behalf,

In the performance of your ongoing operations for the additional insured(s) at the location(s) designated above

However

- The insurance afforded to such additional insured only applies to the extent permitted by law, and
- 2. If coverage provided to the additional insured is required by a contract or agreement, the insurance afforded to such additional insured will not be broader than that which you are required by the contract or agreement to provide for such additional insured

B. With respect to the insurance afforded to these additional insureds, the following additional exclusions apply

This insurance does not apply to "bodily injury" or "property damage" occurring after

- All work, including materials, parts or equipment furnished in connection with such work, on the project (other than service, maintenance or repairs) to be performed by or on behalf of the additional insured(s) at the location of the covered operations has been completed, or
- 2. That portion of "your work" out of which the injury or damage arises has been put to its intended use by any person or organization other than another contractor or subcontractor engaged in performing operations for a principal as a part of the same project

C. With respect to the insurance afforded to these additional insureds, the following is added to Section III – Limits Of Insurance:

If coverage provided to the additional insured is required by a contract or agreement, the most we will pay on behalf of the additional insured is the amount of insurance

1. Required by the contract or agreement, or

2. Available under the applicable Limits of Insurance shown in the Declarations,

whichever is less.

This endorsement shall not increase the applicable Limits of Insurance shown in the Declarations.

POLICY NUMBER: GLD 13138-03

THIS ENDORSEMENT CHANGES THE POLICY. PLEASE READ IT CAREFULLY.

ADDITIONAL INSURED – OWNERS, LESSEES OR CONTRACTORS – COMPLETED OPERATIONS

This endorsement modifies insurance provided under the following:

COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY COVERAGE PART PRODUCTS/COMPLETED OPERATIONS LIABILITY COVERAGE PART

SCHEDULE

Name Of Additional Insured Person(s) Or Organization(s)	Location And Description Of Completed Operations
As required by written contract or agreement	
Information required to complete this Schedule, if not s	hown above, will be shown in the Declarations

A. Section II – Who Is An Insured is amended to include as an additional insured the person(s) or organization(s) shown in the Schedule, but only with respect to liability for "bodily injury" or "property damage" caused, in whole or in part, by "your work" at the location designated and described in the Schedule of this endorsement performed for that additional insured and included in the "products-completed operations hazard".

However:

- The insurance afforded to such additional insured only applies to the extent permitted by law, and
- 2. If coverage provided to the additional insured is required by a contract or agreement, the insurance afforded to such additional insured will not be broader than that which you are required by the contract or agreement to provide for such additional insured.

B. With respect to the insurance afforded to these additional insureds, the following is added to **Section III – Limits Of Insurance:**

If coverage provided to the additional insured is required by a contract or agreement, the most we will pay on behalf of the additional insured is the amount of insurance:

- 1. Required by the contract or agreement; or
- 2. Available under the applicable Limits of Insurance shown in the Declarations;

whichever is less.

This endorsement shall not increase the applicable Limits of Insurance shown in the Declarations.



CITY OF DAYTONA BEACH

RISK MANAGEMENT DIVISION

P. O. Box 2451

Daytona Beach, FL 32115

Phone: (386) 671-8222 Fax: (386) 671-3257

 \mathcal{BF}

Memorandum

To:

Letitia LaMagna, City Clerk

From:

Bob Flaniken, Sr. Account Clerk

Date:

May 15, 2018

Re:

Contract 0118 - 0880

Attached is a copy of Contract 0118 – 0880 with Eurofins Eaton Analytical, LLC. (Lab testing for St. Johns River water management). I have reviewed the evidence of insurance submitted with the contract, and I find it to be satisfactory.

Attachments