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ARLINGTON COUNTY, VIRGINIA
OFFICE OF THE PURCHASING AGENT
2100 CLARENDON BOULEVARD, SUITE 500
ARLINGTON, VIRGINIA 22201

NOTICE OF CONTRACT AMENDMENT

TO: Rock Hard Excavating, Inc. DATE ISSUED: October 10, 2019
1202 Monroe Street CONTRACT NO: 20-021-1TB-2
Herndon, Virginia 20170 CONTRACT TITLE: Heavy Equipment Rental
AMENDMENT NO: 1

THIS IS A NOTICE OF A CONTRACT AMENDMENT AND NOT AN ORDER. NO WORK IS AUTHORIZED UNTIL THE VENDOR
RECEIVES A VALID COUNTY PURCHASE ORDER ENCUMBERING CONTRACT FUNDS.

The contract documents consist of the terms and conditions of AGREEMENT No. 20-021-ITB-2 including any attachments
or amendments thereto.

EFFECTIVE DATE: March 17, 2021
EXPIRES: September 30, 2021

RENEWALS: Three (3) Renewals Remaining
COMMODITY CODE(S): 97500

LIVING WAGE: N

ATTACHMENTS:
Amendment No. 1

EMPLOYEES NOT TO BENEFIT:
NO COUNTY EMPLOYEE SHALL RECEIVE ANY SHARE OR BENEFIT OF THIS CONTRACT NOT AVAILABLE TO THE GENERAL
PUBLIC.

VENDOR CONTACT: K. Marie Shepard VENDOR TEL. NO.: (703) 742-5444
EMAIL ADDRESS: shepardkm#@gmail.com

COUNTY CONTACT: Jeremey Hassan, DES-WSS COUNTY TEL. NO.: (703) 228-3647
COUNTY CONTACT EMAIL: jhassan@arlingtonva.us

PURCHASING DIVISION AUTHORIZATION

Tomeka D. Price Title Procurement Officer Date 3/24/2021
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ARLINGTON COUNTY, VIRGINIA

AGREEMENT NO. 20-021-ITB-2
AMENDMENT NUMBER 1

This Amendment Number 1 is made on March 17, 2021, and amends Agreement Number 20-021-ITB-2 (“Main
Agreement”) dated October 10, 2019, between Rock Hard Excavating, Inc. (“Contractor”) and the County Board
of Arlington County, Virginia (“County”).

The County and the Contractor agree to amend the Contract Terms and Conditions, Bid Form and Exhibit A —
Pricing Sheet called for under the Main Agreement as follows:

1. Add the following additional equipment for heavy equipment rental services:

1 McCloskey 516RE Trommel Screener (equipment only) at $14,000 per month. A one-time fee of $2,500.00
per mobilization.

2. REFERENCE 49. NOTICES: Notices is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as follows:

49. NOTICES
Unless otherwise provided in writing, all legal notices and other communications required by this Contract are

deemed to have been given when either (a) delivered in person; (b) delivered by an agent, such as a delivery
service; or (c) deposited in the United States mail, postage prepaid, certified or registered and addressed as
follows:

TO THE CONTRACTOR:

K. Marie Shepard

Rock Hard Excavating, Inc.
1202 Monroe Street

Herndon, VA 20170

Email: shepardkm@gmail.com

TO THE COUNTY:

Jeremy Hassan, Project Officer
DES, Water Sewer Streets
4200 28™ Street S

Arlington, VA 22206

Email: jhassan@arlingtonva.us

AND

Sharon T. Lewis, LL.M, MPS, VCO, CPPB
Purchasing Agent

Arlington County, Virginia

2100 Clarendon Boulevard, Suite 500
Arlington, Virginia 22201
Slewisl@arlingtonva.us
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TO COUNTY MANAGER’S OFFICE (FOR PROJECT CLAIMS):
Mark Schwartz, County Manager

Arlington County, Virginia

2100 Clarendon Boulevard, Suite 318

Arlington, Virginia 22201

3. INCORPORATION OF SEXUAL HARASSMENT POLICY: Clause Number 53. Sexual Harassment Policy is hereby
added to the Contract Terms and Conditions:

53. SEXUAL HARRASSMENT POLICY

If the Contractor employs more than five employees, the Contractor shall (i) provide annual training on the
Contractor's sexual harassment policy to all supervisors and employees providing services in the
Commonwealth, except such supervisors or employees that are required to complete sexual harassment
training provided by the Department of Human Resource Management, and (ii) post the Contractor's sexual
harassment policy in (a) a conspicuous public place in each building located in the Commonwealth that the

Contractor owns or leases for business purposes and (b) the Contractor's employee handbook.
4. Replace Bid Form in its entirety with the attached Revised Bid Form.
5. Replace Exhibit A — Pricing Sheet in its entirety with the attached Revised Exhibit A — Pricing Sheet.
All other terms and conditions of the Main Agreement remain in effect.
WITNESS these signatures:

THE COUNTY BOARD OF ARLINGTON ROCK HARD EXCAVATING, INC.

COUNTY, VIRGINIA

AUTHOR'ZE DocuSigned by: . AUTHOR'ZE DocuSigne(? by:
SIGNATURE: omeka Price SIGNATURE: {ﬂ- Man SWWA
5950D4EQACC0472... ODE7A9CCCB1C4C1...
NAME: TOMEKA D. PRICE NAME: K- Marie shepard
TITLE: PROCUREMENT OFFICER TITLE: Secretary
DATE: 3/24/2021 DATE: 3/24/2021
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ARLINGTON COUNTY, VIRGINIA

INVITATION TO BID NO. 20-021-ITB

REVISED BID FORM

SUBMIT: ONE (1) FULLY-COMPLETED AND SIGNED BID FORM WITH ORIGINAL LONGHAND SIGNATURE; AND ONE (1)
COPY OF THE BID FORM ON A USB FLASH-DRIVE LABELED AS “20-021-ITB, HEAVY EQUIPMENT".

BIDS WILL BE OPENED AT 1:00 P.M., ON SEPTEMBER 6, 2019

FOR PROVIDING HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL PER THE TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS OF THIS SOLICITATION

COMPLETE THE PRICING SHEET PROVIDED WITH THE BID DOCUMENTS AS ATTACHMENT A TO ITB NO.
20-021-1TB AND SUBMIT IT WITH YOUR BID. RECORD THE BID TOTALS BELOW.

FAILURE TO RECORD THE TOTALS BELOW AND SUBMIT THE PRICING SHEET WITH THE BID WILL DEEM
THE BIDDER NONRESPONSIVE.

1. Bidders may bid on one, some or all items listed per section to be considered. Bidders should mark “No Bid” or
“N/A” on the non-applicable section of the bid form(s).

NOTE: Bidders may use blank rows in each table to identify and price additional equipment for each equipment
category that will be available for rent to the County. If more rows are needed, Bidders can add additional
sheets and provide pricing in the same format.

# Total Cost # Total Cost # Total Cost # Total Cost # Total Cost
Al | $70,425.00 B1 No Bid C1 $58,500.00 D1 | $88,500.00 E1l | No Bid
A2 | No Bid B2 No Bid C2 $58,500.00 D2 | $105,000.00 E2 | No Bid
A3 | $78,750.00 B3 No Bid c3 $58,500.00 D3 | $105,000.00 E3 | No Bid
A4 | $96,675.00 B4 No Bid Cc4 $83,350.00 D4 No Bid E4 | No Bid
A5 | $96,675.00 B5 No Bid C5 No Bid D5 | NoBid E5 | No Bid
A6 | $68,675.00 B6 No Bid C6 No Bid D6 | NoBid
A7 No Bid B7 No Bid c7 $71,900.00 D7 No Bid # | Total Cost
A8 | No Bid B8 No Bid C8 $75,000.00 D8 | NoBid F1 No Bid
A9 No Bid B9 No Bid c9 No Bid D9 No Bid F2 No Bid
A10 | No Bid B10 No Bid Ci10 No Bid
Al11 | No Bid B11 No Bid C11 No Bid # Total Cost
Al12 | NoBid B12 No Bid C12 No Bid G1 $68,675.00
Al13 | No Bid B13 No Bid C13 No Bid G2 $61,000.00
Al4 | No Bid B14 No Bid
A15 | No Bid B15 No Bid
Al16 | No Bid B16 No Bid
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2. PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF OF THE LIST PRICES FOR RENTAL OF OTHER EQUIPMENT, NOT LISTED
ON THE BID FORM: BIDDER MUST ENTER A PERCENT DISCOUNT, IF NONE, ENTER 0%.

0 %

MINIMUM BIDDER QUALIFICATIONS:

e Proof of 2 continuous years of experience providing rental of various types of heavy equipment
with or without operators. The experience shall be work of similar size and scope. Bidders
experience should be included in the References section of the bid form under “Contract/Project
Dates (from-to)”.

e The Bidder shall meet ALL of the following qualification and certification requirements and submit
certificate and/or license at the time of submission of bids for heavy equipment operators:
X Yes or No

» Operator shall be fully trained in OSHA requirements, manufacturer’s guidelines for safe
operations and the Contractor’s safety procedures

» Operator shall have a valid Class-A CDL license that was issued by the Commonwealth of
Virginia, State of Maryland or Government of District of Columbia

» Crane operators shall have a crane operator certification or license and have an OSHA-
compliant rigging & signalperson qualification and certification

THE FULL LEGAL NAME OF THE ENTITY SUBMITTING THIS BID MUST BE WRITTEN IN THE SPACE BELOW.
THIS BID FORM AND ALL OTHER DOCUMENTS THAT REQUIRE A SIGNATURE MUST BE FULLY AND
ACCURATELY COMPLETED AND SIGNED BY A PERSON WHO IS AUTHORIZED TO BIND THE BIDDER, OR

THE BID MAY BE REJECTED:
SUBMITTED BY:
(legal name of entity) Rock Hard Excavating, Inc. ) S,
AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE: ) B / o
PRINT NAME AND TITLE: / G
K. Marie S pﬁ'd
ADDRESS: 1202 Monroe Street
CILGSYATEIBE: Herndon, Virginia 20170
E-MAIL
TELEPHONENO.:  703.742-5444 ADDRESS: shepardkm@gmail.com
THIS ENTITY IS INCORPORATED
IN: Virginia
THISENTITY IS A: CORPORATION X LIMITED PARTNERSHIP QO
(check the applicable
option) GENERAL PARTNERSHIP O UN'Niggggiﬂéz Q
33
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LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY O SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP QO
IS BIDDER AUTHORIZED TO TRANSACT BUSINESS IN THE YES A NO O
COMMONWEALTH OF VIRGINIA?

IDENTIFICATION NO. ISSUED TO THE ENTITY BY THE
SCC: 2705058860

Any Bidder exempt from Virginia State Corporation Commission (SCC) authorization requirement must
include a statement with its bid explaining why it is not required to be so authorized.
IS YOUR FIRM OR ANY OF ITS PRINCIPALS CURRENTLY

DEBARRED FROM SUBMITTING BIDS TO ARLINGTON COUNTY, Yes Q NO X
VIRGINIA, OR ANY OTHER STATE OR POLITICAL SUBDIVISION?

BIDDER STATUS: MINORITY OWNED: QO WOMAN OWNED: O NEITHER: x

THE UNDERSIGNED UNDERSTANDS AND ACKNOWLEDGES THE FOLLOWING:

THE OFFICIAL COPY OF THE SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS, WHICH INCLUDES ANY ADDENDA, IS THE
ELECTRONIC COPY THAT IS AVAILABLE FROM THE COMMONWEALTH OF VIRGINIA'S eVA WEBSITE AT:
HTTP://WWW.EVA.VIRGINIA.GOV.

POTENTIAL BIDDERS ARE RESPONSIBLE FOR DETERMINING THE ACCURACY AND COMPLETENESS OF
ALL SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS THEY RECEIVE FROM ANY SOURCE, INCLUDING THE COUNTY.

The undersigned acknowledges receipt of the following Addenda:

AS
ADDENDUM NO. 1 DATE:__8/23/2019 INITIAL:\//L

\
ADDENDUM NO. 2 DATE: INITIAL:

ADDENDUM NO. 3 DATE: INITIAL:

TRADE SECRETS OR PROPRIETARY INFORMATION:

Trade secrets or proprietary information submitted by a Bidder in connection with a procurement
transaction will not be subject to public disclosure under the Virginia Freedom of Information Act.
Pursuant to Section 4-111 of the Arlington County Purchasing Resolution, however, a Bidder seeking to
protect submitted data or materials from disclosure must, before or upon submission of the data or
materials, identify the data or materials to be protected and state the reasons why protection is necessary.

Please mark one:

No, the bid that | have submitted does not contain any trade secrets and/or proprietary
information.

O Yes, the bid that | have submitted does contain trade secrets and/or proprietary information.
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If Yes, you must clearly identify below the exact data or materials to be protected and list
all applicable page numbers of the bid that contain such data or materials:

State the specific reason(s) why protection is necessary:

If you fail above to identify the data or materials to be protected or to state the reason(s) why protection
is necessary, you will not have invoked the protection of Section 4-111 of the Purchasing Resolution.
Accordingly, upon the award of a contract, the bid will be open for public inspection consistent with
applicable law.

CERTIFICATION OF NON-COLLUSION: The undersigned certifies that this bid is not the result of or affected
by (1) any act of collusion with another person engaged in the same line of business or commerce (as
defined in Virginia Code §§ 59.1-68.6 et seq.) or (2) any act of fraud punishable under the Virginia
Governmental Frauds Act (Virginia Code §§ 18.2-498.1 et seq.).

CONTACT PERSON AND MAILING ADDRESS FOR DELIVERY OF NOTICES

Provide the name and address of the person who is designated to receive notices and other
communications regarding this solicitation. Refer to the “Notices” section in the draft Contract Terms and
Conditions for information regarding delivery of notices.

NAME: K. Marie Shepard

ADDRESS: 1202 Monroe Street

Herndon, Virginia 20170

E-MAIL: shepardkm@gmail.com

Rock Hard Excavating, Inc. 35
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REFERENCES

Bidders shall provide two (2) references for similar goods that have been provided by the Bidder within
the past 5 years. Bidders experience (minimum of 2 years continuous) should be included in the under
“Contract/Project Dates (from-to)”. The County reserves the right to evaluate the quality of Contractor’s
work through site visits with Contractor’s references.

REFERENCE 1: Contact Name: __Danny Gray
Organization: Arlington County Solid Waste
Phone Number: _703-228-7626

E-mail Address: __dwgray@arlingtonva.us

Contract/Project Name: Arlington County Contract #532-14

Contract/Project Dates (from-to): __8/19/14-9/30/2019

Contract/Project Description: __Heavy Equipment Rental County Wide

REFERENCE 2: Contact Name: __Louie Robertson

Organization: Arlington County Water Department

Phone Number: _ 571-274-2257

E-mail Address: Irobertson@arlingtonva.us

Contract/Project Name: Arlington County Contract #532-14
Contract/Project Dates (from-to): __8/19/14-9/30/19

Contract/Project Description: Heavy Equipment Rental County Wide

BIDDER NAME: Rock Hard Excavating, Inc.
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s g:i 00‘&’
AN 'J\ INSURANCE CHEC

CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE MUST SHOW ALL COVERAGE AND ENDORSEMENTS MARKED "X".

COVERAGES REQUIRED COVERAGE MINIMUM(S)
\ n/a 1. Workers' COMPensation .............c.coeueueunen Statutary limits of Virginia
n/a 2. Employer's Liability ...........cccccveniiviniviiinnnn 5100 000 accudent $100,000 disease, $500,000 disease policy limit

_X_3. Commercial General Liability
_X_4. Premises/Operations .......

.$1,000,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, 52 Million annual aggregate
.$500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, $S1 Million annual aggregate

S AUOMOBHETIABIIY ..o cocionissasgonvuiss ivinsssssimbessonnsssasamssssasess $1 Million BI/PD each accident, Uninsured Motorist
_X_6. Owned/Hired/Non-Owned Vehicles............cccocvceienininiinnns S1 Million BI/PD each accident, Uninsured Motorist
_X_7. Independent CONtractors...............ccccoccueeueen $500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, $1 Million annual aggregate
_X_8. Products Liability..........cc.coomercneiiriiinananaans $500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, S1 Million annual aggregate
_X_9. Completed Operations...........ccccccueeuiucuecaune $500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, $1 Million annual aggregate
_X_10. Contractual Liability (Must be shown on Certificate) .............c..cc.cccuvuenee $500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence,

$1 Million annual aggregate
_X_11. Personal and Advertising Injury Liability........................ $1 Million each offense, $1 Million annual aggregate
X0 DN LEDIRY o s e e Ry $1 Million Bodily Injury, Property Damage and Personal Injury

__13. Per Project Aggregate

__14. Professional Liability
3. Architects and EnGINEErS .c....iuisisninttamasissiissisiississsssnisisssvossos $1 Million per occurrence/claim
_b. Asbestos Removal Liability .. $2 Million per occurrence/claim
__ €. Medical Malpractice S1 Million per occurrence/claim
_d. Medical Professional Liability ...S Limits as set forth in Virginia Code 8.01.581.15

TS IAISCRIEANBOUS BRI «icvuciccasississansntomsimmmsesinsmmesmaeiestspassmivssss s s hismmasn s smuapatvenssng $1 Million per occurrence/claim

__16. Motor Carrier Act End. (MCS-90) .......c.ccccivrmimmuninimnuninnininiinne $1 Million BI/PD each accident, Uninsured Motorist
__17. Motor Cargo Insurance
AR GArARE LIADMIY. oicoiicinsinitmidammisis s sismsan $1 Million Bodily Injury, Property Damage per occurrence

__19. Garagekeepers Liability
__20. Inland Marine-Bailee's Insurance

$500,000 Comprehensive, $500,000 Collision

__21. Moving and Rigging Floater ...........ccoeeeecericcecvinnens T e L e e S P S e s Endorsement to CGL
__22. Crime and Employee Dishonesty COVErage ............c.ccocuirimeuieueiieisisiamssnsinsasesssssssssnsnns S
X.23. Bullder's Risk ..........ccciiiiicmsossois Provide Coverage in the full amount of Contract, including any amendments
B - S a e TPy QAR e S ooy Endorsement to CGL
B L Ly s I R T R e e e e e Federal Statutory Limits

_X_26. Carrier Rating shall be A.M. Best Co.'s Rating of A-VI! or better or equivalent

_X_27. Notice of Cancellation, nonrenewal or material change in coverage shall be provided to County at least 30 days prior
to action.

_X_28. The County shall be an Additional Insured on all policies except Workers Compensation and Auto and Professional
Liability.

_X_29. Certificate of Insurance shall show Bid Number and Bid Title.

__30. OTHER INSURANCE REQUIRED:

INSURANCE AGENT'S STATEMENT:
| have reviewed the above requirements with the bidder named below and have advised the bidder of
required coverages not provided through this agency. Doris J N R T
0N awOoni i Owant
> - Mlv-a':::
AGENCY NAME:__FREEMAN & SHERBURNE. INC. AUTH. SIGNATURE: Oveissi  =wmmaiss
BIDDER'S STATEMENT:

If awarded the Contract, | will comply with all Contract insurance requirements.

j //7 s
BIDDER NAME::'i;U( Y\ @V[\ E}CA\;(“h Y"DAUTH.SIGNAM ,‘/57/ il %'<

S a——
g=*

. < <
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INSURANCE CHECKLIST
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE MUST SHOW ALL COVERAGE AND ENDORSEMENTS MARKED "X".

...51,000,000 CSL Bi/PD each occurrence, $2 Million annual aggre
$500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, $1 Mitlion annual ager.

K_S. A IR NABRIICY coonivnicnicsonommssssismunsersossirnmanssansnnumsacasonssis torist
_X_6.0wne Mag/Non-Owned Vehicies............c..cocouiivicinnnnnee Motorist
_X_7.Independe

_X_8.Products Liabit S veerennnenn 500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, $1 Milii ual aggregate
_X_8.Completed Operat SR R IR $500,000 CSL BI/PD each occurrence, $1 Mil gF annual aggregate
_X_10. Contractual Liability " $geshown on Certificate) ..........ccceuecrevccnnenne. D each occurrence,

S & llion annual aggregate
T Million annual aggregate
Damage and Personal Injury

_X_11. Personal and Advertising Inju

_X_12. Umbrelia Liabllity ...

b __13. Per Project Aggregate
R =L Professional Liability

o. 8 _a. Architects and Engineers.. ....... SRR RO SR SN ) SRR $1 Million per occurrence/claim

__b. Asbestos Removal Liability.. .$2 Million per occurrence/c'aim

_ €. Medical Malpractice ............ ereeeenn e 31 Million per occurrence/claim

_ d. Mecical Professional Liability. imits as set forth in Virginia Code 8.01.581.15

....................................................... & ceriereennennnn. 91 Million per occurrence/cizim

BI/PD each accident, Uninsured Motorist

V1) (R R $1 Million each offen
...... S1 Million Bodily Injury, Proj

W __17. Motor Cargo Insurance

* __18. Garage Liability

__19. Garagekeepers Liability.............

__20. 'nlanc Marine-Baiiee’'s Insurance B . e

__21. Moving and Rigging Floater ............... v WEndorsement to CGL
22. Crime and Employee DiShONesty C gl FABE .........cccouemiieeiueirireicuerisaraaseiesessasaaessnssssesane S

X_23.Builder's RisK..........c.oc00asieos . Provide Coverage in the full amount of Contract, includi 'samencments

r...51 Million Bodily roperty Damage per accurrence

ehensive, $500,000 Collision

__30. OTKER INSURANCE REQUIRED:

INSURANCE AGENT'S STATEMENT:
| have reviewed the above requirements with the bidder named below and have advised the bidder of
required coverages not provided through this agency.

AGENCY NAME: ST CACCK [A/SVYRWEL. ™  AUTH. SIGNATURE;

BIDDER'S STATEMENT:

If awarded the Contract, | will comply with all Contract insurance requirefreénts.
P
BIDDER NAME.R(«(\( \m‘(\ EXCC\YCm A}m\‘ SiGNATURE: ] =
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| 1 Section A: Backhoe, Skid Steer and Fork L

REVISED EXHIBIT A — PRICING SHEET

Total Cost
Estimated Estimated Estimated Mobilization/ | [{HQ*HR) +
t Hourly Quantity | Standard | Weekly Monthly Numberof | Demabilization | (WQ*WR)+
Equipment Only or Operator | [8 hrs = 1day) | Hourly Rate | Quantity | Weekly Rate | Quantity Monthly Rate | Mobilizations Rate (MQ*MR) +
1w Type (HQ) (KR} (waj (WR) may (MR} ANMB) (MBR) (NMB*MBR)| Equipment
13 AL_|Backhoe, Tired (John Deere 410, CAT 420 or equal) 50 $ _ 200.00 2 $ _8,000.00 1 $ 3467500 5 3 75000 | § 70,425.00 |John Deere 410
5 __A3_|Backhoe, Tired with Hydraulic Breaker (John Deere 710, CAT 450 or equal) 50 $ 22500 2 S 9,000.00 1 S 39,000.00 5 3 750.00 | § 78,750.00 iohn Deere 310
6 __A4 _|Loader, Track (Liebherr 914, CAT 313FL or equal) 80 $ 27500 2 $ 11,000.00 1 5 4767500 5 s 1,000.00 | §  86,675.00 |Liebherr 914
7 _AS_|Loader, Tired (Liebherr 538, CAT 926M or equal) 50 § 27500 2 $ 11,000.00 1 § _ 47675.00 5 3 1,000.00 | § 96,675.00 |Liebherr 538
B A6 |compact (Bobeat E42, CAT 304E2 or equal) 80 S 200.00 2 S 8,000.00 1 S 34675.00 5 s 4000 | §  66,875.00 [Kubota KX121
8] $_409,400.00
E2
39 Section C: Trucks
Total Cost
Estimated Estimated Estimated Mobilization/ | [{HQ"HR) +
1 Hourly Quantity |  Standard | Weekly Monthly Numberof | Demobilization | (WQ*WR)+
! Equipment Only or Operator | [8hrs = 1day) | Hourly Rate | Quamtity |Weekly Rate | Quantity | Monthly Rate | Mobilirations Rate (MQ*MR) +
a0 _w Type and Equipment (HQ) (HR) (waj (W) (M) (MR} (NMmB) (MBR) NMB8*MBR Equipment
41 _ €1 |Dump Truck, Single Axle Operator & Equipment 80 $  175.00 2 §  7,000.00 1 3 30,500.00 5 § 58500.00 |GMC 7500
42 €2 |Dump Truck Tandem Axie Operator & Equipment 80 $ 17500 2 § 7,000.00 1 $ 3050000 5 $  58,500.00 |Kenworth T-800
43 €3 |Dump Truck Quad Axe Operator & Equipment 80 $ 17500 2 § 7,000.00 1 $ 3050000 s $  58,500.00 |Mack CV713
44 €4 |Tractor with Lowboy Trailer, 10,000 Ibs. Operator & Equipment 80 5 25000 2 5 10,000.00 1 s 43,350.00 5 $  83,350.00 |Mack CXU613
47 __7_|Roll-on/Roll-Off Truck Operator & Equipment 80 $ 21500 2 $ 8600.00 1 $ 3750000 5 $ 71,900.00 |Mack GU713
48 C8 |Rollback Truck (IHC 4900 or equal) Operator & Equipment 80 $ 2500 2 $ 9,000.00 1 S 39,000.00 s $  75.000.00 [Kenworth T-370
54 $ 405,750.00
55 Section D: Dozers, Crawlers,
Total Cost
| Estimated Estimated Estimated Mobilization/ [{HQ*HR) +
Hourly Quantity | Standard | Weekly Monthly Numberof | Demabilization | (WQWR)+
Equipment Only or Operator | [8 hes = 1day) | Hourly Rate | Quamtity | Weekly Rate |  Quantity Monthly Rate | Mobilizations Rate. (MQ*MR) +
| 6w Type and Equipment (HQ) (HR) | (wa) (wr) (M) (MR} NmB) (MBR) NMB*MBR Equipment
57 __DL | Dozer [JD-450 or equal) Operator & Equipment 80 $ 25000 2 $ 10,000.00 1 5 4350000 5 $ 1,000.00 | $  £8,500.00 |John Deere 450
| 58 02 |Gradali pxt 4100 or equal) Operator & Equipment 50 $ 30000 2 $ 12,000.00 1 $ 5200000 5 B 1,000.00 | §105,000.00 XL 4100
| Motor Grader, Ruber Tired, 65HP (min) with Specialized Accessories (See
59 D3 Operator & Equipment 80 $ 30000 2 $ 12,000.00 1 $ 52,000.00 5 $ 1,000.00 | § 105,000.00 |Flatallis 658
s 5 298,500.00
|
7
| 80 Section G: Extras
Estimated Estimated Estimated Mobilization/ | [(HQ*HR) +
Hourly Quantity | Standard | Weekly Monthly Numberof | Demabilization | (WOrWR)+
Equipment Only or Operator | [Bhrs = 1day) | Hourly Rate | Quantity |Weekly Rate | Quantity | Monthiy Rate | Mobilizations Rate (MQ*MR) +
|ar_# Type and Equipment (Ha) (KR} (wa) (WR) (M) (MR} NmB) (MBR) (NMB*MBR)] Equipment
82 _G1_|Skid Steer Loader Operator & Equipment 80 S 20000 2 5 8,000.00 1 S 3467500 5 s 400.00 | 5 68,675.00 [Takeuchi TLIO
83 G2 _|Trommel Sereener i 80 2 4 s 14,000.00 2 5 250000 | §  61,000.00 |McCloskey S16RE
| 82 § 129,675.00
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