
Bidders must submit pricing for the goods set forth in the ITB and fill in the pricing schedules using US Dollars.

For line items that bidders will not bid, place a $0 in the "unit Price" and add a comment in comlumn "H" of "No bid".

If Bidding "or equal" please provide the detail specs in column "H" and a link to the website if all possible.

Section 1 - Evidence Supplies

Item 

No.
Item Description

Part 

Number

Estimated 

Yearly 

Quantity

Unit of 

Measure

Unit 

Price

Total 

Extension 

Price

Comment

1 Adult Body Bags 7106W 48 Case $306.15 $14,695.20 Part #A-FBB5 
Full length nylon zipper, tested to 400 lb, Medium duty, 

Size 36" W x 96" L

24 Body bags per case

2 Child Body Bags 7100C 24 Each $6.85 $164.40 Part #A-SPB8C   
Full length nylon zipper, Medium duty, Size 36" W x 

60" L

3 Infant Body Bags 7100IN 5 Each $6.85 $34.25 Part #A-SPB8C   

Size 22" W x 30" L

4 DOA Sheet / Disposable Cover 7122 100 Each $5.05 $505.00 Part #A-7103   
Yellow or white with absorbent layer and protective 

plastic film, Size 54" W x 80" L
$1.20

5 Hand Preservation Bags A-4841NP 30 Each $119.30 $3,579.00Bidding exact part number which is for a pack of 50.  Quoted total is for 30 packs of that part number

Plain, Size 7" x 12.5" $18.47

6 Plastic / Wire Padlock Security Seal 39R482 500 Each $1.78 $888.00 Part #A-1076  

Serialized padlock with approximately 100 lbs breaking 

strength, plastic body, Size 3" H x 3/4" W x 1/4" D

7 Disposable Shoe Covers 6097XL 100 Box $27.60 $2,760.00 Part #A-4719   

Non-conductive, non-skid, Size Extra Large *priced per box / 10 pair per box

10 Pair of gloves per box

8 Tyvek Disposable Shoe Covers (by pair) SF0073 100 Each $5.10 $510.00 Part #A-4004, priced per pair   

9 Hair Covers 6081LW 1 Box $17.00 $17.00 Part #A-ZZ-AZ24   

100 Per Box

10 3M Respirators - N95 6058-CS 1 Case $183.33 $183.33 Part #A-4614 priced per case   

Case of 160 respirators

11 Protective Gown 6099 1 Box $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Elastic wrists, waist ties, disposable, polyethylene 

coated (5 gowns per box)

12 Protective Safety Glasses 6053 10 Each $9.00 $90.00 Part #A-S4500X   

13 Cast-Pro  Bulk Dental Stone 7009 2 Each $70.15 $140.30 Part# A-5063  

Buff color, 50 lb box

14 Adjustable Footwear Casting Frame FCF100 2 Each $17.50 $35.00 Part #A-5007   

Aluminum frame, Size 7" W x 11-19" L

15 Sterile Wood Shaft Swabs KCP160M 1 Case $105.00 $105.00 Part #A-7008  

Wood shaft, 6" L, 

2000 Swabs per case

16 Swab Boxes KCP196M 1 Case $123.00 $123.00 Part #A-7034   

Cardboard box for 6" swabs

1000 Boxes per case

17 Sterile Water Ampules KCP247C 100 Each $0.25 $25.00Part #A-7604  priced per ampule (each)  

3 ml Vial squeeze containers, single use $0.07
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https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-fbb5-flapover-body-bag-90-x-36-5-mil.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/straight-pull-body-bag-36-x-20-8-mil-child.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/straight-pull-body-bag-36-x-20-8-mil-child.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-7103-body-sheet.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1076-tamper-evident-padlock-seal-100-seals.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-4719-ultragrip-shoe-covers-xl-15-25.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-4004-tyvek-boot-covers.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-zz-az24-hairnet.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-4614-3m-n95-respirator.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-s4500x-uvex-falcon-safety-glasses.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-5063-arrowstone-free-flow-casting-material-50lbs-tan.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-5007-adjustable-casting-frames-footwear-7-1-4-x-12-18.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-7008-sterile-cotton-tipped-swab-6-length.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-7034-pop-up-swab-box-6-plain-100-boxes.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/catalogsearch/result/?q=a-7604


PRICING SCHEDULE (Continued)

Item 

No.
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18 Single Use Black Powder 1025SU 50 Each $3.50 $175.00 Part #A-2308W   

Size 1/2 oz. Jar

19 Single Use Magnetic Powder 1039SU 50 Each $3.50 $175.00 Part #A-2409W   

Size 1/2 oz. Jar

20 Evident  Black SquirtPowder Fingerprint Powder SP02 50 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Fingerprint powder, Size 2 oz. Jar

21 Evident  Black Magnetic Fingerprint Powder BPM1146128 4 Each $211.00 $844.00 Part #A-2411W   

Magnetic fingerprint powder, Size 128 oz. Jar

22 Viper Fiberglass Brush 1105 30 Each $6.10 $183.00 Part #A-2488   

Individually sealed brush, Size 6.5"

23 Single Use Fiberglass Fingerprint Brush 1109 30 Each $3.90 $117.00 Part #A-2351SFB  

Individually sealed brush, Size 7"

24 SEARCH Goat Hair Powder Brush 117L 5 Each $11.45 $57.25 Part #A-2473 Camel Hair Brush   

Size 4.75", with container

25 Standard Magnetic Powder Applicator 125LM 10 Each $18.90 $189.00 Part #A-2910
Aluminum and plastic construction with plunger, clear 

plastic storage tube.

26 Large Magnetic Powder Applicator 125MD 10 Each $15.05 $150.50 Part #A-2917
Aluminum and plastic construction with plunger, clear 

plastic storage tube.

27 Evident  Clear Fingerprint Tape 144L 200 Each $4.95 $990.00 Part #A-2102

Tape Size 1.5" W x 360" L

28 Evident  Stretchable Fingerprint Tape 2012 40 Each $12.51 $500.40 Part #A-2302

Tape Size 2" W x 360" L

29 BVDA  Black Gellifters 2102 2 Packs $13.05 $26.10 Part #A-35LB

Size 3.5" W x 5" H

10 Gellifters per package

30 BVDA  Black Gellifters 2115 2 Packs $24.05 $48.10 Part #A-2915

Size 5" W x 7" H

10 Gellifters per package

31 BVDA  Black Gellifters 2100 2 Packs $13.90 $27.80 Part #A-2916

Size 7" W x 14" H $3.13

2 Gellifters per package

32 BVDA  White Gellifters 2101 2 Packs $13.90 $27.80 Part #A-2931

Size 7" W x 14" H $3.13

2 Gellifters per package

33 BVDA  Transparent Gellifters 2108 2 Packs $13.90 $27.80 Part #A-2940

Size 7" W x 14" H $3.13 *slightly smaller size

2 Gellifters per package

34 Diff-Lift  Lifting Tape with Jar 144LRJ 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Size 1.5" W x 60" L

35 Ninhydrin Fingerprint Reagent 3605 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Heptane premix, Size 32 oz.
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https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/arrowhead-single-use-fingerprint-powders.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/arrowhead-single-use-fingerprint-powders.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/black-latent-magnetic-fingerprint-powder-128oz.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/catalogsearch/result/?q=a-2488
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/specialist-dna-free-sterile-fiber-brush.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/deluxe-camel-hair-brush-flat-head.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2910-standard-magnetic-applicator.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2917-zenith-magnetic-applicator.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/catalogsearch/result/?q=a-2102
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2302-polyethylene-stretch-lifting-tape-2-x-360.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-35lb-gel-lifters-black-3-6-x-5-2-10-lifters.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2915-gel-lifters-black-5-2-x-7-2-10-lifters.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2916-gel-lifters-black-7-2-x-14-4-2-lifters.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2931-gel-lifters-white-7-2-x-14-4-2-lifters.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2940-gel-lifters-transparent-5-2-x-14-4-2-lifters.html
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36 Ninhydrin Fingerprint Reagent 3603 2 Each $25.65 $51.30 Part #A-PF037

Methanol premix, Size 32 oz. **smaller size, 16oz.

37 NinhydrinHT Pump Spray NHT609 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 discontinued part

Size, 8 oz / 240 ml

38 Evident  Small Particle Reagent 3626 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 discontinued part

Black fingerprint reagent premix, Size 32 oz.

39 Evident  Wet Powder Solution ASD7D 2 Each $22.50 $45.00 Part #A-2625B-100

Black premix, Size 8 oz.

40 Evident Wet Powder Solution ASD7L 2 Each $22.50 $45.00 Part #A-2624W-100

White premix, Size 8 oz.

41 Bluestar  Blood Reagent 3737 2 Each $67.09 $134.18 Part #A-2534

Forensic Kit, Size 16 oz. spray

42 Bluestar Forensic Tablets - 8 3747 2 Each $107.09 $214.18 Part #A-2531

43 Basic Yellow 40 Dye Stain 3166 1 Each $29.65 $29.65 Part #A-2650

Premix, Size 32 oz.

44 Basic Yellow Spray LVS500 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Size 500ml

45 RAM Fluorescent Dye Stain LVS650 1 Each $27.05 $27.05 Part #A-26581

Size 500ml

46 Evident  #442 Fingerprint Ink Pad 442-6 4 Packs $54.00 $216.00 Part #A-2594

Black ink, Size 1-3/4" W x 1-1.5" H $13.20 2" x 1.5"

6 Ink Pads per package **initially priced per pad, now priced per pack

47 Postmortem Print Spoon PMNS60 2 Each $17.10 $34.20 Part #A-2815

4 Tab spoon

48 Postmortem Non-Adhesive Print Spoon Strips 30031R 1 Packs $100.00 $100.00 Part #A-2650B-500

Right Hand Strips, Size 1-1/2" W x 8" L 500 LH and 500 RH strips

500 Strips per package

49 Postmortem Adhesive Print Spoon Strips FC543R 2 Packs $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Right Hand Strips, Size 1-1/2" W x 8" L

500 Strips per package

50 Postmortem Adhesive Print Spoon Strips FC543L 2 Packs $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Left Hand Strips, Size 1-1/2" W x 8" L

500 Strips per package

51 Lynn Peavey  Pocket Inkless Elimination Print Kit LE46 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 discontinued

Black ink, 50 case sheets

52 5X Magnifier 3192 1 Each $160.10 $160.10 Part #A-100114

53 MicroBurst  Cyanoacrylate Glue CNA103 1 Each $45.45 $45.45 Part #A-2616

Bulk 16 oz. size to include 4 empty 1 oz. bottles **no extra bottles included

54 MicroBurst  Glue Fuming Dishes CNA106C 1 Packs $19.00 $19.00 Part #A-2559D

Aluminum dish, Size 57 mm

100 Dishes per package

55 MicroBurst  Glue Fuming Pellets 3925-50 1 Packs $44.75 $44.75 Part #A-2607C

Replacement pellets for MicroBurst Fuming Wand

50 Pellets per package

56 MicroBurst  Fume-A-Wand Kit 3920 1 Each $172.00 $172.00 Part #A-2606C
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https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2625b-100-wet-powder-black-125ml.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2624w-100-wet-powder-white-125ml.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2534-bluestar-forensic-kit.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2531-bluestar-forensic-tablets-8-applications.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-26581-ram-mixture-dye-stain.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2594-arowhead-fingerprint-rectangle-ink-pads.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2815-postmortem-record-strip-holder.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/replacement-record-strip-left-right-hand-100-each.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-100114-5x-magnifier-arrowhead.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/cyanoacrylate-16oz.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/aluminum-fuming-dish-2-oz-capacity.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/cyanowandtm-standard-replacement-cartridge.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2606c-cyanowand-kit.html
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57 MicroBurst  Fuel Refill 3928 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

58 MicroBurst  Fuming Cylinder 3920-FC 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

59 Electrostatic Lifting Film 3055 2 Packs $0.00 $0.00 discontinued

Foil backed mylar film, Size 12" W x 16" H

10 Pieces of film per package

60 Electrostatic Lifting Film ESP902 2 Packs $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Foil backed mylar film, Size 24" W x 36" H

15 Pieces of film package

61 Fingerprint Ink Roller FPT262B 1 Each $21.36 $21.36 Part #A-2587

Size 4" roller

62 Glass Evidence Jars ECGJ2 2 Case $48.00 $96.00 Part #A-1531

Clear jar with screw on lid, Size 2 oz.

24 Jars per case

63 Glass Evidence Jars ECGJ4 2 Case $48.00 $96.00 Part #A-1532

Clear jar with screw on lid, Size 4 oz.

24 Jars per case

64 Glass Evidence Jars 4033 2 Case $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Clear jar with screw on lid, Size 8 oz.

24 Jars per case

65 Clear Plastic Evidence Jars ECJ1 10 Case $4.00 $40.00 Part #A-1201P

Clear jar with screw on lid, Size 1 oz.

10 Jars per case

66 Clear Plastic Evidence Jars ECJ2 10 Case $5.00 $50.00 Part #A-1200P

Clear jar with screw on lid, Size 2 oz.

10 Jars per case

67 Clear Plastic Evidence Jars ECJ4 10 Case $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Clear jar with screw on lid, Size 3 oz.

10 Jars per case

68 Clear Plastic Evidence Jars 4038 10 Case $10.10 $101.00 Part #A-1208P

Clear jar with screw on lid, Size 8 oz.

10 Jars per case

69 Metal Evidence Cans 4028L 2 Case $17.05 $34.10 Part #A-1510

Lined metal paint can style with lid, Size One Pint

6 Lined cans per case

70 Metal Evidence Cans 4029L 2 Case $18.05 $36.10 Part #A-1509

Lined metal paint can style with lid, Size One Quart

6 Lined cans per case

71 Metal Evidence Cans 4030L 2 Case $26.00 $52.00 Part #A-1508

Lined metal paint can style with lid, Size One Gallon

2 Lined cans per case

72 Small Evidence Boxes 4046C 5 Case $31.05 $155.25 Part #A-1009
White cardboard, sliding style box, Size 3/4" x 1-3/4" x 

3"
$4.31

72 Boxes per case

73 Small Evidence Boxes 5 Case $41.05 $205.25 Part #A-1010

White cardboard, sliding style box, Size 1-1/4" x 2" x 3" 4047C $6.63

72 Boxes per case

74 Poly Coated Ice Cream Container with Lid 50 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

75 Jumbo Paper Bags 5 5 Case $41.00 $205.00 Part #A-1037
2 Ply, 50 lb Kraft paper bag with flat bottom, 1/6 Heavy 

Paper, Size 16" x 12" x 35"

25 Bags per case
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https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2587-inking-rollers-4-roller-plastic-handle-with-steel-frame.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1531-liquid-accelerant-storage-jars-2-oz-24-jars.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1532-liquid-accelerant-storage-jars-4-oz-24-jars.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1201p-evidence-collection-jars-polypropylene-1oz-12-pk.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1200p-evidence-collection-jars-polypropylene-2oz-wide-mouth-12pk.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1208p-evidence-collection-jars-polypropylene-8oz-12-pk.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1510-metal-evidence-cans-lined-1-pint.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1509-metal-evidence-cans-lined-1-quart.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1508-metal-evidence-cans-lined-1-gallon.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1009-evidence-slide-boxes-3-x-1-3-4-x-3-4.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1010-evidence-slide-boxes-3-1-4-x-2-x-7-8.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1037-monster-evidence-bag-25-pack.html
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76 Evident  ReproCast Extruder Gun, No substitute 7208 1 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Two Section 50 ml Silicone cartridge

77 Evident  ReproCast Forensic Silicon, No substitute 7204 12 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Brown, flexible, silicone casting material

Size 50 ml Catridges

78 Evident  ReproCast Forensic Silicon, No substitute 7205 6 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Clear, flexible, silicone casting material

Size 50 ml Catridges

79 Evident  ReproCast Mixing Tips, No substitute 7213 6 Packs $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Size 50 ml Cartridge

40 Tips Per Package

80 Sterile Tongue Depressors 3040 5 Case $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Wood depressor, approximately 6" long

100 Depressors per case

81 Snow Print Wax SP1000 4 Each $20.50 $82.00 Part #A-5010

Aerosol spray, Size 250 ml

82 Hexagon OBTI - Human Blood Verifier 3777 10 Packs $107.40 $1,074.00 Part #A-2537

Two part blood test for human blood

24 Tests per package

83 Sterile Disposable Scalpels 7098 4 Packs $12.14 $48.56 Part #A-6711

Individually wrapped, Size #11 Pointed $3.79

10 Scalpels per package

84 Disposable Pipettes 3130 2 Case $13.00 $26.00 Part #A-7009

LDPE - Low Density Polyethylene, Size 5 ml

500 Pipettes per case

85 Disposable Pipettes 3130L 5 Case $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

LDPE - Low Density Polyethylene, Size 23 ml

Extra long, approximately 12" in length

100 Pipettes per case

86 Plastic Zip-Tie Write-On Tags ET-LR18 10 Packs $74.90 $749.00 Part #A-1018-R

Red in color, Size 18" long $12.05

Write-on surface 2" W x 3" L

100 Tags per package

87 Plastic Zip-Tie Write-On Tags ET-LY18 10 Packs $74.90 $749.00 Part #A-1018-Y

Yellow in color, Size 18" long $12.05

Write-on surface 2" W x 3" L

100 Tags per package

88 Plastic Zip-Tie Write-On Tags ET-LY 10 Packs $44.05 $440.50 Part #A-1019-Y

Yellow in color, Size 6" long

Write-on surface 2" W x 3" L

100 Tags per package

89 Disposable Tweezers 7061-250 2 Case $101.00 $202.00 Part #A-6955

Plastic, single use

250 Tweezers per case

90 Sterile Disposable Tweezers 7067 2 Case $94.00 $188.00 Part #A-6957

Plastic, individually wrapped, single use

100 Tweezers per case
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https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-5010-snow-impression-wax.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-2537-hexagon-obti-human-blood-test-24-tests.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-6711-disposable-scalpels-pointed-blade-11-pk-10.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-7009-disposable-transfer-pipettes.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1018-r-property-and-evidence-marking-ties-18-red.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1018-y-property-and-evidence-marking-ties-18-yellow.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-1019-y-property-and-evidence-marking-ties-9-yellow.html
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/catalogsearch/result/?q=a-6955
https://www.arrowheadforensics.com/a-6957-disposable-polypropylene-tweezers-sterile-12-pk.html
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91 Evidence-Pro  Security Stips w/ Date and Initials 4142R 2 Packs $13.00 $26.00 Part #A-3311

"Evidence Do Not Tamper"

Red strip with black letters, serrated security edge

Size 6-1/2" L x 1-1/4" W

100 Strips per package

92 Evidence-Pro  Security Tape 4002R 4 Each $12.50 $50.00 Part #A-3001

"Evidence"

Red tape with black letters and a white writing line

Serrated security edge

Size 1-3/8" W x 108" L

93 Crime Scene Chalk 7046W 10 Packs $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

White, Size 1" x 4"

3 Pieces of chalk per package

94 Dixon  Lumber Crayon None 20 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Yellow, wet / dry surfaces, non-toxic

95 EVI-PAQ  Standard ID Tents IDTC-0120Y 20 Each $76.00 $1,520.00 Part #A-IDTC-0120Y

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 1-20

Flat lower section includes metric scale

96 EVI-PAQ  Standard ID Tents IDTC-2140Y 10 Each $76.00 $760.00 Part #A-IDTC-2140Y

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 21-40

Flat lower section includes metric scale

97 EVI-PAQ  Standard ID Tents IDTC-4160Y 10 Each $76.00 $760.00 Part #A-IDTC-4160Y

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 41-60

Flat lower section includes metric scale

98 EVI-PAQ  Standard ID Tents IDTC-6180Y 10 Each $76.00 $760.00 Part #A-IDTC-6180Y

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 61-80

Flat lower section includes metric scale

99 EVI-PAQ  Standard ID Tents or equivalent IDTC-8100Y 10 Each $76.00 $760.00 Part #A-IDTC-8100Y

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 81-100

Flat lower section includes metric scale

100 EVI-PAQ  ID Tent Kit w/case, Cut-Out Style IDTCK-0160Y 20 Each $0.00 $0.00 discontinued

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 1-60

Flat lower section includes metric scale

101 Cut-Out Photo Evidence Marker Numbers CUTO120Y 20 Set $76.00 $1,520.00 A-IDTC-0120Y

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 1-20

Flat lower section includes metric scale

102 Cut-Out Photo Evidence Marker Numbers CUTO160YK 20 Set $0.00 $0.00 discontinued

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 1-60 Kit

Flat lower section includes metric scale

103 Cut-Out Zippered Case CUTZC1-60 20 Each $29.00 $580.00 Part #A-6326KC

60 Marker Capacity

104 Mark-n-Doc, Cut Out Style MDM120 20 Each $76.00 $1,520.00 Part #A-IDTC-0120Y

Yellow, ID Tent Sequence 1-20

Flat lower section includes metric scale

105 Mark-n-Doc Storage bag MDBAG 20 Each $29.00 $580.00 Part #A-6326KC

106 Photomacrographic Scale 5120 5 Each $3.65 $18.25 Part #A-6200

4" x 4" L-Shaped ABFO Style Scale

White scale with photo gray imprint
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No.
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Unit of 
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107 Photo Evidence Scale PPS400 15 Packs $7.00 $105.00 Part #A-6306
Plastic, non-glare, white scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 6" Long

10 Scales per package

108 Photo Evidence Scale PPS401 15 Packs $7.00 $105.00 Part #A-6106
Plastic, non-glare, gray scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 6" Long

10 Scales per package

109 Photo Evidence Scale PPS403 15 Packs $7.00 $105.00 Part #A-6206
Plastic, non-glare, black scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 6" Long

10 Scales per package

110 Magnetic Photo Evidence Scale MR401 5 Packs $13.43 $67.15 Part #A-6106M
Plastic, non-glare, gray scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 6" Long
*priced as pack of 10

10 Scales per package

111 Credit Card Size Scale 5138 20 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Plastic, non-glare, gray scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 3" Long

112 Adhesive Photo Scale 5088G 5 Pack $4.55 $22.75 Part #A-6630A
Stick-on, non-glare, gray scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 2" x 50 mm
*link is for white color

50 Scales per package

113 Adhesive Photo Scale 5088B 5 Pack $4.55 $22.75 Part #A-6530A
Stick-on, non-glare, black scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 2" x 50 mm
*link is for white color

50 Scales per package

114 Adhesive Photo Scale 5088W 5 Pack $4.55 $22.75 Part #A-6430A
Stick-on, non-glare, white scale, measurements in 

standard and metric, Size 2" x 50 mm

50 Scales per package

115 2500 - 2" Adhesive Pad Photo Scales TSCL50 1 Each $8.00 $8.00 Part #A-6430AR
Measurement in inches, space for additional 

information

116 2500 - 2" Adhesive Pad Photo Scales TSCL50M 1 Each $8.00 $8.00 Part #A-6430AR
Measurement in metric, space for additional 

information

117 Adhesive Photo Evidence Markers 5191 1 Packs $46.00 $46.00 Part #A-6614

Photo Numbers 0 - 9, 25 of each number, paper stock *this book has letters and numbers, one page of each

2 cm Measurement noted on the marker

250 Photo Markers per package

118 Adhesive Photo Evidence Markers 5192 2 Packs $46.00 $92.00 Part #A-6614

Photo Letters A - Z, 25 of each letter, paper stock *this book has letters and numbers, one page of each

2 cm Measurement noted on the marker

650 Photo Markers per package

119 Adhesive Photo Evidence Markers 5193 2 Packs $0.00 $0.00

Photo Arrows, paper stock discontinued

2 cm Measurement noted on the marker

25 Photo Markers per package

120 Adhesive Photo Evidence Markers 5194 2 Packs $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Photo Blanks, paper stock

2 cm Measurement noted on the marker

25 Photo Markers per package

121 Reversible Footwear and Tire Track Photo Scales PPS600 2 Each $12.25 $24.50 Part #A-6201

Flat vinyl, L-Shaped scale, non-reflective

White with black printing and black with white printing

Size 15 cm x 30 cm
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122 Supersticks  with Case 5091SS 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

4 - 48" Flexible PVC sticks

Black numbers on yellow background

2 Horizontal sticks numbered left to right / right to left

2 Vertical sticks numbered top to bottom / bottom to 

top

123 Large Ruler Scale Tape PPS101 4 Each $14.10 $56.40 Part #A-6605

Black numbers on yellow adhesive background

Standard ruler imprint repeats every 12"

Size 1-1/4" x 30"

124 Steel Carpenters Tape Measure 5124 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Standard measurement, Size 1" W x 30' L

125 Pocket Rod 5127 2 Each $24.00 $48.00 Part #A-PR618

Standard feet and inch measurement

Stand alone 6.5' measuring rod

126 Fiberglass Tape Measure 5130 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Open reel, standard measurement, Size 50'

127 Fiberglass Tape Measure SK700 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Open reel, standard measurement, Size 100'

128 Fiberglass Tape Measure SK701 2 Each $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

Open reel, standard measurement, Size 200'

129 Barricade Tape / Banner Guard 4012-CS 15 Case $98.33 $1,474.95 Part #A-6100

"Police Line - Do Not Cross" Priced per pack of 8

Polyethylene yellow tape with black lettering

Size 3" W x 1000' L, 2 mil minimum thickness

8 Rolls per case without dispenser box

SECTION 1 TOTAL:  $44,444.71

Section 2 - Other Items at a Discount

Item 

No.
Manufacturer / Item Description % Discount

35

36

37

38

Catalog / Website:  ___www.arrowheadforensics.com___________________________________
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